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World News Business Sumroar’

General links

Gandhi to

Bofors

cover-up >

UK calls for

inquiry Into

shipping line

fate fixinn
A senior -Indian, general
provided evidence suggesting -

Prime Minister Rajiv flawYM
was directlyinvolved in a -

cover-up crftheBofbrs
affair in which the Swedish
arms group is alleged to have!
paid illicit rflmmTwrinMB ..

Page4

Soviet action urged
Politburo conservative Yegor '

. Ligachev urged political.actkpi
to stop nationalist unrest in. i‘

outlying Soviet republics but
said the Government must not
be repressweTordHctatodaL
'Page 3 . ; .,• v..;

US, Japan in talks

officials today begin the first
round of trade (alksflach are
nicely to touch on .basic .differ*

eoces in hour both economies
work* Page 4

'

Iran appoints radical
Iranian-Presldfint Ra&anjani •

-

appointed former Prime Minis-
ter Mir-Hnssein Mousavi as
his adviser in .a concession to

'

radicals within theleodership, •

Soviet Jews in US J.
J:

Bush Administration has -

drafted plans to impose curbs
on the admission of Soviet
Jews because it fears a wave
of migration following
Moscow’s easing ofexit restric-
tions. Page 2 • -

Peru snoln Panama
Peru will not rerogmsePanv-
ama's new government,
because it has been “hand- .

;

pickecL.by a militarydictator,”
President Alan Gardasaid.

I
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Vietnamese reforms
Nguyen van £Jnii; the V5et
namese leader,rdectedany .

multi-party. system strstLsaid .

hberahsatioti wegfiiOnly Occur
in economic life. Page 4

Egyptians Moslems
Egyptian court sentenced 28 •-

Moslem militants to long peri-

ods in jailina contmnmg -

crackdown on dissidents of
both the left andthereligious
right. Page 4 :>• • v..

-The chart shoux the turn con-
stroints on European Monetary
Sff&emirpes. Theuppergrid,
haSedonthe weakestazrrrmcg

(except the Ura and Spanish
peseta) may move more than
2Vpercent The lower chart
gives each currency ’s divergence
fivmlheyeftiral rate* against
the European Currency Unit
(BCD) a basket ofEwropean
currendes. Thepeseta and the
escudo are not included as they
haveno weighting until Septem-
bers -

Royal Naval arrest
British navel vessels helped
arrest a US registered ffddng
vessel carrying 12 tobs'of mari-
juana off Florida after Shadow-
ing ft for three days.

rEAf.Y’SBancaNazionale del
Lavort> chairman, Nerio Nesi,
wfll meet government minis-
ters to discuss the widening .

scandal overmore than $L5bn
ofunanthorised loans dia-

Nloaraguan poas -

Publisher ofthe opposition
La Prensa newspaper and
founder member of the San-

_
dinista Government wib nomi-
nated to represent Nicaragua’s
main opposition group in presi-

dential polls. Page 2 •

Georgia, branch to US and
European companies exporting
to Iraq. Page 3

TAIYOKobebank President
YasuoMatsushita denied
insider tredihg took place
before the announcement last

week of the proposed merger
wtEhMitsm Bank. Page 23

Newspmwf bombod
A powerful bomb killed one
person and caused extensive

'

damage ata leading Goknufalan
newspaper which Is-cmsading
against the drug trade. . :

"
•

TOMAS FINANCIAL, Texas

Castro stays away
President Ektel Castro wiUnof
attend this week’s non-aligned
summit in Belgrade, the first

time he has been absent since
he helped launch the move-
ment in Havana 28 years ago.

North Sea rig scare
Ships and helicopters evactfc- /

ated 110 workers from an
Amoco oil platform in the
North Sea when vibrations

caused by drilling into a high
pressure gas pocketled to a-

production shot-down.

struggling with large losses
and a heavy debt burden,
hinted ft would consider bank-
ruptcy if its bankers do not
iTiafep concessions on their
loans. Page 23 . ....

CISEE reached agreement for
a *95m one-year stand-by .

agreementwith the IMF that -

could lead to a Brady-style pro-
gramme of debt reduction. -

Sage 2

WESTFIELD, Australian group
owned by Frank Lowy, sold
out of the Channel Tea net-

weak, becoming the first casu-
alty in the competitive com-
mereial TV industry since its

media regulations changed

Libyan sanctions
Italian Foreign Minister,

Gianni De Michehs, said he
was convinced Libya wants .

friendly relations .with the

West and that the EC should
rethink diplomatic sanctions

it imposed in 1986.

HUUTON International Met-
als. RoyalDutch/Shdl division
budding worldwide mining
operations, is buying a 35 per
ceofc-toterestitt Les Mines Set
hade, a copper, zinc and pro-

.

dons metals complex in north-

western Quebec, Canada. Page
23

Afghan exodus
About 40^00 peopleJiavebeefr
leaving the A&iuui capital-

-

-

Kabul every monthfar Pakis-
tan. or other countries to avoid
conscription and rebel attacks,

diplomats and international •

relief workerssaid

Panda ctab dies ;

Athree ounce panda cubbean'
on Friday at Washington
National Zoo died of an infec-

tion despitepaediatric help
from a children's hospital.. -

FALCONBRTOGE: the with-

drawalby US-based Amasc
from the bidding for Canada's
Faleonbridge apparently leaves

the way clear for the diversi-

fied minmgeompany to be
ialmh over fay.Nocanda inpart-

nership with Trelleborg cifSwe-

den.Page23
.

MEDIOBANCA, Italy’s largest

Merdfcant bank, posted a 35
per cent increase in net profit

to L162.4bn <SlI5m) in the year

ended June 80. Page 23

ALIANCA, Portugal’s state-

owned insurance company,
will «eH 49per cent of its capi-

tal atja basic Bs3,000 ($18^0)

pewsharelhthe third ptivatisa-

Eton this year. Page 23

BA wins buy-out
pledge from United

THE EUROPEAN Commission
has been adced to invffitlgate

.

thetegahty'ctf arate-fixii^

agreement between agroup
of leading shipping -tines bn
some north Atlantic routes.

The British Shippers’ Council,
which Sled the^complamt, says
fheNorth Em®pe/U&& Rate

' Agreement (Neuaara) breaks 1

at least two EC cOnmetitfon^ •

.

regulations. Page

EUROPEANMiHi^ary System:
The Spanishpeseta remained
very firm last week» maving
dose to itsmaximum cross- ~

. .

rate hirittagainst the Danish
. krone, the weakest member
bftiue^fcan: fradfr® isllkely
to becbmeMdse^volBtfle after
nesistliatthe^imilshautiiori-
tfos'h^caltedagenezaleleo-
tkm:

1
.'

The Hallanlirawaaalso . ... .

strong de^)tte occasional Inter-
vention bythe of Italy.
Elsewhere; theDanlshkrone
fostgrmmdajidSnishedthe
weekfostwithin itsTScudlver-
ganriff limit.

irlines pilots
By Clay Harris in London and Roderick Oram in New York

September 1,1989

BRITISH AIRWAYS has
received a binding commit-

• meat from the pilots of United
Airlines to remain loyal to the
employee-management consor-
tium which is bidding S6-8bn
for the second largest US car-
rier.

BA would take a 15 per cent
stakein United if the leveraged
takeover offer is accepted by
the non-executive directors of
UAL, United’s holding com-
pany. UAL faces a rival $&4bn
hid from Mr Marvin Doris, a
Los Angeles investor.

. If the consortium bid sue- ,

ceeds. United will become the
largest US company ever to be
rontrolled by its employees.
United staff would own 75 per
cent of the airline through an
employee share -ownership
plan (Esop), a tax-efficient sys-
tem encouraged by the US
Government,
United executives, led by

chairman Mr Stephen Wolf,
would hold the remaining 10
percent
BA’s involvement in the bid

will face close scrutiny from
United’s competitors and the
US Government, even though
the proposed 15 per cent stake
is well below the 25 per cent
maximum holding a foreign
entity can own in a US carrier.
The two airlines already have
dose marketing unite.

WORLD’S LEADING
AIRLINES

' PMnnar fcBomir—

*

IMS Bn
Aeroflot
United
American
-Doha
Continental
Northwest
Brftteb Airways
TWA
JAL

Pan Am
Air Franca

Sown* WTAworM transport ataOgtkK. US

The written commitment
received from United's pilots
ties them firmly to BA.
Mr Piers de Montfort of Mor-

gan Stanley, the US invest-
ment bank which advised BA,
said yesterdays “They will not
do a deal with any third
party."
The pilots’ loyalty is crucial

to the consortium’s hopes for
success. As part of the deal,
the pilots and United’s non-
union staff have agreed to
sweeping changes in work
practices which win save more
than |200m a year.
These savings wifl be applied

directly to finance the S3bn

debt incurred by the Esop to
buy its 75 per cent stake. Most
Esops are funded by payroll
deductions.
The Esop is central to the

financing of the bid. Lending
to Esops attracts tax breaks for
banks, which can offer lower
rates as a result and for the
company itself, which can off-

set interest and principal pay-
ments against income.
The prospect of employee

ownership is also likely to dis-
tract attention freon the poten-
tially contentious issue of BA’s
stake. BA pointed out at the
weekend, however, that as
much as 19 per cent of its own
shares are now held in the US.
Mr Davis’s hopes of thwart-

ing the consortium rest with
wooing the two unions - the
machinists (ground engineers)
and the cabin staff -which
have not yet joined the bid.
United's 25.000 machinists are
particularly antagonistic
towards the pilots and towards
the idea of buy-outs.

Nevertheless, Mr Davis is at
a severe disadvantage. He has
the money to raise his offer
from $275 a share to top the
consortium’s $300 offer and
might get the machinists and
another non-US airline to join

Continued on Page 20
A global future. Page 18; Fj»t,

Page 20

Talking business with Toyota
By-Richard Tomkins in London

THE DECISION by Toyota,
Japan’s biggest car company,
to build its £70Om ($Llbn)
European assembly plant in
Derbyshire, central England,
will have unexpected conse-
quences for tire region's school-
children.
From a date to be fixed, the

county council, which doubles
.as the local.education author-
ity, is to introduce Japanese
studies as a compulsory part of
the curriculum in all of
Derbyshire's secondary
schools.

The lessons will include
instruction in the Japanese
language and an introduction
to the country’s modem his-

tory, with emphasis on the rea-

sons for its post-war rise as an
economic power.
Pupils win also learn about

Japan’s different culture and
values, with teachers unravell-

ing file mysteries of the tea
ceremony, sumo wrestling and
why, for the Japanese, ft is so
rude to blow one’s pose in pub-
lic.

Mr David Bookbinder,
Labour leader of Derbyshire
County Council, says the ded-
skm has been taken not simply
because Toyota is moving to
the area but because of the
other Japanese employers
which are expected to follow
suit
He believes at least 20 Japa-

nese suppliers will move to
Derbyshire on the back of
Toyota’s investment establish-

ing the county as an important
location for Japanese industry
in Europe and prompting other
Japanese companies to move
in.

“There is going to be a mas-
sive influx of Japanese busi-

ness into Derbyshire and it will

have a considerable impact on
this part of the world." Ur
Bookbinder said.

“ft seems sensible that if we
are going to be living and
working with Japanese people,
we ought to be getting to know
about their country and cul-
ture.

”

Sensitive to suggestions that
the move might be seen as
kowtowing to the Japanese, Mr
Bookbinder said the Japanese
would dearly be taking trouble
to learn about western culture.
"It will be very much a
two-way process,” he said.

The Toyota plant, to be sited
near the village of Bumaston,
is expected to begin production
in 1991 and build up to a work-
force of 3,000 over the next two
years.
The investment is expected

to create another 3,000 jobs
among component suppliers.

GrandMet to sell Mecca and
William Hill betting shops
By Vaire88a Houlder in London

GRAND METROPOLITAN, the
UK drinks and retailing group,
is selling its Mecca and Wil-
liam EDI betting shops in a
deal expected to raise at least

£600m ($934m). The group
acquired William Hill only
nfrra months ago.
BrentWalker, the drinks, lei-

sure and property company, is

semi as the most likely buyer
of tbs shops, which, form the
UK’s second largest bookmak-
ing chain. With more than
1,500 outlets, the group has
about 15 per cent of toe UK
off-track betting market, fall-

ing closely behind Ladbroke,
the market leader.

Discussions are also taWng
place with other contenders
which are flwught to include
Mr Bob Green, the former head
erf Mecca Bookmakers.
Mr 'Allen Sheppard, chair-

man of GrandMet; said that no
agreement had been reached
but a further statement was
expected late this week.
GrandMet’s derision to sell

its - bookmaking interests
stemmed from a strategy

review in which it resolved to
concentrate an its food, drink
and eyecare businesses.
GrandMet rfaims to be the

second largest group in the
world in terms erf the number
of retail outlets it operates fid-

lowing recent acquisitions,
such as Burger King, Wiener-
wald and Wimpy.
The funds raised by the sale

will be used to strengthen
GrandMet's balance sheet,
which is thought to show bor-

rowings of about £3.5bn. Its

debts stem principally from its

$5.75bn acquisition in January
of Pfllsbury, the Burger King
group- The company has since

raised $lbn from the disposal

of pillsbury subsidiaries and
r/mrtnTt nhihBj its UK casino
interests.

GrandMet acquired William
HH1 from Sears, the retailing

group, for £3Slm. Mr Sheppard
justified the apparent shift in

strategy by saying the William
Hill acquisition had given
GrandMet the opportunity to

add substantial value to its bet-

ting business.

“The integration of the Wil-
liam Hill organisation and the
Mecca bookmakers is a genu-
ine case of one and one making
three and was essential to
obtain critical mass in a highly
competitive market,” he said.

In addition to the betting
shop outlets in the UK, Grand-
Met is expected to do a sepa-
rate deal concerning its over-
seas outlets whichmake up the
remaining 5 per cent of the
nhatn.

Before the sale is completed,
GrandMet will be obliged to
comply with the findings of the
Monopolies and Mergers Com-
mission, which last month
ruled that GrandMet should
dispose of about 25 shops
mainly in south-east England.

If Brent Walker buys the
shops, the deal would more
tiian double its size and mark a
massive expansion into book-
making. The company’s first

move into the betting business
was made in January when it

bought 119 betting shops In
London and the south-east
from GrandMet.
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MIDDLE EAST
Defence spending
is scaled down
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In the shadow of Lenin: More than 100,000 nationalist demonstrators gather in Baku's main
square, Azerbaijan, to demand more autonomy from Moscow. Report, Page 3

Pretoria may try to reschedule
By Patti Waldmefr in Johannesburg

SOUTH AFRICA might propose accept
a unilateral rescheduling of its He i

debts if creditor banks refuse unlike
to sign a new refinancing seek 1

agreement when the current debts
one expires in June next year, sched

Pretoria’s foreign creditor agreed
banks are under increasing But
pressure from anti-apartheid believf
campaigners to refuse to res- be res
chedule $8bn of debt covered deadli
by the partial moratorium resche
imposed by South Africa in and nc
August 1985. he hop
Mr Chris Stals, the new Gov- such b

emor of South Africa’s Reserve Rani
Bank, the country’s central have a

bank, told the Financial limes pressu
that Pretoria “could take a uni- held k
lateral derision on the matter covere
and say the banks should mediu

accept it”
He implied that Pretoria was

unlikely to default, but would
seek to continue repaying its

debts whether or not the
schedule of repayment was
agreed with its creditors.

But he stressed that he
believed agreement could still

be reached before next year’s
deadline, arguing that the
rescheduling was a technical
and not a political matter and
he hoped it would be treated as
such by the banks.
Bankers say some US banks

have already reacted to public
pressure from the anti-apart-
heid lobby by converting debt
covered by the standstill to
medium-term credits which

allow a five year grace period
on capital repayments. South
Africa included such an “exit
clause” as a voluntary option
in the two rescheduling agree-
ments signed to date.
More may do so as they

come under increasing pres-
sure not to reschedule South
Africa’s debts, or to exact polit-

ical concessions from Pretoria
in exchange for a refinancing.

South African pro-sanctions
campaigners, such as Arch-
bishop Desmond Tutu, have
made clear they are focusing
on financial sanctions. A
recent conference of Common-
Continued on Page 20

No quick fix for economy;
Blacks defy ban, Page 4

The Vital Component
Entering the property

market without back-up

from a professional is like

expecting your car to

perform without its spark

plugs. You're a non-starter.

Look on us as the critical.U
element in your next

property transaction.

We have experts

in planning, V ’

funding and investment
- crucial considerations

without which you could

grind to a halt. Or never

even get

going at alL
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unmatched knowledge
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OVERSEAS NEWS

Right-winger to lead Nicaraguan opposition
By Tim Coone in Managua

THE principal opposition
alliance in Nicaragua, known
as UNO (National Opposition
Union), at the weekend chose a
controversial presidential slate

to fight the ruling Sandinista
party in the forthcoming gen-
eral elections.
Should UNO win, Nicara-

gua's next president will be
Mrs Violeta Chamorro, the
owner of the opposition news-
paper La Prensa. As the UNO
candidate, Mrs Chamorro now
shares its banner with allies of

her husband's assassins.

Her husband was Mr Pedro
Joaquin Chamorro who.

through the newspaper's edito-

rials, fought the right-wing dic-

tatorship of General Anastaslo
Somoza. The dictator had him
assassinated in 1978 but his
murder helped to rally middle-

g
onnd support behind the
t-wing Sandinista guerrillas

who swept to power one year
later Since then the newspaper
has taken a shift to the right

under his widow's tutelage and
become the mouthpiece of the
right-wing opposition, includ-
ing the US-backed Contras.
The Contras were born out of
supporters of the defeated dic-

tatorship.

One experienced observer of
Nicaraguan politics said last
night: “It is as though she is

saying Tny husband’s enemy is

my Mend"’. Her elder son, Mr
Carlos Fernando Chamorro, Is

editor of the Sandinista news-
paper Barricada.
Mrs Chamorro's running-

mate is Dr Virgilio Godoy, the
leader of the Independent Lib-
eral Party (PLI) which until
1984 was allied to the Sandtois-
tas. He challenged the Govern-
ment in that year's elections
from a centre-right stance but
won only 9 per cent of the vote.
His further gravitation to the

right into the UNO alliance
caused a recent split of the
party. It’s centre-left is now
running independently in the
electoral race.

The final choice of the UNO
presidential ticket came after
two days of intense debate and
eight different rounds of voting
between the 14 parties. Despite
the satisfied smiles on Satur-
day night it was only last-min-
ute negotiations which saved
the nomination, pointing to
continuing deep differences.

Mrs Chamorro, who does not
have a party affiliation, was
obliged to read out a prepared

statement In her candidature
acceptance speech, promising
to abide by the UNO electoral
platform if she is elected Presi-
dent next February. Her
adopted platform is as broad as
the main political trends repre-
sented in UNO. It embraces
Conservatives, Liberals, Social
Democrats and even Socialists
and Communists.

Electoral promises include
vague references such as “a
commitment to a social-market
economy”. The pages of her
newspaper, however, have led
tfrg campaign for her candida-
ture and created distrust of her

.

Violeta fiiiawmrm: iate husband’s enemies axe now her allies

within UNO ranks.
Any 'pre-electoral splits in

the UNO alliance wffl guaran-
tee victory for the Sandzrdstas.
They still have a large cushion
of support: they went the 1984

elections with 67 vex cent of

the valid votes cast. The big-

gest, single opposition party,
the Nicaraguan Conservative
Democrats (PGDN), which won
14 per cent c£ the vote in 1984,

is also running independently
of UNO.

Brazil to discuss bank payment
By Stephen Fkller, Euromarkets Correspondent

BRAZILIAN debt negotiators
are due in the US this week to

discuss a threatened $1.6bn
interest payment to commer-
cial banks, due later this
month.

Brazil is unlikely to make a
payment without the promise
of support from the Interna-
tional Monetary Fund. But the
possibility of short-term IMF
finance to help the country
over elections in November
and the takeover of a new
administration is still being
considered by Mr Michel Cam-
dessus, managing director of

tbe IMF.
The assumption is that, if

the IMF provided short-term
help, banks and other lenders
would be wining to amend debt
agreements signed last year to
provide further help. A 5600m
bank disbursement has been
held up by Brazil's failure to

meet its IMF economic targets.

Some hankers claim that
some of Brazil’s short-term
trade and other credit lines

will be jeopardised if the pay-
ment, due around September
18, is not made. Others are
hoping that a partial payment
will be made if fall payment is

not possible.

Mr S&gio Amaral, director

of international affairs at the

Ministry of Finance, and Mr
Arnim Lore, central bank
director responsible for foreign
debt, will visit Washington and
on Thursday will meet com-
mercial bankers in New York.

Brazil last week announced
the exchange of SLlbn of its

external bank loans for exit

bonds under the commercial
bank financing package agreed
last year. The bonds - carry-

ing a fixed interest rate of 6 per
cant, a 25-year maturity and a
10-year grace period before

principal repayments begin to

be made - were issued to 109
bank lenders at the full face

value of their loans.

Chile in stand-by deal with IMF
By Barbara Durr in Santiago

CHILE has reached an accord
for a 395m one-year stand-by
agreement with the
International Monetary Fund,
retired General Enrique
Segue], the Minister of
Finance, has announced in
Santiago.
The minister said the IMF

agreement, as well as other
accords with multilateral
organisations, helped to pave
the way for Chile to use the
Brady Plan for debt reduction.
Given the country's careful

debt management and stable
r, he added that Chile

benefits equal
to or better than the 35 per

cent debt reduction, achieved
fay Mexico, the first country to
time advantage of and In

effect define - the Brady
Han, named after Mr Nicholas
Brady, US Treasury Secretary.

Gen Seguel said; "We must
continue to try to be
distinguished within the
international community as a
separate case. Chile today is

perceived as a secure, reliable,

stable country with a future.”
The technical negotiations

on Chile’s new agreement with
the Fund were finalised in
Washington last week. Chile’s

three-year extended fund
facility with the IMF ran out

last : month. The new
agreement is expected to be
ratified by the Fund's board in
October.
While Chfie met its previous

fond programme targets, it

has been attempting to cool its

overheating economy during
the last five months. Growth
in Gross Domestic Product in
the first six months was .MM
per cent, a level, that was
Considered mumstnlnwMn.
June statistics showed that

cooling measures, including
higher Interest rates and a
speeded up devaluation of the
peso, were begining to take
effect.

Not everyone knows
Texas Instruments

make computers*

Our competitors

might like it

to stay that way*

It surprises many people to find

that one of the world’s leading

electronics companies is also a

computer company with a world-

beating range of com-

mercial minicomputers.

Time after time, the

Texas Instruments 1500

Computer is taking on
big competition - and
winning. Which is some-

thing else our competi-

tors might prefer you

didn’t know.
Why is it winning?

First, there’s TI System V,

our enhanced implementation

of UNIX System V. It provides

facilities usually associated with
proprietary operating systems, yet

loses none of its adherence to

industry standards and supports a
wide range of application software.

Second, there’s the hardware.

Its unique, open, multi-processor

design gives you industry-leading

price/performance. That’s been

’

"i ... •-.iaS'v -S?b.s . . !* jfc'Si?

'

established in independent tests*

and in businesses all around the

world*

This gives your business fast

response time and lower cost

per user. Even better, expansion

from 1 to over 500 users can be

achieved simply by adding more
processors, miniiniai^

,

of growth*.

Third, we have the commitment
to the long-term future

that you dqpend on in a
computer company. After

all, we are a $6 billion

electronics companyn^kir^
computers since 1970;

So now you knowr

.

perhaps you’ll he joining

the 150,CXX) other

businesses yvho have
chosen computers from
Texas Instruments.

Call Christine Langley on Bedford

(0234) 224169 or 224296.

a®

Then 1500 Computer has the following features: • TI System V (AT&T UNIX System V SVID-compIiant) • C, COBOL, Pascal, FORTRAN • Up to twelve 33.3 MHz MC68030 processors •
Up to 288MB memory • Up to 21.4GB mass storage •2GB8mm cartridge tape backup • LAN: Ethernet • WAN: 3780/2780, 3270SNA, X.25, X.40G (planned) • UNIX is a registered trademark ofAT&T
• Ethernet is a trademark of Xerox • "Testa requested by TI and carried out by Neal Nelson Benchmark* (trademark of Neal Nelson fit Associates, Chicago, Illinois) January-March 1909.
©Copyright 1989, Texas Instruments.
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US plans
curbs on
Soviet Jews
By Lionel Barber in

Washington

THE Bush administration, baa
drafted plans to impose curbs

on tbe admission of Soviet

Jews because it fears a wave of

migration following' Moscow’s
ppsing of exit restrictions.

If: Implemented, tbe Plan
would represent; a shift in
tang-standing US policy.
* Previous policy has

.

been to

insist on boman rights
grounds that emigrating Soviet
Jews should have complete
freedom to choose their desti-

nation.
But the US is finding it

increasingly difficult to cope
with the cost of Jewish emigra-

tion which doubled last year to

almost 19,000, and is likely to

rise this year to nearly 50,000.

The most likely alternative

haven for Soviet Jews would
be IsraeL

The draft plans ~ drawn up
by the State Department and
other Federal agencies - are
bound to arouse controversy in

Congress where both House
and Senate members have
sponsored bills to make it

easier for Soviet Jews and
evangelical Christians to come
to the US.
The Administration argues

that the cost of resettlement is

relatively high - about 97,000

per refugee: But officials also

say it is proving more difficult

to show that the Soviet Jews
are political or reHgkms refu-

gees.

The US began to impose
stricter rules on refugee status

for Soviet Jews late last year
when it became clear that Pres-

ident-. Mikhail Gorbachev’s
relaxations were leading to a
dramatic increase in emigra-

Soviet

'

Jewish emigration came dur-
ing the 19708, a period of
detente between Washington
and Moscow. But restrictions

were reimposed and became a
focus of criticism by the Rear
gan administration.

Ethiopian
delegates
to seek
ceasefire
By Palm-RUM, US -

Editor, in Atlanta

A CEASEFIRE in the
28-year-old civil war between
the Ethiopian government and
tbe Eritrean secessionists has
been set as one of the initial

objectives of peace, talks,

starting in Atlanta on Thurs-

day unde*1 the chairmanship of

former US President Jimmy
Carter.
The Ethiopian government

and the Eritrean People's lib-

eration Front have agreed to
meet on an open-ended basis
without pre-conditions, unlike

in previous abortive discus-

sions, in an attempt to end a
conflict which has contributed

to the death of hundreds of
thousands <rf people through
war and famine.
Daring a wide-ranging inter-

view with the Financial Times.

Mr Carter said that while the
outcome was "totally. Unpre-
dictable", he hoped that the
preliminary discussions would
at least decide an agenda, for-

mat, time and place for later

substantive talks.

He hoped that the four- to

five-member negotiating teams
would agree on possible confl-

dence-buflding measures, nota-

bly a ceasefire.

This, he suggested, could
lead to an improvement in
tribal communications and
also to a greater involvement
by international relief organi-

sations.

Former President Carta- win
act as an observer, prodding
over the initial sessions and
keeping a record of proceed-
ings hut not acting as a formal
mediator.
The talks in Atlanta follow a

number of visits by Mr Carter

to Ethiopia ora: the past year.

Both sides expressed an inter-

est in his involvement
The discussions will -be held

at the Carter Presidential Cen-
tre on the outskirts of Atlanta.

This has been closely involved
in atomining civil wars and
gfrnilar domestic conflicts. Mr
Carter chairs the International

Negotiating Network, a private

body backed by the Norwegian
and Swedish governments and
by charitable foundations in
the US.
Monday Interview, Page 34

Post for Mousavi

IRANIAN President AH AKbar
Hasfaemi Raftaqjanl yesterday
appointed former Prime Mini*,

ter kBrHuBSein Mousavi as Us
adviser in *cbhfiessfam: to radi-

cals within the leadership,
Reuter reports tram Nicosia.
The port of prime minister was
abolished by constitutional
reforms endorsed by a referen-
dum held during presidential
elections in July:

SHIPPING REPORT

Tanker demand rising
By Kevin Brown, Transport Correspondent '

BROKERS said the tanker
market afotearad to- be emerg-
ing. from. its. summer, doldrums
last week as demand for Very
Large Crude Carriers (VLCCs)
began to increase, .espedally in
the Middle East Gulf.
Japanese principals were

prominent among those inquir-
ing for tonnage : and rates
appeared likely to move signifi-

cantly up as several cargoes
were fixed to Japan at around
Worldscale 56.

However, Shell subsequently
entered the market for 270,000
tons from the Gulf to Singa-
pore and -secured a re-let at

NWS 45.
- " Elsewhere, demand contin-
ued to be strong for ships of
around Un barms in the West
African loading area# Rates
appeared to have steadied at

around NWS 85 for trifrete the
US Gulf when Shell efeiaed a
ship2^pomtsbelowti^pprevi-
ous set leveL J?*:-:

- Little tonnage was^tinught
to be available for-.jba first

week of September in the
North Sea and owners were
aide to push rates taNWS 145

for coastal movementsofhalf a
million barrel stems, and NWS
130 for trans-Atlantic voyages

.
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Mercedes-Benz win
for the 6th time this season

1st: N0.62, Saaber-Mercedes C9-88, driven by lean-Louis Schlesser and Jochen Mass.

2nd; No.6i. Saufeer-Mercedes C9-88, driven by Mauro Baldi and Kenny Acheson.

(Result subject to official confirmation.)

.

Victory at Donington Park yesterday gave

Mercedes-Benz their sixth win of the season

from seven starts, it also gave the team

a commanding lead in the Group C World

Championship, a model of consistency that

underlines the fundamental strength, durability

and competitiveness of Mercedes-Benz engineering.

ENGINEERED LlK£ No OTHER CAR
In The World.

OVERSEAS NEWS

E Germans continue to flee in hundreds to Hungary
By Judy Dempsvy In Budapest

HUNDREDS (tf EastVGennass
continued to enter. Hungary at
the weekend as the Austrian^
West German and- Hmtgyrfgn
authorities worked overthneto
agree ojq the flnalarrange-
merits for evacuating thou-
sands WhO Still remain irj. the
country.

.
.

-West Gennan pffl8parts wiH
'

today be issued to 4^)00. East
Germans who are.at present in
temporary shelter in finer

.

camps in Hungaiyof which
three are.nmiiy the Interna*
tkmai I&dCroseandtheMal-
tese Cress, ah international
ambulance* and humanitarian
organisation- .

However it remains' unclear

-when and how the East-Ger-
mans will be transported to
West Germany,- said Mr WoB-
gang Wagner, headed two. of
the camps. But Hungarian
Tnedia and dlpTomute garths.

:In addition, .thousands- of
Hast Germans wfll -eitherJbe
allowed toleave tiae countryop
special “permits dir voyages?.
(travelling-perffiite)-vtoich will

be Issued 17 the International
Red (boss.

. : The Hungarian authorities
might also decide to dnm afl

header Testrictions for those
who will leave the country car-

rying passports different from

- those cm which they entered
the country.

Austria, meanwhile, is also
..preparing to drop its visa
requirements for ‘'certain cate-

vgories" of East Gentians, hut
only on a temporary basis. -

The decision by Hungarian
authorities could eventually
amount to the largest single
esodua of East Germans to the

. West since the Berlin Wall was
built in 196L -

OfBcialfi.at me of the camps
in Budapest, which is run by
the Maltese Cross, also con-
firmed yesterday that scores of
East Germans crossed from
Czechoslovakia into Hungary.

'

However, Maltese Cross offi-

cials believe that the pressure
on the camps will soon be
lifted, now that the school holi-

days in East Germany have

Last week, 200 Bast Germans
a day ware arriving at one of
the camps in Budapest The
figure peaked to 300 on Friday
evening. Ninety more arrived
yesterday, all seeking refuge
and asking for West German

Although there are 4,000
East Germans in the camps
officials reckon that between
15,000 and 20,000 will try to
emigrate to the West
Their fate, however, has

received little sympathy from

the East German authorities
who have sharply criticised
West Germany and particu-
larly Hungary ter not repatriat-

ing the refugees.

They quote a bilateral agree-
ment signed between East Ber-

lin ana Budapest in which
Hungary was obliged to send
back East Germans caught
escaping to the West

"Because Hungary ealrier
this year signed the United
Nations convention on refu-

gees we will adhere to it" a
Hungarian official said.

It is that convention which
thousands of East Germans
have now put .to the test

Moscow Ligachev
plans $66bn calls for
import: drive crackdown
THE SOVIET Union is
importing more, than $66bn
worth of food end consumer
goods to honour the pledges
which helped bring an acid to
July's national , miners’ strike.
Radio Moscow said yesterday.
Beater reports (ram. Moscow.
Mr Suren Sarukhanbv, dep-

uty Trade Minister, was quoted
as saying that major contracts
had been signed with foreign
flmw.

The announcement as
the government newspaper,
Izvestia, reported that petrol
bad joined a long list of items,
including meat, salt sugar,
already in short supply.
“Mr Sarukhanov says more

than 43bn roubles (gram) have
been allocated to buy food and
other commodities abroad,”
Radio Moscow said.. <

. “Most of the money has
already been spent' This' has
made it possible to -increase
Imparts of food Jar the ntiners

of Kuzbass, Donbass and Vor-
kuta where there were m***

A Preach businessman
involved in cue of the deals
said he believed Sovietauthori-
ties were in a hurry to con-
chide the imports, partlctdariy
of clothing and footwear,
before winter.
July’s coal strikes, which

swept from the Siberian Kuz-
bass to pits In the Ukraxdan
Donbass and Vorkuta in the
for north, highlighted « rapid ,

deterioration in the supply of
food and other goods across'
the country.

MB ?egar Ligachev, a leading
conservative fo. the FoHtouro,
Vm aAmandftd pflum action
against nationalists, who have
flourished under Moscow’s

alflH^lgh fly 'jpiwit.

mentmust nbtheiepsssivB or
dictatorial, Reuter reports
from Moscow.

. Short of brute force, how-
ever; It is nuclear how the
Kremlin con halt nationalist
unrest to qanMm repub-
lics, especially Lithuania,

.

Estonia and Latvia, where it

has become respectable to talk
about outright independence.

Mr -LigacKev’s comments,
afaed on national television,

.

fallowed a stnrilar call for
action against nationalists by
former KGB. chief Viktor Che-
firikov on Friday and a central
committee statement which
denmoicedBaltic "eartreadsts”.
Despite the warnings* lead-

ers .of mass political move-
ments in sill three republics
said they would pursue pro-

.
grammes 'to loosen or oat ties
with the Soviet -Government.

Baltic party leaders Issued
conciliatory statements aimed
at plaimting the Kremlin, but
thoe were dear signs they
would not side with Moscow
against any movements Jar
autonomy.
- In Lafvi& the Popular Front
.saH yesterday the movement
idammd to ptibBsh in the next
Sew .days a new draft pro-
gramme which would address
pimsIMe secession from the
Soviet Union.

Azerbaijan gears up for

week long general strike
Passions are inflamed and independence is the cry
on many lips, writes James Blitz from Baku

VIEWED from the roof of The strike is being called to nists. Eight months later, the
thehotel Azerbaijan on protest about everything. The curfew is still in force betweer
Saturday evening, the Azerbaijani Popular Front lam and 5am. Everywhere.VIEWED from the roof of
the hotel Azerbaijan on
Saturday evening, the

city of Baku was crying out to
be painted by same old master.
Dominating the right of the

picture was the Caspian Sea,
shimmering in the heat and
stretching out to dozens of oil

rigs that mean hard work, in
Baku and hard currency in
Moscow.
In the foreground 100,000

Azerbaijani men and woman,
tightly packed on Bain’s colos-
sal main square.
Backs to the sea, their eyes

and arms were raised towards
the podium. Each new speaker
from the "rwrffvriaT Azerbaijani
Popular Front received a roar
worthy ofa Cup Final goal.

In the for left comer, tower-
ing over the podium - though
no one seemed to notice him -
was Lenin, a goliath-sized
statue, furiously pointing at
some spot for out in the Cas-
pian. He seemed to be yelling:

“Stop this nationalist nmmgnge
and get back to work on those
oilrigs!”
But to no avail The demon-

stration was a warm-up for a
week-long general strike which
starts today.
' It is the firsbever all Repub-
lican work stoppage in the
Soviet Union. The rigs wfll be
empty. The cost in lost produc-
tion prodigious.

The strike is being caned to
protest about everything. The
Azerbaijani Popular Front
seems to have as many
demands as supporters: it

wants to be legalised by the
local communist party, it

waists economic sovereignty,
and of course, it wants Azov
baijan to' have Nagorno-Kara-
bakh returned.

gwrahflirh is inside the Azer-
baijani republic, but is now
deemed a special territory,
effectively ran by Moscow, to
protect the local Armenian
population.

Karabakh is our pure
territory”, says Mr
Ehtibardar Mamedov,

one of the Front's leaders. “We
don’t want Moscow interfering
with it”
But on Saturday night the

anger over Karabakh seemed
to be lost amidst tiie cries of
fadapwidflTinfi for all Azerbai-
jan. “Down with Moscow!
Down with dictatorship!”
An iwAqiPiylfgnt state fa what

many people were cheering fin*.

And they will continue to
cheer for it unless the authori-

ties muffle the cheers first

.

No one dares to ignore the
possibility of repression. Last
December, -Soviet troops
brought two weeks of demon-
stration in Baku to an end by
arresting most of the protago-

nists. Tft'ght months later, the
curfew is still in force between
lam and 5am. Everywhere,
skinny Russian militia men
wield enormous back-up.

Glasnost has not yet come to

Azerbaijan’s press. The local
Tass correspondent seems the
most dejected man in town.
“Need any photos?" be moans.
“There's no way our office in
Baku will use any of this dem-
onstration stuff."

Nevertheless, beneath the
surface, the local party does
appear to be adopting a more
conciliatory policy towards the
popular front
But there are plenty of hard

liners around.

Mr Zvyad Zamebadze, the
central committee secretary, in
charge of the economy, bravely
stood at the back of the popu-
lar front podium on Saturday
and held a quite, impromptu
chat with a few western jour-

nalists.

Tm telling you bluntly," he
said. "This strike won't suc-
ceed. They’ll get no support"

It is a million pities for him
that he was overheard.

Within a second, & rousing
speech had been interrupted.
In another second the hapless
party man’s views were being
belted out to the 100,000. In

.

Baku, they know how to boo as
wefl as cheer.

Congress to

press Bush
for Polish

aid boost
By Peter Riddell and
Lionel Barber in

Washington

CONGRESSIONAL leaders will

this week press President
George Bush for ah expanded
programme of US assistance to

Poland.
The Bush administration is

considering an increase in the
already announced $50m in

food aid ter Poland, possibly by
as much as another $30m.

However, the president has
so far moved slowly on
requests from Warsaw for an
increase in help above the
$ll9m In industrial ami envi-

ronmental aid he announced
when visiting Poland in July.

Mr John Sununu, White
House chief of staff, echoing
the administration’s caution,
said Poland’s problems would
not be solved in one fell swoop.
As Congress returns this

week from Its month-long
recess, momentum is growing
for a more adventurous US
response to political changes In
Poland, notably the coming to
power of a Solidarity-led Gov-
ernment since Mr Bush’s visit.

Several leading members of
Congress, in particular Sen
Robert Dole, the Republican
Minority leader, have visited
Warsaw in toe past few weeks
and have returned urging fresh
support Sen George Mitchell,

the Democratic Majority
leader, has called for “a com-
prehensive plan” to help
Poland. His staff later
explained that this should
involve not primarily more
cash, but food aid, debt
rescheduling and technical aid
for restructuring the economy.
There is considerable reluc-

tance to pour a lot of money
into Poland, not only because
of US budgetary constraints,

but also because US legislators

are pessimistic about the
short-term state of the Polish
economy and industry.

At the end of last week Pres-

ident Bush told reporters at his

holiday home in Maine that
the administration would be
working during the coming
week to speed an emergency
shipment of food to Poland.
The US is also seeking to

hasten agreement on the
rescheduling of Poland's S39bn
of official debts by the Paris

Club of creditor nations.

ITALIAN MINISTERS TO MEET

Scandal grows

BNL Iraqi loans
By Alan Friedman in Milan

MR Nerio Nesi, chairman of

Banca Nazionale del Lavoro
(BNL), Italy’s biggest bank, is

to hold a series of urgent meet-

ings this week with Govern-
ment ministers in Rome to dis-

cuss the widening scandal over
more than $i.5bn of unauthor-
ised loans dispensed by the
bank’s Atlanta, Georgia,
branch to US and European
companies exporting industrial

and agricultural products to
Iraq.

BNL has steadfastly denied
that any of the exports
included armaments or weap-
ons related equipment. The
hank has also denied it risks

any loan write-offs as a result

of the Iraqi affair because part
of the credits were guaranteed
by the US Commodity Credit
Corportion (CCC) and toe rest

by Iraq’s Cenral Bank.
In the US, Moody’s, the rat-

ing service, has placed toe Ital-

ian bank on its “credit watch"
list

BNL’s top three executives
have meanwhile been des-

patched to BagtThadj New York
and Atlanta in order to coordi-
nate the international investi-

gation, which now involves
officials from the Federal
reserve, the Bank of Italy, the
FBI, the District Attorney’s
office in Atlanta and a Rome
Investigating magistrate. The
Italian bank has also decided
to reorganise toe management
of its North American
operations.

In Rome, the Italian Central
Bank is monitoring the BNL

affair in order to ascertain
whether the US CCC guaran-
tees will remain valid.

The BNL-Iraqi export loans

were made through toe issue of

2,500 letters of credit issued
over toe past two years by toe

Italian bank’s Atlanta branch.
Many of the credits were
issued without the authorisa-

tion of BNL's head office for

North America in New York.
Among the companies believed

to have benefited from the
export credits were numerous
grain shippers, major US cor-

porations including at least
one Detroit-based car group
and at least a dozen Italian

companies. It is not known
why Italian companies would
go to the Atlanta, Georgia,
branch of an Italian bank to

seek export credits for Iraq.

The BNL affair first came to

light early last month when
the FBI informed the Federal
Reserve that it was looking
into possibly irregular dealings

by BNL's Atlanta branch. Mr
Chris Drougoul, toe 35 year old

French-Algerian manager of
BNL's Atlanta branch who has
been suspended by the bank,
has been questioned by toe

local authorities and the Fed-

eral Reserve.
Mr Nesi on Saturday

repeated toe bank's denial that

any illegal arms shipments
were involved. The BNL chief

also said that it was too early

to estimate the exact size of

toe bank’s overall exposure,
but he insisted that Iraq would
honour all payments.

Budapest reform plan
IN WHAT is seen as a
‘desperate attempt to regain the
confidence of the electorate
before next year’s free parlia-

mentary elections, Hungary's
reformers yesterday agreed a
package of measures for the
party congress next month,
Judy Dempsey reports from
Budapest.
The measures, involving

reform of property rights, toe
economy and party structures,

j

were adopted after a meeting

|

in Budapest of the “Reform

Circles" - liberal party mem-
bers inspired by Mr Imre
Pozsgay, tipped to be Hunga-
ry’s next president.
But while the Circles, which

so for contain 1.000 supporters
from the 740.000-strong party,

sought a coherent programme,
it became clear party members
know they could face defeat in
free elections.

Mr Rezso Nyers, party chair-

man, warned any attempt to
persuade electors to vote for
the party would not be easy.
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Blocks
om

By Jim Jones in Johannesburg

SEVERAL thousand black
South Africans thronged Dur-
ban's white beaches and pad-
dled in the Indian Ocean yes-

terday in peaceful defiance of
apartheid. The protest con-
trasted with Saturday's march
in Cape Town in which 500
people were arrested and
marchers dispersed by police

armed with water cannon and
whips.
Breaking the Cape Town pro-

test has presented the govern-
ment with a dilemma. Police

action risks alienating black
leaders whom it hopes to bring
into talks after Wednesday's
general election. But a less

forceful handling could
exploited by the ultra-right
Conservative Party (CP).

The cabinet is reported
divided on the issue. Mr Bar-

end du Plessis, the Finance
Minister, said “chasing people
off beaches was a mistake". He
was referring to events a fort-

night ago when police drove
blacks from white beaches in

Cape Town. About 1,000 people
were arrested nationwide on
Saturday for participating in
the defiance campaign of the
Mass Democratic Movement
(MDM), though most demon-
strations were peaceful.
Yesterday, police units did

not intervene to prevent blacks
from using Durban's whites-
only beaches, though several

demonstrators were detained

when their protest spilled over
into a beach-front road.
On Saturday, the police set

up road blocks to prevent dem-
onstrators travelling into Cape
Town to join a march on par-

liament. The march was halted
in the city's central Greenmar-
ket Square as police dispersed
marchers and sprayed them
with purple dye. They arrested
people marked by the dye.

In Soweto, a protest planned
for the township’s Jabulani
Stadium was stopped when
2,000 people were turned away
by army units. In central
Johannesburg yesterday, an
MDM meeting planned for the
city ball did not take place.

Beuter adds: Workers
removed Whites Only signs
from parks in a South African
town this weekend after a
landmark court case ruled
them illegal. Legal experts say
the decision marks the start of
the end for the Separate Ame-
nities Act, a pillar of apartheid.
The signs came down ahead

of a deadline imposed by the
Pretoria Supreme Court on
Carletonville Council, con-
trolled by the extreme rightist

Conservative Party (CP). Hie
court had ruled council duties
extended not to whites only,
but to the entire community.
Carletonville was thus negli-
gent in its trusteeship of the
public interest by excluding
blacks from the park. A South African police water cannon drenches demonstrators with identifying purple dye

No quick fix for ailing South African economy
Bankers fear renewed foreign borrowing is a distant prospect says Patti Waldmeir

HENDRIK VERWOERD, the architect
of "grand apartheid" in South Africa,

told whites in the 1960s they must
choose between being pure and poor or
mixed and rich.

Twenty-odd years later, as voters go
to the polls in Wednesday’s general
elections, that choice is probably no
longer open to them.
Few economists would disagree that

Dr Verwoerd's apartheid policies were a
major cause of South Africa's economic
decline. But just as few believe that
abolishing apartheid would, on its own,
bring prosperity.
Ending apartheid would faring many

economic benefits: cheaper imports, bet-

ter technology, a halt to the brain
drain. But no one can be sure that Pre-
toria's estrangement from the interna-
tional financial community - which
suspended new lending to South Africa
after Pretoria imposed a partial debt
moratorium in 1985 - would end at a
stroke with the demise of apartheid.
Shortage of new capital is the single

most important factor restraining
growth in South Africa.

The banks did not halt lending to
South Africa because they objected to
Pretoria’s morals: they did so because
political instability made them reluc-

tant to put large amounts of capital at
risk in South Africa.

In the near term, foreign banks are
coming under increasing moral pres-
sure from shareholders not to roll over
outstanding loans to South Africa, or to
exact a high political price tor doing so.

As the focus of the international sanc-
tions lobby shifts to bank lending, that
pressure can only increase.

By the middle of next year, South
Africa hopes to have rescheduled some
$8bn in debts covered by the partial

moratorium. Supporters of sanctions
are determined to disrupt or prevent
the rescheduling.
Whether or not they succeed the

odds, at the moment, are that the hanks
will withstand the pressure and con-
clude a third interim agreement with
Pretoria by June 1990 - economists
fear that resumption of new lending to
South Africa could still be a distant
prospect.

“If the government continues to
resist the final abolition of apartheid,
then South Africa will be denied new
capital because itisrefusing to reform,”:
says one economic analyst in Johannes-
burg. “And if they do reform - and even
bring in majority rule > then bankers
would be wary of the new government
until it proved that its politics and eco-
nomics made it a good credit risk. That
cannot be done overnight."
Meanwhile, shortage of capital places

intolerable curbs on economic growth
in a country whose African population
is rising by 3 per cent a year. By the
year 2000, South Africa win be a nation
of 47m people. Economists applaud
improvements in government economic
management - and in private sector
efficiency - in recent years, but
acknowledge that providing a
decent standard of living to 47m

people will be a struggle.

Mr Chris Stals, the new Governor of
South Africa’s Reserve Bank says the
country needs economic growth of 5-6

per cent a year to keep pace with popu-
lation growth. -Without saw capital,
Pretoria might manage 3-4 per cent
yearly growth. But while exporting cap-
ital at its current rate - Ri5bn worth
foreign debt has been repaid since 1985,

and a further RIObn has left the coun-
try through other channels - the .upper
limit on growth would be nearer 2 per
cent, he says. , . .

He stresses that South Africa has
done all it can to keep its image as a
reliable debtor. The first mid second
interim rescheduling agreements, cov-
ering August 1985- to June 1990, have
been followed, at high cost to economic
growth and Irving standards.
“We have faeen- able to survive the

balance of payments crisis of the past
four years,” says Mr Stals. “But it is

very frustrating to use the whole of the
surplus on your current account just to
repay debt."
“And we are still on thin ice,” Mr

Stals adds. He says it will be difficult

for South Africa to generate a surplus
on the current account of the balance of
payments ofmore than R6bn next year -

just enough to finance expected capital

outflows.
Repayments of both rescheduled debt,

and other foreign debts maturing in
1990, would total about J2bn next year.

And a further $L5bn will fall due in
1991. To generate the current account

Vietnam rejects

political reform
NGUYEN Van Linh, the
Vietnamese leader, has
rejected any multi-party sys-

tem and the hastening of dem-
ocratic reform in his country,

AP reports from Bangkok.
Speaking about sweeping

changes in the communist
world. Mr Linh emphasised in

a 10,000-word speech that lib-

eralisation would come in the

economy rather than in politi-

cal life.

“It is not our policy to has-

ten renovation of the political

system while preparations are
still inadequate," he said. “Nei-

ther is it our intention to effect

limitless democratisation."
Mr Linh, regarded as an eco-

nomic reformer, was speaking
at a meeting in Hanoi to mark
Vietnam’s National Day.

Japan detains Chinese
from refugee boat
By Robert Thomson in Tokyo

JAPANESE police detained 31
Chinese yesterday and were
searching for more members of

a refugee boat found anchored
near Nagasaki, while other
Chinese facing deportation
claim they will be arrested and
executed on their return to

China.
The Chinese arrested yester-

day bring to almost 500 the
number of Chinese nationals,

some posing as Vietnamese ref-

ugees, to have been detained in
recent weeks by Japanese
authorities, who have begun
negotiations with the Chinese
government for the return of
virtually all those in custody.

Police were told by one of

Guangdong trade official

sacked for Corruption

the 31 Chinese that they paid
just over 512,000 for passports,

none of which have the Chi-
nese government seal required
to make them valid, on the pre-

sumption they would be per-

mitted to stay in Japan and
work would be easy to find.

Hie surge in Chinese arriv-
als has prompted Japan to
screen all boat people for the
first time, and this will be
intensified in a fortnight, when
a distinction will be made
between economic and political

refugees from Vietnam.
One group of 160 Chinese

ruttinnaifi said they had paid
bribes to police before leaving
Fujian Province, in the south.

A SENIOR foreign trade
nfBdal in China’s Guangdong
Province was sacked for cor-

ruption yesterday, the latest

high-level victim of a nation-
wide crackdown, Reuter
reports from Peking.
Xu Yunian. director of the

province's foreign economic
relations and trade committee,
was dismissed for “squander-
ing, and abusing power for per-

sonal gain”, according to the
official New China News
Agency.

k

It said Xu had spent
HK$228,000 (£18*500) to import
a luxury car and a similar
amount to buy and lease
mobile telephones for his own
use.

He also allocated himself a
huge flat and arranged for it to
be decorated on the cheap, the
agency said. It did not say
whether criminal charges
would be brougfat, but said he
was still under investigation.
Guangdong, which, borders

the British colony of Hong
Hong, is China’s wealthiest
province in terms of foreign
trade.

• AP adds: Passenger fares
on Chinese trains, aircraft and
ships will roughly double
tomorrow, to pay for badly-
needed renovations and expan-
sion. Train tickets will go up'
from Yuan 0.02 (05 US cents)
per pereon-MLometre to at least

Yuan 084.

surpluses needed to make those repay-
ments, Pretoria must suppress eco-
nomic growth to keep imports to a level

which would not strain the balance of

payments.
Mr Stals says the economy is already

slowing: GDP growth of 32 per cent in
1988 is expected to fall to no more than
2 pa cent this year. The anti-inflation

campaign he announced last week
(which calls for the continuation of
restrictive fiscal and monetary

,
policies

to combat inflation expected to peak at
near 17- per cent later this year) may
well suppress growth further.

Mr Stals predicts GDP growth of 2 to
2J5 per cent next year, but he.acknowl-
edges this may be overoptimlstic; pri-

rate economists say 0-5to-l- per emit
]may be more realistic.
I

Employment-wilt inevitably suffer,

especiaHy *aanJhg blacks; But though
j

Mr Stals concedes, that low, growth
j

might exacerbate township unrest, as it

did in the mid-1980s, he asks, “what
Mud .of unrest would you have If you
had 30 or 40 or 50 per cent inflation?"

In the longer term, Mr Stals atgues
that South Africa must become self-suf-

ficient in financing domestic growth:
that means government must stop bor-
rowing domestic savings to finance cur-
rent spending; positive real interest
rates must be maintained to encourage
saving; and productivity must be
increased through improved training.

It is a tall order. But in the short to
medium term, it is difficult to see that
Pretoria has any alternative.

US battle

for Seoul
$3bn fighter

contract
By Maggie Ford in Seoul ’

TWO US defence contractors
are vying for a S3bn contract to
equip South Korea with a new
generation of jet fighters, in a
deal which will boost the coun-
try’s aerospace industry. -

For several years, the Seoul
Defence Ministry has been
Inspecting the respective mer-
its of the F16

,
made by Gen-

eral Dynamics and the F/A 18
(Hornet) made by McDon-

,
nell-Dougias.

A decision has been delayed
for political and technical rea-

sons,but an announcement by
Mr Le8 Sang Hoon, the Defence
Minister,

made in Washington
last .month suggested -the
award was imminent .

The contract, known as the
Korean Fighter Programme,
will Involve co-production of
120 jet fighters and the transfer

of technology to several South
Korean companies such as the
.Samsung. and Daewoo groups,
along wlth Korean Air.

The companies will not be
involved' in joint design devel-

.

opmenfc as under the US/Japa-
hese FSX: fighter deal, where
the fate of US technological
advances became a political

issue in Washington.
The South Korean Air Force

already has .36 Fl6s, which
have a 2S per cent price advan-
tage over the McDonnefl-Doug-
las product, andDaewooHeavy
-Industries, a local aerospace
manufacturer, already manu-
factures parts for the fighter.

General Dynamics stresses

its fighter’s advantages on
pricejogistical inter-operahility

with the present capability of
the US Air Force, which has a
large number of F16s stationed
in South Korea, cheapness to
run, and proven ability under
local conditions.
McDonnell-Douglas argues

that its more recently devel-

oped fighter, which is capable
of operating from aircraft carri-

ers, is more advanced, and
with its two engines, compared
with one on the F16, is likely to
be more cost effective, espe-
cially during peacetime.
The South Koreans have pre-

vious experience with the older
F4 Phantom, also developed by
McDonnell-Douglas which is
now being phased ouL
The- Defence Ministry is

likely to make the award on
the basis- partly -ef-how they
see the future defence needs of
tfae .country, and partly on the
basis;ogefiset proposals. Devel-
c|&^a]^wo^Eiace industry is

arntyTJbraty goal of the South
Korean Government, and both
US companies have developed
detailed offers as partuf their
hid.
Seoul wants to obtain manu-

facturing technology, manage-
ment expertise and design and

!

development ability for its <

local companies under the con-
j

tract, with a view eventually to
]

becoming self-sufficient In its
!

-defence needs and perhaps an
important exporter. .

General Dynamics has a
high opinion of the South Kor-
eans’ ability developed during
the current FX parts-making
programme, noting that Dae-
woo Heavy Industries had
developed some innovative
techniques in setting up the
factory to manufacture the F16
parts .

Under their proposed hid, 72
of the 120 fighters would he
produced under licence in
South Korea, with 86 assem-
bled from kite and 12 mad? la
the US. The company la also
offering to help Seoul with the
design of trainer aircraft
- McDonnell Douglas believes .

that the - South Koreans win
gain more from the production
of the F/A 18 because of its
more advanced technology,
especially in composite materi-
als and crew station design.
Both companies are offering

indirect offset contributions
including technology transfers,
and other industrial participa-
tion, formerly very important
in South Korean defence deals,
but now. less. so. as the country
becomes an industrial power.

Gandhi accused of

cover-up in Bofors
payments affair
By David Homegd in New Delhi

UNEXPECTED disclosures by
one of India's most senior gen-

erals have provided evidence to

suggest that Mr Rajiv Gandhi,
the Prime Minister, was
directly involved in a
“cover-up” of the Bofors

' affair

. General K. Sundaiji, former
chief of the army staff, said he
had urged in 1987 that India

threaten to cancel the contract

with Bofors; the Swedish arms
group, for a new artillery gun
to force it to reveal to whom
illicit commissiohs'.had been
paid.

In an interview with India

Today magazine; General Sun-
daiji - who was head of the

army when the contract wa?
signed — said he told the Gov-
ernment that if cancellation

resulted in a two-year delay
while purchase of. other, artil-

lery was negotiated, fids was
an “acceptable" risk to
national security.
- la the wake of this advice,

the Defence Ministry prepared

to threaten Bofors with cancel-

lation to extract the details.

But according to the General
this ‘approach .was abandoned
in July 1987 after direct

intervention from the Prime
Minister.

“Yohra (then additional sec-

retary for defence) told me that

thi HM lit into him for adopt-

ing a threatening approach
towards Bofors to force them
to come out with the informa-
tion,” General Sundaiji said in

the interview. “Vohra came
back from the meeting (with

the Prime Minister) somewhat
disgusted and I - believe he
booked calls to Before to tell

its officiate not to come.”
The General's account runs

counter to earlier statements

by Mr Gandhi asserting that

the Defence Ministry had told
him that a cancellation would
jeopardise national security.

Mr V.P. Singh, leader of the
Opposition, yesterday called on
President R. Venkataraman to
“advise" the Prime Minister to

rerign because of alleged "bla-

tant untruths” over the Bofors
deal he had told in Parliament
and outside. Craning close to

sumrating that the Prime Min-
ister had personally benefited^

Mr Singh said that Mr Gand-
jji's intervention to block the
cancellation of the contract
showed “he was --deeply inter-

ested In the Bofors kickback

issue."
The disclosures went with-

out response from the Govern-
ment whose tactics now would

to be to stonewaIt until

tiie election due by fhejeud of

the year. The risk -for Mr
Gandhi, who left -Delhi yester-

day for thenon-aligned confer-

ence in Belgrade, must be that

other more ' embarrassing
details will emerge before then.

In the interview General
Sundaiji called on Mr Aran
Singh, Defence Minister at the

time, to speak out as welL Mr
fifngh

J a former close friend of

Mr Gandhi, resigned, without
explanation in 1987 shortly

after the pressure on Bofors
was lifted.

The General’s disclosures

come as the Opposition is con-

sidering how to follow up its

partially successful national

strike last week aimed at build-

ing up popular pressure
against Mr Gandhi. Among fur-

ther measures they are consid-

ering are a civil disobedience

campaign and farther strikes

at local or state teveL

Among details that emerge
from General Snndaiji’s
remarks - the first time a for-

mer head of the army has ever

take issue with a Prime Minis-

ter of tiie day in such fashion
— is confirmation that the pay-

ment of commissions cm arms
and major public contracts in

India is the norm. He said:

“Generally many Governments
have been getting a percentage

of many of these huge deals,

whether defence deals or other-

wise, perhaps for party funds. I

don't think this is a new phe-

nomenon.”
In a revealing passage of the

emotional strain the contro-

versy over the Bofors issue has
caused him, the General said

at one point to his interviewer:

“You don't know how much
better I feel for having told you
everything:” . General Sundaiji
has oftenbeen- accused of hav-
ing supported the purchase of

ike Bofors gun to please life

Prime Minister.

Egypt sentences 26
Moslenimilitants
^^M^WaflcerinjCmr^

AN EGYPTIAN court at the
weekend sentenced 26 Modem
militants to long periods in jaff
in a continuing crackdown on
dissidents of both the left and
the religious right, thousands
of whom have been detained
this year. . .

The government's campaign
against dissent appears to be
part of a far reaching and
determined attempt to. crush
any hint of political opposition
that might develop into a
threat to public order at a time
when thp authorities are seri-

ously concerned about prices
rises and unemployment
Dr Ismail Safari Abdallah, a

leader of Egypt's broad left
Tugammu or- "rally” Party,
yesterday accused the govern-
ment of staging a preemptive
"coup"- against leftists, includ-
ing two prominent - human
rights activists who have been
detained under tha country’s
emergency law.
A Western official; whose'

brief is hrmonitor - political
developments in Egypt, said it

.

seemed, that the government
was "cracking down on every- :

body these days, right, left and
centre". . . .- .

-Observers believe that the
authorities, who have been
engaged toa remorseless, cam-
paign against Islamic extrem-
ists, have also' decided to .con-
front .leftists following a
serious; strike at the Helwan
Iron and Steel works late in
July, which restated hr the

death bf one of the workers
when pohee stacmed the prem-
ises.

'for the. past month the secu-

rity traces have:
• Arrested 41 Shiite Moslems
accused of plotting a coup in
Egypt;
• Detained 15 members of the
mainstream Moslem Brother-
hood, including a prominent
wn»TUhpr pfparifgmwrf, accused

- of recruiting and indoctrinat-

ing children at a summer
camp,
• Arrested a large number bf

.
alleged leftists, including com-
munists. Among those arrested
were a lawyer and a researcher
attached to the Arab Organisa-
tion for Human Rights.
• Continued their harassment
of Mawrift groups agitating for
the introduction of Islamic law
hr Egypt.
Human rights groups are

demanding the release of Mr
Amir Salem, a human rights

lawyer, and a researcher, Mr
Mohammed el-Sayed~3aeed.
The US-based Human Rights
Watch called last week fra- the
."unconditional release of the
two men as long as they are
not charged with an offence

- that is recognteably criminal".
- Among tire 26 Moslem mili-
tants sentenced yesterday on

. charges of fltfaaniiKng to mur-
der two former ministers of the
interior and a journalist, five

received life with hard labour.

..
.Two of the five woe tried in
their absence.

Japanese and US officials today begin a difficult new round of trade negotiations. Ian Rodger looks at the complaints raised hv «arh side
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WHAT WASH INGTON WANTS
1. Land use. Low property tax
and exemption from succession
duties on farmland promote
hoarding of land and discour-

age its sale, exacerbating short-

ages in urban areas. This is a
financial barrier to foreign
businesses seeking premises.
2. Savings. Japanese house-
holds saved 15.1 per cent of dis-

posable income in 2987, com-
pared with 6.3 per cent by US
households. High savings were
encouraged when Japan was
rebuilding its economy. Now
they largely reflect lack of
opportunities to spend money,
especially as many people can-
not buy homes because of high
land prices. The US claims this
discourages consumption,
including sales of imported
goods.
3. Distribution. Japanese
industry developed in a pro-
tected environment and manu-
facturers formed close,
long-term links with domestic
distributors and retailers.

These relations are cemented
in various ways, including

ownership ties and inventory
finance for retailers. It has
thus been difficult for foreign
manufacturers to arrange dis-

tribution of their products,
regardless of price and quality.

In one notorious example, most
shops selling electrical goods
are affiliated with one or more
of the big domestic manufac-
turers. They would not con-
sider selling foreign appliances
for fear of offending their sup-
pliers. Car dealers have also
refused to offer imported lines.

4. Exclusionary business prac-
tices. Bid rigging is common in
the construction industry and
cartel arrangements are toler-

.

ated in many sectors and
encouraged in a few.
5. Retail pricing. As a result of
exclusionary practices, Japa-
nese manufacturers have usu-
ally kept their domestic prices
significantly higher than their
prices overseas. The US com-
plains that the higher margins
cn domestic sales enable them
to be more competitive in for-

eign markets.

Spectre of sanctions haunts talks YQ WANTS
SENIOR Japanese and US
government officials begin
today in Tokyo the first round
of what will be perhaps the
most difficult and dangerous
bilateral trade talks they have
ever undertaken.
The talks, which have been

given the awkward title of
Structural Impediments Initia-
tive, or sn. are aimed at noth-
ing less than changing the way
the economies of the two coun-
tries work.
Yet the US side, impatient

with Japan's persistent large
trade surpluses, wants rapid
and substantial results, while
the Japanese side, weakened
by political turmoil at home,
may be unable to take even
minor action in the short term.

If that turns out to be the
case, the Bush Administration
could come under heavy Con-
gressional pressure to impose
sanctions on Japan next spring
under the so-called Super 301
clause of last year’s Trade Act.
a move which could badly sour

bilateral relations in generaL
Hie SH initiative was pro-

posed last May by the Adminis-
tration as a way of avoiding
sanctioning Japan under Super
301. However, the two sides
have agreed to produce an
interim report on sn in the
spring, just as the deadline for
ripgiriiMg on action under Super
301 occurs.
Even if the Japanese Govern-

ment was not politically weak
at home, the negotiations,
which are to take place at two-
monthly Intervals for a year,
would be difficult, in the past,
trade talks between the two
countries have always been on
specific subjects and there has
been general agreement on the
issues involved and often on
the objectives as welL
For example, the yen-dollar

talks, started in 1984, were
aimed at deregulating Japan’s
short-term money markets.
Both sides agreed on the issues
and on the ultimate objective.

The only points of difference

were on the best timing of the
deregulation process.

In the SU talks, the subject
matter is vast, as can be seen
in the issues raised in prelimi-
nary papers submitted by the
two sides. It will take some
time for them just to find out
which ones are the - most
important to the other.

. Ultimately, the two may
share the same objective —
having their economies work
better - but the potential for
disagreement oh how to get
there seems considerable.
• Moreover, most of the issues .

axe highly political, so the offi-

cials involved, senior as they
may be, will probably not be
able to commit their govern-
ments to winrfi.

It is difficult to see what the
US wants or expects from the
talks. Behind weir demands
for rapid and substantial
results, US officials know that
nothing they are asking for
will have a big impact on the
bilateral trade, imbalance in

the near term. They have
admitted that more than
three-quarters of the imhniaw»
is caused by macroeconomic
factors, especially the US bud-
get deficit.

As for the rest, if Japanese
exports to the US were sud-
denly curtailed, most would be
replaced by imports from else-
where. Xf the many structural
impediments to Japanese mar:

kets were suddenly removed,
countries other than the US
would' probably be better
placed terexploit the opportuni-
ties created.

. The Japanese interest in SH
is clearer. For one thing

, if the
initiative succeeds in driving
away the spectre of Super 301
sanctions, that is all to the
good, in the Japanese view.

Also, despite their com-
plaints, Japanese officials
having foreign pressure to
remove protectionist practices
because it gives them some-
thing with which to attack
powerful vested interests.

! l. . Savings rate. Both at
government.; and. personal
levels, the US is not generating,
enough savings to finance its
spending. Policies for
promoting savings and discour-
aging consumption ghnnid be
studied.

- 2. Corporate investment and
mamfactuting strength. The
supply of long-term investment
capital for industry is inade-
quate and its cost is high.
Foreign direct investment is
helping to improve US manto
factoring strength, so ttshould

_not.be discouraged.'
3. Corporate culture. Perfor-
mance is hindered by the pre-
occupation of many companies
with short-term profits; direc-
tors’ remuneration and share-
holders' dividends. The prolif-
eration of leveraged buyouts
ahd hostile takeovers detracts
from attention, to the business.
US manufacturers also lack
Interest in exporting and are
not given enough encourage-
ment by the Government.
-4. Government regulations.

Export controls are excessive,
especially on sales of alleged
strategic goods to communist
countries. US government poli-

cies giving preference to
domestic goods have ,

removed
the need for US manufacturers
to be competitive in some sec-
tors and caused prices to rise.

Anti-trust laws hinder competi-
tiveness of US companies in
some sectors.
5. Research development.
The Government should pro-
vide continuous assistance pro-
grammes. Better communica-
tion, is. needed between the
R&D effort and the running of
businesses. The Inhibiting
effect of anti-trust laws on co-
operative R&D projects should
be examined.
6. Manpower education and
training. Confusion exists
between public and corporate
rofes_The harfn education sys-

tem needs to be improved and
more emjdtesfe{daced on. voca-
tional training. Training in lan-

guages of priority export cram-
tries should be encouraged.
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Howe remains determined
to influence Government

TUC CONFERENCE Strike vote mf\\0

By Philip Stephens, Political Editor

Willis predicts era
of union ascendancy

SIR Geoffrey Howe, the deputy
prime minister, yesterday
underlined his determination
to remain an influential force

in Mrs Margaret Thatcher's
Government after his forced
move from the Foreign Office

In July’s cabinet reshuffle.

In his first interview since
his appointment as Leader of
the House of Commons and
Deputy Prime Minister, Sir
Geoffrey made it clear he
envisaged an “active and inde-

pendent role” in shaping poli-

cies in the run up to the nest
general election.

He sought to downplay his
differences with Mrs Thatcher
over her insistence he should
make way as Foreign Secretary
for Mr John Major, bat added
that he still saw himself as a
candidate for the future leader-
ship of the Conservatives.

Sir Geoffrey's comments.

which included a number of
references to the importance of
key decisions being folly
debated in Cahfnet, will rein-

force the view at Westminster
that Sir Geoffrey is determined
not to be brushed aside by the
Primp Minister.
The interview came against

the background of two new
opinion polls showing the
Labour Party retains an 8-point
lead over the ruling Conserva-
tives and amid continuing
grumbling among the Govern-
ment's own supporters about a
number of its policies.

His remarks may rekindle
concern among backbenchers
about the potential for internal
conflicts at the highest level of .

the Government if Mrs
Thatcher is unwilling to dele-

gate significant authority to
Sir Geoffrey.
Despite suggestions from

Downing Street - the prime
minister's official resi-
dence - that bis designation
Deputy Prime Minister was

By Charles Leadbeater and John Gappcr

likely at
Rolls-Royce
and BAe

purely a courtesy title. Sir
Geoffrey emphasised he hadGeoffrey emphasised he had
now plana to take a backseat
or subservient role.

He will chair a number of
key cabinet committees,
including those planning the
legislative programme and
adjudicating in public spend-
ing disputes. Yesterday he
insisted that the scope for
potential conflict with the
Prime Minister had been
greatly exaggerated by the

He acknowledged, however,
that Mrs Thatcher had "strong
views’* and "a strong sense of
purpose” and said that he did
not doubt that, as in the past,

they would have some differ-

ences of view.

Ferriday ‘plans return to UK’
BY Richard Tomkins, Midlands Correspondent
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MR John Ferriday, the man at
the centre of the Eagle Trust
affair which is under investiga-

tion by the Serious Fraud
Office, was yesterday said to be
pfenning to return to Britain to
give his version of events.
Mr Ferriday, chairman of

Eagle Trust until June, went
overseas last month «Tmd pub-
licity over tiie auditors' diffi-

culty in tracing about £13.5m
of Eagle’s funds.

Eagle’s new chairman, Mr
Malcolm Stockdale, had earljHr

called in the Department of
Trade and industry to investi-

gate the whereabouts of the
£13.5m. The DTI passed the
case to the Serious Fraud
Office.

Mr Ferriday, 45, reportedly
told the Sunday Telegraph at

the weekend that he was earn-
ing back to Britain "to set the
record straight"
He was also reported as giv-

ing a comprehensive explana-
tion of how the £13.5m was
used to finance the purchase of
Eagle’s own shares following
the collapse of a £21m rights

issue in the October 1987 crash.
Under the Companies Act a

UK company cannot legally
purchase its own shares except
under certain clearly defined
circumstances. These include
the requirement that share-
holders receive prior notifica-

tion and give their explicit
authority, and that each such -

transaction is reported to the
Stock Exchange.
The suggestion is Mr Ferri-

day brought in friends and

associates to sub-underwrite
the 1987 rights issue, but when
it flopped, many of them were
unwilling or unable to meet
their commitments.
In an attempt to save the

situation, the interview says,

arrangements were made for
Bagle to loan funds to Connect,
a parcels company later to
become an Eagle subsidiary.
Connect passed them to
another company eaTteri Auto-
motive Industries (UK), and
that company used the money
to take up the rights from
Savory Milln, the stockbroking
subsidiary of Swiss Bank Cor-
poration that organised the
tights.

Mr Ferriday is reported as
accepting all responsibility for
the arrangements.

MR NORMAN Willis, general
secretary of the Trades Union
Congress (TUC), yesterday
delivered an upbeat assess-
ment of-the union movemmi’s
prospects, -declaring that the
political and economic tictohad
turned in its favour. .. .

On the eve . of the TUCs
annual conference in Black-
pool, north west England, Mr
Willis said there whs a new
mood of confidence in the
union movement winch would
mark the end of ton years in
which the unions have been on
the defensive.
After a decade in which the

unions have been hit by tough
Government legislation, high
unemployment, employment
growth in- nonunionised sec-
tors and more assertive man-
agement strategies, the unions
lwfl now Sia foundations
for significant membership
growth in the next few years,
Mr Willis said.

He said 1989 might be
regarded as a filming point for
the unions because over the
summer several unions have
taken .successful industrial
action without felling foul aS
tits few;or losing public sup-
port :

-

Mr .Willis was bouyed by

By Cluules LswAwater,
Labour Editor

wmtic in optimistic mood

opinion polls published in two
.Sunday newspapers which
should a majority believed
unions were essential to pro-
tect people at work.
A Mori poll in the Sunday

Hines found 58 per cent ofpeo-
ple blamed managers for eco-
nomic problems, but only 19
per cent blamed unions. For
the first time since Mini

started the question in

1975, a majority said unions did

not have too much power.

A Gallup poll in the Sunday
Telegraph found that only 14

per cent of people thought the

Government’s union legislation

had not gone far enough, while

32 per cent said it had gone too

. ."Mr Willis said the unions

were ready to launch a recruit-

ment drive, especially among
. part-time, women workers in
fh«> service sector, which would
create a 'tidal wave of trade

'unionism.'
Mr Willis said he was confi-

dent Congress would today
- approve bis proposals to

reform the membership erf the

TUC general council, despite

the opposition of .a group of

large left-wing unions.

Rolls-Royce and. British
Aerospace (BAe)*.-'two of
Britain’s leading engineering
groups, seem Increasingly
likely to face strike ballots
called by engtneexfes. unions
in tiie next stage of their cam-
paign to wfci a reduction in the
working week to 85 hours. .

The two companies have
emerged as leading candidates
for ballots on strike action
after a series ofmass meetings
addressed by onion leaders
over the past month.
The programme of meetings,

several of Which attracted
thousands of workers, was
designed to rally support for
the Confederation of Ship-
building and Engineering
Unions’ campaign to. win a
four hour cut in the manual
workers’ working week and a
two and a half hour cut for

white-collar staff.

The unions have made 12
companies In the Engineering
Employers Federation targets

for possible ballots. But onion
officials report the strongest
response has come from work-
ers at Rolls-Royce and JBAe.

Shop stewards from the two
companies are expected to
meet engineering unkin lead-

ers an Tuesday before a final

decision is made.
It is likely the unions wifi,

aim at a central plant in each
company, where industrial
action would quickly bring
other plants to a halt by stop-

ring the flow of components.

Unit says women may
lead casual workforce
By Jimmy Bums, Labour Staff

It’s the best possible catch. A great return on

your investment.

And that’s the only catch there is.

With HALIFAX DEPOSIT INTERNATIONAL there is

simply no need to go fishing around For a better investment

There is no time limit on your investment and you

can have instant access with no penalties.

WOMEN could become the new
casual workforce of Europe fol-

lowing the creation of a single

market in 1992 unless urgent
measures are taken to safe-

guard their rights, according to
the Low Fay Unit, the research
group.

In a report published today,
the Unit states that Britain haft

spearheaded a deregulation of
labour ' markets which is

spreading rapidly across Conti-
nental Europe and could
become the norm after 1992.

It argues that in the name of
flexibility, women are Increas-
ingly being employed on a
part-time, temporary or casual
basis, as homeworkers or on a
variety of new types of con-
tract which "erode their rights

as employees.”
Drawing on a comparative

survey of conditions in Britain

and The Netherlands, the
reports concludes that flexible

working is associated with loss
of benefits, insecurity of
employment, low pay, and
exclusion of legal protection
which is available to Adi-time
permanent employees. ~

-

The TUC .Congress is due
this week to debate a motion
cafiing for a Europe-wide
action to improve working con-
ditions. for women both in the
office and at home.
• What Price Flexibility? The
Casualisation of Women’s
Employment. Low Pay Unit, 9
Upper Berkeley Street, London
WlH 8BY. (Price £3.00p)

ping the flow of components.
Union leaders believe both

companies would be under
pressure to concede a reduced
working week as they have
strong order books. They
believe the mounting1 pressure
of the campaign, combined
with skill shortages, prompted
Rolls-Royce last month to pay
ah 8.9 per cent itferoase to
workersatlts Bristol plant.

The ofiler companies which
have emerged as the most
likely targets for action are
Lucas Industries and GEN, the
components suppliers. A strike

at .either company would
threaten components supplies
to the car industry and other
mapitfapinriug companies.
Some nffloiiifa of the AEU,

fixe union leading the cam-
paign, axe pressing for targets
for strike action to be
announced this week. However
Mr Bill Jordan, the AEU presi-
dent, said it was likely the
unions would wait until at
least next week, when they
will have the details of how
modi money has been raised
through a membership levy.

HALIFAX JERSEY-BASED INVESTMENT. Suppliers face shortage of Chinese nuts

HIGH INTEREST. INSTANT ACCESS. SO WHAT’S THE CATCH? B’ RtehardDon,[,n

You can have UK standing orders and direct debits.

And monthly interest can be paid into UK bank accounts.

Being the Halifax you can obviously expect highly

competitive interest rales. And being offshore you can get

interest with no UK tax deducted.

Your sterling investment can start with a minimum

of £1,000 at the substantia] rate of 11.00%.

From there the interest rate automatically rises on

the whole investment as your balance steps up as follows.

BRITISH industrial suppliers
are feeing a shortage of hexa-
gon nuts caused by a squeeze
on supplies by China, the larg-

est exporter.

According to one distributer
supplies of steel hexagon nuts
began to dry up last November
when deliveries became
increasingly erratic. «

Imports have now slowed to
a trickle and some distributers,

faced with & ran on their sup-

plies, have introduced ration-
jug.

Several factors are thought
to have affected supplies. The
Far East is suffering a steel
shortage and since China boys
steel with dollars but sells nuts
to the UK in sterling it has
found the margms so tight it

has not been worth exporting
to the UK.
- A cnriency shortage has also
cut into China’s steel buying

which may have had a knock
on effect on the industry.
Hong Kang which finances

some Chinese industry is also
believed to be using financial
mnscle to exert pressure on the
Chinese Government following
the prodemocracy massacre in
Tiananmen Square.
The shortage follows a

period when the price of basic
steel hexagon nuts had steadily
faTfen

AMOUNT £1,000+ £10,000+ £25.000+ £50,000+

INTERESTRATE 11.00% 12.00% 12.60% 12.85%

11.50% 12.36% 13.00% 13.26%

THE GOLDEN KEY TO
INVESTMENT IN THAILAND

Interest ratesmay varysoyou can call ourHalifaxJersey

Hotline on (0) 554 59840 for up to the minute information.

This great investment opportunity is only open to

those not ordinarily resident in the UK.

If this includes you and you would like to open an

account, simply send us the completed coupon below.

Once you’ve got your hooks into this investment

opportunity you can just sit back and reel the money in.

1 To Halifax Building Society, International Investment Unit, Ingouville 1

. House, Ingomffle Lane, St. Heller, Jersey. Channel Islands. .

lAVe enclose a cheque/money draft No.

(minimum deposit £1;

I/We are not ordinarily resident in the UK. Please send the declaration

form forthepaymentofgross interestI/Wewould like the interest to be:

Added to balance Paid half-yearlyQ Paid monthly
Or please send me Tull details of HALIFAX DEPOSIT INTERNATIONAL

Full Name (Title) Tel No

Nationality Date

This sura is being invested in HALIFAX DEPOSIT INTERNATIONAL by
me/us as sole/foint beneficial ownerfs).

Signature(s)

M1/077/10

'NcvJr?

Golden oppor-

tmrilirg await fiuv

sighted investors in ;

one of die most dynamic and
fastest growing economies in
the Asia-Pacific region,

Thailand .is today

synonymous with high-tech,

labour - intensive manafacta*

Thailand's Board of
Investment has been aasnmiiy
a major role in- - attracting

overseas financing and invest-
ment. Its liberal policies will

make sore that investors enjoy
mhhA operational mana-
gement and aazuram

| __
THE WO R L D * S NO

J |

Halifax Building Society. International Investment Unit,

Ingouville House. Ingouville Lane, Si. Heiier, Jersey, Channel Islands.
Fax No: 0534 59280 Telex No: 4192384

<r —-&S

ring facilities. The a
country's • 4j*e enterprise ri

system ensures dud develop- ti

ment takes" place at a rapid S
pace. One principal advantage
over, others developing. p
countries is the abon-
dance and diversity

of Thailand’s natural indTLjj
human resources. • ftej

Why not come and
meet with senior representa-
tives of the BOI in London
*nd Glasgow to discuss wide
«nging investment oppor-
tonWes in Thailand on
September 13-15, 1989.

For further information
please contact or write tos

1 Office of the
Board ofinvestment

Interest is paid twice yearly. piinR a higher compounded annual rate (C-AA*) IT left Inlsa for

the whole year. Copin of the last audited accounts ore mailable on request. Halifax Building

Society's registered ofllre Is In Halifax. LX. Rates are correct al tbne ofgoing to press.

Office of Board of Investment, 555 Vipavadee Rang* Road, Bangkok 10900, ThaW.
'

.
Tel: (662} 1704400, Fax: (662) 271-0777.

Qvoseas Offices; Zurich Tel: (01) 221-2320, Fax: (01) 2114180
:

CBI/femdoa-Nkii Cann Td: (01) 379-7400
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at two south east plaints
By Terry Dod»worth,Jndustriat Editor

STC, THE ,CK_ filtsctrortles

group, Is to make TOfrworkerc
redundant Tn fl. rffHrinaBwtir^ .'

caused by theLshift from tele-

communications product man-
ufacturing to Increased emjdMK
sis on software and services*.
Two sites, New Boaifagate in.

North London jimlHairiitfan -fw

Essex, win be affected. Most of
the jobs will be lost at New"
Southgate, where SOaminufeo-
turing employees ant ofa1

total

workforce of ZfiOO, are to be
made redundant.

1 A farther 100 workers from a
staff of 550 will lose their jobs
at Basildon. -

' STC*s move follows a wave
of rationalisation in the TWftaW
electronics industry this year
as companies have responded,
tp the steady rifling in manu-
facturing content in their prod-
ucts. The rapidly, inm-wnfing
use of components,' such -as
microchips and fibre optic
cables, means that production
lines use less space than in the
past and demand fewer work-
ers to operate them.

Investors paid
compensation
under scheme
By Richard Waters

CLIENTS of three failed
investment firms have been
paid compensation out of the
rnvestor Compensation
Scheme, set up almost exaetiy
a year ago under the Financial

*

Services Act
In-all, 257 clients of the firms

— Bowers Cadte, E. J. Collins,
and Greenan Investment. Man-
agement - have received
£865,542, an average of £3,368.

. Most of the money <£608£02)
was paid to clients of E.J. Col-
lins, the stockbroking firm that
went into liquidation in March.
More than 200 Other- nTfeyita

of the three firms will also
receive compensation once
they return their claim farms.
There is also a "significant
number 1

* of others whose
claims are more complex or
have been .received only
recently, according to the inde-
pendent management company
which runs the scheme.
Compensation covers the

first £30jQ00 off a loss and 90 per
cent of the next £20,000.

, Those trends were behind a
dedstom-by lCL, the computer-
manufacturing -subsidiary of
STC, to launch a similar rear-,

ganis&tfon in March thi« year.
‘ Closure of the company's two'
Letchworth plants in Hertford-
shire results hf 500 redundan-
cies, _as manufacturing was
concentrated at Ashtan-tmdar-

' Lyne in Greater Manchester,
and Kidsgrove, near Stokeon-
Trent
_ Ferranti, one .of the UK's
leading defence electronics

,
groups, has also announced a
wide-ranging rationalisation

: this year with th&dosure.ofits
civil- computer-maimfactrffing

~ piemf near Mandififltec '

.Other restructuring moves
have occurred"at RacaU. the
defence and telecomnnmica-
.tions group. and GPT, one of
Britain’s leading telecommuni-
cations companies, which
announced 700job losses at its

planit ln Aydiffa County Dur-
ham, in'July.
, Several -of those companies
wm benefit from the reorgani-

sations as spare land is
released for redevelopment It
jfe expected, tor instance, that
STC will be able to redevelop
about 32 acres at its New
Southgate plant, valued at
approximately £30m.
STC said yesterday it would

be concentrating its manufac-
turing resources in future at
its Monkstown plant in North-
ern Ireland and Treforest, In
South Wales, both of which
benefit from lower production
costs than the south-east of

Parts of the New Southgate
and Basildon sites will be
maintained for development
and pre-production work, stra-

tegic planning and procure-

The company emphasised
that, in spite of the closure, its

order book in telecommunica-
tions is continuing to rise. The
orders derive largely from the
company’s new high-speed
transmission systems, which
are replacing its output of the
older generation of equipment.

Lloyds Bank report backs
idea of pollution tax
By Ralph Atkina, Economics Staff

FURTHER hai-iring far taxes on
pollution-generating products
comes today in a report pub-
lished by Lloyds .

A report by Mr Patrick
Foley, aeprafy. chief

adviser at the bank, suggests
labelling and fating1 goods
according to the amount of
environmental damage their
production or consumption
nmnwH ..

The report follows a govern-
ment .study published last

month by - Professor David
Pearcie,,flpedfll adviser to Mr
Chris Patten,- Environment
-Secretary, ‘ which proposed
"pollution” taxes to preserve
the environment
The Lloyds Bank report says

pollution taxation would cor-

rect, rather than create, mar-
ket .distortions. It would mean
the price erf goods reflected

fhebr environmental cost and
would encourage research, into,

methods of reducing pdfintian.

. Taxes could be maced on
goods such as electricity.
r.hAmirfllR and pharmaceuti-

cals, which generate pollution
in their manufacture, as well
as goods that cause damage
when consumed - such as pet-

rol, chemical fertilisers and
some aerosols.
Mr Fafey says VAT could be

cut to compensate for the extra
revenues from pollution taxes.

That would, he suggests, also
reduce the Inflationary impli-
cations.

Pollution taxes should be
made obvious to the consumer
and easy to understand, he
says. By levying taxes at the
consumption stage, the impact
an the UK’s competitiveness
would be minimised because
imports would be subject to
the same penalty as domesti-
cally produced goods.
However, Mr Foley says, the

adoption <rf such taxes by the
entire European Community
would be “greatly preferable.”

Being economical with the
environment. Economics
Department, Lloyds Bank, 71

Lombard Street, London EC3P
SBS.

UK NEWS
Optimism
in business

improving,

IoD says
By Alan Pika

GENERAL OPTIMISM about
the economy has increased
among business leaders during
the summer although their
main concern is still insuffi-

cient demand, according to an
Institute of Directors survey.
Mr Peter Morgan, the insti-

tute’s director-general, said
the survey results indicated
that business had so for expe-
rienced a gradual deceleration

of economic activity from the
boom conditions of a year ago,
rather than the hard landing
Hint many had feared.

“In the light of these fig-

ures, we can see nothing in the
present situation which should
make the Chancellor change
either his short-term monetary
policy or his lang-texm fiscal

stance of reforming the tax
system through tax reduction
to create a low-tax, high-
growth economy.”
The survey shows that 18

per cent of directors inter-
viewed In August were more
optimistic about the UK econ-
omy than they bad been six
months earlier. Another 29 per
cent felt about the same.
In the institute’s June sur-

vey, only 8 per cent were more
optimistic. Exaetiy half those
interviewed in August were
tom optimistic ftm they had
been six months earlier, but
that compares with the 84 per
cent who had been less opti-

mistic in June.
As to whether directors

were more or less optimistic
about prospects for their own
companies, the survey dis-

closes littie change in thinking
dnririp Mm summer.
Of the sample, 46 per cent

said they were more optimistic

about company prospects in
Angnat, against 47 per cent in
June. The ratio feeling less
optimistic dropped from 28 per
cent in June to 23 pear cent in
August.
Insufficient demand -

which replaced labour supply
as the chief business concern
among directors at the time of
file institute's April survey -
is shown as a growing worry.

It was expected to be the
main cause of concern during
the next stac months by 28 per
cent of those interviewed, com-
pared with 22 pear cent in both
June and ApriL

Fickle fashion kicks up a trend
Alice Rawsfhorn on the recent resurgence of a 70s cushion-soled cult

T HE SCENE is Solaris, a
London night dub, on a
Sunday night A young

man Jg dawning tO the JlQUSfi

music that throbs out from the
sound system. He is wearing a
long T-shirt, loose track pants
and a pair of brightly coloured
boots called Kickers.
Kickers have become the

shoe to wear in London dubs
this summer. They were last

popular in the late 1970s but
fell from favour in the early

1980s. The current craze for

house music — and the fashion

for the sports clothes worn by
New York street kids in Brook-
lyn and the Bronx - has made
them fashionable again.

Pentland Industries, which
holds the licence for Kickers in
the UK through its AIrboume
Footwear subsidiary, noticed a
sudden surge in sales last
autumn. It has been struggling
to satisfy demand ever since.

The shoes originated in the
France of the eany 1970s, when
a company called Rausaust
introduced a new style of
brightly coloured, soft-leather
shoes and boots.

Kickers have since appeared

in tliffetent designs in various

countries. The British version

has a leather “flower”, embla-

zoned with “Kickers”, tied to

the left shoe; together with a
red tab on the left foot and a
green tab on the right

In the late 1970s, Kickers
were popular with the sheepish
sort of students who wore dun-
garees and duffel coats.

By the mid 1980s the market
had shrunk to the faithful few
who bought Kickers, probably
as a memento of their duffel-

coated university days.

Last autumn, however, Pen-
tland noticed that orders for

Kickers were rising rapidly.

The new orders came mainly
from shops in London that had
not bought Kickers before.

By this summer. Kickers had
become a common sight on the
London club dancefloors. Afi-

cionados bought extra leather
flowers so they could tie five or
six at a time to their laces.

Kickers, selling for £40 or
£50, have achieved the same
cult status in London as high-
performance sports shoes, or
trainers, in -New York.
As the summer progressed.

Pentland - which is also a big

shareholder in Reebok, one of

the biggest US sports shoe
companies - received new
orders from the North, the
Mifiianrta and Scotland. Sales

of Kickers are now three or

four times higher than at the

same time last year.

The immediate task has been
to find enough Kickers to fill

Pentland’s principal

concern is that the

Kicker craze might
well disappear as

quickly as it began

Pentland’s bulging order
books. Pentland nas commis-
sioned extra production from
Morocco, where Kickers are
made; but it has had difficulty

securing sufficient supplies of
raw materials and triznmings.

Piracy is also a worry. As
soon as Kicker sales started to
rise, cheap “copycat” products
came on to the market
Pentland has stopped selling

the extra leather flowers to
prevent its competitors from
buying them to pass off their

fake Rickers as the real thing.
But the principal concern for

Pentland is that the Kicker
craze might disappear as
quickly as it began.

The company is working on
new styles and new colours to

sustain demand, but the prece-

dent set by Griggs, another
British footwear firm, is far
from reassuring.

Griggs has been making Dr
Martens, the classic British
working shoes, for decades.
Two or three years ago. Dr
Martens suddenly became fash-

ionable.
The same shoes that had

been sold to London construc-

tion workers for £20 were being
snapped up at smart shops in

Tokyo for £100. .

Griggs boosted output to
meet the sudden surge of
demand - but the orders from
the smart Tokyo shops have
started to £alL Now Griggs has
been forced to adapt to a new
environment where Dr Mar-
tens are no longer quite so
fashionable.

Doubt over electricity emissions clean-up
By Maurice Samuelson

BRITAIN’S £lbn programme to

combat power station pollution
is in doubt because of confu-
sion over how to finance it

after the electricity industry is

privatised.

Work has started at only one
power station, the 4,000 mega-
watt plant at Drax, North
Yorkshire, accounting for only
a fifth of the whale clean-up
programme. No firm decisions
have been taken about the
work to be carried out at other

Mg coal-fired stations to meet
international deadlines.

Under an ambitious Euro-
pean Conmumity plan accepted
Last year, the Government
undertook that emissions of
sulphur dioxide (S02) should
be reduced progressively over
the next 25 years to only 40 per
cent of the 1980 level by 2003.

The sulphur emissions are
thought to cause widespread
“add rain” damage to forests

and plant life to northern
Europe and North America.
Britain's clean-up pro-

gramme is the latest casualty

of the prolonged impasse in
negotiations between the elec-

tricity generating companies
and the regional distributors
about their trading arrange-
ments after privatisation.

The same difficulties,

centring on the' contracts for

bulk supplies from power sta-

tions, have already threatened
to delay by at least six months
the flotation in the 12 distribu-

tion companies of England and
Wales and caused the old Mag-
nox nuclear stations to be
withdrawn from the sale.

It has also led to the Shelv-

ing of the generators' plans for

three large, environmentally
dean coal-fired power stations.

The generating companies
have told the Government that
cutting contracts for power sta-

tion output to a maximum of

five years instead of 15 win
give them insufficient time to

underwrite the heavy cost of
fitting flue-gas desulphurisa-
tion equipment to coal-fired

stations.

Moreover, if the individual
power station had to bear all

the additional clean-up costs,

as the Government currently

appears to require, it might

lose business to an older,

unconverted power station,
thereby defeating the whole
purpose of the investment

Several alternative ways of
financing the clean-up pro-

gramme have therefore been
suggested. The generating
companies say that since
everyone will benefit from it,

the electricity users should
meet its cost
That could be spread across

the whole electricity industry

by adding it to the cost of
using the transmission system.

It is also suggested that the
distributors would be obliged

to buy the power from the sul-

phur-free plants in the same
way that they will have to take
supply from nuclear stations.

Above all, however, the Gov-
ernment is being urged that
contracts of at least 10 years
should be permitted for all the
coal-fired power stations which
would be modified to meet the
dean up targets.

That is particularly attrac-

tive to British Coal, which is

fighting to secure long-term
guarantees for its market in

the face of threats from
cheaper imports.

Once the clean-up pro-
gramme is clarified, it would
lower the asset value of the
power stations prior to their

privatisation, but it would
remove an important element
of uncertainty for potential
investors.

The Government, for its

part, says that the whole issue

is still subject to negotiation

and that no decisions have yet

been taken.

Drax power station, the only
plant where large-scale anti-

pollution work is in progress,

belongs to National Power, the
larger of the generating compa-
nies to be carved from the Cen-
tral Electricity Generating
Board.

PowerGen, its competitor, is

expected to confirm In a month
that it will instal de-sulphuris-

ers at two of its biggest plants,

including the 2,000 MW Rat-
cliffe station in the Midlands.
However, no contracts will be
let until it knows how they
Will be financed.
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Paris Bourse -A major

European stock exchange.

. When the Riris Bourse decided to expand its services

to meet growir^demand fa Prance, they chose Northern

|
network.

f - ^ith tfas sysfera, the brokers, .dealers and agents

I fradingoatheEaiiangec^

j|
to accurateandup to date infonnatkxi and maintain constant

~ contact%rifrsharehoki^lmksaftdstockmarketsworldwide.

In Canada we’ve been setting the pace for over 100 years.

In the USA we’re an industry' leaden

InJapan we’re the only foreign switching supplier to the public telephone network.

And in Europe, were the market leader in digital PBX and packet switching, working uith national

partners to build a European community'.

In fact, we’re at the forefront in exploiting digital technology And now we’re developing this technology

to take telecommunications into the next century

Northern Telecom. The power behind communications across 5 continents and in over 60 countries.

"V
i

The thrust behind NASA’s

data network.

Tb carry the vast amount ofdata from its computer

network to desktops throughout the Ames Research Center,

NASA setectedalforthemlfelecomintegi^ network system.

It links the widest variety ofterminalsofany PBX.lt

opens access to the krai network of supercomputers, main-

frames and minicomputers, it even reaches data on NASAk

nationwide computer nowoik.
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The worlds largest

telephone company.

When japan's enormous public telephone network

needed new community dial offices, they wanted foe most

advanced equipment available.

That’s why they called on Northern Telecom - the

corporation that has built the largest base of digital

swhdiingsystems in servicearound the worid.

S.WI.ET. - the world’s largest

financial services network.

^hen the Society for Worldwide Interbank Financial

Telecommunication deckled to mine to packet pitching tech-

nology it turned to Northern Telecom.

On completion ofits enhanced network in lQou-lMl.

no fewer than 2.6(h) financial institutions mover wi countries

will be constantly linked. And every day over one million

messages will pass between them.

^0»lherllTd«MEwvU«» 44 (0)753®^ Sorthtm Telecom Co*H 49 40)6966970; NTMerWanM-U 1 49 07 2* 2*- ret
northern
fcfeeom
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;her-education funding ‘is down9

By David Thomas, Education Correspondent

PUBLIC SPENDING on higher
education has fallen further in
Britain in the 1980s than in
almost all other industrialised
countries, an independent
study for the Organisation for
Economic Co-operation and
Development has concluded.
The unpublished study looks

at changing patterns of finance
in higher education across the
OECD, the Paris-based group of
industrialised nations. It was
prepared by Mr Gareth Wil-
liams, Professor of Educational
Administration at London Uni-
versity's Institute of Educa-
tion.

The report is to be debated
at a three-day conference
starting today in Barcelona,
jointly organised by the OECD
and the Council of Europe.
Reviewing spending patterns

in 13 OECD countries, the
study concludes: "Countries

where higher education has
apparently had the least
favourable treatment in recent
years are Denmark. [WestJ Ger-
many. the Netherlands and the
United Kingdom.”

Critics of the UK Govern-
ment’s policy towards the uni-

versities and polytechnics are
likely to seize upon that con-
clusion.
However, other aspects of

the 90-page report confirm
arguments used by ministers
to defend their policies, partic-

ularly on student loans.

The report cites figures
showing that Britain has the
most generous financial sup-
port for students of any coun-
try in the study, but that is

coupled with low- participation
rates in higher education.
“The British system of rela-

tively generous grants for all

students on traditional higher

education courses is not well
suited to mass higher educa-
tion," the report concludes.
Moreover, even after the

recent financial squeeze, total

spending per student in British
universities is higher than in
any other country, except in
private US universities, the
most prized sector ofUS higher
education.
The report shows that most

OECD countries have cut
fhnds to higher education in
the 1980s. Japan and Spain
were the only countries to
escape such cuts in the decade
up to the mid 1980s. Only
France and Finland are pre-
dicting increased public spend-
ing in the sector in the foresee-

able future.
The study also points to

widespread interest in introdu-
cing more private funds Into
higher education.

Scandinavian countries led
the way in the recent introduc-
tion of student loans, although
there are now fears that they
might be deterring some poten-
tial students from higher edu-
cation. There is a general
desire for more business fund-
ing of higher education,
although the report suggests
that Britain has gone relatively

far in this direction.

A paper prepared for the
conference by the Council of
Europe questions whether the
US derives clear benefits from
devoting a larger proportion of
national income to higher edu-
cation than most European
countries.
However, it also notes there

are few reliable comparative
figures on higher education,
although it costs almost $100bn
(£64bn) a year in the US and a
trimfiay amount in Europe.

Market research services up 8% last year
By Christopher Parkes, Consumer Industries Editor

UK SALES of market research
services grew by 8 per cent in
real terms last year, continu-
ing the strong expansion since
1982. according to the Associa-
tion of Market Survey Organi-
sations.

Growth has been helped by
increased demand among com-
panies other than consumer
goods Tnanufaoinrerg — tradi-

tionally the principal users of
the service.

Non-consumer research
accounted for 60 per cent of
turnover last year against 48
per cent in the early 1980s.

Combined turnover of the
association's 31 members rose
to £206m last year, accounting
for about three quarters of the
industry's sales.

Food and soft drinks manu-
facturers formed the biggest
single client group, paying
£32.5m during the year to
investigate the rapidly chang-
ing habits, dpmanric and lifes-

tyles of consumers.
However, television and

other media companies came
second, with £20m. Govern-
ment clients spent ca.gm-

Most surveys among con-
sumers were devoted to market
measurement, developing and
testing products and monitor-
ing advertising, while most
non-consumer work studies the
retail and wholesale trade.

AMSO Handbook 1989190.
AMSO, Iiux House, 60 Eerdl-
worth Bead, Leamington Spa,
Warwickshire CV32 6JY.
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Light industry.

DIY retail

sector ‘faces

slowdown in

growth rate’
By Maggie Urry

A GLOOMT outlook is

predicted for do-it-yourself
retailers, suggesting that the
Dr? market growth rate will
slacken after the rapid expan-
sion in most of the 1980s.
The report, by economic

forecaster Staniland HaU, sug-
gests that DIY spending has
been boosted by rising owner-
occupation, particularly
through council house sales. It

expects the growth rate in the
DIY in&rket to fall to 16 per
cent fit the seven years to
1994, compared with 25 per
cent in the previous seven
years.
"A aouch must come sooner

or later in the Cast-growing
DIY retail sector,” Staniland
Hall says, adding that it is

probable tat the early 1990s.
The leading retailers have

achieved growth rates Caster
the market as a whole,

aided by acquisitions. It is

expected to slow down, how-
ever, and the six largest retail-
ers are likely to see their sales

growth converging with, that
ofthe sector as a whole.

; The Do-It-Yourself Market to-

1994. From Staniland HaU
Associates, P O Bar 648, Alder-

burp House, Upton Park,
Slough, SLi 2UJ. Price ktx.
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The TJ135 design: first non^uropean contract for designer MGA

Car designer wins China deal
By Richard Tomkins, Midlands Correspondent

MGA DEVELOPMENTS, a
vehicle design and engineering
company based in Coventry,
West Midlands, is working on
what is believed to be the larg-

est vehicle design project
awarded by riiina.

It is being paid (£7.B9m)
by the. Tianjin Automotive
Industrial'. Corporation of
China to design and .put into

production a multi-purpose,
1%-torme truck, the TJ135.

China’s decision to commis-
sion a design marks a signifi-

cant break with tradition. Most
vehicles made in the country
have been variations of West-
ern. models, manufactured
under licence.

'

Production of the TJ135 is

due to start in February 1991 at
a new plant in Tianjin, 75 miles
south-east of Peking. The mak-
es are aiming for an output of

The added values ofBritish SteeL Numberoneofa series.

You may think of British Steel as one of Britain’s

heavyweights. And in terms ofour size and importance to the

economy, you’d be right.

But it’s surprising how light-footed this giant can be.

Especially when it comes to meeting - and anticipating - our

'

I customers’ demands.

Our lightweight steels

are shining examples of

HOW BRITISH STEEL HELPS . ww . tn

CUTYOUR PETROL BILLS.
how we readdmgvalueto

our products.

The car industry, for instance, athome and abroad, ismaking

more and more use ofBritish steel. Because we’re researching

and developing light, sophisticated steels which are strong

andanti-corrosive, yet malleableenough topressinto complex

shapes and light enough to help cut fuel consumption.

Then there’s cans. Tin cans. Now made more and more

from lightweight British Steel tinplate. Good for us, ofcourse.

And good for the environment, too. Because our cans are

eminently recyclable.

Unlike glass or plasticbottles (or cansofothermetals), they

don’t need special treatment. A quick pass with a

magnet over the municipal dump, and ont they

come: 950 million ofthem last year.

BRITISH STEEL LITE.

What’s more, we’re very happy to see them back, because

recycling has always played a large

part in steelmaking.

Our lighter steels are becoming^^^^^^^^^Ez

moreandmore versatile. We’ll behappy to explore

.

the possibilities with you, ifwe haven’t already.

The general point to he made is this. We don’t just make

large quantities ofa commodity and wait for a buyer to call.

We aim to make precisely the right amount of precisely

formulated products and deliver them precisely on time.

And that’sno light undertaking.

WE’RE ADDING VALUE
AT BRITISH STEEL.

60,000 twyH* a year. The vehicle

will be based on the chassis

arjri engine of the TJ130 track,

a 20-year-old design, in produc-

tion at Tianjin.
. „ ,

The MGA project includes

styling and engineering the

vehicle body and interior; prod-

ucing of a prototype; manufac-
turing tooling, assembly and
inspection equipment; and
helping with plant layout.

.

The contract is MGA’s first

outside Europe and was won in

the face of fierce competition

from Marubeni, the Japanese

trading house, which planned

to put the work out to its asso-

ciates.
' MGA, formed in 1979; is a
relative newcomer to vehicle
Hftgigti and engineering and is-

gniaTi compared with better-

known companies such as

Hawtal Whiting, of Basildon,

Tisane, and international Auto-
motive Design, of Worthing,
Sussex.

Since 1985, however, when it

invested heavily in computer-
aided design equipment and
moved to its present site in

Coventry, the number of peo-

ple it employs has risen from
30 to 260 and annual turnover

has' grown to £8m.
Mr Michael Gibbs, chairman,

said most of the company's
body styling work involved
designing variations' of existing

models for companies snch as

Ford, Volvo, Jaguar, Rover,
LSyl&nd-DAF, BMW and Land
Hover. .

’

“Most of the major manufac-
turers still have the in-house

capability to design and engi-

neer a car, but they don't have
the capability to do Several

concurrently,'’ he said.

little boost to jobs seen

In single market of 1992
By Alan Pike

GAINS IN employment as a
result of the change in the EG
to a single market in 1982 are
likely to prove “rather mod-
est,” according to a report fay

the Employment Institute.

The report — fay Paul Got-
oski Jonathan p»skeT,
economists in the London Busi-

ness School's Centre for Busi-
ness Strategy - is contained in
the institute's latest economic
study. It. says estimates of
medium-term community-wide
employment growth are in the
range of L8m-5m jobs.

Such gains, it says, are Small
when set against Europe’S
working population of mote
than 140m, and would reduce
tiie EC’s unemployment rate
by only 1-2 per cent.

The single, market, the
authors say, is nnlikeiy to
faring about big dmugiw in the

mm
me

employment structure of the
UK Any reductions in produc-
tion costs and expected econo-
mies of scale resulting from
the expanded European market
were likely to be small.

Dr John FMlpott, director of
tiie Employment Institute, said
yesterday that when delegates
to this week's TUC conference
in Blackpool and tiie political

party conferences tins autumn
debated 1992, they would be
wise to ignore the “hype and
rhetoric” and consider instead
the more sober view presented
in the report
. While the UK had to be pre-
pared for the single market
through, investment in capital,

research,' development and
training, there was a need to
be . wary of rfaima that 1992
proposals alone would result in
a trangftM-mjttinn of industry.

WHITBREAD

YACHT CALL
(for ati Hienon)
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EESULTS
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is competition for

tenders ‘will grow9

By Richard Evans

LEADING French, Dutch and
Spanish companies are likely
to be serious challengers for
council services such as refuse
collection put out to tender,
according to a report published
today by tbe Association of
London Authorities.
So far, local authority direct

labour organisations have won
most of the contracts for refuse
collection and street cleaning
put out to tender in London
and the rest of the country.
However, most ALA mem-

bers and large authorities such
as Sheffield. York and South-
ampton have been approached
not just by local bidders but by
overseas companies, including
Sitaclean Technology and Cory
Onyx of France.

Cory Onyx has won a £2-2m
refuse contract in Bromley,
Kent, and a £L5m refuse and
street cleaning contract in
Tower Hamlets, London. Sita-

clean has the £886,000 a year
refuse collection contract in
Erewash, Derbyshire.
The ALA publication pro-

vides local authorities with
details of the Continental com-
petitors and a history of their
involvement in municipal con-
tracts in their own countries.

Six council services, includ-
ing refuse collection, street
cleaning, vehicle and grounds
maintenance, and school
meals, must be put out to com-
pulsory competitive tender by
all councils in stages during
the next two years.

Mr Len Turner, vice-chair-
man of the ALA, said yester-

day that as the second round of
tendering was completed for

the phase that is to begin in
January, and as further rounds
opened, it was increasingly
likely that more and more
authorities would find them-
selves dealing with a number
of Continental competitors on
the tender list

“This guide will be a crucial
starting point for assessing the

N Sea oil

platform
shut down
after ‘kick9

By Janies Buxton,
Scottish Correspondent

competition and recognising
the European challenge,” hethe European challenge,” he
said.

The Continental Challenge:
European competition for local

authority services. ALA, 36 Old
Queen Street, London SWlB
9JP. £5.

Big rise in satellite TV sales
By Raymond Snoddy

SALES OF satellite television

receiving equipment surged
last month, in spite of the holi-

day season and unusually hot
weather.

According to the FT Satellite

Monitor, the total number of
satellite dishes installed rose
by 33,000 - the largest
monthly increase since the
monitor began six months ago.
The best estimate now is

that 160,000 British homes can
directly receive satellite chan-
nels such as Mr Rupert Mur-
doch’s Sky Television, MTV or
W. H. Smith's Screen Sport,
apart from those receiving
them via cable networks.
The latest monthly research

carried out for the Financial
Times by Kennington Research
does, however, suggest that the
total market for satellite televi-

sion - those who say they will

definitely or probably instal
equipment - is declining as
some of the “probables" decide
against
About 4.5 per cent of the

population say they will defi-

nitely get satellite television —
968,000 homes. That represents
a slight increase on the April
figure.

The percentage of the popu-
lation who say they will proba-
bly instal satellite receivers
has declined from 15.7 per cent
in April to 10.8 per cent in
August - 22m homes.

Mr John Clemens, managing
director of Kennington, which
is being merged with a new
company. Continental
Research, said: “This kind of
trend probably reflects grow-
ing awareness of what is on
offer and of the likely cost and
is a result of those in the mid-
dle market making up their
minds.”
About a third of the poten-

tial market said they did not
know when they would instal
satellite receivers.

Of the remainder, only one
in four said they would move
by the end of December and
the rest, 73 per cent, said some
time next year.
Allowing that not everyone

buys products when they say
they will, that suggests a total

installed base of 430,000 dishes
by the end of the year.
The main two reasons given

for delaying installation are
the cost and lack of knowledge
of what is available.

Only 16 per cent rite waiting
for British Satellite Broadcast-
ing as the main reason for
delay. BSB - which has Fear-
son, publisher of the financial
Times as a shareholder - says
it plans to launch its five chan-
nel satellite service “in the
spring.”
Only one in 10 said they

were delaying because of poor
quality of the programmes.

Just as the June figure for

television satellite installations

was swollen by 10,000 dishes
given away by the Today news-
paper, so the August figures
include sales from the Sun’s
"
100,000 sale-or-return dishes”

campaign and the News of the
World's “50 per cent ofT pro-
motion.
Last week Sky Television

announced a £2im advertising
campaign behind a subscrip-
tion package which will offer

all the necessary equipmentall the necessary equipment
and four channels for £4.49 a
week.
Market research, based on a

sample of 4,136 adults located
10 homes with large satellite

dishes and 23 with the 60cm
dishes needed to get Astra
rfiannpfc such as Sky.
Because of the small num-

bers involved the estimate of
160,000 homes that can directly
receive satellite transmissions
is subject to a margin at error
of plus or minus 25,000.

The strongest interest in sat-

ellite television is among the
under-44s bnt the market is

spread fairly evenly across the
UK.
The concept is most popular

among alditol workers but pro-
fessional and managerial
homes are not far behind.
The fuU FT satellite monitor

is available from FT Market
Research, price £185.

D. C. Thomson
ends printing

In Manchester
D. C. THOMSON, the Scottish
publisher, yesterday
announced a £50m reorganisa-

tion of its newspaper produc-
tion facilities.

The restructuring means the
closure of the company’s print-

ing facilities in Manchester
with the loss of 138 jobs. At
present the company employs
a total of 2,750 people.

It will make colour available
to the firm's publications,
which Include The Sunday
Pest, The Weekly News and
the Dundee Courier and Even-
ing Telegraph.

Printing in Manchester has
been slowly run down in
recent years to allow retire-

ment and natural wastage to
minimise redundancies.

\burExpress Call to thtrStates.”
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Exchange’s paperless trading

plan worries listed companies
By Richard Waters

A NORTH SEA oil platform
was shut down yesterday and
its non-essential personnel
evacuated after a high-pressure
“kick” was encountered during
drilling.

Some 113 men were evacu-
ated from Amoco’s North West
Hatton platform, which lies

about 90 miles northeast of
Shetland, leaving 75 essential

personnel on board. No one
was injured and there was no
exrdosion.
One of the platform’s drilling

derricks was drilling a develop-
ment well when the dim yes-
terday morning encountered
an unexpected zone of high
pressure gas. Although this
caused a sales of heavy vibra-
tions, a possible blowout was
averted by swift closure of the
blow-out preventers — valves
that block off the How of oil

and gas from the welL
Production on the platform,

which normally runs at
between 19,000 and 20,000 bar-
rels of oil and gas per day, was
shut down. In accordance with
Amoco company policy* non-es-
sential personnel were evacu-
ated to nearby platforms.
An Amoco spokesman nairi it

was not known when produc-
tion would resume.

LISTED companies, expressed'
fears .about the •• Stock

.

Exchanro’s .ulajmed nanerless.
trading system for the first

time last week.
Concern surfaced at the

meeting of the Investor Rela-
tions Society late last week,
which heard representatives
foam the exchange how
the system will work.
Listed as being present were

more than 100 representatives
of leading companies which
included British Telecom,
Imperial Chemical Industries,
National Westminster Bank
and Marks and Spencer.
Companies are wearied that

the long-awaited automated
settlements system, -Taurus,
will make it more difficult and
expensive for tham to identify
who.owns their shares.
“There was very widespread

«aM one renre-
sentative at the meeting. “Peo-
ple feitvery concerned.”

Another said: "People could
see nothing for - companies
except increased cost and tbe
same, or marginally worse, ser-

vice.”
At the heart of the fears is

the exchange's plan to extend
its nominee system, currently
restricted to market makers, to
cover all users of the market.

All shares traded in tbe mar-
ket would be registered in the
name of one of the so-called
Taurus Account Controllers,
which wfil include banks, bro-
kers Othflr tnirtitiitinna.

Under present plans, compa-
nies will ne- given information
about the holdings of these
TAGs once a fortnight They
will only get information about
the underlying shareholders
once every two months but
win be able to request it more
often.

Companies fear that by issu-

ing a request they win signal
to the market that1they fear a

hostile hut, *Tt would be too

easy- to start a rumour, said

Mr Terence Jagger, head of

investor relations at' Burmah
OiL

Another, who declined to be
nawiaA

,
said that the volume of

requests would put too much
strain on -the system.
The- exchange sought to

counter the fears by emphasis-
ing tha* its plans 'are still at

the design stage. It also

pmwtori out a representa-

tive of listed companies sits on
the committee responsible for

the development of Taurus.
'However, companies are

afraid there wfil not be enough
time for proper consultation.

Experts say that to meet its

scheduled introduction by the

end of next year, full sperifica-

tions for Taurus will need to be
produced before the end of this

year. That leaves companies
fearing they will be presented
with ajfafl accompli.

Age trends
behind high
pay rises,

survey says
By Jimmy Burns,
Labour Staff

Prince plans community ‘army’
Financial Times Reporter

PRINCE CHARLES plans to
create a volunteer community
army of at least 1Q.000 young
people between the ages of 18
and 25 working mi projects
such as helping the hondl-
capped and reclaiming derelict

land.
Details of the scheme, drawn

up after months of consults-
tfons with Cabinet ministers.

Labour Party and trade union
leaders, are scheduled to be
amumnred in the spring next

The project, to be .crganlaed

.by the Prince’s personal char-,

ity. the Prince’s. Trust,- woi&d
'

aim to attract 18,000' young'
people initially, rising to as
many as 100,000 as it becomes

:

more established.
The Prince’s idea is that

those in work would be paid
by their employers and allow-

ances would continue to be
claimed by those on youth
training schemes.
Students would also con-

tinue to draw their allowances
and others could be supported

by funds raised by local busi-

nesses. Young people on the
scheme would work fall-time

for three months.
Advisers to the scheme are

likely to be Sir Richard

Prince Charles: plans a volunteer community army

O'Brien, former chairman of
the Manpoivrar Services Com-
mission, and Sir John Cassells,

director general of the
National Economic Develop-
ment Office.

•

The Sunday Times, which
interviewed the Prifice, said

the wflnwwo would provide a
common experience for young
people of different back-
grounds pot right "the
liflwmgB done to the sense of
community within society by a
social philosophy too narrowly
based on hriWMlgm.^

FRESH EVIDENCE . of the
extent to which UK demo-
graphic trends are contributing

to pressure for higher pay set-

tlements emerges today with
the publication ctf two reports

on the pay ctf clericaPaad man-
ual staff.

The reports, carried out by
the Institute of Administrative

Management and Reward, the

pay and employment research

group, found that companies
are having to award higher pay
increases to retain and recruit

a diminishing number of
young people entering the
labour market.
One report was based cm sur-

veys of pay to over 250,000

employees ranging from a can-

teen to a senior office

faffrTiirian during the period
January to June 1989.

While the average annual
increase recorded for these

staff was between 7.7 per cent,

skilled and semi-skilled 17-

year-olds were getting pay
increases of up to 14 per cent
Another report detailing sal-

aries being paid to over 30,000

clerical and administrative
staff at 227 offices at April I

1989, found that novice and
basic office clerks below the
age of 18 had been getting pay
increases of 10-15 per cent.

The surveys confirm con-
tinuing wide regional differen-

tials in pay rates. For clerical

staff, the six highest-paying

regions (all in the south-east)

have moved ahead of the
national average by 1.3 per
cent, while tbe six lowest
regions (all in the Midlands,

the north, the south-west and
East Anglia) have moved
behind the national average by
L6 per cent - •

One of the surveys also
found that 34 per cent of com-
panies have their manual
workers on a basic 39-hour
week, while 19 per cent are
still on 40 hours and 18 per
cent have moved to 37.5 hours:

Only 7 per cent worked 35-hour
wee&s-
Clerical & Operative

Rewards; Office Trend Report
1989.(£70 and £25 respectively.)

The Reward Group, Reward
Bouse, Diamond Way, Stone
Business Park, Stone, Staffs
ST15 OSD.
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The woriefc a big ptace.196,951000 square
miles to be exact.
And If you'rean International business

buying Insurance country by country, ft can
seem even bigger.
Dealing with other cusfoms,poRcies end

pecuBarfties can be more than just compfr-
cated. It ccn leave you unsure of your
coverage. If not completely uncovered.

Thus the need for comprehensive global
coverage. The kind of coverage that the
CIGNA companies can provide.
As a truly global organizatkXLCIGNAcom-

panies offer a wide range of property and
casucrtty insurance all around the worid. On
both land and water.With local operations
In nearly 80 countries, led by experienced
representatives who know faced customs
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'

protection,
Whc ŝ more,we have a network of loss

control specJafcts to help prevent accidents.
As well as a worldwide cidrns-hancang

system that can process claims quickly
should any accidents occur.

y

And with over 48,000 employees worid-wideand almost 200 yearsSgtabSesSSt
match Strength.

To team mare about our worldwide
property and casualty coveraaes write

And find out just haw
small the world can be. HnmgfiAa
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That’s how easy it is with the new Super Shuttle from BA

rfS

SUPER
SHUTTLE
executive

Or to be more precise, both new Super Shuttles. For Super Shuttle Executive flights are full. As if that wasn’t enough, until the end of October, Executive

passengers, exclusive check-in desks mean you can turn up just ten minutes passengers can get Air Miles. Super Shuttle Savers passengers now get low cost,

before take off. Frequent travellers move even faster with new Dn|T|CM A |DU/AVC guaranteed seats booked in advance. There are meals or snacks

TimeSaver machines which issue your ticket and boarding A1KWft on every flight for every passenger. What could be simpler?

pass in less than a minute. There are even back-up planes when Thewodds favourite airhn& So if you’re looking for the easiest way from A to B, C B.A.

SUPER
SHUTTLE
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Shand
Committed
toConstruction

Shand Construction Ltd.

Shand House. Mattock,
Derbyshire DE4 3AF.
Tel: (0629)734441

Chelmsford
shopping
facilities
Work on four contracts in
Chelmsford. Harlow and Saf-
fron Walden, together worth
over £9m. has been started by
EMSON EASTERN.
The largest, at over £6.5m. is

at Riverside Park. Chelmsford.
The scheme, for Citygrove
Developments, is for the con-
struction of a retail park. The
year-long project has Just
started.
Another of the contracts is

also in Chelmsford. It Is a joint
Emson Developments/Chelms-
ford Borough Council scheme
and will provide offices at
Regina Road.

CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTS

£50m Sellafield project
Sir Robert McAlpine & Sons
has been awarded a contract

worth over £50ra by British
Nuclear Fuels for the main
building and civil engineering
works on the second medium
active solid waste encapsula-
tion plant IMASWEP EPS) com-
plex at Sellafield.

The contract covers the con-
struction of an encapsulation
building for intermediate level

waste, a services building,
cement silos and a grout wash-
ing building. The three-storey

encapsulation building, mea-
suring 120 metres x 60 metres,
will be housed within an enve-
lope structure on foundations
already prepared by Sir Robert

McAlpine & Sons under a pre-

vious contract.
Construction will be of

heavily reinforced concrete
walls and suspended floors
supported on heavy structural
steelwork - all to seismic
design. Stainless steel linings

will be applied to the walls and
floors of the process areas and
externally walls above a level

of six metres will he clad in
insulated aluminium faced
cladding panels.
The services building, which

will be of structural steel-frame

construction, will contain
changing rooms, refreshment
areas, plant rooms and the
main distribution centres for

the building services.

The contract includes the
installation of four EOT con-
struction cranes and plumbing
within the services building.

The EP2 encapsulation plant
at the Sellafield nuclear fuel
recycling plant In West Cum-
bria is part of a further £500m
investment in waste manage-
ment and treatment by BNFL
which will result in the already
drastically reduced low level
liquid discharge from the site

reaching a 'virtually zero” sta-

tus by the early 1990s.

Work, due for completion in
July 1991, is being carried out
under the direction of BNFL.

Refurbishing the Royal Academy
BOVIS CONSTRUCTION, a
P&O company, has been
awarded a £4m management
contract to extend and modern-
ise the Royal Academy of Arts

in Piccadilly, bringing the gal-

leries up to international stan-

dard and easing the movement
of visitors around the historic

building. Work begins shortly.

Public areas will not be closed
and the exhibition programme
will continue.
A ticket office, cloakroom

and ladies toilets will be built

in the entrance foyer of Bur-
lington House. The Diploma
Galleries on the second floor

will be refurbished and re-

roofed. Some present features,
like the tiled floor, and the
three-inch thick doors, will be
stored. A 4.000 sq ft temporary
roof wil be erected over the
Galleries.
The work should be com-

pleted by September 1990.

Building
offices

in Sydney
The newly-established
Australian office of BOVIS
INTERNATIONAL has been
appointed project manager for

a £i2m contract to build an
office and retail development
in Sydney for P&O Australia. It

is hoped that construction will

start in late 1989.

The 14-storey building will

provide 100.000 sq ft of offices

with 2,600 sq ft of retail space
at ground level. A Krupp sys-

tem will provide parking for 30
vehicles at basement level
The external appearance is

designed to blend with the
environment and the historic

facade on the Sussex Street ele-

vation will be retained and
restored. The retail area will

consist of aluminium and glass

with masonry elements faced

in polished reconstituted gran-
ite. The new facade will be of

precast concrete panels faced
with polished reconstituted
granite. Windows will be
glazed with Austint grey glass.

Fenchurch Street station development

ELEMETA, part of the Cornier Group, Inna been awarded the Slim design, manufacture and
construct contract for bespoke curtain-walling on a development based at Fenchurch Street
station, London ECS. The steel and aluminium wall panels will be clad in granite.

SWEDEN

The Financial Times proposes to publish a

Survey on the above on

2 OCTOBER 1989

For a full editorial synopsis and
advertisement details, please contact:

CHRIS SCHAANNING OR
GILLIAN KING

on 01-873 3428 or 4823

or write to them at:

FINANCIALTIMES
fuiOM * tutiNdt Nf wtrarta

Number One, Southwark Bridge

London SE1 9HL.

FIDELITY DISCOVERY FUND
Soclgte d’lnvestissement & Capital Variable

Luxembourg, 5 Boulevard de la Folre
R.C. Luxembourg B 22.250

DIVIDEND NOTICE

At the Annual General Meeting held on
August 31, 1989, it was decided to pay a
dividend of US$ 0,07 (seven cents) per
share on or after September 15, 1989 to
shareholders of record on September 1,

1989 and to holders of bearer shares upon
presentation of coupon No 5.

Paying Agents: COMPAGNIE FIDUCIA1RE
5, boulevard de la Foire
L - 1528 LUXEMBOURG

KREDIETBANK S.A. Luxembourgeoise
43, boulevard Royal
L - 2955 LUXEMBOURG

APPOINTMENTS
Management changes

at Northern Foods
Mr Tony Hughes has been

appointed managing director

Of NORTHERN FOODS*
grocery group, which includes
the Fox's and Elkes biscuit

companies and the canning
and fruit juice operations of
Batchelors (Ireland). He has
been a director of Northern
Foods since 1S86 and was
formerly managing director

of the company’s convenience
foods group.
Mr David Sims succeeds Mr

Hughes as managing director

of Northern's convenience
foods group. He also joins the
executive committee of
Northern Foods. Mr Sims was
previously managing director

of Bowyers (WJtshire), a
member of the Northern Foods’
meat group.
Mr Matthew Gribben, a

director of the convenience
foods group, becomes
managing director of Bowyers.

At J.P. MORGAN Mr Gerard
G. Cameron li. vice president,
has been named head of
personnel for the London
office. Mr Cameron, previously
general manager of Morgan’s
Italian offices, succeeds Mr
C. Dixon Kunzelmann. who
has relocated to New York to
head personnel for the bank's
worldwide securities group.

PRUDENTIAL PORTFOLIO
MANAGERS - the investment
management arm of Prudential
Corporation - has appointed
Mr Michael Denham as global
fixed interest director. He was
formerly the fixed interest
director of Morgan Grenfell
International Fund
Management

REDMAN FISHER
ENGINEERING, the West
Midlands-based manufacturer
of industrial flooring, has
appointed two directors: Mr
William Farnell becomes
production director and Mr
Barry Trubshaw is promoted
to sales and marketing
director. Mr Farnell was
production manager and Mr
Trubshaw was UK sales
manager. Redman Fisher is

a member of the
Wolverhampton-based Cl
Group.

Mr Christopher Brown. Mr
Daniel Cohen, Mr Paul Hewitt
and Mr Gerard Strahan have
been made directors of
EUROMONEY
PUBLICATIONS. All four are
executives of the company.
Mr Brown is senior
Yte&president of Euromoney
Inc based in New York, Mr
Cohen is publisher of
Asiamoney based in Hong
Kong. Mr Hewitt is financial

director and company
secretary and Mr Strahan is

director of business
development Mr Padraic
Fallon has become chief
executive ofEuromoney
Publications and Mr Richard
Ensor deputy chief executive.

DCI, the Scottish property
development group, has
appointed Mr Alistair W.
Coutts as project management
and development director. Mr
Coutts was project coordinator
for the Mass Transit Railway
Corporation in Hong Kong.

ADAM & CO has made the
following appointments to the
board of its investment
management subsidiary, Adam
& Company Investment
Management: Mrs Jill Staite

and Mr James Montgomery
join from the private client

department of N.M. Rothschild
Asset Management

Mr John Dawson (above) has
been appointed operations
director of CXM INTERNA-
TIONAL, the Hampshire-based
food group. He was previously
managing director of Ess-Food
Danepak, the Danish-owned
UK bacon and food product
processor, packer and distribu-
tor.

LONDON AND
BISHOPSGATE
INTERNATIONAL
INVESTMENT
MANAGEMENT has appointed
Dr Christopher Adcock as
director of quantitative
investment research. He was
previously head of technology
for County NatWest
Investment Management

Mr Allan Capp has been
made manufacturing director
at NORTHERN RUBBER. He
was previously general works
manager of the United
Kingdom Optical Company.
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DIARY DATES
FINANCIAL Trade Fairs and Exhibitions: UK

TODAY
COMPANY MEETMOB-

Bteallbur Grp_ EnrsHfmr Noun. Ptffc Lana.
Birmingham, 11.00

Rra Tadmloar. Rest MM. MlMay Road.
Reel Hants,. 10.00

PMmsraun Hklge, Connaught Rooms. Great
Queen Bnft W.C_ 10.30

Reed Executive. 114.' p—good Shmb'WM-
sor. Berio* 3-00

Setters Grp. OartomMfl Conference Canto,
asunma Otton. E.C, NUB

BOARD MSETMQS-

Centore

Cana. Venture Tel
Cooper (Alan)
Durham (D.G.)

H*«s Homes a Gardena

Unread
Pacific Asset* TSt

Romeo ON
Tactmology Prefect Serrieo
Unidera
Wilkaa (James)
DIVIDEND ft INTEREST PAYMENTS-
BeBsrware Conaroer Products a.7Sp
Broad Street Grp. 0Xp
Colored Qrp. 4-660
Gopeng BwhocJ tOaen
Hauls (FWtrp) afip
Leflnvaei 10l|H to iifc% Stopd. let MW.

Ob. 2012 Si,pc.
M & G Dual Tat 2BJ2P
Mayer ml lip
Scottish a Newcaafla Brawertaa 7.73p
Stakla anp
Bunco Exhibition Grp. ip
Stunte Midge. 6p
Tinsley Rabor J.35p
Wace Grp. 1-TSp
Wlgglna Grp. 6p

TOMORROW
COMPANY MEETMGS-

Blimlngham Mint Birmingham Botanical
Gardens. Wesfeoume Road. Edgteatoo.
Birmingham. 12X0

KMC Brp_ Honourable ArtOtary CO- Armoury
Howa. City Read. E.C. 12.00

BOARD MEETMGS-

Bullough 1-730
Countryside Propartfes 1-3p
Credo cosmetics ft Tolfetriaa 7>a% Un- Ln-

1967192 33, PC.
area Estates 6% Un. In. 1932197 4pc.
Exmoor Duel Inv. Tat 2p
M7MM Un. Ln. 1988/91 3^pc.
Joseph (Leopold) 9«s* Un. Ul 1997/2002

WaddinrtMi (John) 10*z% Ob- 1B8W9S 5true.
Whitbread ft Co. 9* M Rd. Ob. 1991/98

4%pc.
YofMUre Chemtaate 1Q% Dtn 1891/98 fipc.

THURSDAY SEPTEMBER 7
COMPANY MEE1WGS-

Bubnar (H.P.). Oder MIBs, Plough Lana, Her-
eford, 2X0

Caicfo Engineering. Quaana Hood. Leeds.
4.00

Deafen Hldgs, CSi. Centre FOUL New Oxford
Street. W.C.. 12X0

Rich Loved, PUMarara Halt 1. London WaB,
E.C., 3X0

Batcher King. Stratton House. Stratton
Street W„ 12.00

ML Mdgs.. Savoy Hotel. Strand. W.C- 12.00
7HOHH EMI. London Manta* Hotel. Groe-

venor Square, W„ 11X0
Tops Estates, 77. South Audley smut W„

11X0
Whtaney Madtay-Lawfe. Royal Inattuta of

British Architects, H. Bu tman Place. W..

3X0
YRM. 24. Britton Stoat, E.C„ 11X0
BOARD MEETINGS-

Chlna ft East Hr*.
Coronation Syndicate
Kiehwrert Demon inL Inc. Bond
Tneatontnln UKL Collieries

Peters (Michael)

ACT
ASOA Preps.
Avonmore Poods
Beattie (James)

CRH
EW Phot
Eadfe
Fftfeey
Gawrtngs
Heetair
Home Counties
IMI
Isotron

Lopes
Mata) Closures
OUvse

AMEC
Burmah
Campari InL
Cannon Stoat tore.
Contain
Enterprise Oil

Friendly Hotels
Gibbs ft Dandy
Hattons
tnt Business Corams.
PE btL
Parkdsla HMgs.
PavHlon Leisure
Pony Pack
Portals HMgs.
Ractdtt & Cotnum
Senior Eng.
Singer & Frtedtander
Tyne Teas TV
yjn-—- l(,-nTiicun wwuijii
OMDEKD ft INTEREST PAYMENTB-
Angloai & Overseas TsL IXp
Barclays Bank 7fe% Un. Cap. Ln. 1988/91

34 pa
Cardo Engineering 4X5p
Cons Gold Fields Gtd. Rtg. Rtfs Ms. 1893

£180X8
Deafen Mdgs 14p
Morris Ashby 2Xp
Prudential Cap.

Ptckwlck Qrp.
Pro*Idem Financial
Robtnson Bros
Ropnor
Sedgsridc Qrp.
IlWrtMd Reeve
Systems RelkaOWty
Taylor Woodrow
Tatar Kemsfey X Mftbouni
WSP Hldgs
Wyevste Garden Cantos
DMOEND ft INTEREST PAYMBfTS-
Bowatar bids 9>sK Bds 1992 4l*pe.
Cntarch Core 20cts
GIBade 24cts
Israel (Jar* L) OABSp
Lockheed Core. 46ots
Pahnaraton Mdgs. 5.75p
Rockwall InL 19XCIS

WEDNESDAY SBTCMBER 8
COMPANY MSTINGS-

Baapak. Bergen Way, North Lyrai bid. Estate,

King's Lynn. Norfolk. 11X0
Compco HMgs. 38. Cork Stoat. W_ 12.00
Empire Stores (Bradford). Victoria Hotel,

Bradtard. 12X0
Hrih (G.M.), Cedar Court Hotel. Wak—eld.

11.45
Kicking Pentecost. Royal Hotel. WoWakxi

Street. Nottingham. 12.00

London Securities. Mill Ride Estate. Mill

HMe. North Ascot. Berks. 11.00

Priest (Ben|amln). National Motorcycle
Museum. Coventry Road. BtakenMfl
SoltedL West Midlands. 2.18

BOARD MEETMGS-

Phg. Rate Nts 1996 £356X7
Robertson Grp. 2-Tp
Sslnshury (JJ 7>s% 1st Mtg. Db. 1987/92

34 PC- «
Sweden (Kingdom tf) 85»% Bds 1990 4Ape.

FRIDAY SEPTEMBER 8
COMPANY MEETVtGS-

Goods Durrsm. Strand Pslace HobM. Strand.

W.C, 11X0
Joseph (Leopold), Haberdashers' HaH, Stain-

ing Lana. E.O. 12.19

Marling lods. Charing Cross Hotel. W.C.
1200

North of Scotland lnv„ 10, Quaana Terrace,
Aberdeen. 1200

Slebs Savoy Hotel Strand. W.C. 12X0 .

BOARD MEETWGS-

Northern tnd- Improvement TeL
Second America TsL

Black (Peter)

American TsL
Anglo American Gold
Bar* or Nova Scotia
Btua Circle
Bunzl
Conder Grp.
Canon Beach
Creoa InL
Edinburgh Fund Managers
Hambro Countrywide
Hitedown
INSTEM
Mecca Leisure
Niadn ft Peacock
Paragon Comms
Quicks
Slal-Plus
Sun Aiilanoa
Tin
Ttfsmstrta
Wereldhave
WHlIams Hldgs
Wlmpsy (George)
DiVJDENO ft INTEREST PAYMENTS-
BFG Finance Fhg- ftatf Nts 1998 S248.17
Bank at Greece i0tt% Ln. 2010 5Hpc
Barclays Overseas Inv. Gtd. Fhg. Rata Nts

200*5280X8

Abbeycrest
British Dredging . .

Elya (Wimbledon)
McLaughlin & Nnvey
Perry Grp-
DIVIDEND O INTEREST PAYMBITS-
AlUadStgnal 49cts
Anheuser-Busch 22cts
Australia Inv. TSL OXp
Bank of Ireland UmL Fltg. Rate Prim. Cap.

Nts S246X7
BanfcAmarlra Corp. iSols
Boeing 300*..
British Kktney Patent Assoc. tav.1M.4p
CardW Property 0J8p
Chase Manhattan FXg. Rate Nts 2009 534278
Cowls (T.) IXp
Davy Corpn. 8p
Dun O Bradstre
Hogas 4.121p
GnUg flipping 2Xp
Do. A N/Vtg. 2fip
Hongkong a Shanghai Bemdog Prim. Cap.

Und. FRN 2nd. Series S122S9
Lsbowa Plsdnum Mines Sots .

Lyons Irish HMgs 7Xp
Moorgaw Inv. TsL 5.8p
Nahonsl Medicsi Enterprises tacts
Norfolk House Grp. 1.123p
North of Scotland krv. 0X5p
Renold 7%K 2nd Ob. T9921W 312pa
Ruatanburg Platinum ISScts-
Sun Co. Hill.
TNT 3 /SctS
Tasaco Inc. Cap- 75cts
Trans-Natal Coal 20otS
Treasury 10% 2003 Spa
Wsmar-Lambert 64ctS
Yeoman tmr. TsL Sp . .

SATUROAY SEPTEMBER 9
BOARD MEEDNGS-

rtnali.
Equity a Law
Maonedc Materials
DMoSo O INTEREST PAYMENTS-
Houston tads 74cts
IBM 121cfs
Travelers Core OQcts
USX Core 3600-

SUNDAY SfcKTEMBER 10
DJVIDBtD B INTEREST PAYMENTS-

Agricultural Mortgage Corp. Db. 1988/
so V.oc.

Grace (WJL) 35cta.
Scott Psptf tflcti,

Treasury S>2% 2008/12 2Vpc-
Utd. Tochnokjgfes 40cts

A MISSING SLIDE
CAN LEAVE

A IN YOUR
PRESENTATION.

At The Presentation Company
we count them all in. And we count

them all out again.

In between we make sure they’re

properly focussed, perfectly coloured

and match your requirements to a T.

So you get all the slides you
want looking the way you want. With

nothing out.

Cali us on 01-831 3630 and
we'll fill you in.

Temporary
Executives

you’ll wish were permanent.
Ourcomprehensive registerof high calibre, experienced and
highly motivated executives provides ihc right person for

short or long term assignments, one off projects or unexpected
crises.Contact Derek Wellington on UI -867 6737.

Current ..

Top Drawer Gift and
tive Accessories Exhibition
(until September 6) (01-727

1929)
Alexandra Palace

Current _ .

International Autumn Fair

(until September 7> <01-855

9201)
Olympia

September 5-8 .

International Carpet Fair

<021-705 6706) „
Exhibition Centre, Harro-

_

Offshore Europe Exhibition

and Conference (01-549 5831)
Aberdeen

September 10-13
.

International Menswear —

MAB (01-437 8754)
Barfs Court

September 12-14
Point of Sale, Merchandising
and Display Exhibition and
Conference (01-340 3291)

Business Design Centre,
Islington

September 12-23

Antiques Fair (04447 2514)

Chelsea Old Town Hall
September 15-23
International Boat Show (0703

737311)
Southampton

September 17-18

DIY Trade Show (01-302 8585)
Karls Court

September 17-19

Gallery 89 - Framing and Fine
Art Market (01-855 9201)

Olympia 2, London
September 19-22

International Handling & Stor-

age gvhffiitinn (0895 56431)

NEC, Birmingham
September 18-19

International High Definition
Television Exhibition — HDTV
(01-931 9985)

Tara Hotel, london
September 19-22
international Helicopter Tech-
nology & Operations Exhibi-

tion (01-549 5831)

Redhfll Aerodrome
September 25-28
International Police Exhibition

& Conference (01-446 8211)

Barbican, London
September 26-27
Independent Power Generation
Conference and Exhibition -

INPOWER (0737 768611)

Heathrow Park Hotel
September 27-October 1
Personal Computer Show
(01-486 1951)

Saris Court, London
September 29-October 1
National Franchise Exhibition

(01-727 1929)

NEC, mnriiigivnn

Overseas Exhibitions

Current
International Autumn Fair
(until September 9) (0375

Leipzig
September 4-9

Show of the Nations Exhibition

(01-977 3474)
Vienna

September 13-14

Pre-Press Exhibition (0372
373161)

Copenhagen
September 13-17

International Fisheries Indus-
try KvMhiHnn (01-948 9900)

Nantes
September 14-24

International Motor Show -
IAA (01-734 0543)

Frankfurt
September 17-20

International Hardware Show -

QUOJEM (01-225 5566)
Fans

Sept 25-Oct 1

International Technical Fair
(01-836 5219)

' Plovdiv
Oct 2-6

International Robotics, CAD/
CAM, Automation Engineering
Exhibition - PRODUCTIQDE
(01-225 5566)

Paris

October 9-14

International Fair for Instru-

mentation and Automation -

INTERKAMA (01-794 0166)
Dusseldorf

October 10-14
International Anti Pollution,

Environmental & Safety Tech-
nology Exhibition - IFEST
(01-639 7265)

Ghent
October 12-15

International Languages,
Translation & Cultural Com-
munication Trade Fair (01-977

3474)
Vienna

Business and management conferences

Current
European Society for Opinion
and Marketing Research 42nd
ESOMAR congress (until Sep-
tember 7) (Amsterdam
+3120^642141)

Stockholm
September 6
Tolley Conferences: Payroll
manager’s review third annual
updating conference 1989
(01-680 5682)

London Press Centre

September 11
The Industrial Society: Annual
hours - principles into prac-

tice <01-262 2401)
London

September 12
CBI Conferences: Fay and per-
formance (01-379 7400)

Centre Point, London
September 13-14

Financial Times Conferences:
World Motor (01-925 2323)
Hotel Inter-Continental,

Frankfurt

Anyone wishijig to attend any ofthe above events is advised to

telephone the organisers to ensure that there have been no
changes to the details published

FINANCIAL TIMES CONFERENCES
The following conferences are among those to

be arranged by the Financial Times this Autumn
and Winter:

WORLD MOTOR
13 & 14 September - Frankfurt

RETAIL FINANCIAL SERVICES
2 & 3 October - London

EUROPE AND THE NORDIC COUNTRIES
9 & 10 October - Stockholm

FT-GITY COURSE
9 October-27 November - London

WORLD MOBILE COMMUNICATIONS IN THE 90s
11 & 12 October - London

.
RE-REGULATING EUROPE’S FINANCIAL

SECTOR
16 & 17 October - London

FINANCIAL TIMES/PRICE WATERHOUSE
CAPITAL MARKETS WORKSHOPS

16, 17 & 18 October
15, 16 & 17 November

4, 5 & 6 December - London

FT CITY SEMINAR
31 October, 1 & 2 November - London

BUSINESS WITH SPAIN
6 & 7 November - Madrid

WORLD SHIPPING. IN THE 90s
14 & 15 November - Amsterdam

WORLD ELECTRICITY
16 & 17 November - London

EUROPEAN FOOD AND DRINK INDUSTRY
28 & 29 November - London

WORLD BANKING: EUROPE AFTER THE
DELORS REPORT

30 November & 1 December - London

WORLD TELECOMMUNICATIONS
4 & 5.December - London

-
•

-
’ WORLD PULP & PAPER

.12 & 13 December - London -

C
AU enquiries should be addressed to:

Tme
~. Conference Organisation

jdo dermyn Street
, London SWiY 4UJ

T
Teiel~

9
?7i4^T^K?ur answerin9 service)

Telex. 27347 FT CONF G Fax: 01-925 2125



British Gas's success in Britain probably has not escaped your notice.

Particularly if you happen to be a shareholder.

But our activities are not limited to these shores. Technology export

and international consultancy, exploration and production are already

helping to build a global reputation for British Gas.

Our aim now is to match ourdomestic success with worldwide growth.



For us, flying is precision work.

No matter what There are

certain things where we
aren’t prepared to budge an

inch from our basic prin-

ciples. For instance, when
it comes to technical relia-

bility.

Regularly, our aircraft are

subjected to a whole range

of visual, status, function and
detail checks. This is some-
thing which you can expect

of every airline. For us, how-
ever, ifs not enough. Our
technicians and engineers

work with a degree of preci-

sion only rarely achieved

elsewhere. Using highly sen-

sitive testing equipment they

inspect every aircraft down to

the last rivet

Because theythink it’s impos-
sible to be too thorough.
Thafs just the way we Ger-
mans are. For us, everything

has to be exactly right There
are simply some things
where we never try to cut

corners. And this pays in the
long run. Precision is our
maxim. And we won’t budge
an inch from this.

Lufthansa

J
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MANAGEMENT

T he exoauadf oficoat-
pwjfla ftomtheirgen-

Metals mining and processini

JL into the metdi
mining Industry ctHfrtoaea
with Exxon’s safe, st the week-
end of its holding JnLes Mines-
Sdbate, acopper, zinc and pm-
dons metals Brining Complex -

in Panada. Tftfe ftinown'mijy a
few weeks after British. Petnx-
feom completed ttier4feposa2,bf
most Of ifaf mining '«nyf piinw.
sis assets to the RTZ Conpr*^
tion. .^.v* ...

But the Selbaie -deal also
draws attention to the biggest
exception to the rale' - the
Royal Dntdi/SheQ oil gfottp^
Fhnmn 1* nrifing a 4n t4y»

wholly-owned metals division

of Shell, Bflntnn international :

Metals.
The question Isrwhy Is Shell-

not only holding ontoBlffifcm
hut also birilifingup its writing

and metals interops when BP
and Exxon'would argue this is

an opporbme time to take
advantage erf. current high nietr
als prices and sell? ...

Jan Slechte, president«CBU-
hton, readily-admits that one
of the options given, serious
attention by Shell at the time
be took up the post early in
1986 was the break-up and safe
of Billiton. The outlook was
bleak and other oil companies
had started to durinvest from
vpatalu and mining.

Billiton had been acquired
by Shell in May 1970.. For -a
time it did well; but then it

suffered severely attfae begin-.,
ing of the 1980s in the long
recession in the metals busi-
ness. By the time Slechte
jumped abwd ttie company
was sinking under accumu-
lated losses totaCQhg more than :

ITSfen.

Sheik like the other oil-'

majors, moved into mining arid

metals for what seemed very.
good reasons arid proceeded't6
follow some very sound man-
agement theories when dealing
with its new acquuxtion&.
The oil companies relied

heavily on an.incorrect eco-
nomic forecast from the Club
of Rome (a group of industrial-
ists, scientists, 'economists,
educators ami uttiwmww from.
many countries) which, after .

an international study ofworld'
problems and prospects fer tile

future made in -the mid-1960s,

painted a very rosy picture for
commodity-based industries.

The Club suggested that
resources were -finite, that
Increasing' demand would
make commodities mine scarce
and that prices would have to
rise. With the market growing
by 5 per cent a year, mpre
capacity would he needed and
the marketpice would base fe.

rise to meet the cost of that

How Billiton climbed out of the pit
specialist <£^dsion is digging deeper where other oil companies have quit. Kenneth Gooding explains why

capacity. : 1

Taking such forecasts into
account, SbeH/coustafereg that

:

-priri
; metals plgW

become its “fourth. leg- to com-
plement aiL gas awl cfiehdcala.
So h paidFls422m (249m then)
forfifllfom, a companywith an
UO-year history, . first in tin

. arid then in tabling it

also had the attraction erf being
- baaed, like one of, me Shell
partners, in the Netheriqnds.
: However, with' its turnover
of: about; Imri & year; Bfflton

.

. Was onfr a medmatabed mia-
- ing group, and certainly not
big- enough cm its' own to be
even a spindly “fourth leg”. /

- Shell decided1

. it ;should
expand it qntcklyto ti» right

“critical _ma8s” and that it
should accountfer aboutw per
Cent of the Bn in

l
l<B •hTiqfn^g

.

That indicated Bilfiton .must
- move.to ansssetbase ofabout
flZbn mod steps.were taken to
push it speedy iri that direc-
tum. • •

la view of ’ the total size of
the-mfcring industry that was a

. very muadietic target and the
BtBkon managers might have
pointed this out more fbree-

. ftjfc bad &ey been less over-
awed. They regarded Shell
management as highly-re-'-
apectea and successful and the
BCUtpn executives could be
forgiven for thinking: “Perhaps
they knoW something we
don’t” ...
. According to some erf the
execdlivea who lived through
ithis period; 'some . important
management' (fisciplmes were
sometimes overlooked in the
push fin: size.

' At the banning cf the 1980s
came the long period cf low

. metals, prices. That . recession
waa caused partly by the ail

s^^yshocksin the 1970s but
also arose because «rnipHTri«g

like Billiton responded to
strong world growth in the
197QS fltid to *>» Cctab Of Bntns
forecasts by making large
investments In new capacity.
Thin mainly wmtf im ntnirm

just as economic growth, fell

back. There were then seven
years of fundamental over-sup-
ply across the whole of the
nan-ferrous metals industry. .

The serious consequences
were folly apparent when
Slechte was appointed.. Apart
from «ditng off the assets,
otiier options were considered

Exptonaon

tertnoend/ar procesainp

Sendee company

Manuftouitag

K&d

i's.'VjTs

111!

Income by segment
USSm

1987 1088

AJumMum 9 126

Manufacturing 1 29

Mning& associated

processing 40 78

Marketing & tracing 13 18

Jan Slechte

sibility that further massive
Investment in Billiton might
help.
. Ultimately, swhte amf his
team concluded that there was
a great deal which could be
achieved with BHliian just by
working on -its existing
operations. He advised Shell
that, if Rillitqw WP7PwrntnaTly

to be sold, it Should be put into
better shape first.

•

That was after every one of
the operations within Billiton

had been reviewed “to define
what businesses we were in
and why we were in them.”

.
A survival plan was imple-

mented. Bflliton's product-ori-

ented divirions were scrapped
in favour of four core business
segments: mining ami associ-

ated processing business; alu-

nrinfann awfl almnina; wmnnfmv
truing and marketing of
downstream, added-value prod-
ucts; apd glfthaT trading and

Pre-tax profit

Net Income

tTiarlrating of matais min-
erals.

' Billiton’s management
organisation, in typical metals
industry style, was heavily
centralised bnt Slechte
believed it was better to push
responsibility as far down the
rha<ti as possible.
Wand nffiflp, a pltmwanf' hitfld.

ing on the outskirts of Leid-
schendam, near the Hague,
was turned into a service com-
pany. This required tiie staff to
be reduced by half, Some went
to the operating businesses but
there were also redundancies.
“As the rales of people in the

organisation were changing we
decided we had to change
behaviour and attitudes as
well,” says Slechte. The new
management team decided, for
example, that “we would like

to trust each other. We wanted
individuals to tell their bosses
what the problems really were.
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not what they thought their
bosses wanted to hear.”
The team dealt with other

problems identified in up busi-
ness review, “from the bottom
up.” Bankrupt Billiton subsid-
iaries were refinanced by ShelL
T)QBfl.mairing long-term supply
contracts were renegotiated.
Over-manning was dealt with
and go On.

It was also important for Bil-

liton to live within its own
cash flow so that it would
never again have to run to the
parent group for more money.
And, if Billiton were to be a
healthy part of the Shell group,
it would have to match the
average return on capital
achieved by sister companies
over the economic cycle of
between 11 and 15 per cent
From that latter objective

ramp a determination that Bil-

liton should rely less on the
aluminium operations which

currently dominate its busi-
ness. In the early 1980s Billiton

had about Slbn of aluminium
investment coming on stream.

Slechte points out that the
ainmininm industry is one in
which national governments
are frequently involved for rea-

sons not primarily associated
with maximising profits or
return on capital.

Also “if we want to achieve a
competitive rate of return on
our aluminium business in thp

Shell class (11 to 15 per cent), it

would have to be well above
the Industry average. Given
the quality of some of our com-
petitors in North America and
Europe, that is unlikely.

“But we are in the alumin-
ium business and we will
optimise what we already
have,” says Slechte, which sug-
gests that other parts of the
Billiton business will have to
do much better than the Shell

standard to compensate.
Billiton’s aluminium inter-

ests currently account for 73

per cent of its $1.6bn capital

employed and include alumina
refineries in Surinam, Brazil,

the Republic of Ireland and
Australia plus the associated

smelting facilities of Alumar
and Valesul in Brazil. Bauxite,
the raw material for alumina,
is produced from mines in
Surinam, Guinea, Brazil and
Australia. To complete this

strong vertical diversity in alu-

minium, there are alloy manu-
facturing plants in Venezuela
and the Netherlands.

Away from aluminium, pro-
cessing assets include a share
in a ferro-nickel plant in Col-

ombia (and its associated
mine), zinc and lead smelters
in the Netherlands and the UK,
a tin smelter in Thailand and
magnesium oxide and titanium
dioxide plants in the Nether-
lands.

Surprisingly, Billiton was
not very strong in mining
when Shell acquired it taut the
company has recently acquired
gold mining interests in Ghana
and Indonesia to add to exist-

ing gold operations at Vilacollo

in Chile and at Boddington in
Western Australia and lead-
zinc mines in South Africa and
Australia.

Slechte says that, in order to
counter the cyclicality of met-
als market, political upheavals
and currency realignments,
Billiton wants a wide spread of
metals, countries and curren-
cies in its portfolio.

It already is one of the very
few multi-metal companies
(there are 12 in the portfolio),

but it is still making strenuous
efforts to look worldwide -
outside the US - for further
mining investment opportuni-

ties which are past the explora-
tion stage. Within the US, met-
als company activities are
directed by the parent there.

Shell Oil in Houston.
New mining investments not

only have to be capable of
producing low-cost metals but
aim must meg* the financial

criteria Bi 1lfam has set itself.

So far mainly gold properties

have been able to match up -
until the opportunity to buy
Exxon’s stake in Selbaie came
along.
The Selbaie deal also high-

lights another part of the phi-

losophy - although Billiton

would prefer to have control, it

is willing to accept something
less than 50 per cent of a ven-
ture. In this particular case
only 35 per cent of Selbaie Is

available.

Billiton’s drive into more
mining ventures - and its

annual $250m to $300m in capi-
tal investment and acquisitions
- has not been made because
of an optimistic view of future
metals demand and prices.

Slechte says that the long
term trend in metals prices in
real terms is inexorably down-
ward. Metals will not benefit

fully from future worldwide
industrial growth because pro-

ducers are not investing
enough in product develop-
ment, there will be less inten-

sive use of raw materials and
substitution for metals in

future. “So it would be asking
a great deal for metals demand
to grow in line with the world
economy.”

But, he suggests, there is an
opportunity for more growth
through adding more value to

products and giving customers
a better service. Also Billiton,

even with 5,000 directly
employed worldwide, is still

only a medium-sized metals
group so it has a chance to
grow bigger in a fragmented
industry where the competi-
tion is nothing like as formid-
able as Shell faces in the oil or
chemicals businesses.
Gone is all talk of Billiton

becoming a fourth leg for Shell
but so far this year it is contri-

buting a healthy 4 per cent of
group profit.
Rimtnn produced its first net

profit since 1980 in 1987 -
$27m. This jumped to $193m
last year. In the first half of
1989 net profit soared again to

S137m. Return on capital
employed rose from 2 per cent
in 1987 to 13 per cent last year
and currently is 17 per cent.

Billiton generated a cash sur-

plus of 3104m in the first half
of this year.

Slechte is the first to admit
that record metals prices have
been mainly responsible for
Billiton's remarkable financial

recovery. “The real proof will

come with a downturn in eco-

nomic activity,” he says. “Then
we will see tiie results of the
fundamental improvements we
have made to the business -
in cost controls, applied tech-
nology, contributions from new
and expanded operations, mar-

keting and trading and the
emphasis on higher-margin
products downstream. We are
confident that, even in reces-

sion, we will still have a rela-

tively good rate of return and
will be able to live within our
cash flow. That will be the acid
test of our success.”
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LEGAL COLUMN

Probing the workings of Japan’s legal system
By Hiroshi Oda

THE JAPANESE legal profession is

small by the standards of Western
industrialised countries, having
approximately 14,000 attorneys. The
number of inhabitants per attorney is

ten times that for solicitors and bar-

risters in the UK.
The contrast is not so sharp, how-

ever. because Japanese attorneys
share the “legal" market with other
professions. Conveyancing, for exam-
ple. is not usually part of an attor-

ney’s business but is primarily han-
dled by judicial scriveners.
Their qualifications are less strin-

gent than those of attorneys and they
are more accessible.

Patent cases are handled by patent
counsels, while advice on taxation is

available from tax consultants.

Attorneys are entitled to perform
the functions of tax consultant, patent

counsel and judicial scrivener when
they register, but those three profes-

sions are not allowed to perform the

function of an attorney. Attorneys
can form a multi-disciplinary partner-

ship with members of other profes-

sions.

In addition, many large and medi-
um-sized companies have legal depart-

ments stalled by specialists. Most of

them are not qualified as attorneys

but they do have legal expertise. Big

companies involved in high technol-

ogy also have patent departments or
intellectual property departments
staffed by legal experts.

Recently, it has become more com-
mon for big companies to employ
attorneys in their legal departments.
Large trading houses also now
employ foreign attorneys as staff

counsel

The law gives attorneys a monopoly
over legal services and a breach of
that monopoly by an unqualified per-

son can lead to two years’ imprison-

ment Friction between attorneys and
judicial scriveners sometimes results

in a prosecution.
Partly as a result of the difficulty in

contacting attorneys, people some-
times turn to judicial scriveners for

legal advice.
The examination system for law-

yers is often blamed for the shortage
of attorneys and Judges. There is a
uniform state examination for judges,
public prosecutors and attorneys
which is administered by the Ministry
of Justice.
About 500 out of 20.000 applicants

pass the examination every year and
go through two years of learning at
the Legal Training Institute run by
the Supreme Court The pass rate has
been kept intentionally low due to the
capacity of the Legal Training Insti-

tute and also tO maintain standards
Out of those who pass the final

examination. 50 become associate
judges and will be promoted to full

judicial status in ten years. About 40
to 50 become public prosecutors and
the remaining 400 become attorneys.
Before the end of the Second World

War, the status of attorneys was
much lower than that of judges and
public prosecutors, who were part of
the offirialdom. Attorneys had to reg-
ister with the district court and were
supervised by the chief prosecutor of
the court. Disciplinary action was
taken not by the bar, but by the
appellate court.

The bar enjoys hill autonomy under
the present system. Attorneys are reg-

istered with a local bar and there is

also a national Japan Federation of
Bar Associations. Disciplinary action
against members is by the disci-

plinary board of the bar, which is

subject to judicial review.
The fact that the number of attor-

neys is small does not mean that Jap-
anese attorneys live in a non-competi-
tive environment Most attorneys are
concentrated in main cities, particu-
larly Tokyo and Osaka. There are
many attorneys fighting for business
in such cities, while there is an acute
shortage of attorneys in rural areas.

An important difference between
Japanese and British law firms is that
Japanese lawyers are predominantly
sole practitioners. They mostly advise
private clients and small companies

It is often difficult for
clients to find an attorney,

even in large cities such
as Tokyo and Osaka

on domestic matters and are seldom
involved in international business.
There are larger firms advising big

companies, but even those firms are
much smaller than the well-known
law firms in England.

Advertising by attorneys is subject

to various restrictions. Attorneys
have to find clients through personal
connections and the links they have
developed while working in larger
firms. For the clients, it is often very
difficult to find an attorney, even in
large cities.

Access to attorneys by ordinary citi-

zens and small companies is Anther

limited by the fact that legal fees are
not easy to predict. The Bar has a
standard scale of fees, but it is not
binding. The set fees are often vague
and offer little information to prospec-
tive clients.

People seldom consult an attorney
unless a dispute actually arises. As a
result, most attorneys spend consider-
able time in court and preparing cases
for litigation.

Companies seek the advice of an
attorney from time to time, but the
day-today legal work is carried out by
staff. A few leading law firms that

with transnational business are
exceptions to the pattern.

The development of international
trade and finance in Japan has
affected the legal profession to some
extent Urged by the US, the Japan
Federation of Bar Associations has
reluctantly accepted the need to open
the door to foreign attorneys.
A law in 1986 made it possible far

attorneys qualified in a foreign coun-
try to practise in Japan but this law is

still considered to be unsatisfactory
by foreign attorneys.

Partnerships between Japanese and
foreign lawyers are not permitted and
the requirement that the attorney
should have had five years’ practice
in his home country is especially
inhibiting.

It is fairly common for com-
panies to seek advice and assistance
from foreign law firms. The floating of
bonds abroad is- only one example of
the sorts of cases where the advice of
a foreign law firm is indispensable.
Such firms are contacted either

through a Japanese law a™ which
acts for the company or by direct per-

sonal connection.
In a survey of listed companies con-

ducted in 1987. 33 per cent of the
respondents said they had consulted
foreign attorneys in the past Ameri-
can attorneys were most frequently
consulted, which is not surprising
considering the (dose trade relation-

ship with the US.
With closer financial and trade rela-

tions between Europe and Japan, par-
ticularly with 1392 in view, there will

certainly be more cases where British

and European firms will be consulted
on legal matters.
There are already British law firms

with offices in Tokyo advising on UK
and EC law.
In contrast, it may not be too harsh

to say that Japanese law firms are
lagging behind developments in inter-

national business.
Even leading firms are slow in pre-

paring to take up the business oppor-
tunities that the Single European
Market may provide, although some
leading firms have established formal
links with law firms in Europe in the

last couple of years. .

That is bound to increase as Japa-
nese law firms become gradually
aware of the necessity of developing
expertise in the law of European
countries and the European Commu-
nity.

The author is a visiting professor at

University College London on leave

from the University of Tokyo.- He will

be taking part, along with a number of
top specialists from Japan, in the

Third UCL Conference on Japanese
Law (Banking, Securities and Intellec-

tual Property Law) from September
68.
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FEHDT. Tome Edward Hr. QdgwriL Essex

FORSYTH. NeO Haag LLB Mr. FiiitojiuteH Ujaatar
GADS8T. Dm Hotel Jane Ur. Gral tan, Esex
GARETT. Itetmay Aaoe B5c Ms. CmSta Deni
GEE. Craig BA Mr. Uytrtttet. Loafer . . ...

BLLE5HE. HodiBta Start« the Steed Ota -of

HawKowgMr. HoagRaa)

ClfD HILL. JdWi LLB MH Nrtaa Luotav
GOLDBUTT. Jags 01MrMr. Bouhamd. Hetfartddw
GOWER LOCK. Jwfitt Marges LLB MM, BriW. Aroa

BRATTON, Sara# CardtaelLB MIS, Bah. Area

GRAVES, part* HkteH Ml Nr. ChgtaaL Defer
HARDY. Artec LLB Mr. Hoa»tea-Udprt«. Ty» &
War

CLUBS
EVE has osIMd Via other* because of a

policy on lair play and value tor money.
Supper from 10-3J50 am. Draco and top
musicians, glamorous hostsssae, axdeng
Noorshowa. 01-734 0557.188. Regent SL,
London,

CONTRACTS & TENDERS

Department of Educotion and Science PICKUP Programme

PICKUP Europe Unit
INVITATION TO TENDER

The DES encourages colleges, polytechnics and universities to increase their

provision of adult training and updating forthe professions, industry and commerce
(PICKUP).

It is proposed to set up, within the PICKUP framework, a small unit to enable the

development of training and updating services by further and higher education (FHE)

institutions in response to new business needs created by the completion of the Single

European Market in 1992. The proposed unit will aim to:

— raise awareness within FHE of the training implications of foe Single Market
— digest and provide information on the Single Market for the specific use of foe FHE

audience

— identify scope for development in FHE provision related to Single Market

opportunities

— disseminate good practice In foe FHE sector.

Costs up to a maximum of £123,000 perannum excludingVAT at current prices,

win, subject to foe necessary Parliamentary authority, be met by the DES fora period of not

more than 3 years. It is expected that foe need for Government funding will become less

during the 3 year period as foe Unit generates its own Income.

It is anticipated that an HE institution would be the most appropriate body to develop

foe proposed Unit However, afl organisationswith experience of FHE are invited to submit

tenders for the setting up and operation of the Unit Private organisations are welcome to

submit joint bids in conjunction with FHE Institutions. All tenders need to be submitted via

an HE institution and Include such an institution as a partner.

Experience of European Community matters will bea key criterion in assessing bids.

The Unit will be based in London but not necessarily staffed and managed by a
London-based body. Two professional staff with one support staff member will comprise

the Unit

The Unit win be operated by the successful bidder under the overall management
control ofa steering group comprising representatives of foe Department of Education and
Science, the Department of Trade and Industry, the Employment Department: The Training

Agency, and the Further Education Unit-

Interested institutions should write for further information to: Department of

Education and Science. Furtherand Higher Education Branch 3,

Room 8/10, Elizabeth House, York Road, London SE1 7PH.

Witten requests should be clearly marked 'Ref: PICKUP

EUROPE UNIT, to be received not later than 18 September 1989.

RMMNCTDN, WWta Hut LLB Mr, AUrMp. WMs*
HO, CM Krt DNrtSortrolMSwinCtat «f Hon
ItegMf. CBOamtKNM

~~ ”

IREIE, Minbm'Ckrta LLB Mr HnUffita
CMbMjtaiw
JACKSON. HMh Hastate LLB Mo. Nrectar Ortr
Irtt. Stall

JAMES, Kart Drtot LLB Mbs. HwNcrcflrt. Wet
VMMMt
JAMISON. DaH LLB Mr. Wutita Lteta
JONES, Jta Alvji LLB Mr. Ota**. On*
JONS. Abroad Alpoa BA Mbs. Holyadl. Ci*rt

JONES. Sbtaa Grtta LLB Mr. Kotitafl, CM*
JOOO. CWaoMw-rntai LLBMfTtrKXctoi. MMHrex
KARABETEL Nna LLB M% EtaM Data
KNBHT. Ftou ONili LLB Mis BtewnU.DM
LAM. Gw Kart-ttMi Start d rt Start Cta d
OortfoNr, Toraate. Coada

LANIN. Drtrt PM LLB. Mr. tea SrtbfMR, Data
LEA. Jrttalat Mstpru U.B, Mis lata Notitart
LEWIS, EHBtefa tat, 6A. Mta, BbHOiWMm
U. ArtU Sat Htn. Bit LLB, Mta, Lndaa
UNDSAY. ten U.B. Ml* ToosUS. SOW Oa Ttal
UHTBN, (Mata EHrtrt, Bsrtte 6 Stater Of Tkt

W56 Csat d NtaDM, Ml. Data
MACARTNEY, Jta Ltaioa PrtUsiv, Mr, Hlreortb,

MJMua
HALVE. Asipta KrtMtartjl CMtrt. Sottdta Of

The tarn Oort M Sri Lata. Mta, HsUa Em,
Mddtaa
MAN. Ytebfl* BA Mu. Rod llatata Nsttadtaw
MCCORMACK. Tr*qr Art LLB. Mta, CsWff. Soot*

MffADDEH, Doric Gtes. Sodriur 01 TV Sapnav Coart

01 Albert. Mr. DrtS
MCFALL Beta Jan. LLB. Mta. taste, Stapta*
HUHMEAD. Jmb Dirt Ourtac LLB, Mr, IMNaa.

GMtor

MULHERR. Mta JanpH* BA Mta. Orfta
OWEN. WUUtm Bdacd. LLB, Mr, ttamw. Httsa
MNESAR. Puntader Sta*. LLB, Mr. HanckadL Enb
PARTRIDGE. Roger Jato Ctorla. SMktar K Tbe Htga

CsaiJH MarZtaad. Ur; Data.- -

PATEL Krti tagtal, SoUdte OTTta SrtOMOMt K
ZMIl, Nr. Data
PINHEY. Si«i Eten. Solicitor Of Tta Start* Com Of

tea Sort Wart. Ml, Laota
PITTKK. Darid Oario, Mr. BUM, Art
POOH. ArtoorKta Sob. SMUtor «Ttar
Hoag Kong. Ur, CMftl Hoag Koag

POWER. Park* ta. Mr. GolUford. Sorrej

PRTSE-OAVeS. rtgk. MA Nr. Irtta
IAJAPAKSA. Aali Merirt- Baring BSoriritor Of Tta
HMb Dm Of Not Ztartl Hi itert* Bate
SAYNEK. ValrtL LLB. Mt, MUMoo, Oa
RDBHTS. PM1UJrteULB. Mr, TWetata
SARGMSH, Jaoe. Ms. Wn ringta. Ckrtta

LEGAL NOTICES
insurance Companies Act 1982

FS ASSURANCE LIMtTEO

BRITANNIA UFE UMITED

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that an 22nd
August 1968. a Pafltlon havtng baa prrt-
•ntad la lh« Court o( Sou I on by FS
Aaouraoca Unriud • company mcofporaoed
undor Conteanlea Ms T948 Id 1987 (rog-

btered no J7222I and havtng Its ragtatarad
otto* «l 190 Wrtt Owrga Street. Glasgow
0a 2PA (Hftaanor retarred go as "F3") lor

(1) tba sancUon ot Nw Court aa required
by 6«cNon 49 of tha maunnea Care-
panlas Act 1962 to a Bctwnre
Involving tha tranoter to Britannia
Uie United a company incorporated
undor tx Compantes Act 1986 (reg-

taared no 1I7|18) and having tfe

regkusred offica at 190 Watt Oawge
StreoL GMagow 03 SPA (haretnaitar

referred to aa Britannia Ufe*) OI tha
whola ol thm tong term buolnaas (aa
dsflnad by tha oaM Ad) carrfed on
by F& and

(2) on ardor undor SaeMon SO ot tha said
Ad panstarring to Britannia Ufe (ho
whofe ol tha vKtortalctngs and ollha
property and UaoBWaa o< FS shrfCxs-
atria to such long tarm businaas,

(ho Vacation Judga by Interlocutor estod
22nd August WHO appointed the Petition la
be intimated on tha WaHa and In (he Minute
Book In common term vid to ba advertised
once In the London GaaetM, die Edinburgh
Gazette and the Ballast Gazette and once he
each of the Scotsman, Glasgow Herald,
Hnandal Timas and The DaHy Telegraph
newspapers, directed service d a copy ol
the Petition on Her Ma|eoiy‘a Secretary of
State tor Trade hi common form, dtapeneed
whh the requirements of section 4S(3Hb) of
the Insurance Companies Act 1962. aird
appointed all parties delating Interest to
lodge answers to the Petition H so advised
wtdun Si days after such Intimation, ssrvlce

Copies ol tin Petition, the Scheme and lha
Report on DM terms of die Scheme by an
Indaoandem Actuary Its required by Section
49 d the said Ad) win be open to inspection
at the registered offices ol FS and Britannia

Ufe. both situate at 190 West George Street
Glasgow G2 2PA. and at each of the branch
ottcea d FS, whoee addresses are set forth
In die Schedule hereto, during normal busi-
ness hours oo any week day (Monday to
Friday) up 10 and Including Die day 21 days
after the publication or Ms notice.

Copies of the above documents writ be fur-
nished to any parson requiring the same by
me unttaiwnentioned Sottdta rs si any time
before an Order sanctioning Die Scheme le

made on toe Petition on payment at a copy-
ing charge ot 10 pence per page.

All of wMah Intimation Is hereby given.

105 West George Streat Blggan Baltlle S
Gifford WS

Glasgow BaBcMera tor Dm Petidooera
G2 10P

4 September HH9

120 Comoro Row imperial House
Birmingham fS-19 fOngswey
B3 3AP London YYC2S 6TH

King WHBam House )4 St James's'
Hoiae Square
T3 Queen Square Manchester
Bristol BS1 4NT M2 OON

.

6 Hop* Sb-SM
Edinburgh
EH2 4DB

176 Bate Street
Glasgow
Glasgow G2 4TB

12 South Parade
Leeds LSI DOS

Houndsgate House
41-43 Houndsgate
Nottingham
NG1 7AA

Spencer House
19-M Carton Place
Southsrrtpton
SOI SEA

LAWYER -BANKING Middle East Location

Our client is a fearing Middle East bank with global operafions. They are looking to remit a

qualified lawyer to work ir their legal department Candidates should have 3^5 years

experience ft a banking or financial institution environment Responsibilities will indude

counselfing, credit documentation and debt securities reviewas weUasgeneraJprocurement

ayeements.

Please contact Brian Jarvis, Senior Consultanton 01-623 1266

SPANISH SPEAKING IN-HOUSE LAWYER Prestigious Bank

c.£253000 plus full benefits

The London branch of a tearing Spanish bank requires an ambitious and diligent graduate

lawyer.^Ttre successful applicant forthis exceptional opporturity will be reqrired toadviseon

the effects of financial legislation, foe recovery of nra-performing assets, and the drafting of

security documentation. Candidates must beable to speak and write excellent Spanish in

order to liaise effectively with external and head office lawyers. Our client also seek& a

. law. ..." .

.

' ..
-• •*

^ Jv.,

•

Hease contact Ron Bradley, Senior Consultant on 01-623 1266

LONDON HONGKONG MIDDLEEAST SINGAPORE SYDNEY

Recruitment Cons&ltants

No. 1 New Street, (offBishopsgale), London EC2M4TP
Telephone: 01-623 1266 Tax: 01-626 5258

IfiJ Irtteioational. foe investment banking subsidiaryInLondon ofThe Industrial
BatnkofJapan.isaleadirigfostttutionfotheint<-iiuitioh^«iP^rH^ir

1ji rii?̂

Weatecurcenfiyseekinga quidlSedlawyer to operate as a seniormember ofa
growing transactions team. Ifouwffl be activelyinvolved inmanagementofeuromarket
transactions rangingfrom straightbonds to complexderivative products and structured
issues. .

Ideallyyouwm be a quafiSedlawyerwith experience inCapital Markets
transactions ataGtylaw firm. Vfe willalsoconsidex candidates without alegal
qualificationbutwith severalyears’experienceinsecuritiestransactionmanagementat
anotherleadinginvestmentbank.

J

Vbu wfflbeathorough professionalwith excellent writtenand oralcommunication
skills, a dYnamteworfeerand an enthusiasticteam player

Inreiumfbrtheabovexequiigments.we areableto offerasalaryandbenefits

Cantfidates shouldsenda ftdlCV, indudii^salary detafistaijufia Stead.
PersonnelDqaartment. ortelephone heronO1-236 1090.

IBJ International
Limited.Buddeirixiry House.'

3QueenVictoria Sheet London EC4N 8HJ5.

LAW SOCIETIES ADMISSIONS
1st SEPTEMBER,1989

SEUATHAM90, Aribote Makodno. Solicitor 01 Tbe
tanwr Ctat Of 5H Ltaa, Mr. Wwtaer. MkHtaot
SERESUWE, Ltiodzn Ifijfeaww JteaUtate WDertrt
SoOttaa OflteSfertta Oort 01 Sri Dol^ Hr, GallC Sri

tab
SETD. Ftate KM SaRttar Ot Tta Srtrt* Com Of
HOte Ote.-Hr. Hoot KMO
STAMFIWTH, Ortttpta Icaawd WllBta BJC, Mr.
rtotywriL Osjd
ST1RZAKCR. la Rabat. LLB. Mr, FanUR Rtatfe,

Warnta
SDDDSIHW& B»a^ SMhftar Of Tta Start Ctat OfSI
Lteta. Mr. Lata
TAW. 0*00 Kte9te.US, Mt 8rt Data
THOMPSON. Gafdn Cap. OA Hr. WHUaiUi,
Hrtata
TTMBERLAKE. Mat Bktad. LLA Mr. Note taut
TWABOSCO. CBtefe. SoddiarOtlteStare Cewt« Hai
5Mb WMB. MV cant mag Kaat
15VI. BteaiOa Itart Sftftcr» TlaSrtta Gewt 01

m* Sort WMa. Mr. CMIM Hog Koq
TWMER. Call*. LLB. Mta, Itate ’ -

TYHER.RKMflJta.B-A. Hr. Wtifistena*. HcrtteotS
VASET, PBricta. LLB. Mta. BrtdoSfSSSL &Sria
WWJBLEftrtd fetii^SpadMrWTteStartCtaW
WEST. Sftan'Cterio, KA Mr. RttbBL Sony
VOURTOH, lair Tmact, LLB. Mr. «*-—TuaTtg.

WKUMTT. tar,. Hr. Otflaa. Bristol

WL5HEH Jart*. BJL Mta Bm. HarttadAbc

WOODWARD. PWr Drtta 9A Mr. Urt
«W. Win Kb. Salfeta 01 Tta Srtnc Cawt W Hoh
Kart «r. ftrtM Naag *»te .

”
YUfal 9bfcMtainhSNaatft«MHteiaq,

Mr. Kotart Han Hate
'

INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL
PROPERTY ADVERTISING

Appears every Saturday.
For further details please contact;

Clive Booth,
Tel 01 873 4915 Fax 01 873 3063

COMPANY NOTICES

HOECHST
AKTIENGESELLSCHAFT

United Kingdom shanehoidera
are advised that copies of the
report on the 1st halfyear
1 989 are now available from:-

S.G. Warburg & Cp. Ltd.
. Paying Agency
2 Finsbury Avenue
London EC2M 2PA

rentals

KENWOODS
rental

UIAUTY FUMliSMCB
FUTS AND H0e$ESJM imI Lent Ut»S Spites SL, Lea*MWZIIA

T«hQM022271Titeb2SZ71
fac (01) 262 3750
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Architecture

A clear

vision
Prince Charles’s
week for the

/
t's going to be a heD of a
week. You may have
thought that the archi-
tectural debatewas calm-

ing down and that after the
long hot summer it might be
possible to slip quietly into an
autumnal hibernation. Not so.

It aH starts on Thursday
when HRH The Prince of.
Wales will open an exhibition;
about tils architectural ideas at
the Victoria and Albert
Museum in London. Tlie open-
ing of the exhibition also
marks the launch of his book
which will be published on’the
same day. (A Wan ofBritain
— A PersonalJ/iem ofArchftec-
tnre, by HRH The Prince of
Wales, Doubleday, 0.635).

To ensure media saturation
the serialisation of the royal
book has already started in a
national Sunday newspaper..
From the initial extract it is
possible to see that the »*nai
substance af Prince Chades's

'

book Is far' from being an
extended attack on modern
architecture. Rather it is a
eflbn, considered and construc-
tive "thinking aloud* by a
young man concerned about
the whole problem of the Brit-

ish built environment
The Prince of Wales has put

himself in-a position where he
receives thousands of letters

.

that share his puzslemfent
about the sheer, difficulty of .

improving 'architectural stan-
dards. No-one could disagree
wsh the need to establish a
simpler code of design ethics

book will kick off an eventful
s$ys Colin Amery

: fliat hwnn snmp rriflflmw'Mp to
.
the places we know^and love.

Respect for the land, a sense of
the importance of scale and

a cohcfem for the
use of local -materials —

all these seem obvious to the.
layman but are often, ignored
wilftiUy

book is really a plea for us all
1 to - state' out of~our' aesthetic

'

jdtehess. lt' is s modest, polite
and decent manifesto, merci-
fully free of flippant jargon.
The book is not simply about
architectural styiq.it naturally
wriijHHy

.
srnnu

.
pwanmil pfffrr-

.
epees, :hut these are scarcely
'SufBoentto justify .some of the
pmfefldiwal MBmah fhs& Tiaa

been exhibited by some arcbi-

.

tects. The' Frlnice does not
Anmi the nbv — heis yearn-
ing for more quality and less

dogma from architect Surely
tiiia should be an area. Jar
national agreement.
The eruption of architectural

.events prompted by the
Prince's book, and exhibition
fachiflas three television pro-
grammes this week. There is a
reshowing of the Prince’s own
fihn on BBC j on Thursday, to

be followed by a. debate ,on
BBC l*sAhnnuus" on Friday.

,

On Tueeday on FTV, and in a
ffifftrmi tari, there is.the first

of a series of six. programmes -

fftmT ynHcaWiw TafevisIppLitt
wHdi priripflu Tamlilairi fyW "

brates toe rich. variety. <£ new
btoldhig8

r

she has teen on her
travels throughout Britain. She

will certainly puncture the
.humourless architectural pro*
Session in her programmes,
which' are significantly called
“Hurray for Today.”
The andteww |\aratio of archi-

tectural events continues next
week with the appearance of a
new monthly (ten tunes a year)
architectural, magazine, Archi-
tecture Today, edited by two
younger"veterans of the build-

ing press, Ian Latham and
Mark Swenarton. The maga-
zine is to be tent free to all

.members of profession, but
it aims to be a high quality
give-away.

'he first issue looks

promising and agree-
ably low-key. It has
an international per-

spective, which could help to
end the ludicrously incestuous
nature oif much of the national
debate that endlessly rattles oh
in so tp*™h of the professional
press. It is interesting to
-glimpse the proposed domed
dty church that is planned for
Milton Keynes ana to learn-
that Ricardo Boffl is to design
on a site at Stockley Park.
For a quick and. partial sur-

vey of what current British
architecture looks like, there. fa
another new book. New British

Architecture, by Jonathan
Giancey (Thames and Hudson,
£20) to be published cm Thurs-
day. There is nothing in this

Stirling or Normab^Foster,
which; certainly makes one
question its value as a serious

Prince Charles: a clarion can
to shake us out of ooelhoUc
Idleness. Above and right, foe
Richmond riverside
development and Glasgow's
Burrell Collection building:
prime candidates for a royal
seal of approval

critical survey of the current
state of the art.

The thesis of the book is that

Thatcherism hasmade enough
people rich to encourage a
wave of- significant new build-

ings in the private sector.
Many of these are bars, shops
and cafes with an ephemeral
appeal However, this is where
the young designers start and
we will certainly tear more of
Nigel Coates (of the Cafe
Bongo in Tokyo and the Kath-
erine Hamnet shop in London’s
Sloane Street), and of David
Chipperfield, who designs
shops and offices inr»1iifling the
remarkable (and remarkably
named) Bingo Bango Bongo
bar, also in Tokyo. If we want
to see the future for London,
Giancey seems to suggest, we
should be looking at Tokyo.
This is really a picture book

with very good photographs,
but it is slight on critical argu-
ment. while it frequently tells

us how vibrant the 1980s have
been, in the same breath he
tells us that it has all been like
a pop video. In feet there is a
great deal of imaginative talent

in Britain but the omission of
important architects like Eric
Parry, Evans and Shalev,

-irrTT''-' • Vi
[j

“i iVYl!

David Lea and Keith Crrtchlow
makes me wonder whether
Giancey is more interested in
trendiness than quality.

The week would not be com-
plete without a mention of the
inevitable whimper from the
Royal Institute of British
Architects, which must by now
feel that it can never get any-
thing right. The institute’s
response to the general furore
has been to produce a book by
its new president. The Prince of
Wales, Right or Wrong? An
Architect Replies

,

by Maxwell

Hutchinson (Faber and Faber
£1039, paperback £439).
This is a curious little vol-

ume written in a sort of jour-

nalese' that I thought Tom
Wolfe bad finally laid to rest
The book reads like an earnest
school essay but at more
length and-with no pictures. It

is a shame that Hutchinson
has been compelled to rush

into print seemingly in order

to gain personal publicity. I

couldn't help wondering why
he had chosen the profession of
architecture. He would be
much more at home at Cape
Kennedy, where he could proj-

ect his vision of a technological

fixture into space.

His book shows him to be a
fantasist with little sense of
logic, history or design. This
book is a throwback to the
1960s, when students skir-

mished with social concern but
really preferred pop music. It

would have been wiser for the
profession not to publish such
a superficial book. There is, of
course, a need for architecture
to evolve and provide for our
needs in the 21st century. But
progress demands an under-
standing of humanity — some-
thing many architects seem
unable to grasp. Enjoy an
architectural week.

The Moonstone
NimrVICTOlIMvCnHdB :

WECkie CofflnsVnovd has not -

so much been adapted by Chris
Martin as serialised. On a
ratimr fetching landscape by
Anny Everson and Brigitte
Lambert, three levels of pol-
ished wood, with a hint of
rushes in -the middle to site'

Best the Shivering Sands, the
characters in this first of
detective stories trite taras to
recite their parts in what 1
take to be mostly the words
from the page.

It is a satisfactorily baffling

tale, though it breaks some of
the rules of detective-fiction as
subsequently agreed by practi-

tioners of the craft. Facts are
concealed that should rightly

be given to the audience; and
as for the final twist, where
we learn that Franklin Blake,
who unconsciously stole" the
Moonstone under opium, then

passed, ft on to Godfrey AWe-
white, there is no due to his
having done anything, of
sort. We am Just told that he

It is not really a detective

story, in fact, in spite of the
endearing figure ofToses-lnving
Sergeant Cuff of the London
Detective Agency, whom
David IfiDer plays very much:
according to the book. The dia-

mond, stolen by young Hem-
castle when he was serving in
India, and .passed to the Verihr
dess with, an.Indian curse on it:

and three Indians determined:
to get' ft back, was given to
-Rachel Vazinder (Frances
Fielding) for her birthday and
stolen the same night.
Blake and Ahlewhlte, both

after Rachel’s
7

hand and for-

tune, were in' the house, and
one- of the housemaids.

Rosanna, has served a prison
term for theft. Cuff thinks
Rachel might even have taken
it herself. The only due we
have is the smeared paint on a
newly-painted door; but. there
is no stained garment to go
-with-it

The entire story is told in
brief episodes in which the
dialogue i«aiwfa»lwf genu-
ine 1850. quality.

I have to say that, although
. flw complications of the tale,

hove their fascination, Chris
Martin’s method (he also
directs) makes far a lung even-
ing;- Ezra Jennings, who pro-
vided the opium, says at one
point, “The time continues to
pass slowly,” and a London
audience would not have
received that fine so passively.

B. A. Young

OlafBar
WKkMORBHALL

To rehearse Bar’s virtues as a
Iieder singer yet again would
be otiose, and also unfairly tan-

talising: nowadays only well-

organised Londoners on the
right mailing lists can get to

hear him. The excellent Wig-
more Hall Is small, and so far

B5r shows no inclination to try

the larger ones here. (We have
a gap that needs filling, by an
auditorium with an acoustic as
friendly as the Wigmore’s but
twice the size.) His velvety,
sweetly confiding baritone
must be one of the most care-

fully husbanded instruments
in the business: no forcing, no
risk-taking. So far, given his

rare musical intelligence and
grace, the result has always
justified itself.

Lucidly all the same, he has
a burgeoning operatic career
which requires more (year

after next, a Glyndeboume
Don Giovanni); and his Satur-

day recital showed how judi-

ciously he is aiming toward
bigger scale. He began with
Schumann’s least favoured
cycle, the dozen op. 35 songs
after Justinus Kemer - hardly
operatic stuff, what with Ker-

nels woozy German-Romantic
verses (which travel very
badly) and the loyal murk pre-

served in Schumann’s settings,

but just on that account need-
ing bold shafts of filumination.

Bar and his accompanist
Geoffrey Parsons (on best
form) provided many of those.

In the one familiar number,
“Erstes Grun" he wasn't mis-
led by the winsome piano-inter-

ludes - unlike most singers -

into making it idyllic and
pretty, but recognised the
underlying malaise.

The Bar voice has darkened
perceptibly, and elsewhere it

took on a sharply poignant
edge. Kemer's morbid shaggy

-

dog story about a young nov-

ice, “Stirb, Lieb und Freud." is

probably unsaveable, and even
Bdr and Parsons sounded dis-

couraged there, but Bar’s sud-

den switch to a white, androgy-
nous timbre for the nun's
climactic plea had to count as
an authentic risk. No space
now to discuss Bar’s ten Rich-
ard Strauss songs; but his new-
ly-found irony and vocal sexi-

ness were splendid, as well as
his searing attack in “Ruhe,
meine Seele.” As the old dis-

arming pudeur fades, his
expanding range promises -

all in due course, naturally -
much more.

David Murray

FT hand delivered ill Belgium
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MUSIC

London

Tbe Proms. This year's Proms
continue until September 16.
Most concerts take place at the
RoyallAlbert Hall, though St
Paul's Church, Krrightsbridge,
and Kensington. Town Hall are
also used. Tickets fear most con-
certs COSt from £3 tO W 1 ami
can be booked on 589 8202, 639
9465 (10am-6pm) or 379 4444 (24
hours); promenade tickets are
available only at the door cm
the day of the concert priced
at £1-50 or £2.
This week's programme

Minna xm], Tavener. Mussotsp*
sky. Stravinsky (BBC Symphony
Orqhfiatra/Oliver Knussen)
(Moo); Prokofiev and Rtefey-
Korsakov played by the London
Symphony Orchestra under
Mlrhafl Tfieoh Thomas (Toe);
Bach’sMass in B Minor in a per-
formance conducted by John
Eliot Gardiner (Wed* and a pro-
gramme.ofBeethoven, Hoddinott
and Elgar conducted by Bichard
Armstrong(Thnr).

Krakow Choirand Philharmonic
Orchestra conducted by Krzysz-
tof Penderecki, with Barbara
Zagorzanka (soprano). Verdi's
Requiem (Toe). Salle Pfeyel
(48049601).
Paris Ars Antique. Musicofthe
Troubadours, 15th century musi-
cal the court of Burgundy, 16th
and 17th court and village music
(Mon), French, medieval songs,
ShalramHarp and •RHvahothan
music (Wed); music from the

Crusaders' period. Guillaume
de Machaut, golden age of Span-
ish music (Thnr). The Ars Anti-
qna concerts take place at 7.16pm
and 9-15pm in tho Salnte Cha-
pelle with its jewel-like 13th cen-
tury windows (43406517)- 4, Bd
dn Palais.

Brussels

Cerde Royal Gardens. La Follia

Instrumental Ensemble and Irina

TsettUn (violin), playing Lully's
Alddiane et Polexandre. Vivaldi
and Bach (Sept 4) (613 83 20).

fflnapaiift rffcw RrigttHnwt Brus-
sels Festival Orchestra con-
ducted by Robert Janssens.
Vivaldi (Sept 4) (513 88 40.

Ludwigsburger ScMoss-
festftptofe

Wflrttemberg’s international

festival:

Schloestheater- Die Hochzdt des

Figaro is Dieter Dorn’s produc-
tion with Joachim Selpp, Verena
Schweiaer, Marianne Hirsti,

Anton Scharinger, Marianne Ror-
hnlm and conducted by Wolfgang
Coennenwein (Mon. Wed); Hans
Werner Henze’s opera Die Bas-
sariden with Kenneth Siegel,

Wolfgang Schoene, Wolfgang
Probst, Michael Austin, Karan
Armstrong, Ortrud Wenkel and
the Stuttgart Opera Orchestra,
conducted by Garcia Navarro
CThur)-

Frankfurter Paste 1989

This year’s Frankfurt Festival

with the title ofA Common

Brotherhood is based on two
historic events: the French Revo-
lution in 1789 and the start of
the Second World War n 50 years
ago.
The programme with around
100 performances, attempts to
explain the historic events and
their influence on contemporary
culture and society in terms of
the struggle for liberty. It starts
with an international chair festi-

val with 10 different ensembles
from various nations, accompan-
ied by the Moscow Radio Orches-
tra. jointly conducted by Wladi-
mlr FedosscJew and Gary BertinL

There will performances of
works by Manrldo Kagel, of Brit-

ten's War Requiem and Proko-
fiev's Alexander Nevsky.
Most of the Beethoven sympho-
nies will be played by the Con-
certgebouw Orchestra Amster-
dam, conducted by Riccardo
Chaifly, the Berlin Philharmonic,
Leningrad Symphony, the Saito

Kinen Orchestra under Setji

Ozawa.
The North German Radio
Orchestra will perform Krzysztof
Penderecki's Polish Requiem,
under the composer.
Other highlights indnde a con-

cert version of Andrea Chenier
starring Renato Brusca, Franco
Banisolli, Marla Guelegina and
the Budapest Radio Choir con-

ducted by Gianluigi Gelmetti,
as well as Handel's rarely played
Ttanerkmo.
There will be also be contempo-
rary music by Wolfgang Rihm,
Mauricio Rage], Michael Sell

and Antonio Madigan. Experi-
ments, musical theatre, chamber
mnrii*, exhibitions *ynd open-air
music round off the programme.
Aite Open tickets Frankfurt 069/

1340-400. Ends Oct 3.

Stress

Setttmane Mnsicaii: Teatro del

Palazzo del Congress. Katia Ric-

carelll sings Mozart. Locatelli,

Handel. Paisello and Vivaldi

CTues) (31095/30459).

Vienna

Jess Trio. Chopin. Liszt, Bee-
thoven. Palais Palffy (Mon).
Haydn Sinfonietta conducted
by Manfred Huss. Haydn. Mozart
Palais Auersperg (Tues).
Wiener Klavierqaarfett Mozart,
Mahler, Schumann. Palais Palffy
(Thur).

Washington

National Symphony Orchestra.
Pops concert conducted by Nor-
man Leyden with the Paul Hill

Chorale. Ellington, Porter, Cohan
(Thur). Kennedy Center Concert
Hall (Thur) (354 3776).

Tokyo

Hiroko Nakamura (piano), with
the Yomluri Nippon Symphony
Orchestra, conducted by Nao'niro
Totsuka. Beethoven. Rachmani-
nov. Suntory Hall (Mon) (356
9999).

Ketko Maefaashl (violin), with
Tokyo Symphony Orchestra,
conducted by Kazuyoshi Aki-
yama. Prokofiev, Brahms (Tues).
With Takahiro Sotioda (piano).

Brahms, Bartok. Franck (Wed).
Suntory Hafi (646 934$).
japan Philharmonic Orchestra
conducted by Ken'lchiroh Kobay-
ashL Mahler. Suntory Hail (Thur)
(234 6911).

Sponsorship

Scotland’s cash

balancing act
With four months still to go

before Glasgow becomes Euro-

pean City of Culture, £1.4m has
already been raised in business

sponsorship and the figure is

expected to reach £2m before

the start of the year-long fes-

tivities on January 1.

Eighty per cent of that

money is new sponsorship -

either from first-time sponsors
or from firms which are mak-
ing a contribution over and
above their normal commit-
ments, according to. Wendy
Stephenson, director of spon-

sorship for Glasgow 1990.

A vital part of her job is to

ensure that Glasgow's gain is

not the rest of Scotland's loss,

with backers dropping less
glamorous commitments to
jump on the 1990 bandwagon.
“It is very important that the
big organisations don't feel we
are stealing money away from
them.” she said. “If a firm
comes to me saying they are

interested, my first question is,

how will it fit in with your
pvisting programme?”
The backing for Glasgow

1990 - the biggest sum raised

in the history of Scottish spon-
sorship — compares with
around £500,000 for this year's

Edinburgh Festival For ail the
confidence that the celebration

will presage a new era of arts

sponsorship in Scotland, there
remains an anxiety as to what
the effect will be.

The Cumbernauld Theatre,
in a new town just 10 miles
from Glasgow, is an example of

a small outlet which, through
sustained hard work, now
makes up to 6 per cent of its

income through sponsorship,
compared with a national aver-

age of about 1 per cent.

Administrator David Taylor
said: “We are looking for extra

money in 1990 for our own
events, but Glasgow has a very
high-powered operation and we
hope that doesn’t drain the
money away."
New sponsors who have

already committed themselves
to the Glasgow festivities

range from solicitors Brechin
Robb, who are putting £5,000

into a night of the Scottish

Opera, to distillers Whyte &
Mackay, making their arts
sponsorship debut with
£135,000 hacking far the Van
Gogh exhibition.

Whyte & Mackay’s approach
to their involvement is hard-
nosed. reflecting a feeling
among many sponsors that
input into the arts must justify

itself in marketing terms. The
company has previously chan-
nelled its sponsorship through
sport, concentrating on golf
and on football internationals.

Marketing director Charles
Shaw sai± “I think up to now
arts groups have seen sponsor-
ship more as patronage, but it

is a commercial world and we
measure the value of it pound
for pound against all other ele-

ments of marketing. Patronage

has no part to play in that”

Whyte & Mackay chose to

back the Van Gogh exhibition

in tbe belief that it had a
strong local appeal and a high

profile. “We thought that put-

ting together the biggest exhi-

bition of a Gogh’s work outside

his home country was some-

thing that in PR terms we
could merchandise,” said Mr
Shaw.

His stance is characteristic

of a business community
which is demanding ever big-

ger and more imaginative
incentives from arts organisa-

tions as the competition for

sponsorship increases.

Figures compiled by the
Scottish Arts Council from its

own clients reveal a tenfold

increase in business sponsor-

ship since 1979-80, with particu-

larly large rises in the
brewing/distillery and media
sections. Deregulation of
advertising has meant that

legal and professional firms are

also featuring for the first

time.

But with more than 90 per

cent of the money concen-
trated on Edinburgh and Glas-

gow, and about two-thirds of it

going to the Edinburgh Festi-

val and the four national com-
panies, huge problems still

remain for organisations that

are either geographically unap-
pealing or involved in tradi-

tionally unattractive areas
such as the visual arts or
experimental work.

SAC’s director Timothy
Mason sounds a note of warn-

ing. “I think we've realised

that sponsorship isn't the

answer: there’s no Seventh
Cavalry. Longer-term sponsor-

ships are rare and bargaining
for the benefits is getting very
much harder."

In response to the uncertain-

ties of both sponsorship and
subsidy, Edinburgh Festival

has launched a £10m endow-
ment initiative, which is

already well on its way to its

first million.

“Complementary" was a
word that loomed large in the

summing up speech of Edin-

burgh's director Frank Dunlop
as he was pressed on the
impact that 1990 would have
on the financial and artistic

wellbeing of next year’s Festi-

val.

Wendy Stephenson; who
built up business sponsorship
for Edinburgh before defecting

to Glasgow, puts it in a nut-
shell: “People must realise that

the most important thing
about 1990 is 1991."

Claire Annitstead

La gazza ladra
PESARO FESTIVAL

Almost exactly 10 years ago.
when Pesaro’s Rossini Opera
Festival shyly appeared on the
Italian musical scene, it inau-
gurated its activities - and the
handsomely, tactfully restored
Teatro Rossini - with an
enjoyable revival of La gazza
ladra in a smooth, simple pro-

duction by Sandro Sequi.
designed by Giuseppe Criscdini
Malatesta, based on the Scala
sets of the 1817 premiere. The
opera was an especially appro-
priate choice because in 1818 it

had opened the then
brand-new Teatro Rossini with
the composer conducting.

In 1980 La gazza ladra was
something of a rarity in Italy,

like many other Rossini
operas; and audiences came
more for the work itself than
for the production. But in this
past decade, the dazzling suc-
cess story of Pesaro's festival

in honour of its most illustri-

ous son has inspired further
Rossini investigation - and
performance - elsewhere.
Choosing to repeat the inau-

|

gural opera after 10 years
afforded an opportunity to
assess in a sew light the posi-
tion of Rossini and the festival.

Though the Rossini canon is

extensive, it is not inexhaust-
ible. and the Pesaro festival is

rightly concentrating less on
discovery and more on inter-

pretation.

In repeating La gazza ladra
it has allowed those of us with
long memories to compare two
different and significant atti-

tudes. Ten years ago. there
were no big names in the cast,

and - except for the American
tenor Bruce Brewer - there

were no singers that could be
considered belcanto specialists.

The production, largely in pas-

tel shades, emphasised the
fairy-tale quality of the
libretto, the dire adventure of
tbe unjustly-accused Ninetta,
saved from execution by a
series of fortuitous coinci-
dences in time for a happy end-
ing.

The new production by Mich-
ael Hampe. designed by Carlo
Diappi, looks at the opera from
a divergent, far more sinister
point of view. Partly also
because of the dominating
presence of Samuel Ramey as
the relentlessly wicked

Podesta, the forces of evil seem
much stronger, and the
fairy-tale takes on a dark, grim
hue.
Another stalwart of the festi-

val, Katia Ricciarelli, was the
Ninetta. After a recent fiasco

at La Scala in a Verdi opera,
here she was on safer ground;
and she sang always decently,
sometimes affectingly. though
she was over-cautious.

A more-than-promising
tenor, William Matteuzzi, was
an appealing Giannetto. The
gifted mezzosoprano Bernad-
ette Manca di Nissa - who has
already mad«» her mark at La
Scala - sang the trouser role
of Pippo simply and movingly.
But, for that matter, the entire
cast was effective and stylish
(another mezzo, Luciana d’ln-

tino, deserves special praise for
her interpretation of the
ungrateful role of Lucia).
Though Ramey seemed the
protagonist of the opera, he
was ably supported by another
fine bass. Ferruccio Furlanetto.
as Ninetta’s unfortunate
father.

Michael Hampe’s staging
was traditional, straightfor-
ward. awkward only in the
crowd scenes. Diappi’s designs

were appropriately autumnal,
in keeping with the general
approach to the piece. The Pra-
gue Philharmonic Chorus (pre-

pared by Lubomir Mall) and
the Turin Orchestra of the Ital-

ian Radio - both apparently
regulars at the festival now -
were in excellent form.
In commemoration of the

late Jean-Piene Ponelle the fes-

tival revived his staging of

L ’occasions fa i! ladra, recre-

ated by his one-time assistant

Francesca Zam hello. Actually,
this revived version seemed
less hectic than the original,

and more likeable. Ion Martin
conducted the Turin musicians
deftly, unobtrusively; and the
largely young cast sang with
brio. Alfonso Antoniozzi was
tirelessly resourceful as the
comic servant Martino and the
petite young soprano Giusy
Devinu (praised in these col-

umns last January for her sing-

ing in Paer's Achilie in Lugo)
confirmed her grasp of early
lSlh century style.

William Weaver
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Labour and
the unions
THIS YEAR’S season of
political conferences, of which
this week's annual gathering
of the Trades Union Congress
is the first, has as its theme
the question of whether the
Conservative Party will or will

not win a fourth election in a
row. All politicians are acutely
aware of this; so are the princi-

pal trade union leaders, who
remain mentors of the Labour
Party. The deliberations of the
four opposition parties, plus
those of the TUC, will largely
be about how to bring Mrs
Thatcher’s period of office to

an end; the Conservatives will

be conscious that the one thing
they cannot do is take victory

for granted.
They will find it less easy

than it was to make political

capital out of the trade unions,
which were once an undoubted
asset for the Conservative
Party. One reason is that
unions are no longer perceived
as a threat to the elected gov-
ernment. The TUC leaders
have become more settled
about their role in politics.

Although the trade unions will
finance Labour's election cam-
paign. they are gradually with-
drawing from an overt political

role. There is little desire
among them to resume a cen-
tral position in managing an
incomes policy or in economic
planning. Another factor is

that Tory legislation is work-
ing. This summer's strikes
were called after lawful ballots.

None involved mass picketing
or violence. As a result in some
cases, such as the rail disputes,
the unions enjoyed substantial
public support

Steady decline
Yet the TUC leaders are not

brimming with confidence this

year. They are aware that the
steady decline in union mem-
bership will not necessarily be
arrested by the election of a
Labour government Their best
hope is to eschew politics and
concentrate on providinga bet-
ter service for their members.
This week the TUC will con-
sider holding its congress bien-
nially rather than annually.
This would create room for
smaller industrial conferences,
at which unions would focus
on collective bargaining priori-

ties rather than Government
.policy.

It would also continue the
process that has made the

Deeply fried

EC chip users

unions less of a liability for the
Labour Party, although there
Is still some way to go. Labour
managed to avoid getting
caught up in this summer's
disputes. There will be decisive
onion support for the party's
policy review at Labour's Octo-
ber conference. Mr Ron Todd,
general secretary of the Trans-
port and General Workers
Union, remains opposed to the
party’s revised multilateralist
defence policy, but the TGWU
is now largely isolated on that
issue.

Block vote
The links between Labour

and the unions will not be bro-
ken, but they are being loos-
ened. During the coining year
the party will produce a plan
to reduce the role of the union
block vote at its annual confer-
ence. On this matter a compro-
mise may not suffice: the pub-
lic will not be convinced that
Labour is a truly democratic
party until the special union
vote is ended.
Voters will also expect a

clear statement of Labour's
Intentions for trade union leg-
islation. The party's policy
review document premuses to
remove what it lists as the
“most objectionable" provi-
sions of Tory legislation; one
effect, it may be' deduced from
statements by some Labour
front-benchers, is that second-
ary picketing would in many
cases once again become law-
ful. The Conservatives will
rightly attack this as a return
to the bad old days. Labour
remains particularly vulnera-
ble on this, partly for substan-
tive reasons, and partly
because a willingness to return
even half-way to pre-1979 prac-

tices suggests that the trade
union leading-strings may
never really be severed.
The forthcoming conferences

will show which of the two
major parties has the best
chance of capturing the centre
ground that is so rapidly
vacated by the diso: _
and poorly led remnants of the
former Alliance. If Labour is to
consolidate the advances it has
made this year, one prerequi-
site is that its relationship
with the TUC and the union
bosses should become at least
as arms-length as that between
the Democratic Party and
organised labour in the US. It

is still less than half-way there.

THE DEAL on exports of
dynamic random access chips
(DRAMs) from Japan to the
European Community,
announced two weeks ago, is

intended to resolve a long-run-

ning dumping dispute. If it is

put Into effect, an industry
producing a particularly impor-
tant intermediate input will be
cartelised on a global scale.
Moreover, the EC has inflicted

the higher prices upon itself

about which it complained
vociferously, when imposed by
the US and Japan, unasked,
exactly three years ago.

The anti-dumping policy of

the EC is controversial There
are questions about whether
the regulations lead to the find-

ing ofdumping when no dump-
ing has occurred. There are
doubts about the relevance of
the concept of dumping. Last
but not least, there is concern
about whether (and when)
actions against dumping are in
the EC’s economic interest.

The agreement on DRAMs
raises the last (and most funda-
mental) issue in a pure form.
An agreement covering not
merely 256K and 1 megabit
chips, but also the next genera-
tion of 4 and 16 megabit chips,

cannot reflect actual findings
of dumping. This is a pre-emp-
tive, protectionist strike, one
affecting a particularly impor-
tant industry. Stripped of cant
about whether a particular
business practice is “fair,” the
action must be judged on the
basis of whose good it serves.

Crocodile tears
One party that cannot be

weeping more than crocodile
tears are the Japanese produc-
ers. Courtesy of the Americans
and now the Europeans an
export cartel is being created,

one that will prevent "‘ruinous

competition" among their most
formidable rivals, one another.
With the floor price in the EC
set at 9 per cent above the
"production cost" of DRAMs
for the next five years, each
new generation is virtually
guaranteed to bankroll devel-
opment of the next. The Japa-
nese can also be confident that
the price to chip-users in Japan
(most of which are the same
companies as the producers)
will often be below that to
users in the two major compet-
ing economies.
But generous as the Commis-

sion is. helping the Japanese to

dominate the world's semicon-
ductor industry and improving
the competitiveness of Japa-
nese semi-conductor users can-
not have been its prime objec-

tive. It also believes it is

helping Community industry.

Market share
Prima fade, however, this is

most implausible. Japan's
share of the European market
for DRAMs is about 50 per
cent. It follows that, unless
there is a large reduction in
the Japanese market share,
half of the benefit of the trans-

fer of income from chip users
to producers will go to Japan.
From the EC's point of view,
the benefits of this agreement
can exceed the costs only if an
Ecu In the hands of a Euro-
pean chip producer is worth
twice as much as an Ecu in the
hands of a user.

it is hardly surprising that
the users - computer manu-
facturers. for example - deny
that they waste money on this

scale. Since they already pay a
tariff on semi-conductors of 12
per cent, they fear that they
will be handicapped in their
competition with their Japa-
nese rivals, the danger then
being that protection will
spread downstream.
Nothing could better demon-

strate the point made by the
committee chaired by Mr Oli-

vier Long, former Director-
General of the General Agree-
ment on Tariffs and Trade, in

its report, Public Scrutiny of
Protection, recently released
by the London-based Trade
Policy Research Centre: “Pol-

icy initiatives, bearing on for-

eign trade, arise in a piecemeal
fashion, are essentially indus-
try-specific and are biased
towards increasing protection."

While it is clear that direct

subsidisation of chip produc-
tion in the EC would be a more
efficient policy than the mini-
mum price agreement, nobody
- and that certainly includes
the Commission - knows the
economic costs and, benefits of
this arrangement This obser-
vation merely underlines the
point made by the Long Com-
mittee: both governments and
the wider community need a
better understanding of the full

implications of such decisions.
Doing something about
“unfair" trade may be justified,

but not if the costs of the rem-

edy exceed those of the disease.

ritish Airways and United
Airlines have never hidden
their global ambitions under
a bushel. BA. the self-pro-

claimed “World's Favourite Airline"
now wants to take a 15 per cent stake
in a carrier which, with similar
immodesty, once called itself “The
Largest Airline in the Free World."

Before glasnost had a chance to out-
date United Airlines' slogan, competi-
tion did. A decade ago. United was the
only US carrier to advocate deregula-
tion. However, it fared badly in the
new competitive era. the victim of
misguided management, a sleepy cor-
porate culture and poor labour rela-
tions. The final ignominy came last
autumn when it lost to its archrival,
American Airlines, the coveted 'rank-
ing as the Largest US carrier.
Now its parent company, UAL,

faces a hostile $6.4bn takeover offer
from Marvin Davis, a Los Angeles
investor and former oilman. To head
that off. United's management and
two groups of employees - pilots and
non-union staff - have joined BA in a
$6.8bn buy-out offer which would cre-

ate the largest employee-owned enter-

prise in the US. As part of the deal,
the pilots have signed a seven-year
agreement to work longer hours for
less pay.
The impetus behind the sudden

dawn of management-employee har-

mony at United is clear enough. But
why has BA. with an unassailable
position In its home market, decided
to invest $750m for a minority holding
in United? What advantages follow
from partial ownership that could not
be achieved through the existing mar-
keting and reservation systems links
between the two airlines?

Sir Colin Marshall. BA’s chief exec-
utive, agrees candidly that he was
motivated by a mixture of defensive
and opportunistic motives. At the
least, BA needs to protect its existing
marketing arrangement with United;
in the agreement’s first two years,
transfers between the two airlines
have risen by 30 per cent more than
the overall growth in passenger num-
bers. The two airlines together also
control Galileo, one of Europe’s lead-

ing reservations systems.
“If the deal went to a group which

included another European airline,

then our marketing agreement with
United would go out of the door very
fast indeed," Sir Colin said at the
weekend. European airlines have
been pressing ahead rapidly with
financial links with US airlines: SAS
has ties with Continental; ELM is pro-
posing to take a stake in Northwest.
“When you look around in the US

at the moment there is not much
choice," Sir Colin says. “Most of the
big ones are spoken for. Given the
extent of our relationship with
United, it would be very foolish for us

'

to pass up this sort of opportunity,
particularly when it makes financial

sense as well"
But the chance to take a 15 per cent

stake in United, and exchange direc-

tors with the US airline, opens a new
range of opportunity for BA.
“As BA alone, we have access to

about 18 per cent of the world's air-

line market; when you add United and
BA together, we will have 48 per
cent” No other single airline or
mooted partnership can approach this
level of penetration. Of the 168 desti-

nations served by BA and 190 by
United, only 31 are common.

Sir Colin says: “We have really only
got our timetables well positioned to
facilitate passenger transfers at four
US airports. We have another 27
where we can do a much better
choice." The most important 11 of
these are in Australasia and the east-
ern edge of Asia.

BA is also hoping to introduce joint
training schemes and perhaps even
collaborate on some purchasing. “We
should be able to derive benefits from
further systems development - ftu>

ther than Covia and Galileo which are
both centred on reservations and the
actual sourcing of business,” says Sir

Clay Harris and Roderick Oram on ^British

Airways’ proposed stake in United Airlines

Flight towards a
global future
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Colin. “There is a whole range of
other systems-related areas where we
can benefit from joint efforts, recog-
nising that both of us are IBM-based."
The logic leads towards an eventual

foil merger, and Sir Cofln does not
dismiss foe idea out of band. But gov-
ernment rules and political sentiment
on both sides of the Atlantic appear to
rule out this prospect for some time to
come. BA is trying to defuse objec-
tions to its role at United by making
clear that it would welcome the US
carrier taking a similar stake in BA
when its finances permit Moreover, it

emphasises, two thirds of the 28 per
cent of BA shares held outside the UK
are in American hands
At present the US hmftH foreign

ownership to 25 per cent and ELM'S
proposed 20 per cent stake - the
highest so far on the table - in
Northwest has not yet been approved.
fr tite UK, the limit is not specified.

“It is dependent entirely on the level

of foreign ownership at which our
British operating licences wifi be in
jeopardy,” says Sir Colin. “At the time
ofprivatisation, we said we believed it

was about 35 per emit It has nevm1

been tested. Air New Zealand Is 34j9
per cent foreign-owned. and nobody to
my knowledge has challenged the
integrity of their licences."

Despite rumblings from Washing-
ton about the current talk of highly
leveraged airline takeovers and the
voracious appetite for US carriers
shown by European airlines, the buy-
out is unlikely to be Mocked by the
regulators.

But the US wifi strenuously fight
any pressure to remove the two road-
blocks to creating truly global carri-

ers: the 25 per cent ownership limit

and fin* pmMMtfrrn nn fhrcdgn gh-ffnaw

carrying passengers between US
cities. The US will

these up in exchange for its

equal access to the deregulated Euro-
pean skies of tire 1990s.

In the current battle fin* United, the
buy-out depends not just on outbid-
ding Mr Davis, but also on getting the
machinists end nahtn staff to makp
similar concessions to those agreed by
pilots and non-union workers. The
pilots and machinists, especially, have
a Long history of mutual antagonism.
“United's pfiots are among toe less

enlightened and most self-interested

in the industry," says one aviation
consultant.

Success, however, would ensure
that the airline has tiie cost structure,
work practices and atmosphere neces-
sary to bring to full fruition the revit-

alisation which has been achieved
under Mr Stephen WoK, DAL’S chair-
man and leader of the buy-out
“Where the industry turned

we turned left," Mr Wolf
this year. His predecessor, Mr Richard
Ferris, embarked on a quixotic quest
to create a global travel conglomerate
at a time when UAL’s competitors
were pouring investment into their
airline operations.
In the decade up to 1987, UAL

invested $L7bn on buying and build-
ing up the Hertz car rental and Wes*
tin hotel operations. The company
invested only $5^tm in United Air-
lines. AMR, American’s parent, spent
more than HObn (Including aircraft
leases) to build its operations. As a
result; United's domestic passenger
capacity increased only 3.1 per cent a
year, while that of AMR and several
other competitors increased by more

than 8 per cent
The relative stagnation weakened

its market power and contributed to

the deterioration in labour relations,

particularly with United’s pilots. The
blunt, belligerent Mr Ferris was no
help. Hie puoied through, forexample,
a rule that executives riding in cock-
pits could give orders to pilots.

As a result of long; bitter strikes

with cabin crews in 1984 and cockpit

crews in 1985, UAL won the right to

pay incoming staff less than old
hands. But because United grew more
slowly than its rivals, its labour costs
have risen L7 per cent since 1982
while American's have fallen 5.6 per
cent, according to Ms Candace Brow-
ning, tiie airline analyst with Werth-
ebn Schroder in New York.

Ultimately, it was bad morale as
much as poor financial performance
that ended Mr Fterris’s era. In 1987,
the pfiots offered to buy the airline

from its parent, which helped to. put
the company in play. Conistan Part-
ners, a group of three New York raid-

ers, hefoed force out Mr Flerris, trigger
-rtfre safe of Hertz and Westin and
Tiring about a buy-back of $3fan of the
company’s stock.
The company brought in Mr Wolfto

pick up the pieces. A tall man with a
formidable reputation for rescuing
troubled airlines, he gets the credit
for yanking UAL most of the way
back on track. He stands to make
more than |5Qm on his UAL options.
“He has intense fandabttfty.” says

one corporate financier. This wifi be
pul to the test fitting up the money for
the buy-out, although Sir Cohn said
on Saturday; “Bankers are lining up
to lend money to tire company.” .

In less than two years at the con-

trols of UAL. Mr Wolf has invigorated
the slow and cautious, culture,
reshaped the company’s structure and
hired new Wood - about 25 per cent
of its corporate officers werenired is
his time.

. .
..

United has greatly 'improved its ser-

vice and marketing. It Is also - now
better at exploiting Its bigmar-

ket shares at its main hubs of Chi-
cago, Denver and. San _Francisco and
at squeezing the .maximum revenue
out of its seats. Operating profitsWere
up 47 per cent in the first half of this
year from a year earlier. Mr Wolf even
found rtm« last year to get married
for the first tune at the'age of 47.

He made one serious miscalcula-

tion, though. He told pfiots and other
employees, some of whom bad been
negotiating new contracts for two
years, he would not order newaireraft

until they- agreed to pay; and:work-
rule concessions, :

Eventually,, tills May. he gave in

and ordered 370 Boeing antiners

worth 515.7bn without getting the
new labour pacts. He could not afford

to be pushed even farther dawn the
Industry's fast-lengthening queue for

newaireraft.
Until the latest buy-out idea sur-

faced. Mr Wolf had made little prog-

ress in winning over the pilots. For
example, two new Boeing 747-400 air-

liners. worth 3125m apiece, have sat

on the ground all summer because the

plots haye yet to agree terms for fly-

ing them. This hurdle was cleared in

last week’s negotiations.

The buy-out team cannot assume,
however, that they have the deal
locked up. Mr Davis, the rival bidder,

is still a wildcatter at heart Even h
he has forsaken the oilfields, for Bev-
erly unlit, he is always on theprowL
He wffl be likely to push the buy-out

price tn tin* limit.

If BA and its partners win, the
effect on United's domestic competi-

tion will be electrifying. Pah Am and
TWA in particular wfil have to hasten

them search for the partners they say
they need to survive. "There's an
awful lot of ‘me-too-ism’ in the airline

industry,” an analyst said. “Globalisa-

tion has barely begun."
“Pan Am and TWA will be the big

losers,” said Mr Morten Beyer, presi-

dent of Avmark, a Washington avia-

tion consultancy. “They wifi be forced

into someone’s arms.” '

.

Either one, but more likely Pan
Ain, could find a.^veLcome at AMR,
which under the restless and aggres-
sive leadership ofMr Robert Crandall,
will have to find a way to match the
international power UAL wifi gain
through BA.
But for BA itself; Is the decision to

expose itself so deeply to the cut-
throat. US market - especially
through a leveraged bid - a wise
one? It argues that it has no choice.

Passenger traffic to and from the UK
is forecast to grow by only 4 per cent
per annum over the next decade,
against a 6 per cent estimate for the
world as a whole. BA needs to break
out of its mature market, and the
time is now right to enter the US.
“US airline profitability, particu-

larly United’s, is going to grow
strongly,” Sir Colin rays- “They^ve
sorted out their problems, leaving
than far more efficient. Regulation
has worked.through, with the smaller
competitors being bought up by the
bigger ones. They’ve got a helpful reg-

ulatory environment, and United’s got
routes where there is very strong
growth. Because the cash flow is so
strong in this business, they can oper-
ate more successfully on a leveraged
basis.”

BA’s participation has been care-
fully structured to avoid dilution of
earnings; it could write a cheque for
the $750m on existing borrowing facil-

ities and still show a profit because it
will be receiving a higher rate of
Interest bn the bid vehicle’s preferred
stock. The auction of UAL, however,
may have only begun. The first test
for BA'will be how the London stock
market treats its shares today.

On with the

vendange
Thanks to the long sonny

summer, the vendange in the
French vineyards has started
much earlier than usual this

year, and looks set to produce
some memorable wine. Accord-
ing to the Office National
Interprofessionel des Vins
(Onivins), 1989 should turn
out to be “a very great year",
on the assumption that the
harvest is not spoiled by a
last-minute downpour.
(The word vendange, by the

way, is a sign of the impor-
tance of the French wine
industry, any other harvest
may be a recolte. hut the wine
harvest is a vendange from
the Latin vindemia, itself from
viman and demere.)

In the Bordeaux region, har-
vesting started last week, on
August 29, for the white wines
of Chateau Haut Biion, and
two days later for the reds.
This is the first time since 1893
that the vendange has started

in August, 10-15 days earlier
than usual In Cognac, the har-
vest is expected to start on
September 25, three weeks ear-
lier than normal.
Moreover, the quality of the

harvest promises to be remark-
able in most of the wine-grow-
ing areas. In Champagne, the
local growers are already
talking of a vintage year, in
Burgundy the growers are
starting to compare 1989 with
the memorable year of 1976;

the growers of Touraine specu-
late that this year’s wine may
be even better than 1976 if the
weather holds, and may per-
haps approach the quality of
1959.
The price to be paid for the

long rainless months is that
the quantity will be much less
impressive than the quality.
According to Onivins, the
national total should be about
6lm hectolitres, 7 per cent up
on last year's harvest, the
smallest for 20 years, but
around 12 per cent less than
the average for the previous
five years.

Only In Burgundy is the size

Observer
of the harvest likely to be in
line with previous averages,
because only Burgundy was
spared serious drought.

Royal ways
Totally cut off from western

communications for the past
week or so, the only piece of
news I beard about Britain
was the separation of the Prin-
cess Royal from her husband.
It made the headlines on Bul-
garian television several times
running and, ina country
where the news tends to be
du ll, aroused great interest
A Bulgarian also told me that
it had been recently reported
that the Prince of Wales had
taken off his jacket at lun-

cheon and put his elbows on
the table. Such is the influence
of the British royal family, that
this is now accepted practice
in Sofia.

Unholy hurls
Hurling, as any Irish person

wifi tell you, is the world’s fast-

est field game. The ball can
travel at 90 miles an hour off
the “hurl” or stick the players
use. Yesterday was the high
point of the season, the AU
Ireland Final at Crake Park
in Dublin, a sort of Superbowl,
FA Cup Final and big match
at Cardiff Arms Park rolled
into one.
Tipperary played the rank

outsiders, Antrim from Nor-
thern Ireland, who had not
played In a final since 1943.
Fast and furious it went from
end to end, as the sports writ-
ers say. But the northern
dream was not to be. Not even
Niall Patterson, the 18 stone
Antrim goalkeeper, could stop
Tipperary running away with
thematch-
Huriing is seen as very much,

a Roman Catholic game. At
least one cardinal and a whole
bevy of bishops and priests

watched the Dublin final. Neil

“I cant watt for the An-dear*1

Ennock, the leader of the Brit-
ish Labour Party, was also
there.

But the Unionist mayor of
Ballymena, one of the main
towns in Antrim, said he did
not watch it “Sunday is the
Lord’s day. Protestants tend
to leave hailing alone.”

Pivot’s exit
The literary world in France

is reeling from the blow: after
15 years at tbe top of the
charts, the television pro-
gramme Apostrophes, chaired
by the engaging Bernard Pivot,
is coming off next summer.
The decision was announced
by Pivot during last Friday
evening's broadcast, but so
for no plausible explanation
has been forthcoming.
Malicious voices - always

in a majority on the French
intellectual scene - suggest
that Pivot is retreating in the
face of the competition from
a rival literary programme.
Ex Libris, on the commercial
channel, TFL But this does
not square with Pivot's

remarkable success in holding
a regular audience running

into the millions.

It is in any case a cause for
dismay. By and large, the qual-
ity of most French television
is low, and only the most deta>
nxined optimist will have faith
in the latest reforms intro-
duced by the Socialist govern-
ment The Pivot programme
has long been an exception,
even though it consists
“merely" of a 75-minute discus-
sion of half a dozen new books
between Pivot and their
authors. John le Carre will
be among them before the

Levelling up
David Steel's new book —

Against Goliath - wifi be
reviewed in its proper place.
A stray about tiie late John
Mackintosh, however, is worth
retelling.

As a Labour MP and aca-
demic, Mackintosh was proud
of having addressed trade
onion meetings in Frankfort
and Glasgow on tbe same day
and an the same theme of
brotherhood in Europe. “In
Frankfort,” Steel recounts,
“he had been met bya chauf-
feur-driven car and taken to
the union headquarters, where
the glass doors had automati-
cally slid open, and hegave
his talk in a warm, carpeted
lecture room, complete with
visual aids. Catching a direct
flight to Glasgow, he had to
take a bus-ride from the air-
port, make his way to the KMr
Hardie Hall, climb the stone
stairs with chipped dark-brown
wall paint and settle la a room
with rickety wooden chairs
and a bare light bulb. At the
end of his persuasive address,
a voice said: ‘But John, ye .

dinna understand. We’re no
goto’ tae be dragged doan to
their standards/”

Darker Sussex
Froman advertisement In

a WestMidlands newspaper:
“Foryour late holiday, why
not give yourselfa changeand
be adventurous? Join our five-
day safari to Brighton.”

The Answer...

GLUTTONS
45 Berkeley Square'
London W1X5DB:

01-408 1010
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Hugh Carnegy and Tony Walker on the scaling down of Middle East defence spending
hen diplomate-and strate-
giststolk about the mffi-

tary balance tat the mmbia :

Easkas often as not they
warn of the dangers of a Mg asms
bofld-up in the region. Yet. recent. evi-

dence suggests, remarkably, that in
Israel, Egypt, Jordan and "Syria, the
foixr neighbours .at the xenfra _toie

Arah-Iscaefl ^
is being scaled down significantly ,

-
mainly as a wynsaipwffy : of

economic problems, ..

Israeli economists wfco have analysed
the trend like to. call ft.*injcftordInated
disarmament.*- That may be an over-
statement, as purchases' of sophisti-
cated missiles, plands and other weap-
onry, especially by other Arab states
each as Iraq ami Saudi Arabia, liave
gone on apace. Established armouries
in the region are more than enough to
sustain war ona frightening scale, espe-
cially given th&prolifaratian of chemi-
cal weapons. . .-v

But there are strong signs that, with-
out any of the paraphernalia of formal
arms or peace negodattons^the govern^
ments in Jerusalem, Cairo,Amman ,

Damascus are separately having to trim
.

their defence budgets in a way which
could have a longer-term effect on mflf.

tary tensions in the region.
Latest figures from the Inter"aHnnai

Institute of Strategic Studies (HSS)
show that total domotic military

.

spending (excluding external aid) fen in
Egypt in 1988 to 8&2bn from $3.4bn in"
1987. Likewise, in Israel it fefl to J3.7bn
from $3.9bn, in Jordan 4o 8631m from
8703m and in- Syria to $L£bn from
8L8bn.
Such a trend follows a long period in

which the four countries established, by .

international standards, huge levels of
defence spending as a proportion, of
national income as thdr -rela-

tions were punctuated all too fre-

quently by war. Economists at -the
Israel International Institute (IQ), an-
independent think-tank in Tel Aviv,'
believe now, however, that there is a
growing recognition by the four that
economic regeneration requires cutting
defence budgets.
A striking measure of how much of.

their resources the four poured into-
defence lies in the proportion of miH--
tary spending to grogs national prodnet-

:

lo developing countries, the average Is

;

about 3 per emit. Organisation for Eco-_
noznic Co-operatum. and Development
countries spend 4£ per centof GNP on -

defence and the US up to 6 per cent.In-.

Israel and Syria the figure peaked in
the 1980s at around 25 per cent and In
Jordan at around20 per cent The pro-

portion in Egypt has been Jbwer, out
still stands at some 12 percent a huge
level by international standards.
These staggering commitments to

military spending grew rapidly over the
pasttwo decades, fuelled by the SixDay
War of 1967 and theTom KippurWarin
1973. In each case, the outlays were
bolstered by heavy infections of foreign
assistance -? the most notable being the
hfllinng of dnPara rimnnflltoH jumnally
to Israel anditoEgypt fay the US. The IQ
estimates that aid assistance has aver-

aged about 40 per cent of total ^aid-
ing, bat notes that toe balance. still

Recorded military expenditures

140
Constant prices 1982*100

1970 ; 80 81 82

I Secretekraal International

amounts to ah enormous burden an toe
regtoh’S economies.

Professor EHazer Suffer, one of toe
anthore-:oif, a forthcoming HT study of
-x^jopel economies, notes'that each of
, the. four Middle -East neighbours "has
been, characterised recently -by - heavy
foreign debts, large fiscal deficits, bal-

ance of payments problems, a bias
towardsnan-tradeable sectors and other

it appears that governments have
accepted the conclusion that reversing
such positions fanpHea cutting at least

toe', domestic ' component of defence
spending. -

"In addition, the four countries are
also subject to pressures from their out-
tide szqzpliers of military aid.

-"

:
As a^residt of an these trends:

-

• in Israel, there was mi 8 per cent cut
in domestic military expenditure
between 3964 and 1988 when the Gov-
ernment finally began to tarfrlft huge
budget deficits and triple ditrit vnffaHrrn

More recently, the cost of combatting
toe Falesttaiian nprfaring in fbe West
-Bank and Gazahas put upward pres-

sure oacurtent defence spending. But
economic stringencies prompted the

in 1968 of a very expensive
project to build a locally-developed jet
fighter, the LavL Ministers now accept
that fife defence burden limits attempts
to reform the economy. USaid has also
begun to decline m real terms.

.

m In Egypt, similar pressures are at
work. One of the main reasons
advanced for toe sudden removal from
office in April of Field Marshal Abdel
Hahm Abu Ghazala, the powerful for-

mer Defence Minister, was that he
became embroiled in an argument with
President Hosni Mubarak over the
defence budget One of the first tasks
that General YoussefAbu Taieb, Gfaaza-
la’s successor, embarked on was a
review of military expenditures.
Egypt's military is perhaps In a

sUgntly more fortunate position than
those of Syria, Jordan and Israel. It was
empowered by toe late President Anwar
Sadat to generate and control its own
revalues from military industries, and
from other business activities such as
contracting. “Such a move was very
radicaL It gave the military a great
measure of ffaewrfei autonomy,* says
Gefaad And* of Egypt’s Centre for Polit-

ical and Strategic Studies. Egypt’s eco-
nomic crisis has inevitably squeezed
funds available for the military. At the
lamo thrift thft winding down Of the
GulfWar has reduced Iraq’s demand for
Egyptian-produced small arms and
ammunition, worsening the financial
squeeze on Egypt’s military.

• Jordan's economic crisis, high-
lighted by price riots in April, has inevi-

tably had an impact on military spend-
ing. An eariy casually was the proposal
to purchase eight Tornado attack air-

craft from the UK. The has been
postponed, and may well be cancelled.

There is little prospect of substantial
near equipment purchases in the
short-term. A Western defence attache
in Amman says that, while tone
appeared to have been no reduction in
toe “operations and maintenance" bud-
get of the military in local currency
terms, the rapid depreciation of the

dinar in toe past year meant that
spending in real terms is down by about
20 per cent
• Syria's own economic difficulties,

plus toe cost of its occupation of Leba-
non, are also squeezing military expen-
diture. The Syrians have toe added dif-

ficulty that the Soviet Union, its main
benefactor, is adopting a much tougher
approach to new equipment sales.

Moscow has been telling Damascus
toot it must hpgin Tpftfrfng payments on
its estimated $l5bn Soviet military debt.
Defence experts note that deliveries of
more sophisticated aircraft such as the
SU-24 have been delayed, partly because
of Syria’s inability to pay. Payment dif-

ficulties are also believed to be holding
up deliveries of some missiles and
advanced fighter aircraft
Domestic economic pressures and

pressure from friraign backers may not
be the whole story. Egyptian defence
experts say that military expenditures
were in any case set to slow following
the peace treaty with Israel and a pro-
cess of democratismtlon and liberalisa-

tion at home. For perhaps the first time
since the 1952 revolution, there have
been public calls domestically for a
reduction in military spending.
Mr Heino Kopietx, a ffafannft econo-

mist at the nss, says one of the impor-
tant factors in the slowdown in Middle
East anus purchases is that countries
had reached “saturation point” in terms
of absorbing new equipment. Egypt for
example did not have the man,

power to operate new squadrons of
sophisticated aircraft beyond those it

had already taken delivery of, such as
the Mirage 2000.

“Barring a conflagration or military
takeover in any of these countries,
[spending on new equipment] is on a
down-slope until major re-equipment is

required,” Mr Kopietz says. Ian
Anthony, a researcher at the Stockholm
International Peace and Research Insti-

tute (Sipri), says that the latest figures
on arms purchases for the region show
a marked reduction tax spending from
$LL5bn in 1987 to $8.1bn in 1988.

Sipri’s research, which focuses purely
on equipment purchases and on deliv-

eries of big items, reveals that Egypt
spent $30Qm in 1983 compared with
$2Sbn in 1984: Syria spent Sl.lbn last

year compared with $1.6bn in 1964;
Israel’s spending on equipment imports
reached 8300m compared with $1.6bn. in
1987 (mostly accounted for by purchases
of F-I6s to enwippumt-p for the cancella-
tion of the Lavi), and in Jordan expen-
diture was 8270m compared with 8165m
in 1984.

Whatever the combination of
reasons for the check in defence spend-
ing in the four countries, a trend seems
to have been established. The region’s
chronic instability may well conspire to
upset the tense peace which prevails at
present between them. Nor do lower
levels of military expenditure carry
guarantees aghast war. But Israel's
Professor Sheffer paints out that the
build-up in spending took on a life of its

own as one country responded to the
perceived increase in threat from the
other. “Now it is possible to imagine
that there might be a corresponding
downward, dynamic,” he says.

Lombard

Thinking about
drug legalisation

Martin Wolf

DRUG users commit at least 40
per cent of all property crime
in toe US. No fewer than
250.000 American drug users
are infected with AIDS. Colom-
bia feces a direct challenge to

the state, with its system of

criminal justice in ruins.

The natural response to such
evils is to intensify the anti-

drug crusade. But casual exam-
ination of the list shows that

they are all the effect not of

drugs, but of their illegality.

They are, in toe words of a
pamphlet* by James Ostrowski

for the Cato Institute, an influ-

ential, free-market-oriented
think tank, the "cost of crimin-
alising an activity in which all

participants are willing."

When public policy is failing

on so grandiose a scale, it is

natural to ask whether it

makes sense in the first place.

The basic economics of the
black market in drags sharpen
the question. Precisely because
demand is little affected by
price (this being, after all, the
economic meaning of addic-
tion). the more supply is cut
back, the greater become both
the incentive and the resources
to expand it once more.
The total value of black mar-

ket drug sales tax the US is esti-

mated at $80bn, this turnover
bring derived from drugs with
intrinsic costs of production
and distribution of no more
thaw a tenth of that sum. The
huge rewards - dwarfing
expenditure on law enforce-
ment - are a direct measure of
the success of the policy of pro-
hibition and explain its equally
ineluctable failure.

Mr Ostrowski dares to think
tfhn imfhiwirahift He presents a
Case for legalisation (or, at the
least, decriminalisation) of
hard drugs that, if not unan-
swerable, clearly demands an
answer. He notes that the fact
that a drug is harmful is not a
sufficient justification for pro-

hibition. Nor is the fact that
prohibition may reduce use of

a given drug. The question is,

instead, whether the costs of

legalisation would exceed
those of prohibition, one whose
force derives from the damage
done by prohibition.

In his pamphlet, Mr
Ostrowski argues that toe case
for legalisation is sustained if

any of the following preposi-

tions is true: (1) prohibition
has no substantial impact on

toe level of illegal drug use: (2)

prohibition Increases illegal

drug use; (3) prohibition
merely redistributes drag use
from uipgai drugs to harmful
legal drugs; or (4) even’ though
prohibition might decrease the

use of illegal drags, the nega-
tive effects of prohibition out-

weigh the beneficial effects of

reduced use of illegal drugs. He
relies largely on the last, first

and third points.
What then are the costs of

prohibition? It criminalises
users, increases their disre-

spect for the law and forces
them into contact with profes-

sional criminals. It offers a
lucrative criminal life to entre-

preneurial young people from
impoverished backgrounds,
destroys the economic viability

of poor neighbourhoods
through drag-related crime and
leads to violent gang warfare.
It greatly increases the danger
of the drugs themselves,
because they are impure, are
often injected with unsterilised

needles and are used in more
powerful and life-threatening
forms (thus giving the user
more bang for his bucks).
The economic costs of prohi-

bition include the waste of
resources in the illegal indus-
try itself, the expenditures on
health required to tackle such
by-products - not of addiction,
but of illegality - as the
spread of AIDS, and the lack of
information and quality con-
trol which cause overdoses.
Huge sums are also being
spent on law enforcement,
$10bn a year in tbe US alone.

Mr Ostrowski argues that “at
least 80 per cent of deaths from
illegal drags today are attribut-

able to the effects of drug pro-

hibition.” Tobacco and alcohol
are, he suggests, both more
lethal per user from the phar-
macological point of view,
while there is little evidence
that the pharmacological
effects of hard drugs them-
selves cause either crime or
accidents.

With so huge a proportion of

the costs attendant on prohibi-

tion, what are its benefits?
Those benefits are, of course,

the costs associated with toe
additional drug use that would
follow from legalisation. In
considering these costs, it is

important to remember that
any given amount of legal use
is much less socially damaging

than an equivalent amount of

illegal use. For the costs of
legalisation to exceed those of

prohibition there would have
to be a substantial increase in
drug use.

There is reason to doubt,
however, whether legalisation

would lead to an explosion in

overall drug abuse. One reason
is the likelihood of drug
switching. Furthermore, nar-

cotics were freely available in
the US and UK during the
nineteenth century, but use

peaked and then declined long
before prohibition was
adopted. In the US the use of

narcotics per head was no
higher before prohibition than
it is today.

Nor are the hard drugs
uniquely addictive. Mr
Ostrowski quotes the Surgeon
General of the US as stating
that “the pharmacological and
behavioural processes that
determine tobacco addiction
are similar to that that deter-

mine addiction to drugs such
as heroin and cocaine." A sur-

vey by the National Institute

on Drug Abuse indicates that
the proportion of repeat users
of cocaine is only 24 per cent,

far below that for tobacco.

In short, there is little reason
to fear that legalisation would
be followed by an explosive
increase in addiction to hard
drugs. It is more likely that, at
least in the US, anyone who
wants to is already getting
them. It has proved impossible
to keep drugs out of prisons.

What chance is there of keep-
ing them out of countries?
The popular choice for Presi-

dent Bush will be tougher
action. He may suggest stricter

penalties on users, but this will

largely increase the criminal is -

ation of society. Meanwhile,
the main effect of enhanced
efforts to limit supply will be
to make American streets still

more dangerous and increase
the rewards to successful drug
runners. Thomas Sewell has
written that “policies are
judged by their consequences,
but crusades are judged by
how good they make the cru-
saders feeL” Is it not time to
try policy again, with decri-

minalisation the obvious
starting point?
*James Ostrowski, Thinking

about Drug Legalisation, Policy
Analysis No. 121, Cato Institute,

Washington D.C.
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The question , -

of Estonia
From Mr ValeSs tiepins.

Sir, I would suggest that ftis
Professor Vladlen. Tfchehenko
(Letters. August 23) and not
James Blitz (August 17) who
overstates matters concerning
Estonia's new election laws.

Moreover, it is somewhat
ironic that his letter appeared
on the 50th anniversary of tbe
Soviet-Nazi pact, which paved
the way for the annexation of

Estonia, as well as Latvia and
Lithuania, into the Soviet
Union. This annexation was
Illegal To this day it is not
recognised by the western
democracies. So the Soviet con-
stitution may remain in force,

but it has no legal basis and
therefore no legal application

in Estonia. The only Soviet
thing that can prevail there is

military force.

Because the Estonian Soviet
Socialist Republic's constitu-
tion is also a result of (Soviet)

occupation, it too has no legal

standing. Clearly there is a
constitutional vacuum which,
would most appropriately be
filled by a new constitution of
the Estonians’ choosing.

In the meantime Estonians
have to act as best they can in
the circumstances. Part

,
of

these circumstances — a seri-

ous threat to their existence as
a nation - is the continuing
heavy influx of Russians in
response to toe forced, econom-
ically irrational industrialisa-

tion of Estonia imposed from
Moscow; Professor Tishchenko
euphemistically refers to this

as “natural migration of man-
power." Most of these migrants
- some after decades in
Estonia - do not even learn

tbe Estonian language-

So it is understandable that

Estonians have doubts about
toe fitness and appropriateness

of such “residents* to partici-

pate in Estonian elections, and
in the determination of
Estonia’s fixture- If anything,
in an attempt to achieve an
accommodation-in present etr-

cumstances, the Estonian
Supreme Soviet has probably
been too liberal in setting the

residential requirements m its

new election laws.

Let me pose a question.
Would Professor Tishchenko
think it reasonable for Nazi
occupying forces and settlers

to participate in Soviet elec-

tions if Hitler had won tbe war

.

and occupied, the Soviet Union?
Valdis Liepmfi,

84 John Sonet,

Toronto, Canada

‘Keep an open mind’
From MrJohn Jenkins.

Sir, Following David
Richardson's well-argued, bat
anced article (August 22) on
nitrate pollution, I was flabber-

gasted and appalled to read
Tom Spencer's letter (August
2$) attacking it as a one-sided,

blinkered approach.
We are all concerned with

pollution, but it is important
not to take up extreme posi-

tions which are not supported
by facts. As Lord Lewis, the
eminent Professor of Chemis-
try at Cambridge University,
said recently, he has repeat-
adly asked for evidence to
show to?* nitrate levels of 100
parts per million are hannftfl.

and failed to get it
.

We are in danger of adopting
positions which win unneces-
sarily increase toe costs offood
and water significantly - the
consumer will ultimately have
to pay those costs. We could

VAT revisited
From MrEdward Troop.

Star, The flaw in Professor
Ellon’s reasoning (Letters,

August 24) is to assume that
just because a company is
VAT-registered, it can reclaim
•VAT charged to It
- A further important condi-
tion must be satisfied .before

VAT can be reclaimed: either

toe company must only make
VATable supplies or the VAT
it seeks to.reclaim must relate

only to the making of VATable
supplies. EC law requires us to
exempt from VAT such mat-
ters as transactions Jn securi-

. transactions and
insurance. The effect is that
large numbers of businesses
make some exempt supplies,

and
.
cannot reclaim all the

VAT charged.
Thus it is not just members

of tbe public who bear the bur-

den of VAT, but any business,

.
some or all of whose supplies

are exempt If toe ability to

de-register, or not pay VAT, is

extended to all supplies to

VAT-registered persons, there

would be a ' loss of fax which
could be very significant. H, on
the other hand, the proposal is

confined to supplies made to

fUfly taxable persons, ft would
in practice limit its advantages

to such an extent as to make it

unattractive.
1- suspect that until the Euro-

pean Commission and the UK
Government can be persuaded

to remove exemption from the

VAT system. Professor Ellon's

suggestions will not find

also be in danger of removing
from food production large
areas of good land. This is not
the right way to deal with sur-

pluses, and carries at least toe
risk of creating real food short-

ages in' the not too distant
future (far worse than food sur-
pluses).

But I will keep an open
mind. Tom Spencer more or
iflsa admits thie flimsy nature
ofany medical evidence to sup-
port the present proposed dras-

tic redaction in nitrate levels.

But be says that there are
other reasons for such a reduc-
tion without saying what they
are.

If he now produces evidence
to substantiate such an argu-

. Tngnt
. we must certainly exam-

ine it with great care. If

not ...
John Jenkins,
ChSderley Had,
Dry Drayton, Cambridge

favour with the Chancellor.
Edward Troup,
14 Dominion Street, EC2

From Mr Graeme Hamnumd.
Sir, It was refreshing to read

Steve Franklin’s account of his
visit

.
from the VATman

(August 19). However, Mr
Franklin’s version of toe penal-
ties of sending in VAT return
and payment late was not
quite accurate.
After two defaults have

occurred within a 12-month
period a written, warning Is
sent. A third default within 12
TTiOTithR nfthe anrnnij lands to a
surcharge of .5 per cent of toe
tax. due, with subsequent
defaults attracting surcharge
at rates increasing in stages of
S per cent to a ranrimnm Of SO
per cent. Subject to certain
conditions, anyone who is sur-

charged has a right of appeal
to an independent VAT tribu-
nal
The VAT system allows at

least one month and at most
four months - an average of
two and a half months — in
which to collect tax before it

has to be remitted to Customs
and Excise. Also, traders may
take credit for VAT on their
purchases whether or not they
have settled their supplier's
account As Mr Franklin dis-

covered, for many traders VAT
registration can provide a sig-

nificant cash flow benefit
Graeme Hammond.
HM Customs and Excise,

22 Upper Ground, SEl

Drinking water
is different
FromDrGeoffrey Myddelton.

Sir, Debate about tbe purity
of water (Letters, August 25) is

based on the erroneous
assumption that there need be
only one supply for all pur-
poses.

*

London water contains puri-

fied sewage and smells like it
It is impossible to supply pure
water for every purpose - and
unnecessary. Drinking and
cooking water, including sup-
plies for toe manufacture of
food and drink, should be abso-
lutely pure and uncontami-
nated by sewage, pesticides,
nitrates or other fertilisers. It

could be supplied to cities by
pipeline, metered and charged
for at an economic rate.

Any competent authority
would be planning it now.
Geoffrey Myddelton,
Blue Moon,
1867 Ghti&res sur OUon,
Vaud, Switzerland

Pension scheme
risk and reward
From Mr TJZ Shucksmith.

Sir, Miss Sue Ward is correct

to reject an insurance company
analogy for a defined benefit

scheme in which toe employer
meets the balance of cost
(Letters, August 22). But such
a scheme is not a charity
either, because in essence the

trustees are dispensing the

employer’s money.
To be fair to Mr Redman

(Letters, August 12), many pri-

vate sector employers have
given more than they promised
under toe scheme, whereas the

public sector schemes have
given what they promised -

no more and no less.

The pity is that the private

sector benefits which were
promised represented inade-

quate provision. This

is not surprising considering

the risks involved for the
employer.
May 1 suggest that the risks

and schemes should operate

more like insurance compa-
nies, with the employer’s risk

liwttod, and the members enti-

tled on a “with profits" basis to

what the scheme's funds can
provide? It is legally possible to

establish final salary- schemes

on fWs basis, and to control

them actuarial]y. Why isn't

everybody doing it?

T.S. Shucksmith,
Shucksmith & Go,
Lincoln House, Nutley Lane,

Reigate, Surrey
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Manhattan
faces the
social spiral
IT IS no longer possible for the
business community of Man-
hattan to ignore the spiralling
social problems of the city
where most of its employees
live and where it has to pay its

taxes.

The crisis of education in
New York's schools is a grave
long-term concern for business-
men who need to be able to

rely on a healthy stream of
skilled workers for the future.
The chronic lack of affordable
housing is another major prob-
lem for its potential workforce.
The scourge of drugs is a third
issue.

“Ten years ago. you could
neatly divide business and
social issues. That is no longer
possible,” said Mr Sandy
Bayer, vice president of Eco-
nomic and Commercial Devel-
opment in the New York City
Partnership.
The Partnership, founded in

1979 by Mr David Rockefeller,
is an organisation of leaders of
business, education and non-
profit groups whose aim is to

help improve the social and
economic climate of the city.

It is not, as one might
expect, simply a pressure
group concerned with maxim-
ising corporate tax breaks and
the like.

Mr Ronald Shelp, its presi-
dent, notes that the Partner
ship is the biggest builder of
affordable housing in New
York, working with the city
authorities in joint ventures.
The Partnership, whose

membership is a roll call of the
city’s business leaders, uses its

considerable business skills to
find financing, select develop-
ers, market building schemes
and work through the inevita-

ble bureaucracy.

The second major thrust of
the Partnership's social efforts

is in the field of education. An
example of their work is a soft-

ware package developed for the
Partnership by IBM and
Touche Ross which keeps track
of where teachers are needed
around the city and what
teachers are available.

This is not mere philan-
thropy. Encouraging improve-
ments in education and living

conditions are deemed crucial

for the future of the city as a
business and financial centre.

In June, the Financial Ser-
vices Task Force of the Part-

nership released a detailed
report on what should be done
to preserve New York's status

as the world's financial capital.

Inevitably, chief executive
officers in the financial ser-
vices industry are heavily rep-
resented in the Partnership.
The industry has accounted for
35 per cent of the net private
sector job growth in the city

since 1977 and generates an
estimated $2.8bn in city and
state tax revenues, sorely
needed to cope with a deluge of
demand for social services.

Financial services companies
rely on New York city resi-
dents for 70 per cent of their
workforce and nearly 60 per
cent of total jobs in the indus-
try are clerical

The industry is already
under severe competitive pres-

sure and lost 8,000 jobs in 1988
after years of steady growth.
Other financial centres, partic-

ularly overseas, are attracting
more and more business.
The reduction in trading vol-

ume after the October 1987
stock market crash put Wall
Street firms under severe pres-
sure to cut costs and tills has
meant many have re-examined
the advantages of doing busi-
ness in New York which is so
costly.

With the benefit of advanced
technology, many firms have
already moved back office
operations out of Manhattan.
Mr Shelp cites an extreme
example of a New York life

insurance company which has
its back office operation in the
Republic of Ireland.
“The big issue for ns is to

stop the front office moving
out as well,” said Mr Shelp.
One of the key reasons keep-

ing firms in Manhattan is

demographic. The metropolitan
New York area simply has
more people in the right age
group than other cities to sup-
ply the workforce and it is cru-
cial that they are adequately
educated and housed within
striking distance of Manhattan.
Among the recommenda-

tions of the taskforce are that
women should be encouraged
to enter the workforce by pro-
viding better child care, that
the city should ensure it has a
top rate telecommunications
infrastructure and - yes - that
the overall tax burden on com-
panies should be reduced.
Mr Bayer, who has been

working on the telecommuni-
cations side of things, com-
ments: “In the end, self-interest

and helping in social areas
such as education merge. We
don't expect a quick return
but, in the long term, a better

city is in all our interests.”

Pressure on Mazowiecki grows
By Christopher Boblnskl in Warsaw

MR Tadeusz Mazowiecki,
Poland’s newly-appointed
Prime Minister, is coming
under pressure to speed up his

efforts to form a Solidarity-led

coalition government which
will contain representatives of
all of Poland's official parties,

including the Communists.
The Prime Minister origi-

nally promised to have a gov-
ernment ready for parliamen-
tary approval by the end of last

month. Under the Polish con-
stitution new elections have to

be called if Parliamentary
approval of Mr Mazowiecki's
team has not been obtained by
September 18.

Solidarity's parliamentary
group is expecting a list of
names to be presented to it

tomorrow.
Mr Broanislaw Geremek, the

group’s parliamentary leader,
met the Prime Minister yester-

day to impress on him the need
for quick decisions. But yeste-

day evening, Mr Jerzy Urban,
the present head of radio and

television, said he would be
surprised if a list of nominees
would be ready by tomorrow.
Mr Mazowiecki held his first

talks with Mr Mieczyslaw
Rakowski, the Communist
Party leader, and Mr Marian
Orzechowski, the party’s par-
liamentary chief, at the week-
end on the role the Commu-
nists would play in the
Government.

It has always been accepted
that they would retain control
over defence and the Ministry
of the Interior, but Mr
Rakowski threatened that his
party would go over to being
"a constructive opposition”
unless they received further
portfolios.

The Communists are
thought to be demanding to
retain control of the Foreign
Ministry and the Cabinet
office, to have a major say over
radio and television, and to
have one deputy premier.
Mr Rakowski said his party

had been promised posts

“affecting all the major areas
in society.”

Yesterday, too, Mr Kazaim-
ierz Olesiak., the present Farm-
ing Minister and a member of
the Feasants Party, attended a

harvest festival ceremony at
the Czestochowa national
shrine for the first time after
the Government's own sepa-
rate ceremonies were cancelled
at the last minute. Mr Olesiak
is his party’s nominee for the
fanning post, which was prom-
ised to fixe Peasants Party by
Mr Lech Walesa, the Solidarity
leader, without consulting
Rural Solidarity, his support-
ers in the countryside.
Yesterday Mr Jozef Sllsz

head of Rural Solidarity, told
the tens of tlimisarate of farm
era assembled at the shrine
that he trusted the farmers
demands would be noticed.
Mr signalled his opposi

tfon to Mr Olesiak's re-appoint-
ment as Fanning Minister by
attacking the Peasants Party
as “mere representatives of the
Communists in the country-
side”, He said his movement
would form a basis for a new
political party for farmers.
US Congress presses Bush for
Polish aid boost. Page 3

British shippers call for inquiry

into rate accords on US routes
By Kevin Brown, Transport Correspondent

THE EUROPEAN Commission
has been asked to investigate
the legality of a rate-fixing
agreement between a group of
leading shipping lines operat-
ing between Europe and the
US.
A complaint filed by the

British Shippers' Council (BSC)
says the North Europe/USA
Rate Agreement (Neusara)
breaks at least two European
Community competition regu-
lations.

The complaint is the latest
move in a long-running battle
between shipping conferences
and shippers’ councils in the
UK and other European coun-
tries.

Shipping conferences are
associations of shipping lines
which fix rates and service
schedules. The shippers’ coun-
cils, which represent the own-
ers’ cargoes, claim the confer-
ences are price-fixing cartels.

The Commission has the
power to ban or amend the
Neusara agreement if it finds
the shippers’ claims proved.
However, this could lead to a
clash with the US, where the
agreement has been filed with
the Federal Maritime Commis-
sion.

In a detailed submission to

the Commission, the BSC
claims the Neusara agreement
creates a super-cartel covering
all the routes between north-
ern Europe and both US sea-
boards.

These were covered by three

separate conferences for the
Atlantic, Gulf Pacific coast
trades until Neusara took
effect in mid-July.
Shipping conferences were

granted a block exemption
from EC competition law in
1986 as long as they meet
broadly defined competitive
criteria.

The BSC claims the Neusara
agreement breaks regulations
4656/86 and 1017/68 by extend-
ing price fixing arrangements
to the whole of a cargo voyage,
rather than just the ocean leg.

This would mean, for exam-
ple, that shippers could not
avoid using a conference line

to the US west coast by using a
rail, road or inland waterway
service from an east coast port.
The agreement is also said to

be anti-competitive on several
other grounds:
• The BSC submission draws
attention to provisions appar-
ently allowing selective pricing
of commodities and cargo allo-

cation between shipping lines.

The council says this allows
conference lines to drive inde-
pendent niche operators out of
business by sharing the costs
of operating at a loss.

• Other provisions would
allow the Neusara lines to con-
trol credit and other payments
jointly, and share information
about "bad debts." The Com-
mission has “come down very
hard on this in other areas of
business,” the BSC says.
The council claims the Neu-

sara lines have 55 per cent of
the North Europe to US mar-
ket. The parties to the agree-
ment are P & OCL, the con-
tainer shipping arm of
Peninsular and Oriental Steam
Navigation of the UK; Hap
Lloyd of West Germany; Ned-
Hoyd of The Netherlands; SeaL-
and of the US; Compagnie Gen-
erate Maritime of France; and
Atlantic Container Lines, a
consortium of six European
container shipping companies.

The BSC is also pressing the
Commission to reach a quick
decision on an earlier com-
plaint about a separate rate fix-

ing agreement known as Euro-
corde. This agreement was
between Polish Ocean Lines,
Evergreen of Taiwan, and the
North Europe US Atlantic Con-
ference (NEAQ. a forerunner
of Neusara.

Separately, the BSC and
other European shippers’ coun-
cils have teen in conflict with
seven major shipping lines

over a complaint by oonferoice
operators that Hyundai of
South Korea offered unfair
rates between Europe and Aus-
tralia.

Hyundai denied the allega-

tion, with strong support from
shippers’ councils, which saw
the company as a source of
legitimate competition. How-
ever, the Commission ruled in
favour of the conference lines
and imposed a 25 per cent
redressive duty on Hyundai.

BA wins pledge from
United Airlines pilots
Continued from Page 1

him. However, at least a neu-
tral stance by the pilots is

essential to Ids success and
they now appear committed to

the consortium.
Sir Colin Marshall, BA nhinf

executive, said at the weekend
that BA entered the fray
through a mixture of defensive
and opportunistic motives.

If the bid fails, he said: “We
can continue to do what we are
doing now, provided the com-
mercial agreement remains in
place. But if UAL was acquired
by a consortium including a
Lufthansa, an Air France or an
Iberia, the commercial agree-
ment would collapse and we
would be left scratching
around to see what we can do
to replace it”
The search for transatlantic

aviation alliances was under-
lined yesterday when Ameri-
can Airlines and West Ger-
many’s Lufthansa said they
were discussing a marketing
agreement and closer links
between their reservations
systems.
More details of the funding

of the consortium’s bid also
emerged yesterday. The offer
wifi require nearly $7bn to be
raised; of this, $lbn will be
equity or preferred equity,
$6bn will be debt Unusually
for a leveraged bid of this size.

however, all of the latter will

be bank borrowings and no
high-yielding "junk” bonds will

be issued.
This is expected to save

about 2 percentage points on
the interest rate and to avoid
the obloquy attaching to junk
bonds in some quarters. The
consortium expects to pay a
rate of 12 to 13 per cent for half

of the $6bn, and 1 to 2 points
less for the Esop’s $3bn por-
tion.

Of the $lbn cash needed by
completion, BA will provide
$750m. About $10m will come
from United executives and the
balance from an unspecified
source in the consortium, prob-
ably from one or more pension
funds.

BA's constribution is split
into undisclosed proportions of
interest-bearing preferred
stock and non-income-bearing
securities which eventually
will convert into the 15 per
cent equity stake.
Mr Derek Stevens, BA

finance director, said the air-

line would receive an 11 per
cent yield on its overall invest-
ment If it decided to do this
entirely with debt, BA would
actually enhance gamings per
share because it can borrow
dollars at a lower rate.
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Pretoria
may try to
reschedule
Continued from Page 1

wealth Foreign Ministers also
endorsed this approach.
Mr Stals, who became Gover-

nor last month, declined to say
whether any creditor had matte
use of the exit clause for politi-

cal reasons. But he confirmed
that $4bn in short-term debt
had been converted since the
standstill was imposed in 1985.

At the end of last year, same
S9bn in debts still remained
within the moratorium “net”,
but be expected that to fall to
S8bn by June.

Pretoria’s foreign debt would
then total $20bn, he said: SBbn
within the net and $l2bn out-
side it. Repayments in 1990
would total 82bn; this would
include amounts failing due on
maturing bonds and notes out-
side the net A further $L5bn
would be repaid in 199L From
1992 to the end of the century,
however. South Africa’s debt
repayments would not exceed
$lbn annually, Mr Stals said,

noting that this would be a sat-
isfactory maturity structure
for Pretoria.
Michael Holman, In London,
adds: The package of financial
sanctions, drawn up in Can-
berra last month by theeight-
nation group of Common-
wealth foreign ministers, will
be high on the agenda at the
organisation’s heads of govern-
ment conference in Koala
Lumpur in October.
The measures include an

official lobbying of the banks
negotiating the South African
rescheduling, toughened guide-
lines restricting new South
African tending, and the estab-
lishment of a body to monitor
a ban on medium and
long-term lending.
A delegation appointed fay

the Commonwealth group will
ask the banks to apply the
highest possible interest rates
to South African debt, to pro-
vide for substantial capital
payments, and to. reject the
so-called “exit clause” under
which short-term debt covered
by the standstill can be con-
verted into 10-year loans.

Banks seek
bond deal

for Mexico
debt plan
By Stephen Fldler,

Euromarkets
Correspondent in London

COMMERCIAL banks
negotiating details of a new
debt agreement for Mexico
have approached the Bank of
England to see if it is willing to
make an unprecedented issue
of zero-coupon British govern-
ment bonds to support UK
banks’ participation in the
deal.

Similar approaches have
been made to other central
hanks and finanrial authorities
inritiflfag the US Treasury by
the leading commercial banks.
The US Treasury has in the
past issued zero-coupon bonds
to support a debt exchange for
Mexico.
As part of tiie proposed

CHILE has readied an accord
far a $95m one-year stand-by
agreement with the Interna-
tional Monetary Fund, retired
General Enrique Seguel, the
Minister „ of Finance,
announced in Santiago.
The minister said the IMF

agreement, as well as other
accords with multilateral
organisations, helped to pave
the way for Chile to use the
Brady Plan for debt reduction.
He added that Chile would
dpiwawd benefits equal to or
better than the 35 per cent
debt reduction achieved by
Mexico. Page 2

agreement between Mexico and
its commercial bank creditors
covering nearly $53bn of
medium and long-term bank
loans to Mexico, banks will be
able to swap their loans for

bonds either at a 35 per cent
discount to face value or car-

rying a fixed 6% per cent inter-

est rate. These bonds will be
supported by official resources
used to purchase high quality
zero-coupon securities.

Most bank lending to Mexico
has been in dollars, but banks
have been allowed to lend in
their own national currencies,
and might, under the agree-
ment, be given the option to
switch into bends denominated
in their own currencies. If Brit-
ish banks are to do this, then
they need high-quality sterling
collateral which only the UK
Government can provide.

The Bank of England’s ini-

tial response has been unen-
thusiastic. Officials are appar-
ently unconvinced that the use
of sterling is necessary and
that even if it ware, an issue of
sterling bonds would be the
only solution.
Furthermore, the unprece-

dented Issue of zero-coupon
gilts would create a new class
of bonds in the UK with a new
maturity. Because of the UK
Government’s full-funding pol-
icy - which means that it
counteracts its budget surplus
by buying back gilt-edged secu-
rities - will mean that it

would have to buy in other
gilis to offset the issuance of
new zero coupon stock.
UK banks are thought to be

owed about $5bn by Mexico, of
which less than $lba is denom-
inated in sterling.

The accord, agreed in princi-
ple in July between Mexico
and its 15-bank advisory com-
mittee led by Citicorp of the
US, had been expected to be
finalised by the end of August,
but has proved more compli-
cated than expected. Bankers
are now hoping for completion
over the next week or two -
with the issue of currency
choice likely to be one of the
last to be settled. Then it will
have to be marketed to the
country’s nearly 500 creditor
banks.- While banks view cur-
rency choice as desirable, it

would not necessarily block
the agreement if it was
unavailable.

TI IL LEX COLUMN

A tricky take-off

for BA and UAL
The ease with which even the
world’s biggest foreign airlines

are now being sucked along by
the collective airline takeover
mania which has gripped Wall
Street is worrying. It is one
tiring for wealthy financiers
like Messrs Icahn and Davis to
gamble their personal fortunes,

but when relatively conserva-
tive European airlines like
KT.M, British Airways and now
Lufthansa enter the casino
with plenty of money it raises

the stakes enormously.
They are well regarded man-

agers and should know the real

value of airline businesses. But
there is more than a suspicion
that Wall Street’s clever finan-
ciers, who can make equity
look like debt and promise
huge financial returns for
seemingly minor risk, are
exploiting the obvious ambi-
tions of European airlines to

become global mega-carriers.
As the US is far and away the
world’s biggest airline market,
non-US airlines are being per-

suaded that unless they move
quickly they may be disadvan-
taged by the corporate moves
now under way.
Texas Air, NWA and Delta

have already tied their knot
with smaller European carri-

ers. But that still leaves Ameri-
can and UAL, the two US air-

line giants, and.BA, Lufthansa
and Air France, the biggest
players on the other side of the
Atlantic. One understand
BA, the world’s biggest Inter-

national airline, feeling threat-

ened by Lufthansa’s linking
with AMR, or Air France’s
joining a rival bidder for UAL.
They could syphon business
away from BA’s most profit-

able routes.
This helps explain why less

than a year ago UAL shares
were trading at under $90, yet
BA has now joined forces with
UAL’s management and unions
to offer $300 a share. Although
a prospective exit multiple of
15 times UAL’s earnings is
almost double BA’s rating, it

values UAL at 5.4 times its

$l.3bn of Mining* before
depreciation, interest and tax,

whereas NWA was taken out
at 6*5 times.
BA’s interest in UAL is not

purely defensive. It is putting
up the hulk of the equity, but
only around 10 per cent of the
cash, and gets a 15 per cent
equity stake in the second big-

gest US airline. The promised
11 per cent yield on an admit-
tedly highly leveraged invest-

ment should counter the City's
immediate fears about massive
earnings dilution; and even
though BA’s gearing could rise

by 50 per cent depending on
bow the deal is financed, it is

gambling less than a year’s
cash flow on a rather bold
move. The investment is

designed to provide BA with a

FT Ordinary Share
Index 1933-45 -

1833 38 38 40 42 44

long-term average rate of
return of over 20 per cent per
annum, and this is before any
potential operational benefits

and advantages in terms of
improved bargaining powervis
a vis monopoly suppliers like
pnefrng are factored fe-

lt is not the sort of move
which should unduly damage
BA’s own share price, unless

the investment turns sour or
BA is forced to pay a lot more.
Admittedly, both are substan-

tial risks. The financing
charges of the new UAL, which
will have nearly, seven times
more debt than equity, win be
less than twice covered ini-

tially. In addition, it wffl still

have to find over $2bn a year
for the new aircraft it needs to

reverse its steady loss of mar-
ket share to AMR. More impor-
tant, the success of the deal
hangs on the hope that

,
there

has been a fundamental
improvement In US airline

profitability, which will not
evaporate in the next reces-

sion. This maybe as dangerous
an assumption as the belief

thatBA will not pay a lotmore
to gain a foothold in the US.
The only consolation for BA
shareholders is that ifBA were
ever to be valued like UAL, its

shares would be well over £4,

rather than a shade over £2.

Step forward. Lord Hanson.

War memories
On Wall Street, the market

was shut for Labor Day. In
London, Monday September 4
1939 found members .of the
London Stock Exchange at
home by their wireless sets.

The Exchange had closed the
previous week, to keep its bro-

kers, jobbers and clerks out of
the way of evacuees filling the
railway trains. On the Berlin
bourse. Hitler’s invasion of
Poland had been greeted cheer-
fully, with shares in Siemens
and Marinesmann showing
gains. In Amsterdam, Fokker
and Philips were rising on
hopes of war profits.

Judging from the market

indices, Britain’s .
equity inves-

tors had been reckoning on
war since 1936 or so. Practitio-

. iters . of the then-popular Dow
Theory of technical analysis
were saying that the market
was poised for a rally, after the
FT Industrial Index’s August
nadir of 9L2. The manner in

which war came - via the
Nazi-Soviet pact of August 23
— was astonishing nonethe-
less. That week, the index fell

another 5 per cent, as 1CI lost

9d to 32s 6dL The real low,
thought was stiff to corned dur-

ing the FalLof France in 1940,

and equities were to remain
• shaky , until a bull market took
off in mid-1942.
Some punters saw buying

opportunities. As Ribbentrop
and Molotov were signing their

- pact insurance shares were a
centre of attention in London.
Investors liked the: assets
insurance companies kept
safely across the Atlantic.
Royal Insurance had $L05m on
Wall Street: by August 23 its

shares and Commercial
Union’s were a screaming buy,

said the FT. On September 4
the newspaper puffed the
shares of the bandage-and-
stiddng plaster manufacturer.

Smith and Nephew. Dealers
were huffish on Ever Ready,
when the Exchange reopened
on September 7, its shares rose

Is 6d, on hopes of extra sales of

electric torches. The same day
P&O climbed 2s 84. as older

hands recalled the sparkling
record of shipping abates after

1914.

Railway companies, like the

Great Western, were the dul-

lest performers. Shares in the
so-called -Home. Rails lan-

guished first under the threat

ofa tram strike, called off only
when war was a few -days
away. There were fears, too,

about how strictly the Govern-
ment would run Britain’s rail-

way network for the duration.

Yet equities ranked well
below, bonds in pre-war Inves-

tors’ eyes. Their prices too had
been discounting the approach
of war. After falling gently in
3937 and 1938, as fears grew of
higher interest rates and war-
time inflation, gilts plunged in
August 1939. War Loan hit a
new low of £86 the day the
Nazi-Soviet pact was
announced. The crunch came
on August 24, when the Stock
Exchange fixed minimum
prices for gilts, as it had done
in 1914. The same morning, the
Bank of England astonished
the FT, if not perhaps the rest

of the City, by doubling Bank
Rate to 4 per cent, from the 2
per cent where it had been
since 1932. On August 27 the
Treasury prohibited UK inves-
tors from selling foreign securi-

ties, and wartime financial
controls were falling into
place.
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is in better financial

health, its structure

C
| | gg is changing. As

ft-gT"
.. direct insurers grow

larger, they cede less business to

reinsurers. In Europe, the 1990s ;

are likely to produce consolidation,

writes Patrick Cockburn. witti less

reliance on reinsurance.

A shifting

WHEN LEADERS of the
world’s reinsurance industry
gathered in Monte Carlo last"

autumn for their informal
annual rendezvous two topics
dominated, ftwr. og^n/fo

;

-

These were the cyclical
downswing in reinsurance
prices, which started in most
world markets in 1967; and the
financial implications of the
SlAbn loss of thieTiper Alpha
oil rig in 198a
This year there is likely to -

be less talk about Piper Alpha,
interest being greater among
the British, who have bom the
brant of. the Ires, than other

West Europeans or Americans.
The very size of the toss. Jar
and away the largest in the oil

and gas insurance market
once it took its present shape
more than 20 years ago, makes

'

it important but its overall
impact on relnsmance pricing
has been confined to excess of
loss cover in the nffsHnre sec-

tor. . .

The lade of impact of Piper
Alpha and of the storm in
southeast England of October. .

1987 - known on the London
market by its Lloyd's catastro-

phe number 87J - is indicative

of the state of the market in
general.

Despite underwriting losses,

prices are soft, and it Is diffi-

cult to Bee wfay^ hi the immedi-

ate ftrture,thls ahouH change.
“The speed with which -the
198&^uptum softened shows
the fimdamental oyezsupply of

;

capital,
n

says one ; analyst.
• “Wtfve had. some hugelosses,
but without effect on prices.

There is nothing on the -hori-

zon hkely to boost. rates by up
to 40-50 per cent For fids, you
need some' companies to go
imfl&r or a persistent srib-fitan-

dafdTdurn-ohcapital reducing
overall capacity.

*
This is ~not a. very optimistic

outlook fbr ah industry which,
since the 1960s, baa usually
accounted tor a seventh of the
world’s total hoai-life insurance
revenues totaffing over WOffim.'

-'Ey hiking a sharem the insur-

ance- business written by pri-

mary. property/casualty insur-

ers. the overall risk is spread
tether..

- Financially, the ^industry is

now much healthier than in
the mid-ians. The capital base
of the US reinsurance industry
has almost doubled, to $117bn
from $64bn in. 1984. Bid, tor aH
this, the structure ofthe insur-

ance industry as a wlude is
changing,

and not hecessariljr

to file 'advantage of the refer

simss.
As . direct insurers become

larger, in .size, through their
own growth or acquisition,

their solvency margins

REINSURANCE
improve and they, cede less of
their business to reinsurers.

-This may be exacerbated by
the present differential
between direct and reinsurance
prices. Furthermore, toe busi-

ness being retained by insurers

is likely to be .what in the past

had been the reinsurers’ bread
and batter business.

Too much can be made of
this. The impact of 1992 on the

European insurance industry
is still very unclear. It might
precipitate a wave of mergers
or acquisitions, but this is by
no means certain. In general
terms, however, toe 1990s do

took likely to produce a consol-

idation In the European insur-

ance industry, and with it less

reliance mi reinsurance.

Nor are these changes neces-

sarily confined to the insur-

ance industry. Larger compa-
nies in Europe also means
more sophisticated treasury
departments and risk assess-

ment, with more business
retained in-house or, at least,

not being ceded to toe reinsur-

ance industry.

How will the reinsurance
Industry respond to these
long-term changes? The two
largest European reinsurance

companies - Swiss Re and
Munich Re - which together

have an annual premium of
$9.1bn have somewhat differ-

ent approaches. Swiss Re has
tended to shift into in direct

life and non-life insurance,
while Munich Re has taken
stakes directly or through affil-

iates in major direct insurers.

The most important of these is

Munich Re’s 25 per cent recip-

rocal stake in Allianz.

Lloyd’s has already suffered

from these changes in the
structure of the insurance
industry. It was, for instance,

responsible for only some 40

per cent of the primary insur-

ance of Piper Alpha, but,

through reinsurance, some 80

per cent of the risk was ulti-

mately centred in London.
This concentration of foreign

reinsurance, as opposed to pri-

mary reinsurance, has its dis-

advantages for Lloyd's, all the

more so since the size of catas-

trophe and disaster Haims has
been going up. Speaking of 87J,

toe October storm which cost

some £2bn in the UK, France
and Norway, one insurance
broker said it was “inconceiv-

able that it would have gener-

ated the same level of toss 10

Europe
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Hie London market 4
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-ondon's planned bourse 5

/view: Hady Wakefield 5

years ago." Even Piper Alpha
was worth only 45 per cent of

the top value rig in the North
Sea.

Yet, despite the size of these

losses, the most significant

outcome of these disasters has

been the lack of impact on the

prices, underlining present
over-capacity. The one excep-

tion to this is long tail proper-
ty-casualty business in the US,
where there are fears of fur-

ther heavy losses from asbesto-

sis, the demolition, erf buildings
containing asbestos and envi-

ronmental pollution.

Asbestos bodily injury has
already produced settled or
outstanding claims worth
$5^bn, and it may be that US
trade unions are getting to the
end of the list of workers most
likely to have been affected
when asbestos was in common
use. But asbestos property
damage, only gradually being
revealed as buildings come up
for renovation or demolition,
could ultimately total 10 times
as much, or around $54bn, over
the next 30 years, according
one estimate. There are same
3*500 school buildings contain-
ing asbestos, in addition to

733.000 public or commercial
buildings.

On hazardous waste, two
important court decisions -
Rocky Mountain Arsenal and
Diamond Shamrock - have
recently gone in favour of the
insurer. But there are still

27.000 identified dump sites in
the US, some 10,000 of which
need to be cleaned up. With
the heavy publicity given to

the tote of members of RHM
Outhwaite syndicate 317
which, in effect, reinsured
other syndicates against asbes-
tos and environmental risk in

1982, the lack of enthusiasm tor
long-term US property-casualty
risk in understandable.

In these circumstances, it is

hardly surprising that the out-

look for insurance brokers also

looks pessimistic. Revenues at

Sedgwick, Frank B.Hall and
several big European brokers
have gone down, in part
because of the poor perfor-

mance of their reinsurance
subsidiaries. For the 20 top
international brokers, 1988 was
the worst year, with the excep-
tion of 1983, since the early
1970s. This makes the compa-

The banks and reinsurance

Catastrophes

Lite reassurance 7

Recant legal cases 8

Editorial production:

Martin Davies

nies more selective in the type
of business they handle, and
keen to offer consultancy and
specialist services. The disad-

vantage of offering extra ser-

vices is that this obviously
increases costs at the moment
when brokers are trying to cut
them.

How far does the present
slump in interest rates resem-
ble the rate cutting in 1978-84?

The most obvious parallel
between the two periods is

high interest rates, when rein-

surers were prepared to cut
their prices In order to collect

premiums in order to invest

them whatever the underwrit-

ing toss.

The argument against this

occurring again is that the tax

incentives, certainly in Britain,

are less than they were 10
years ago. East European and
Latin American reinsurers who
sharply cut rates 10 years ago
have not returned to the mar-
ket, and companies may also
be more conscious that high
interest rates mean that infla-

tion will boost the cost of
claims . As a result, notes on
observer, “everybody says they
are not involved in cash-flow
under-writing - but they
would, wouldn’t they?”

More immediately, the most
interesting development in

world reinsurance is the degree

to which the US reinsurance
industry has managed not to

get involved in the competitive
rate-cutting of the primary
insurance business. Although
the overall volume of reinsur-

ance may be down, this has led

to heavy buying of General Re
on Wall Street, the argument
being that, as the primary
insurers cut the premiums,
they will ultimately have to

turn to the reinsurers.

According to Mr Zerbarini, of

Prescott Ball: “They will even-

tually have to seek reinsurance

relief. And strong companies,
like General Re, will be able to

cherry-pick their business at

the price they dictate and the

terms they dictate."

Nevertheless, in both the US
and Europe, structural changes
in insurance are putting pres-

sure on the reinsurance busi-

ness as a whole, with little sign

of growth in the volume of
business in the next few years.
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THE US: two big questions are looming, says James Buchan; meanwhile^

holds up in

idle capacity and high
the face of
overheads

: believes the reinsurance Industry will (he shake-out In the primary market

SO FAR, so good. The US
reinsurance industry has just
about kept its neutrality in the
price war now raging in the
primary insurance market.
Prices are softening and terms
are getting tougher Cor the
reinsurers. Bat the companies
are making money.

'

This has not been easy In a
market that is shrinking mark-
edly. The industry, which was
writing $llbn in business in
1986, had premiums of Wirier

$10bn last year, according to
the Reinsurance Association of
America. General Re, the larg-

est US company, has seen its

quarterly premium Call from
$721m In early 1987 to $440m in
the quarter just ended.

Executives say the tempta-
tion to scramble for business is

excruciating. With so much
capacity idle, the companies
are carrying excess overheads,
and the pressure on expense
ratios is severe. But by mid-
summer, at least, profitability
was holding up. General Re
was writing business in the
second quarter at a combined
ratio of losses and expenses to
premium of 99.1 - that is, it

made 90 cents in profit on
every S100 of insurance it took
on even before it invested the
premium. The industry as a
whole is probably unprofitable
before investment income, bnt
not by much.
But the reinsurance Industry

and the Lloyd's syndicates in
the US market go into the sec-

ond half facing two big ques-
tions. How long can the rein-

surance market withstand the
pressure on prices coming
down from the primary mar-
ket? And can the industry ever
recapture the business it has
lost?

In the primary market, the

Tod U S reinsurance companies 1988 results ($000*s) -

Company . Policyholder’s Net Premiums
Surplus Written

Net Premiums Losses & Loss
Earned AdJ. Expenses

Loss-Redo
%

Underwriting
Expenses

Expense
Ratio% %

General Re Group
Employers Reinsurance
North American/Swiss Re
American Re-Insurance Co
Munich Re Group

2,319,177
1,045,269
623,401
553,256
505.604

1.780,247
1,312,390
623.611
937,336
625,151

1.921.097
1.332.098
679,178
951 ,463
645,715

1,344,332
996,478
464,370
711,201
-449,091

- 70.0
74.8
68.4
74.7
69.5

517,766
- 341,493
213.277
250.690
203.346

29.1
26.0
342
2S.7
32J)

99.1"
• 100.8 .

.

102.6
1015
102.1

Prudential Reinsurance Co
Kemper Reinsurance Group
SkantUa America Group
National Reinsurance Corp
Cigna Reinsurance Co

416,912
•

364,792-
309,934
199,891
187,927

560.529
308,883

- 234,306
• 281,087

282.498

585.575
320,926
252.134
278,932
294,052

426,903
262302
175,358

. 228,827
207,314

- 72.9
81.7
69.5
82.0

' 70.5
'

207,593
- 66,678

81,872
56.010
83.910

37J3
21.6
342
19.9
29.7

-109.9
103.3
104.5
102.0'
100.2-

Mac Reinsurance Corp
Transatlantic Reinsurance Co
Constitution Reinsurance Corp
Transamerica Reinsurance Co
Underwriters Reinsurance Co

174,217
174,341
164,790
149,046
147,916

171,430
311,139
258,193
257.402
150,591

161,978
298,656
263.905
209,186
149,256

124,690
243,571
192,427
151,340 . .

110,003

77.0
- 81 .6

72.9
72.3
73.7

51.142
73.350
74,182
71,915
38,250

29.8
23.6
282
27-9

25.4

. 106.8 -

• 105.1

101.6
. 100.3

99.1 .

"Winterthur" Swiss Insurance Co
Dorinco Reinsurance Co
American Agr. Ins. Co
US International Reins. Co
ScorReinsurance Co

142,468
117,620
113,355
113,407
108,539

74,025
51.805

106,060
201,344
110,649

78,036
49,056
121.617
188,792
112,063

55,151
41,304

105,518
136,487
73,718

70.7 .

84.2
86.8.
72.3
65.8

26.585
6,461
17,555
63,716
32,600

352
.123
16.6
31.6
292

106.6
96.7

103.3
103.9
95.2

Executive Re (ERIC)

Itonwick America Reins. Corp.
Continental Reinsurance Corp
Putnam Reinsurance Co
Metropolitan Reinsurance Co

107,162
107,640
103,806

.

103,824
100,586

51,731
103,871
248,040
138,792
117,848

46,817
98,275

240,508
127,588
117,344

31,836
69,714
193£46
99,997

102,622

68.0
70.9
80.6
78.4
87.5

16,573
31,889
89,363
34,292
33,486

32.0
30.7
36.0
24.7
28.4

100.0
. 101.6
116.6
103.1
115.9

fetal Reinsurance Companies 10,391.443 10.822,523 11,087,763 8,160,168 73.6 3,172,696 292 102.9
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crisis of the mid-1980s, when
competitive rate-cutting
plunged the property/casualty
industry deep into loss, is bnt a
distant memory. Two years of
record profits, static loss
reserves and booming stock
and bond markets have swelled
the industry’s capital base to

$ll7bn, against an exiguous
$63bn in the terrible year of
1984, according to A.M.Best,
the insurance analysis firm

This increased capital will
naturally support a much
higher level of business.
“Euphoria is still rampant on
the upper floors of home
offices,” says Mr Donald Zer-
hnrini an insurance specialist
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at Prescott Ball & Turben. But
the new business is simply not
coming in. Many traditional
insurance clients, ranging from
municipalities to corporations,
have abandoned conventional
cover, and instead set up cap-
tives or Insured themselves.
They remain embittered by the
high rates and threadbare
cover that the industry offered

as it scrambled back from the
crisis.

One result is cutthroat com-
petition for whatever business
there is. The other is that the
property/casualty companies,
burdened with capital, can now
afford to hold on to business
they would normally have laid

off in the reinsurance market
Some companies are holding
on to as much as 75 par cent of
their premiums for their own
account “There is a good deal

of extra surplus at hand, so
they don’t need to cede,” says

1

Mr Andre Maisonpierre, presi-

dent of the Reinsurance Asso-
ciation.

Reinsurers say that primary
insurers are also being tough
on terms. Risks that would

In the primary market,

after two years’ record

profits, the crisis of

the mid-1980s Is but a

distant memory

normally be laid off separately,

in what is known as the facul-

tative market, are now rou-
tinely included in the treaty

market, where reinsurers sim-
ply shoulder a portion of the
insurers’ business. Facultative
premiums, which were 24 per
cent of the reinsurance market
in the good year of 1986, were
down to 20 per cent in 1988,

according to the Reinsurance
Association.
By all accounts,, the reinsur-

ers ought to be scrabbling for

this reduced business, catting
rates and accepting much risk-

ier business, just like the pri-

mary insurers. But executives

say that renewals on property
ami casualty reinsurance are
running at rates perhaps 10 per
cent lower than last year.

One reason for the relative

price dinrripiim» is that reinsur-

ance Industry was almost
bankrupted in the mid-1980s,
and has not forgotten. Several
reinsurance companies failed,

and the average combined
ratio for the industry was a
horrible m2 in 1984.

“The .crisis was a lot more
scary for reinsurance than
insurance,” said Mr Maison-
pierre. In addition, the reinsur-
ers were confronted in the
early 1980s with a class of
long-lived, or so-called “long-
taiT risks, where huge rfaima

have to be met years after the
risk was insured.
The reinsurance industry is

haunted by the prospect of big
claims for environmental lia-

bility. Millions of dollars have
already been awarded by the
courts to dean up toxic waste
sites. But these costs are
dwarfed

1 by estimates that ft

could take up to glOQbu to
dean up the hazardous waste
sites Identified under the
Superfund laws.
Even if just one quarter of

that cost were passed bn to the
insurance industry, it would be
quite enough to bankrupt the
reinsurers. It is no great sur-
prise that the Lloyd's syndi-
cates, for example, are so chary
of US casualty business. After
all, what looks like profit now
may well turn out to be inade-
quate loss reserves years from
now.
On Wall Street, there is a

growing belief that the reinsur-
ance industry is going to
escape the shake-out in the pri-
mary market, and indeed will
profit from it The argument
which is put eloquently by Mr
Zerbarlni of Prescott Ball,
holds that rates and profits are
going to deteriorate further in
the primary market till bal-

ance sheets will no longer sup-

port the current level' of reten-

tion.

“They will eventually have
to seek reinsurance relief,” he
says. “And strong' companies
like General Re will be able to

cherry-pick their business, at

the the price they dictate and
the terms they dictate."

It is this kind of thinking

that is behind the .extraordi-

nary buying interest in Gen-

Even as rates are cut

in the primary maricet,

there Is no great sign

that lost business Is

being recovered

eral Re. Clearly, if the com-
pany is solidly profitable at its

current low of level of busi-

ness, additional premium
should end. up at the bottom
line. The company's stock,

which ended last year at $56,

was trading in the high $70s in

August, making it one of the
year's best performers in the
stock market.
Scor Re has also been

strongly in demand. Among
the property/casualty insurers,

only 'specialised companies
.such as American Interna-
tional and Hartford Steam
Boiler have generated such a
following this year.

But it is very doubtful
whether the reinsurance indus-

try will ever regain its former
size. Even as rates are cut in

the primary market, there is

no great sign that business lost

to captive insurers or self-in-

surance is being recovered. In
fact, premium growth for the
property casualty companies is

lagging the overall growth of

the US economy.
“This business Is lost for the

time being and maybe for
ever," says Mr Maisonpierre. “I

think there are important
structural changes taking
place."
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LAST MONTH'S news :tftat
Deutsche Bank, West Ger-
many’s biggest ftnenpial insti-
tution, had cbosen Hannover-^
iscbe

.
Rdckversichemag

(Hanover Re) as one of.the four
companies to re-lnsure its new
life insurance unit threw an 1

unexpected spotlight on the
one: of the country’s largest;

.
butJeast knowr^ re-msurens: -

For Hannover Re and its sis-

ter company. Bisen und Stahl
Ruckversichenmg have until
recently hidden their light

- under a.bnsheL As nmtnaily-
owned organisations, their
shares are not quoted on the
bourse, like Munich Re, the -

leading German re-insurer.
Nor, like Cologne Be, can

they claim to .be the oldest in :

the field. As its name implies,

.

Eisen und Stahl was founded
by representatives of German
heavy industry in 39123, while
Hanover Re is a much more -

recent creation dating from
1966.

But, while neither company
individually gets beyond
around seventh place in the
league table of German insur-
ers in terms - of ' premium
income, together they rank sec- -

ond according to their own
estimates, with rinmhhiori pre-
mium income of DM2J30bn.
Yet who they are remains

something of a mystery -
. something Mr dans Bingemer,
the long-serving chairman of
their combined executive
board, would now like , to
change.

-

.

While.Eisen und Stahl

. had built up a solid

but overwhelmingly
domestic, business,

the much younger
Hanover Re had been

forced to look for.

* much of its business.
• abroad' .. .

.

Part of the problem Res in
' the fact that although cjpaelr

/finked; it is only Since Jdntiajy

1988 that the braid between the

two groups, which share the

same modem red-brick home
just outside Hanover, has been
most strongly forged, effec-

tively giving them one top
management and board.

The reasons behind the lag

in cementing the link are com-,

plex. Hanover Re and Eisen
und Stahl first drew closer in

3970, when the Haftpfhchtver-

band der Deutsche Industrie

(HDD, a mutually-owned-
insurer, joined forces with the

Ifeaerscbadenverband, another
mutual, which was particularly

active in fixe risks.

With a 51 per cent stake, the
HDI was the majority share-

holder in Eisen und StahV with
the remaining shares being
held by a number of big Ger-

man mutual insurers, indnd-
ing HDK-Coburg, one of Ger-

many's main motor insurers.

Meanwhile, the Feuerschaden-
verband owned Hanover Re,

which it bad set up four years

earlier.

Each group had thought
alike in establishing its own
re-insurance operation, in

order to guarantee its re-insur-

ance needs, and, to a lesser

extent, look for outside- busi-

ness.
But, rather than take the

obvious step of merging their

re-insurance activities
.

after

1970, the parent companies
decided just to run them side

by side.

The reasons lay largely in

the sharply differing charac-

ters of the two operations. For
while Eisen und Stahl had
built up a solid but overwhelm-
ingly domestic business, the
much younger Hanover Re had
been forced to look for much of

twins
its business abroad. Fra: some
of Hum TTTvi Stahl’s :conserva-
tive >. cedents;/, merging the
established and-well-ran group
witb, fis “riskier” ./young coun-
terpart was felt -to-,be unwise;
prompting ffra

' to keep
them apart.

:

7 •••. .: -

-in January -last, year, that
finally changed with the deri-

sion to"intensify their coopera- -

tiao, which now makes the two
companies, all hut indistin-
guishable.. For the upshot of
the *^Zeltihnnngsgmiffifl^afr

.

between them,means that -all

.senior officers will
1

,how be able
to represent andact on behalf
cf both companies.: •

The fit between Risen und
Stahl and Hanover Re could
hardly - be better. While Han-
over Re derived DM956m (some
8V pea*- cent) of its DM156bn
premium income in 1988 from
.abroad, iMam lrrifl Stahl took
in a mere DMlglm from for-

eign activities - representing
just 23 per emit of its total pre-

miums. Indeed, no other Ger-
man reinsurer derives such a
-high proportion of its business
from abroad, according to Mr
Bingemer. By contrast, domes-
tic .premiums awinmtiri - -to

DM600m -at Hanover -Re and
DM638m at' the - appreciably
mnnTlgr - 'Riflgn .'nnril Jttahl. •

. "Given the present- friendly
solution,. Mr Bingemer is

unsure- whether the two com-
panies wfiLever need to mount
a fall merger. “Things function
.so :weD, it’s not really neces-
sary," he says. However^hav-
ing finally brought

:

the two
companies, together, he. feels

Ihe time has come “for us to

stop hiding our bloom". -

International competition
has also played, a part in the
decision to adopt a higher pro-

file, Hanover Re is particnlariy

active in the US, -its biggest
single foreign market.,where
the need Tor a company to
advertise and present itself is

particularly acute.
_• However, US re-insurance
has proved extremely ficklefor
some of the companies which
flooded into the market; only
to pull back with burntfingers

ite' oertmjdy
does not.put itself In that cate-

gory, Mr Theodor Dlelmann,
the executive vice president
who looks after its US activi-

ties, admits that its sharp
expansion in the US after 1984

caused same concern, hi three

yearSt the group increased the
size of its portfolio some five

times over.

“We were not so much clev-

erer than the market," he. says,

implying that Hanover Re also

went into the red. However, Mr
Dlelmann, who has been with
foe group, since it had just 24
employees back in 1972, stfil

maintains the US business has

been profitable over the . long
term. '

;

Nevertheless, greater cau-
tion in the US is the watch-
word now, with a reduction in

its exposure. *Nbw~fcF not the
best time to be expanding,"
says Mr Bingemer. Doubledigit
growth in the US is now only
being done by companies at

the expense of profitability,

adds Mr Dlelmann.
But- despite the recent deci-

sion to slow down Hanover
Re’s formerly breakneck
growth, its achievements .to

date should not be under-
played. Seldom has a new-
comer managed to-break into
the Gentian reinsurance' busi-
ness from scratch; even with
the help of a powerful parent
like the HDL
The share of premium

income attributable to its par-
ent has steadily declined over
the years, to stand at just 30
per cent That in itself is no
mean feat in Germany; where
the Hnmpctif; re-insurance busi-
ness. is largely in firm hands,

Haig Slmontan

Specialist RrinturaneeBraka*

.

Grclg Fester Lid^ 43-46 King wiilinm Street, LondonEC4K9AD
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~
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GREIG FESTER

EUROPE: Jeffrey Brown weighs the implications of new directives from Brussels

Big players will not be unscathed

The top 10 European
reinsurers

LIFE IS getting tougher for
Europe’s underwriters. The
underwriting cycle is turning
down, with returns under pres-
sure in a number of individual
economies as well as in the
broader, freer-winning interna-
tiohal insurance market And,
as ff that were not trouble
"enough, the rules of the game
are changing East
By the middle of next year,

the first of the Brussels direc-

tives on insurance deregula-
tion within the European Com-
munity takes effect From then
on - in the run up to 1992 -
file trade barriers which have
long protected some national

. insurance markets will start to
tumble rapidly.

'

. To a large extent, Europe's
big reinsurance groups stand
to one side of the direct firing
line. The sort of trade restric-
tions which exist in many pri-

mary insurance markets are
not part of the reinsurance
world. Here a comparatively
free market has operated
across most national bound-
aries for more than two
decades.
The likes of Munich Reinsur-

ance, Swiss Reinsurance and
Sweden’s Skandia Interna-
tional have little to fear from
deregulation in a direct sense.
But the reinsurance industry
cannot hope to escape entirely
unscathed as Europe's primary

insurers scramble to complete
a rash of takeovers and merg-
ers ahead of 1992. In theory,

the move to larger power blocs
for primary Insurance could
lead to less demand for rein-
surance.

As the primary insurance
industry grows less frag-
mented, so its ability to spread
a wider degree of risk across a
greater solvency ratio should

increase. The resultant pros-
pect - a smaller slice of a pos-
sibly lower-quality cake - is

not one that Europe’s reinsur-

ance industry views with equa-
nimity.

The pattern of reinsurance
flows in the US looks an omi-
nous portent. It may have
more to do with the downturn
in the underwriting cycle than
will real longer-term trends,
but even so the slowdown in
US business is disturbing. For
1986, US reinsurance premiums
as a percentage of total com-
mercial premiums stood at 12.8

per cent. Industry estimates for

1968 suggest that the ratio has
narrowed to around 11.5 per
cent.

Does the recent decision to
merge by Scor and UAP Re, the
two top French reinsurance
groups, suggest that reinsurers
are themselves starting to bat-

ten down the hatches for a
period of stormier trading? The
answer, probably, is a qualified

yes.

They operate efficiently in a
highly competitive working
environment Their business is

tough to price and rate, and it

demands a high degree cash-
management patience, since
there are often long tailbacks

before settlement can be com-
pleted with primary insurers.

A number of the big reinsur-

Despite their image,

Europe’s powerful

reinsurance groups
' are not Just a

collection of

overgrown,

self-feeding.

Industry-dominant

power blocs

ers might have captive rela-

tionships with primary insur-

ance companies - Munich Re,
for example, has a 25 per cent
cross-shareholding with Ger-
many's (and Europe’s) biggest
insurance group, Allianz - but
this does not necessarily imply
that management in general is

short-sighted.
Munich Re might appear to

be relying heavily on its links

with Allianz to provide protec-

tion against a cooling business

climate. But having since 1986

paid a total of Dm2.3bn for

RAS of Italy and ComhiU of

the UK, AiKanz has probably

built for itself the best and
most widely spread sales net-

work in Europe.

Munich Re also has sheer

size on its side. With net pre-

miums running at the equiva-

lent of $6-5bn for 1987, the com-

pany is more than twice as big

as its nearest rival, Swiss Re.

This must provide it with a
substantial room to manoeu-
vre. should the normal cut and
thrust of day to day business
ever develop into an outright
rating war.
However, Munich Re does

looks to have too great a con-

centration of business, at a
time when profits are not get-

ting any easier to make. Premi-
ums fell slightly last year,
partly as a result of adverse
currency swings, and pre-tax
profits were broadly
unchanged.

Against this background, the
purchase of New Re, a small
Swiss reinsurer. 18 months ago
begins to take on increasing
significance.
Taken together, Munich Re

and Swiss Re dominate the
European reinsurance indus-
try. Their combined net premi-
ums total $9.1bn, slightly in
excess of the combined premi-
ums of the other eight compa-

nies in the top ten. But their

management approaches could

not be more disparate.

Munich Re remains a rein-

surance purist. In contrast,

Swiss Re has spent the past

few years busily diversifying,

pushing hard into primary
insurance both on the life and

non-life side. In 1984, reinsur-

ance accounted for two-thirds

of total gross premiums. By
1987, the ratio was down to 55

per cent following growth in

on-life direct insurance premi-

ums to nearly 40 per cent of

the total.

The differences are equally
marked in terms of manage-
ment philosophy. Swiss Re
operates through a decentral-

ised structure of subsidiaries,

opting for a looser chain of
command than that at Munich
Re which keeps a very tight

centralised control over its

underwriting.
The Swiss clearly believe in

delegation, while the German
approach tends to leave very
little to chance. The freedom
that Swiss Re allows its subsid-

iaries has occasionally back-
fired, notably in the US in

recent years. Yet it remains
convinced that delegated
responsibility is the way to

attract and retain strong local

management.
The 1992 changes also

threaten to usher in a new

Net oremlums Sbn

Munich Re 6.54

Swiss Re 2.56

Skandia inti. 129
Hannover Ruck 1.19

Scor/UAP Re 1.16

M & G Re 1.14

Generali 1.11

Cologne Re 1.07
Gerling Kozem 1.06

Frttnkonft Ruck 0.81

accounting era for the reinsur-

ance industry. Companies that

do not already do so will be

obliged to produce consoli-

dated accounts, and Brussels is

also calling for greater realism

in the valuation of invest-

ments.
Any new portfolio valuation

directives would have a dra-

matic impact on company net

asset values and - possibly -

on the attractions of the indus-

try to the stock market. For
example, one analyst estimates

that the real worth of Swiss
Re’s investment portfolio is

around SFr4bn (£1.5bn). This is

roughly double the current
book value.
But the new directives could

also have serious implications

for the way some reinsurers
view their balance of risk.

German companies are not
alone in making a determined
stand against the disclosure of

hidden reserves. The German
view is partly philosophical,
partly practical. Insurance,
says Munich Re, is a long-term

business needful of the sort of

cushioning that hidden
reserves provide
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THE LONDON MARKET: as direct insurers retain more risks, reinsurers see a reduction of business, writes Eric Short

players to improve their efficiency
THE LONDON reinsurance
market is now firmly into the
next downswing of Its business
cycle. But underwriters are
confident that it will not reach
the depths seen in the dra-
matic downswing of the late
1970s and early 1980s.

The basic causes of this
downturn are the familiar ones
of over-capacity and a slowing
down of business.

Rating has been firm in the
direct insurance market for the

past few years, particularly for
personal line property and
motor business; while, at the
same time, investment rates
have remained high. This has
resulted in a strong cash-flow
for the direct-writing insurers
and high solvency margins.
So direct insurance compa-

nies have been retaining a
larger share of the risks put
before them. Reinsurers have
seen a reduction in the amount
of proportional treaty business.

In contrast, the direct insur-
ance writers have been increas-

ing the amount of catastrophe
reinsurance cover on a non-
proportional basis. The Octo-
ber 1987 hurricane showed the
need for such cover. Until
then, catastophe reinsurance
had been sought for the large

corporate risks, rather than for

their overall personal lines

portfolios. Now these compa-
nies are seeking such catas-

tophe cover, and are finding it

mainly from the Lloyd's mar-
ket.

Reinsurance accounts for

most business placed at
Lloyd's. This market has

always been an attractive
carrier of catastophe risks.

With its worldwide book of
business, Lloyd's has the expe-

rience of rating catastophe
risks, such as hurricanes and
floods, and the ability to han-
dle claims quickly.
The question facing reinsur-

ers Is how long the downturn
will last. The answer is not in

their hands, but in those of the
direct-insurance writers, par-

ticularly in the US, since rein-

surance markets follow the
direct markets. London is not
alone in facing the downturn.

Over-capacity is a worldwide
phenomenon and, as yet. there
are no signs that London is

losing its share of the world
reinsurance market
The indications from the US

are that rates are not going to

Arm up again for at least
another two or three years.
But, on the other hand, rein-

surers do not expect to see
rates collapsing as they did in

the late 1970s and early 1980s.

Much depends on whether
reinsurance rates soften in line

with direct insurance rates, so
that it again becomes attrac-

tive for direct insurers to lower
their retention limits and buy
their cover in a soft retroces-

sion market, expanding rein-
surance business again, albeit

at lower rates.

But reinsurers are expected
to take a much tougher line

this time against widespread
rate-cutting. Although they
also have strong solvency mar-
gins, they do not have the
same benefit from high invest-

ment returns as the direct
insurers. At present, some
reinsurers are prepared to see
their market share decline,
rather than take on poor risks

at unrealistically low premi-
ums.

Nevertheless, the major rein-

surance brokers are seeing
large risks coming on to the
market, where premiums are
soft, cover Is for wider than
hitherto experienced, and pol-

icy conditions are generous.
Creation of a single Euro-

pean financial market in 1992
will not have a direct effect on
London's reinsurance
operations. Reinsurance is
worldwide, with few if any
national boundaries preventing
the flow of business. Neverthe-
less, if a single finanria) mar-
ket has in-depth effects on the
direct insurance writers, then
there will be a spin-off on the
reinsurers.
The forthcoming downturn

is giving impetus to steps
being taken by reinsurers in
the London market to improve
their administration efficiency.

It is recognised that the admin-
stration required an overhaul,
making use of computers and
technology. Attention is being
given to networking, the pro-

cessing of claims, and to
planned market buildings.

Reinsurance brokers are also
hit by the downturn. Lower
rates and a drop in turnover
means lower income, while
expenses rise. However, rein-

surance brokers are major
international firms and the
drop in margins has been offset

by currency gains.

Lloyd's feces its own wide-
spread problems in connection
with its reinsurance business.
It is still grappling with the
asbestosis claims relating to
cover affected many years ago
- problems that have been
widely publicised. Now a new
threat has arisen, namely
insurance claims on old busi-
ness relating to pollution.
At present, this threat is dor-

mant Recent court .judgments
in the US, on whether insurers
should carry the cleaning-up
costs arising from pollution,
have been in favour of the
insurers.

Lloyd's heaved a sigh of
relief over the Rocky Mountain
Arsenal judgment It faced hav-
ing to meet a significant por-
tion of the estimated $2bn-plus
bill for cleaning up what has
been described as "the most
polluted spot on this planet”.
The Council is currently
grappling with the problem of
a growing number of syndi-
cates leaving their account-
years open at the end of the
normal three-year period.
One solution that is being

mooted is the establishment by
tbe Council of a reinsurance
company that would offer rein-
surance, at commercial rates,

to syndicates to enable them to
dose their accounts.
The success of this proposal

would, however, depend on the
London reinsurance market's
being willing to participate in

providing at least some of this
reinsurance cover - at present
a problematical situation.

WORLD INSURANCE REPORT
Now in its fourteenth year. World Insurance Report is recognised in the industry as fee best in its field. Everytwo
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programme covers all market areas. Subjects indude Rests and Commercial Vehicles, Computers, Contractors,
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PERFORMANCE QF LLOYD’S MEMBERS AGENTS
formance by each Members' Agent on the

shown in the table below from the fughest to the lowest percentage.

The number of. Members' Agents has been reduced by irwgehsantf

takeovers from 234 la .1985 to the present figure of about t«l. Those

now reportinghave done so mainly under their present names and are

listed below accordingly-

Also shown in'the following Bating are:.- - - .•••-

.

• the number of members that each Agent reported as having in 1985;

• the number of syndicates to which those members were allocated;

• the 1985 allocated capacity of those syndicates; this figu rerexcludes

capacity that was acquired by agencies enlarged by meiger of buy-

out after 1985; where a figure is omitted, ttus is because refi&jie

information could not tie readily ascertained for the agency con-_

cemed. •

The Nelli Committee recommended that “The Council should taka the

necessary steps to facilitate the disclosure of members* agents' perfor-

mance by reference to the results of the syndicates to which Uielr

Names have had access".

The Council of Lloyd's gave effect to that recommendation in Byelaw
No 7 of 1988. This requires each Members' Agent tq'pubUsh an annual
Members' Agents Information Report (MAIR). The MAJR [s to include

a statement for each year of account of each agency's average perfor-

mance showing the sum of the aggregate results of its Alames as a
^percentage of the Agency’s total allocated capacity, of Its Names.

The first of these performance reports, which Lloyd's, published on
July 3, In respect of the 1985 year of account. That year's results show
members' profits or losses after Lloyd's and agents!.charges and profit

commission and after UK income tax at the. rate of. .29. per. cent on
Investment Income and GGT at 30 per cent on capital, gains. The per-

Mximiwi Number of Numbered
.

Syndication
lla,nha,alnotnun w^pin
Hardy
NTEvennett
Eduardo APsyna
Gmvatt & TTWng
Mandat Tboaws ft Cooper
HotananMadeod
G PEI tat

RJKfln

Average%
IB.OO
17.04
13.27
10.87
10.80
10.57
10.44
10.21

llamasran iii«»

34
lit .

315 .. .

14
9
80
61

230

Syndfeateaa
ia -

-
•- .15 _•

.

- 8
14

-• 3
29
60

CapacByDn
3.53
9.92

40.32 ‘

0.55
1.22
0.64
5.02

29.10

RHMOuttnraita
Roberta & HIscax
Peter Rapper
Alexander Howden A Beck
Claremount

9.80
9.67

9.55
9.52
9.43

106
219
28

640
90-

78
45

‘ 18
128
47

14.62
42.08
2.76

89.07

Morgan, Penttaian A Barber 8.88 124 49 13.72
Murray Lawrence 8.97 678 131 .

104.29
*»
1VI111 8.94 785 102 64.33
HenryG Nicholson 8.88 33 27 4.58
Bankable 8.85

’. - — 98.42
Cox liHtabery & WHO 8.83 109 71 26.77
ICAgrtaar 8.72 12 20 2.38

Pterl 8.68 55 46 7.81

Bennett Samoa 8.90 .33- •38" • - 8.43

CW Renta 850 4 13 0-52

Gardner Mountain & Capef-Curo B.3B 322 49 44.58
Greetiwn 8.31 2 3 0.07
Cuthbert Heath 8.10 416 54 02 26
Urn* Street 8.07 26 02 7.44

WHUaFaber ADuroas 8.04 1,040 .114 188.88

ThoeR Miller A Son 8.00 127 71 20 49

Ltayd-RobarteAGHkea 7.93 77 51 12.00

Adams Johnson Green 7.89 37 — 6.02

APLeafle 7.73 105 82 21.13

PB Coffey 7.70 12 10 0.70

John Haynes A Co 7.70 182 105 45.94

RMPatamao 7.63 108 56 20.93
Wellington 7.61 68 58 1S.4S

John Haynes Uw 7.58 128 61 12.88

Kingsley 7.53 247 76 68.62

Patrick 7.51 4 18 0.52

Chriauphareon Heath 7.44 152 79 21.72
ChDtem 7.43 52 00 8.75

Higgins, Brasier 7.42 73 30 9.09

Scott 7.40 71 52 . 17.32

Daws A ttandarson 7.39 IBS 106 03.33

Gamma! Kershaw 7.30 ib 31 2.54
Danner 7.26 306 66 114.38
MHCochefl 7.14 18 20 1.64
HG JagaJVenton 7.14 22 33 3.94

Jenson Green 7.10 390 20 71.30 -

C 1 de Rougemont 7.10 132 70 "21.67

Sedgwick Lloyd* 7.09 1,580 159 277.57
RF Kershaw 7.00 98 70.20

ranchurcti 887 828 196 178.04
Sudbrook 6.74 74 68 16.73
BradatockA Barter 6.73 131 12 22.85
GW Hutton 6.71 88 41 12.87

Harrison Brothers 6.83 62 49 18.54
Oaoetan 8.83 43 35 8.80
KMlirEfl, FlljUay S.B2 11 17 1.25
DavidHainan 6.81 137 87 28.25
Banter & Marsh 6-5Z 245 33 35.82
Lambert Brothers 6.50 250 74 29.30
FLPSacratan 6.43 210 45 28.85
Edward wnttome Coutt* 839 227 41 26.25
BF Caudle 6.30 46 28 5.45
MPK 6.17 50 43 6.24
Jardtn* 8.10 423 181 66.87
Anton 8.05 198 91 28.16
Ashtay PahnarA Hathaway 6.00 9 9 0.75
Bain Clarkson 0.00 308 104 87.72

Members’ Agent

CaterAlton -

S A Uncock

Stewart. Cray's Inn
Lxuwm PMHppi
ama smith
David Evers
London WoU
Hinton MM
George Mrtler

*

SKPeomb A Keulngtoa
FMcBng .

FrizzeU
RAFMaamnon
L Hammond
RKHantaoa
ItiylarClayton
Rfeiwda Longman
Mocafta Daatnraod
R wattage -/ .

Crow
A R Mountain C Son
Wendover

Numberof Syndication

Average* Ramos syndicate* Capacity Em
- 109 SB 24.45

'7- .5.83 218 54 22.96

.
159. 34-

,

.1594
.

511 133 48.25

s*3 3C4 83 58.01

43 44 7.15'

9.78 157 132 38.20
,

450 124 72JS6

5.70 66 64 16.74

36 22 4.7*'

.- 5.40 193 128 27-60

5.42 . 73 74 14.02

5.42 200 43 .33.32

5.42 55 51 6.87"

5.41 - 68 17 UL9B.
5.37 330 121 81.64

. 5.36 3t 38 3.46

5.34 38 53 6.50

5.28 443 185- 91.71 '

9.28 1,227 84 . 281.70

6.22 45 18 12.17.

5.19 70 36 - 10.80 •

- 5.04 130 72. . 24:35

Crockferti Dovttt 4.97 153 118 28.78

4.80 562 228 128*8 ..

OabomeBett . 4*3 182 125 52.92

J H Davies - 4*0 32 42 0.44

Cassidy Davie 4,78 94 48 IG.09:

JKShlpton 4.78 209 74 39.78
4.70 79 56 18.10 .

Kalian ,4.67 146 7S 22. 9

1

HsytarBroekbank 4.54 259 92 06.18
'

Bolton, Ingham 4*0 243 58-'

Rosa, Thomson, Young 4.25 20* 80 34*4
H J Bromley 4.21

- 16 16 -
. 1.89 .. .

EUkigar Kaatb Vteatam . 4*0 50 32 -7.60

RP Milligan 4*0 SS 31 2.10

Moaa.MUa 4.18 49 41 10.43

Oxford • 4.15 787 - 142.50

GuestBamea 4.14 - 4 7 0.37 -

8PC 4.0B 421 59 85.90

DMGiean 4.00 169 ' 49 30.08

PWKfnhmtoflth 3.98 Bf 55 10.44

Stewart Wrightson
' 3.85 - 592

.
119 94 20

HarrtsADtocon 3.82 176 88 29.99

Newgran 3.76 248 - 7.85
GrefgPeatar 3.73 . 187 145 - 31.40

RD Robertson 3.82 &4 29 9.70

MecTatt •
. 3.41 - 847 89 • • 124*8

Michael Payne - 3. 30-- .55 34 • 10.80

Ibwry Law
.

3.21 205 59 39.99

SpranA White 3.10 55 29 8.38

Langton 2.80 - 300 18 54*1
Everson 2*2 7 26 - 1.06

CbandterGraham 2.29 2*0 64 - 28.02
CandleHOaum 2*7 107 36 14.65
Foden-Patttnson ii* 45 17 • 9.28

Edward Lumley A Sane .
1*4 48 12 5.69

Roberts, Bird 1.74 8i 86 21.94

Goods Whiter 1.68 195 27 13.10

Octavtea 1.84 223 3a 50*8
Mile* Smith 1*0 22 30 2.90
Philip N Christie 1.04. 180 44 14.02
HnO Martord Jeffreys Lengdato "0.59 109 76 22.00
MJWDWS 0*9 . . 38 • 12- 3.04

. (0*8) 20 .
-.38-

. 3.54
KCwebb (3*7) 9 12 0.92
Golding, Dnny (5.70) 58 20 8*3
HGPoUumI (8*0) 497 92 82.33
Anthony Coster (18.02) 38 7 2.37

tUlpi

Oldest Reinsurance Companyin the World - Established 1846
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The planned London bourse will shortly have a home, as

THE REOBNT decfetou byifce
-

UK campaates to thrnr f &fi$r-

weight behind plans to form ap
reinsurance bourse inLondcai
has given fresh impetus tcMfie
enterprise, and. had provided,
in the words of one enthusiast,
“irresistiblemomentum".; .-V
Supporters, of the new mar-'

fcet-place believe if can rival -

Lloyd's in size and sophistica-
tion, and hpTp T^gittow wnafaltn'*

Its dominance: at the cadre -of.

the international.'Insurance -

industry.
Market Building Ltd (MBL),

the company fimned tndtevEiop
the' bourse, -is now backedby
14 LmdoQ market companies'..
and a number' of teaming for-
eign .reinsurers, including the
London, subsidiary.'of Bwite-JRe.

Three other British compoe-
ite companies — Sun Alliance.
Guardian Royal Frajwtipw and -

General Accident" - are about
to join the founders’ group,
winch is expectedto sign a. 25-

year lease on a building
,
to be

used for the bourse at 3 -Min-
ster Court, in November.

Plans to develop the build-
ing, on a customised iwcte, mt/> -

a reinsurance exchange hous-
ing over 80 domestic and for-
eign reinsurers, who have
already expressed interest in
the project, win then be imple-
mented, with a view to opening
it for business in* ndd-199L
Competition between .the UK

companies and Lloyd’s' market

.

could intensify, but backers

'

believe the new bourse 2s likely
to strengthen the Londwtmar-
ket as a whole »g»ingf- the -chal-
lenge presented by European.
and OS reinsurers.
“The bourse wUl help us to

overcome the threat of compla-
cency. assuming that the busi-
ness win flow to London no
matter what,” says Victor
Blake, of CNA Reinsurance.
chairman of Market HiiiMmg
Ltd.

Sceptics argue that the drift

towards screen trading, in
which brokers will, offer risks
to underwriters electronically,

win undermine the importance
of physical location in the
insurance industry as a whole.
They also say that the derision
to date by some major players
- including the Munich Re
and Assteutazkmi Generali —
not to join wiQ weaken it far-

ther.

Mr Blake is undeterred by
such considerations. He says
face-to-face negotiations
between upderuirlierfl and bro-
kers will remain a central fea-

Vletor BMtr S tongB*a enpraestoin* ol market Integration

time of trading on the London
market for some timeto came,
amd Oust, the physjtaQinlegra-
tten of the manket .WflT rein-

force moves .towards integra-
tion :.bei3to achieved; through .

the electronic loss advice and
settlement system upended by

, Although rents are expected
to be rfififim- to other wntml
London locations, companies

.

wOl reduce costs by basing
only underwriting arid claims'

facilities in the bourse .bond-
ing; with back-up services -
possibly located outside the
London area - linked by com-
puter; The bufldmg. aay*t Mr
Blake, will be a “tangible
expression” of the market’s
integration.

Indeed, the extent to which
the-bourse’s infrastructure is

tilheedy in place' is one of the
main reasons for confidence,
says Mr Blake; who identifies

the inadequacy of back-up as
one of the main reasons for the
fitihxre of the New York insur-
ance Exchange, one of a nran-
her of recent efforts to develop
an international exchange to
rival LJoyd’s.

“The benefits may not be
there from day one, but over

. time, there is no question that

the development will give
meat .economies of scale,'Mr
Blake suggests.
•

- The snccessfal experience of
the Tmrftfaite of London Under-
writers (TTJT) thp London mar-
ket specialising in

marine insurance who opened
a bufldmg at TiwAwhaii St in
1986, was one of the factors
that led him to bring 10 of Lou-
don’s specialised reinsurers, or
“She slip” companies together
in 1988.
Although the reinsurance

subsidiaries of the composites,
. including m^whiHIp Gen-
eral Re (a subsidiary of the
Prudential). Victory (of Legal
and General) and Royal Re (of

Royal Insurance), have been
part ctf the founder group from
the beginning, the initiative at
first was, in the words of one
dose observer, “developed out-
side the hallowed portals of the
big boys”.

It was only *hi« summer that

three of the biggest compos-
ites; - Commercial Union.
Guardian Royal ’Brohauffp anH
General Accident, applied to
become member/shareholders
of the . Market Building Ltd.
Twigflfl; a steering committee,
formed by representatives from
the composites, had earlier
considered — and dismissed —
the idea of setting up a sepa-
rate bamse.
The iTnifirpoTif. deregulation

nf TgiTimpaan numranw* markatu
and the gradual realisation
amnng Pptich iruairara of the
need to gear for the competi-
tive challenges of the 1990s,

was one of the reasons behind
their inova Traditionally weak
in Europe, the composites have
opted to compete for a share of
the fatomatimifli business that

is already arriving in London.
According to Mr Blake: “People

grows
needed to position themselves
for 1992.”

For the Lloyd’s market, the
prospect of the new bourse is

: an ambivalent one. Over the
past 10 years, Lloyd’s has seen
US and European reinsurers
gradually eat into its market
share of international reinsur-

ance business; and. even with-
out the bourse, Lloyd’s could
expect to face tougher competi-
tion for two reasons.

First, Insurance industry
analysts expect a number of
mergers among European
insurance companies to take

' place id the 1990s; and the new
larger companies are expected
to retain more insurance busi-
ness for their own account,

to a contraction of the
volume of reinsurance busi-

' ness.

'

Second, the deployment of
new technologies by many of
the composites has allowed
some companies -to reduce
their costs, and has corre-
spondingly reduced the advan-
tage of traditionally low oper-
ating costs enjoyed by Lloyd’s
syndicates. The companies
have also become more innova-
tive in the range of products
they sell, again undermining a
commercial advantage enjoyed
by Lloyd’s.
Nevertheless, the bourse

could help Lloyd’s in its fight
against continental and US
reinsurers. “It forces Lloyd’s to
recognise that it has competi-
tion in its own backyard, and
will act as a spur, helping
Iioyd'8 to come to terms with
thenew realities and introduce
reforms and changes in prac-
tice that are needed in any
case ” says Mr Blake.
Moreover, the bourse is

unlikely to change the way
reinsurance business is con-
ducted, with a number of
underwriters participating in
the reinsurance of particular
pieces of business on a “sub-
scription” basis. The present
practice, where, say, 20 compa-
nies and Lloyd's syndicates
combine to write 5 per cent of
a slip, can be expected to con-
tinue, especially as services in
other areas, such as are
becoming more integrated.

The bourse could reinforce
collaboration between the two
sides of the market, especially
for high-value catastrophe
risks, where large amounts of
capacity are needed.

Richard tapper

“REINSURANCE?” says Mr
Hatty Wakefield- “It’s changed
hugely in the last 20 years. It's

much more sophisticated -
but also much less gentle-

manly. The old days of the
*have another drink, old boy.
write me another 5 per cent of

the risk’ way of operating are
dead,”
At 50, Mr Wakefield has been

a reinsurance broker since
1968. and now occupies one of

the foremost positions in the
Lloyd’s broking fraternity, as
chairman of C.T.Bowrlng
(Reinsurance) and Winchester
Bowring. Both are parts of US-
based Marsh & Mclennan, the
world’s largest insurance bro-

ker.

His analysis of the state of
the reinsurance community at

the turn of another decade is a
subtle one. What it presents is

a picture of an Industry in
many respects much healthier
than in the 1970s and early
1980s, but faH'ng the challenge
of embracing information tech-

nology as a way both of catting

costs and creating new busi-
ness opportunities.

An Old Etonian, educated
later at Trinity College, Cam-
bridge, where he read law, Mr
Wakefield is Ugpri to thinking

analytically, and well-placed to
comment as a broker whose
clients among primary insur-

ers include such large US carri-

ers as Fireman's Fund and
Allstate.

Asked what he means when
he says the reinsurance market
is more sophisticated but less
gentlemanly, he points to three
changes.

First, the market is techni-

cally more efficient. “Under-
writers get their premiums
more quickly, and they also
pay claims - particularly
property claims - much more
rapidly than 20 years ago. At
the same time, he see a second
important change, towards the
sharper, tighter wordings of
reinsurance treaties and con-
tracts.

Twenty years ago, he recalls,

if you asked a Lloyd's reinsur-

ance underwriter what he
mAani by the term “catastro-

phe”, the underwriter would
have been shocked by the sug-
gestion that he needed to do
so. “The underwriter just
assumed that when a claim
came in, he’d be around to say
what the words of the policy
meant," recalls Mr Wakefield.

Attitudes like that are now a
thing of the past, he says,
adding: “The big tightening
was in 1985.” During the hard
market, when premium rates

were on a dramatic upswing
for US property/casualty risks

especially, underwriters also
refined thalr definitions of cov-

erage. An example is the much-

Hady Wakefield: T deeply deplore the huge growth of litigation’

Interview: Hady Wakefield

Subtle analysis
of better health

closer definition of “hours
clauses,” which set limits to
the duration of catastrophes -
such as earthquakes - covered
by the reinsurer.
Unfortunately, this closer

scrutiny of terms, conditions
and wordings has had its

downside.
The third change that Mr

Wakefield identifies is the now
widespread tendency for the
parties in a reinsurance argu-
ment to reach rapidly for their
lawyers. “I deeply deplore the
huge growth of litigation and
litigiousness.” he says, estimat-
ing that more than 50 per cent
of his working hours are now
spent coping with litigation-re-

lated matters.

Much of the litigation in the
London market generally
arises from disputes over the
meaning of 20- to 30- and 40-

year-old policies, often involv-

ing US liability insurance
claims. The wrangle over the
extent of the RJLM-Outhwaite
syndicate’s exposure to North
American asbestos and pollu-

tion-related losses is the best-

known example in London —
and fmp in which Winchester
Bowring is heavily involved as
a broker - but it is far from
being the only case.

In theory, this kind of prob-

lem should gradually diminish
in scale, as tighter policy word-
ings and closer legal defini-

tions, both in original insur-

ance policies issued in the US,
and in reinsurance policies

written in London, start to nar-

row the scope for argument.
But, says Mr Wakefield, “that’s

still 10 years away. The market
is going to be squabbling over
US pollution claims for a long
time yet”
The cost of handling and

clearing up the so-called “long-

tail” of claims under old poli-

cies underwritten many years
ago has helped squeeze rein-

surance brokers’ profit mar-
gins, says Mr Wakefield. “It’s

huge expense,” he says, and
especially vexatious at a time
when the difficulty brokers
find in placing some large-pre-

mium business - especially

US casualty - has also been
reducing their revenues.
This point helps explain his

enthusiasm about the pros-
pects for saving money and
improving service in the Lon-
don market by using informa-
tion technology, particularly
networking and electronic
mail. C.T.Bowring is one of the

main driving forces behind

C-DEX, a project Initiated by
D-P-Mann, the Lloyd's under-
writing agent, and intended to

allow electronic placing of
risks by brokers with under-
writers.

A C-DEX pilot scheme is due
to start in early 1990, handling
North American property/casu-

alty treaties, one of Mr Wake-
field's main areas of activity.

“North American reinsurance
is appropriate to start with
because it's big business, it's

straightforward, it’s easy to
understand and it catches peo-

ple’s attention," he says.

The objective, if schemes
like this can be made to work
in London, would be to stream-
line working practices and cut
out much of the paper-shuf-
fling which still bedevils the
market Mr Wakefield is espe-

cially exasperated by the cum-
bersome nature of the present

Lloyd's systems of claims set-

tlement:

“The fart is we just cannot
go on with this ludicrous sys-
tem of claims brokers carrying
round their files to 25 separate
underwriters on a risk, going
through the same story with
each one and inviting each one
to contribute his six
penn’orth."

Perhaps surprisingly, Mr
Wakefield is less agitated
about another major issue for
reinsurance brokers: the trend
for primary property and liabil-
ity insurers, especially in the
US, to buy less reinsurance,
retaining more of their own
risk.

“People are re-examining the
rationale of reinsurance. 1
don’t regret that,” he says.
“I’m not fundamentally dis-
tressed about the move
towards higher retentions: it‘s

rather healthy."

His point is that, as primary
insurers grow larger, so that
even apparently sizeable losses

matter less, it is natural
enough for them to look at sav-
ing bottom-line profits by prun-
ing back purchases of reinsur-

ance. “Take a hypothetical US
insurer, which has to decide
whether to retain the first

850m. or the first 8100m of any
one loss. He could save 87.5m
to $10m in premiums by doing
the second in some circum-
stances."
The thing that is bothering

the world's major reinsurers is

not so much the fact that
retentions are going up. “What
they're concerned about is the
business mix they’re getting,”

be says. “They don’t want to
end up just underwriting catas-

trophe reinsurance, rather
than seeing more
bread-and-butter business."

Nick Bunker
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BROKERS

Success depends on new
products and cost-cutting

WITH THE volume of
reinsurance business contract-
ing. rates low. and expenses
steadily rising, reinsurance
brokers face tougb times
ahead.
“The position." says Allan

Nichols, cf stock analyst James
Capel. "is awful. There has
been a dramatic decline in
profit margins.”
Compared with the heady

days of the late 1970s and early
19S0s, 1937 and 1988 were bleak
years indeed for brokers, with
revenues declining in many
cases and profits shrinking. In
the short term, the stronger
dollar offers some respite for

bigger London-based brokers,
but in the long term success
will depend on' the degree to

which the sector is able to cut
costs, while at the same time
developing new products and
services.

During 1988, the revenues of

the top 20 international bro-
kers grew by only 5.2 pr cent,

according to one recent survey.
Last year, therefore, was the
worst but one - that was 1983
- since the early 1970s. Reve-
nues at Sedgwick. Frank
B.Hali and several major Euro-
pean brokers declined, with the
poor performance of reinsur-
ance broking subsidiaries a
major contributory factor. At
E.W.Payne. the reinsurance
subsidiary of Sedgwick, reve-

nues fell by nearly 20 per cent,

compared with 1987.

Falling rates for reinsurance,
in both the US and Europe, are
clearly one of the main reasons
for the decline. Rates in the
specialist aviation and marine
sectors have been notoriously
soft. And in the offshore sector,
despite last year s Piper Alpha
disaster, rates have only
increased to the extent expec-
ted in the highest excess of
loss covers.

The decline in the crucial
non-marine sector has been
less marked, especially when
compared with very big rate
cuts that have been taking
place in some areas of the
direct insurance market; but
here brokers have been faced
with a fall-off in business as
the volume of reinsurance
transactions has continued to

decline. That fall is due to the
tendency of many direct insur-
ers to retain more risks for
their own account, a tendency,
ironically, increased by the
current differential between
direct and reinsurance rates.

Many brokers are convinced
that the decline in reinsurance
volume will continue. Accord-
ing to Morris Mindel, director
of non-marine broking at Alex-
ander Howden Reinsurance
Brokers, the recent merger
activity among European
insurance companies means
that direct insurers are becom-
ing bigger, have stronger sol-

vency margins and can afford

'
- v"'

-
. s-~

.

Despite Piper Alpha, rates have only increased to the extent expected

to keep risks that they would
formerly have ceded to reinsur-

ers.

"When rates do harden,"
says Mr Mindel, "we are going
to find that a significant per-

centage of worldwide cedants
will be able to afford to retain

a bigger share of their business
for their net account.”

In the short term, brokers
are banking on the continued
strength of the dollar to boost
prospects in 1990. According to

Jim Payne, chairman of
E.W.Payne, between 50 and
60% per cent of his company’s
business is transacted in dol-

lars. But with no with no
strengthening of rates likely in
the coming renewal season, the
highly competitive conditions
that have characterised the
sector in recent years will con-
tinue. underlining the need for

changes in the way bigger rein-

surance brokers have tradition-

ally operated.
Brokers are likely to develop

much closer links to the rein-

surers with whom they place
business. “We have to make
sure we are making the best
use of the reinsurance mar-
ket." says Mr Mindel, referring

to the informal reciprocity
emerging between some bro-
kers ar.d reinsurers. If brokers
place reinsurance with the the
same reinsurer consistently,
that same reinsurer is more
likely to seek the services of
the broker when looking for
his own outward protections.

"Eight years ago - apart
from security considerations -

we wouldn't have thought
twice about where we’d have

placed the business. Commer-
cial pressures mean that you
have to use leverage to
increase the volume of busi-

ness," says Mr Mindel.
More thoroughgoing

changes, involving the cost
structure of reinsurance bro-
kers. are also afoot. The diffi-

culty here, though, is that bro-
kers have been forced to cut
costs precisely when expenses,
particularly those incurred in

dealing with long-tail claims
from the US are rising.

According to Mr Payne, the
cost basis of reinsurance brok-
ing is increasing substantially.
“We're having to manage yes-

terday” In addition, increased
investment in technical and
information systems Is also
reducing the room for manoeu-
vre.

At one level, big brokers
have reacted to these problems
by being much more selective

about the business they write.

“Nowadays there is much more
awareness of the profitability

of accounts among brokers,"
says Mr MindeL “Today's bro-
kerage could be tomorrow’s
cost"
Mr Nichols agrees that bro-

kers are now "much more care-

ful to see whether the business
they handle is profitable". He
adds that some types of rein-

surance business, especially
that involving Third World
countries, to which travel is

expensive and where there
may be currency and payments
problems, “are regarded as not
worth the effort”.

At the same time, a number
of brokers have shed staff and

introduced management and
organisation reforms, in a bid
to increase efficiency. The
changes are in line with a new
emphasis on service to clients,

where brokers are responding
to the decline in traditional
treaty reinsurances with new
products, including tailor-made
programmes for the interna-
tional exposures of direct
insurers and financial reinsur-
ance which offers “balance
sheet protections".

Among other covers that
brokers are actively developing
in London are insurances
against computer crime, prod-
uct contamination, asbestos
abatement and additional
forms of liability. Brokers are

responding to the increasing
development of self-insurance

and captive insurance in the
US and Europe, by offering
captive management and con-
sultancy services. Mr Nichols
comments that “there has been
an attitudinal change among
reinsurance brokers", who are
now not prepared to simply sit

back and wait for an upturn.

As competitive pressures
intensify, analysts expect the
rationalisation, which has
characterised the sector in
recent years, to continue, with
some smaller and medium-
sized brokers disappearing; but
they are convinced that effi-

cient small brokers can survive
In the new environment in
which the market will become
more concentrated by develop-
ing highly specialist services.

Richard Lapper
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Banks now have to take LC liabilities on to their balance sheets

BANKERS are increasingly
supporting the demands of the
reinsurance industry with
their ability to provide a high
standard multi-currency inter-

national service. But changes
in the financial insurance and
reinsurance markets are chal-
lenging the Tole played by the
banks, requiring some fleet
footwork from the leading
players.
In particular, while there

have been, no dramatic devel-

opments in terms of enhance-
ments to the banking products
that serve the reinsurance
industry, the last year has seen
the full realisation of impor-
tant changes for the banks
themselves.

Specifically, the Bank of
International Settlements’
(.BIS) requirements on capital

adequacy for banks have, laid

the ground for a potential shift

of power within the business.

The need for banking prod-

ucts to serve the reinsurance
market arose from the require-

ment to guarantee insurer's
collateral, particular where
relationships across interna-
tional borders were involved.

The business has long been
dominated by the leading US
banks which, with Citibank to

the fore, developed the main
products, the Letter of Credit

(LC) and the more recent Regu-
lation 114 Trust. The heavy US
bias of the business is no coin-

cidence, arising directly from
the dominance of the US in-

terms of the world’s premium
income.
Now, however, while bank-

ers are looking to find more
and more imaginative uses for

these and other products, for

the first time they will have to
take their LC liabilities on to

their balance sheets.

This has already had a sig-

nificant effect in curbing
long-standing downward pres-

sure on pricing of large ticket

LCs - although players point

out that competition will
ensure that much pricing
remains extremely fine. “A lot

will depend on how banks
decide they want to manage
their balance sheets,” confirms
Judith Mortimer Sykes, of
Rank of America.
The implications of the bal-

ance sheet requirement is

arguably greater for the largest

writers of LCs, like Citibank

which will have to address the
question of whether they want
to, and then how they will, pre-

serve a formidable market
share in the traditional rein-

surance business.
There have already been

examples where major recipi-

ents of LCs have been offered

dramatically increased prices

by their providers. One bank
tells a story of being
approached by a client asking
it to better a price from a com-
petitor, and finding itself

unable to do so. Prices have
risen by anything from 10 to 30

Judith Mortimer Sykes: growth potential In one-off business

Large writers

must rethink

market share
basis points depending on the

size of the business involved.

At the same time, overall

volumes have been steady,

lacking any significant growth.
“Things aren't booming for the
traditional LC industry," says

Ms Mortimer Sykes, “but there

is real growth potential in one-

off larger business.”
One-off business can cause

headaches for the banks, par-

ticularly in the financial rein-

surance area. A bank might be
asked to price, say, a seven-
year transaction in which the
client cannot allow for any
.unforeseen costs during the
life of the arrangement.

It is understandably hard for

banks to undertake such risk

without sometimes then won-
dering whether the client has

been given a bargain. However,
David Gamer, of Citibank,
comments: "We’re used to eval-

uating risk and pricing it It’s

no different in .specialist areas,

except that we can be talking

about seven-figure premiums."

Financial reinsurance . has
been something of bandwagon
over the last year, with some
notable new entrants, espe-
cially -in Bermuda where Cen-
tre-RE was only the biggest
and higbest-profile new player,

stunning the market with its

announcement of a $200m capi- .

tal base.

-Mr Gamer thinks finan^L
reinsurance is set to be a huge

"

growth area. “The traditional

business is now well estab-
lished. and you can only really

there compete on price and ser-

vice quality," he says. “By con-
trast. the building of aproduct
structure in the financial rein-

surance area offers us the
opportunity for incremental
profits as we find new -banking
relationships or ways ofenhan-
cing relationships.”

One example of the use of
LCs for novel financial insur-

ance can be found on the Euro-
bond market, where' the
growth of mortgage- and credit

card-backed securities ' has
opened a market for credit
enhancement . using LCs

‘

‘to

guarantee the credit of part of

an issue. .

Thus, a bank, usually a third

party to an actual issue of
securities, offers credit guaran-
tees to all or part q£ a dear
using LCs, taking a fee

. and
allowing the issuer to claim a
top credit, rating which should
attract investors to the paper.

To some extent, such devel-

opments have overshadowed
the debate which dominated
the market last year;, that
between advocates of LCs ahd
those of the newer Regulation
114 Trusts. .

Then, players like Manufac-
turers Hanover were arguing
that Trusts represented, the
way forward for the reinsur-

ance market, offering a
cheaper and more flexible
alternative to LCs. In Autumn
last year. Manufacturers Han-
over launched a new Trust'
product using an SEC-reg&-
tered mutual fund. . as the
framework of a flexible, cheap
credit reference.
The aim was to compete'

directly with the much larger

and more established LC mar-
ket which was still dominated
by Citicorp and a handful of

other . banks,' including Bar-
days and Midland.
Trusts have failed to make

the dramatic in-roads their
advocates were predicting,
mainly because the State of
California has still not granted
regulatory approval for . the
Trust vehicle, thereby restrict-

ing its role to special deals.
. .

Looking bade, Ms Mortimer-
Sykes thinks Trusts Were an
area where banks were

.

My ahead of their client

and that the real market for

Trusts lies in the future.

Also in the future lies elec-

tronic networking of the man-
agement of risk and financial

reinsurance. Citibank sees a.

significant opportunity in
Europe to develop a network,
and in October is beginning a
business, initiative to explore
ways to open up the market.
La the mean time, the growth

of UMNET and RINET offers

opportunities for banks to
expand the range of electronic

banking services they offer to

clients, at the same time
diminishing the role played by
Intermediaries a brokers.

• Andrew. Freeman
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CATASTROPHES

the weather
“A FEW years ago, the British

insurers bought catastrophe'
reinsurance mainly lor GarEb- .

bean and Australian : risks.
How they are buying :catastro-

'

pfae cover predominantly 16
protect their UK exposures.” ,

says Graham Dimmock, man*
ager of the non-marine depart-
ment of Swiss Rer

s London
office.

He was commentim oil .the r

gro.wing number ox
r
heavy

Claims that an* fritting Tngnrmrs
.

and reinsurers: of UK weather
exposures*

7
. ..

Storms, floods, and freezes in
north-west Europe are .generat-
ing an increasing nwttbciror
catastrophe fosuranceclalms,
and should, on .the. basis , of
technical factors, lead the
insurance industry to reevalu-
ate the way it covers the risk.

A significant hardening ef the
.

market would result .

Instead, the 'dominant
response to date among rein-
surers has been to cut rates;

and, with competition for mar-
ket share fierce, in the

.
runup

to 1992, many pundits behave
that the market will remain
soft for some time to come:
Even before the storm of

October 1987 - known on the

'

London market by its Lloyd’s

'

catastrophe number 87J 4 dev-
astated the south-east of the
UK, north-west France and
parts, of Norway, evidence
indicating that weather pat-
terns in north-west Europe
were changing fimdnwnwifaiiiy

was growing, with claims aris-
ing from a combination of win-
ter freezes, on the one hand,
and winds and floods m the
other, hitting insurers. .

Between 1964 and 1979, Brit-

ish insurers met claims for
rally one catastrophic weather
loss* By comparison;1 there
were a further eight such
losses in the next eight years,

with the losses having an
increasing impact car Interna-
tional reinsurance markets.
This experience, . combined
with a serious increase, in the

number of freeze losses in

France, and heavy claims from
the Netherlands, Norway and

Ireland, is fcaAfrywumy
era to reassess their . under-
standing ofEuropean weather
patterns.

:.?Tba
‘

Andrew DlngolecM, of

Accident, that thwe has
been greater evidence of
extreme weather events.

11

In the UK, . a consensus
appears to be. emerging that

the relatively mild westerly
weather enjoyed fra the greater

part of this century, until the
tate UWOsJfe chan^teg. TherehL
an increasing frequency of
kesesduein prolonged anticy-

ClflBey jtf Wgh«p
.

Theser'pertods
;

oif
:

sustained-'
high pressure function, as
“Weather mountains.’’, divert-

ing mflder westerly airflows
around the* cotmtty..

.
-r

' fii winter, the htocMng high

.

is associated with- ^freezes;

which' cause losses due to
burst pipe^'ihainly in' domestic
property, nt summer, ,the high
pressure results hrtong periods
ofhot weather. but fliis too can
result -in insurance claims,
through property damage from
subsidence. '.v.

- The average number of days
per year of low pressure or
cyclonic weather systems, in
which storms are more likely

to occur,' has also increased in

the -last 40 years. According to
Graham Farmer, of the Cli-

matic Research Unit, at the
University - of East Anglia," hi
Norwich, between' 1950 and

. 1980: the amraat number of
westerly days declined by
about 30 per year; while the
annual number of cyclonic
days increased by. around 10.

AH there'trends are leading
some .Insurers to reassess the

the -statistics on which the
rates tor weather insurance are
based. For example, an the
basis: of' Admiralty' calcula-

tions, surges,in the level ofthe
North Sea. on the -scale that in

1953 inundated over 500 square
miles of the east coast, are
expected : to occur once every
200 year?- But, according to Mr
Dimmock, since this return
period was calculated In the
early .1960s Ihe one-in-200-year

The other crash of ’87: past climate la no guide to the future
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surge level has already been
observed 11 times - a statistic

which must make a repeat erf

. 1953 (which, caused damage of

£5Gro at 1951 values) more
likely. With insurance for flood

damage now much more com-
mon among British household-

- ere :Hten in the early 1950s,
potential exposures could be
several billion pounds.

- Losses for insurers and rein-
surers are also potentially
greater, because there is now
an increased prospect of -two
catastrophes in one underwrit-
ing year. If the probability of a
damaging European storm
rises to one in five years, then
every 25 years we would have

.-the ..prospect . of two such
events In one year. With most
reinsurance catastrophe covers
written with only one auto-
matic reinstatement, this is

bound to cause problems for

direct insurers. “A worldwide
cover blown today by a Euro-
pean storm might be hit again
tomorrow by a tropical storm,
leaving insufficient time to
organise adequate reinstate-

ment cover,” says Mr Dim-
mock.

There is already consider-

able evidence that this

increase in exposure is leading

to a higher incidence of claims

and losses. Mr Dimmock says

that European weather rein-

surance is becoming increas-

ingly unprofitable for reinsur-

ers. According to figures
produced by Jeremy Hindle, of
Swiss Re (UK), reinsurance
results have deteriorated.
Between 1979 and 1988 the loss

ratio (the proportion of losses

paid or payable to premiums
earned) for first-layer UK
catastrophe covers was over

210 per cent

Theoretically, Insurers
hnanM hp aMa tn amfimpicdatH

these changes by increasing

the costs of the policies they

seQ. According to Dr Dhigo-
lecki, this has already hap-
pened in some direct insur-
ances, with the rate of
buildings* insurance for home-
owners gradually increasing
over the past 10 years from £1

per £1,000 to around £2 per

£1,000. However, with the
exception of the excess of loss

and retrocession markets,
where reinsurers reinsure
other reinsurers, rates for rein-

surance have not increased in

line with the new exposures.

Although reinsurance rates

initially increased sharply fol-

lowing 87J, there has been “a
considerable softening at the
edges” mare recently, accord-

ing to one underwriter. Sun
Alliance, who in 1985 opted not

to reinsure their UK weather
exposures, have recently reen-
tered the reinsurance market,
in part because reinsurance
rates have become cheaper.

A number of reinsurers are
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now arguing publicly for a
change in strategy. A Munich
Re spokesman claimed recently

that the Increase in hazard
potential must have an effect

on the evaluation of risks and
rates. Others argue that under-

writers should buck market
trends and refuse to write
European catastrophe covers
unless rates are adjusted
sharply upward — even if it

means losing market share.

- Mr Dimmock believes rein-

surers must re-examine the
risk. “In line with the changed
character of the risk, under-
writers must fundamentally
re-evaluate the way they write

European weather exposures."

An essential component of

such a shift is that insurers

must begin to retain more
European weather risk expo-
sure for their own account”

However, recent rating prac-

tices on International markets
indicate that none of this

advice is being heeded. Fierce

competition attiring reinsurers

in the run-up to 1992 is leading

to rate-cutting. The problem,
according to one prominent
London underwriter, is "over-

capacity”. “It is not that people

aren’t aware of the problem,"

he says, “but there is nothing
you can do about it"

Richard Lapper

Eric Short discusses a new opportunity for life reassurers

Cover for dread diseases
OVER THE past few years a
radical development has taken
place in the UK life assurance
market - the introduction of

the Dread Disease or Critical

Illness contract. And the life

reassurance companies, partic-

ularly Mercantile and General
Reinsurance and Victory Insur-

ance, have been to the fore-

front
The method by which these

contracts have been devised
mirrors the whole range of ser-

vices provided by a modern life

reassurance company to its

direct life company clients.

The protection element
incorporated in life company
contracts Is either the payment
of a lump sum on the death of

the life assured before the con-

tract terminates, or payment of
an income if the life assured
becomes permanently disabled.

The primary function of a reas-

surance company is to provide
cover on these two protection
elements for their clients.

Under a Dread Disease of
Critical Illness contract, some
or all of the death benefit is

paid in advance at the onset of

a serious illness, such as can-
cer or heart disease, or on per-

manent total disability, though
not AIDS.
Reinsurance companies, by

flie nature of their operations,
are more international than
direct life companies, though
this is changing. Mercantile &
General became familiar with
this contract and the protec-

tion it offered through its

South African operations.
Life reassurance business is

highly competitive in the UK.
The reassurers are under con-
stant commercial pressure to
seek new areas of business.
Dread-disease cover provides
them with a significant oppor-
tunity to open up a new area of

protection where their services

would be in demand. Hence
Mercantile & General and Vic-

tory have both been marketing

the concept to direct life com-
panies with varying degrees of

success, offering advice, help

and guidance on all aspects of

these new contracts.

First, since this is a brand

new area for UK life assurance,

the precise nature of the cover

has to be spelt out in the con-

tracts to avoid any problems in

payment of claims.

There were problems ini-

tially in South Africa over the
wording of these contracts and

The proposal-form

questions are quite

detailed, with greater

emphasis on financial

underwriting

the cover provided. Mercantile

and General’s experience in

South Africa has enabled it to

advise clients on the wording
of contracts. Although these
contracts have only been in

existence in the UK for a short

time, to date there have been
no outstanding problems over

disputed claims.

Second, while there is ample
data on mortality rates in the

UK, there is less on morbidity
rates for these serious ill-

nesses.
Actuaries seeking statistics

on which to base the premium
rates for this level of protec-

tion are retracing the footsteps

of their actuarial forefathers

over 200 years ago in determin-

ing mortality rates,

David Grimshaw, one of the

actuaries at Mercantile and
General responsible for the
development of these new con-

tracts, found it an exhilarating

experience, seeking out data
and producing the necessary
rates on which to base the pre-

miums.

The international nature of

reassurance companies pro-

vides them with a wider know-
ledge of such information

sources than is normally avail-

able in a direct-writing UK life

company. And reassurance
companies dpaiing with many
life company clients tend to

have a wider data base of expe-

rience.

Even so. the rates used for

dread-disease contracts are as

speculative as those for life

contracts 200 ago, with sub-

stantia! built-in margins and
the right to change rates in the

light of claims experience from
these contracts.

This development requires
wider underwriting technlques-

than with pure life cover, with
much more attention being
paid to femily history.

Although underwriting of

life contracts remains the
responsibility of the direct life

company, with the reassurers

following the basis of the
direct company under the
Treaty arrangements, the reas-

surers have held lengthy dis-

cussions with the direct com-
pany underwriters as to the
questions to ask on the pro-

posal form and the medical evi-

dence that should be obtained.

Indeed, the proposal form
questions are quite detailed, in

contrast to the one or two
questions asked for just life

companies. There is greater
emphasis on financial under-

writing - the relationship of

the life assured's salary to the

level of cover being sought For
example, it Is unlikely that a
proposal for £250,000 of cover
would be accepted from a per-

son with earnings of £20,000 a
year. The rule of thumb for

financial underwriting is cover

of four times earnings.

To date, there has been no
outcry from the medical profes-

sion or pressure groups over

this move, in contrast to the

problems over seeking infor-

mation on AIDS.
Finally, the reassurance

companies have to rely on the

marketing success of the direct

life companies for their own
business.

So it is in the interests of

reassurers to provide every
possible help and advice in

marketing to their direct life

company clients. This may
appear unusual. Reassurance

companies do not deal with the

public directly, and any mar-

keting experience comes sec-

ond-hand. Nevertheless, since

they deal with a variety of life

companies, the reassurers see

the results of a wide range of

marketing activities and are

able to provide valuable advice

Reassurance companies were
very much to the forefront in

guiding direct life companies
in dealing with the problem of

AIDS. Again drawing on inter-

national experience, particu-

larly in the US, it was possible

to control what could have
turned into a potentially dan-

gerous situation.

Matters relating to AIDS
have been relatively quite over

the past 12 months, in contrast

to the hectic activity and con-

siderable controversy of the
previous years. However, the

House of Commons select com-
mittee on social services, in a
recent report, urged the Gov-
ernment to seek co-operation

from life companies in not ask-

ing on proposal forms whether
a person seeking life assurance
had had an HIV blood test.

At present the committee is

seeking voluntary action by
the life companies, but the
request has been turned down
by the Association of British

Insurers. If any action is taken,

it will mean compulsion by the

Government, and a complete
reappraisal of life assurance
underwriting by reassurers
and life companies.
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At Barclays Insurance Banking Business Centre

there are committed people with a wide knowledge of all

areas of the banking world, but a specific interest in one.

We concentrate on offering a broad range of bank-

ing services specially designed for the insurance industry’.

And the understanding to back them up.

Our executives have worked extensively in the

insurance industry and have a full appreciation of the

market’s needs. (They work closely with you to gain a full

appreciation ofyour business needs.)

Whether you’re an insurance or reinsurance

company, an underwriting agency or broker, we have the

services and expertise to handle all your business under

one roof.

And we’re literally closer to the insurance market

than any other bank. Barclays Insurance Banking Business

Centre is situated at the very heart of it, right opposite the

Lloyd’s building, and within easy walking distance of all

the major players.

For a closer look at what

we do, contact Terry Hebden,

Business Centre Manager on

01-623 7788.

*

¥

9

a

INSURANGJv
It A *Y K l N (j

eg?

*

BARCLAYS INSURANCE BANKING BUSINESS
CENTRE, 122 LEADENHALL STREET LONDON
EC3V4QD.

BARCLAYS
MEMBEROFIMRQ



FINANCIAL TIMES MONDAY SEPTEMBER 4. 1989

( REINSURANCE 8 )

Rachei Davies considers the implications for the industry of two recent iegal cases

Lloyd’s re-examines form J1 after criticism by the Lords
TWO CASES of significance
have emerged this year. Vasia

Butcher in the House of
lords, and Meadows Indemnity
v Insurance Corporation of
Ireland in the Court of AppeaL

Vesta emphasises the marital
nature of the insurance and
reinsurance relationship,
whereas Meadows retains a
sharp distinction between the
two policies.

Vesta involved what the
House of Lords described as
back-to-back reinsurance, in
respect of loss caused to a fish

farmer by storm damage. The
insurance and reinsurance pol-

icies each incorporated a war-
ranty’ that a 24-hour watch
would be kept over the farm.
Each policy provided that
breach of warranty would ren-

der the contract null and void.

The farmer's failure to keep
a watch was irrelevant to the

storm damage, so that by Nor-
wegian law, the law of the orig-

inal insurance, breach of war-
ranty could not make the
contract null and void. By the
English law of the reinsurance,
however, breach of warranty,
whether relevant to the loss or
not, rendered the reinsurance
null and void.

The reinsurers might have
argued the English law into
predominance on a conflicts of

laws basis, had they not
included the Lloyd’s Jl form
“follow the settlements clause”
in the policy. By that clause,

they bad agreed to reinsure
against loss on the same terms
and conditions as the original

policy.

As well as claiming the pro-

tection of English law. they
said the follow-settlements
clause had been emasculated
by a claims control clause, by
which no payment should be
made under the original insur-

ance without their consent
The House of Lords said the

claims control clause did not
emasculate the follow-settle-

ments clause. All It did was to
show that the underwriters
were entitled to negotiate a set-

tlement of any Norwegian pro-

ceedings brought by the fish

farmer against Vesta, the origi-

nal insurer.
As the two policies were

back to back, said the House of

Lords, identical warranties
must have the same effect in
each policy.

Thus the Norwegian law of
the original insurance effec-

tively overpowered the agreed
English law of the reinsurance.

The situation highlights the
conflict between the easier
marketability of local law
insurance to a foreign insured
who naturally prefers a policy-

governed by a law that he
understands, and the English
reinsurer's natural preference
for a law he understands and
has used world-wide on innu-

merable transactions.

The mirror-image nature of

the back-to-back policies
means that, despite express
provision for English law as
the governing law of the rein-

surance in accordance with the
intention of the parties, the
governing law is effectively
Norwegian law.

The House of Lords did not
look at it as a conflict of laws
issue. It looked at the basic
contract, and asked what did
the English underwriter agree
to insure. He agreed to insure
the risks in Norway, and that
took him back to the original
risk in the chain.
According to Katharine

Lacey, of Clyde & Co, solicitors

for the reinsurers in Vesta, the
decision could have a serious
knock-on effect in the reinsur-

ance chain. Underwriters no
longer have the protection of
English law, but must dig out
the pitfalls of the law of the
original Insurance before con-
tracting.

For example, she says, in
Norwegian law the contract
would not be avoided for non-
disclosure unless the non-dis-
closure is material and caus-
ative of risk, whereas in the
UK non-disclosure, however
immaterial, will avoid the con-
tract.

The laws of some foreign
countries are considerably
more obscure and inaccessible
than those of Norway. A rein-

surer in a long chain could
well have problems digging out
the locality of the original con-
tract he is indirectly covering,
let alone its governing law.

It could be worse, however.
With a bit of thought and
proper negotiation, the prob-
lem is not insurmountable.
Lord Templeman. in his judg-
ment in Vesta, indicates that
the reinsurance policy can pro-
vide expressly that the warran-
ties are to have different
effects in the two policies.

He said the reinsurers’ liabil-

ity in Vesta could have been
limited by express provision
that a breach of warranty by
the insurer would absolve the
reinsurers, even if an identical

breach by the fish farmer did
not absolve the insurer.
Even so. the reinsurers are

still going to have to know
their foreign law to make sure
they pnt in the necessary
express terms, unless they can
think of some standard clause
which will effectively eliminate
danger in all cases.

The scapegoat in the litiga-

tion was the Lloyd's Jl form,
which came in for some criti-

cism by the House of Lords. It

was described as “inelegant,
ungrammatical, obscure”. Lord
Bridge said the only people
who could expect to profit from
its obscurities were the law-
yers.

This is being remedied. Their
Lordships' comments have
been taken to heart, and

The Norwegian law of

the original insurance
overpowered the

agreed English law of

the reinsurance

Lloyd's is looking at form Jl
with a view to its alteration.

In September it goes before a
Lloyd's Underwriting Non-Ma-
rine Association (LUNMA)
sub-committee of experts,
advised by Lloyd’s solicitors,

who will come back with a
recommendation for the full

committee. The Lloyd's com-
mittee system is reputed to
operate efficiently, so no great
delay is anticipated.

In contrast to this unwilling
(on the reinsurer's part) mar-
riage of original and reinsur-

ance, rendering them one in
the eyes of the law, in Mead-
ows we find reinsurers who
would have liked some such
relationship but were denied it

by the court
Meadows had reinsured

insurance of a loan agreement
.on which the borrower
defaulted. The insurer did not
pay up. It was alleged that in
the negotiations, representa-
tions had been made which
affected the validity of the
insurance and the reinsurance
contract. The insured lender
began proceedings in Ireland.
Meadows claimed a declara-

tion against the lender, to the
effect that the insurer could
avoid the Insurance. It claimed
to have sufficient “interest” in
the subject matter of the decla-
ration to give it locus standi to

participate in the battle
between lender and insurer.

Mr Justice Hirst took the
same view. He said Meadows
had "a real interest" and was
not a “stranger to the dispute”.
The Court of Appeal dis-

agreed. They said it was true
that Meadows had a direct
interest in the validity of the
original insurance in the sense
that avoidance would eliminate
its own liability. But, it said,
there was no contested issue
between Meadows and the
insured, and a court's declara-
tory power was limited to
declaring the contested exist-

ing or future rights of parties
to an issue, not those of non-
parties.
Thus, an attempt to take on

litigation rights attaching to
the insured only, failed.
Despite the “interest”, the
insurance and reinsurance pol-

icies were distinctly separate
contracts.
Meadows is not appealing

because, according to its solici-

tors, Ince & Co, it has got what
it wanted despite being struck
out. Its aim was to get the
lender bank. Commercial Bank
pic. involved in the London
action. A stay of third party
proceedings by the insurer.
Insurance Corporation of
Ireland, against the hank was
refused, so that Meadows had a
tactical success.

What has lain dormant ever
since it disappeared from the
House of Lords list last year, is

the prospect of a satisfactory
conclusion to the Phoenix
issue.

In Phoenix the Court of
Appeal decided that contracts
made in the course of unau-
thorised insurance business
were void and illegaL The
result, generally considered
disastrous in the Lloyd's mar-
ket, is that the innocent
insured cannot recover in
respect of loss under such a
contract, and a reinsurer is not
obliged to indemnify an unwit-
tingly unauthorised insurer.

The House of Lords appeal
was listed for February last

year and salvation was antici-

pated, or at least hoped for, but
it disappeared and Phoenix
passed quietly away through
settlement.
However desirable it may

have been for the parties to
have settled, it is disappointing
to find that the question of
unauthorised Insurers still

needs to be sorted out.

Not only that, the settlement

eliminated the first ever non-

g
overrunental amicus curiae
rief, before it had a chance to

be beard.
An amicus curiae is a “friend

of the 00011" who does not take
sides, but whose task is purely
to assist the court by clarifying
the likely impact of legal issues
in a particular context

In Phoenix the brief, filed by
Ince & Co on behalf of the UK
Insurance market, was
regarded with some excitement
as a development in English
law in line with US appellate
courts and the European Court
of Justice. Until now all amicus
briefs in the UK have been
filed on behalf of governments,
so this was an innovation, and
was felt to be particularly
needed in the specialised and
custom-ridden context of the
commercial world.
Some of the impact of Phoe-

nix has disappeared with the
coming into force of the Finan-
cial Services Act 1986. By sec-

tion 132, unauthorised insur-
ance is still unenforceable, but
the insured can recover money
paid, as well as compensation
for any loss sustained.
Under section 132(3) how-

ever, the court has a discretion
to allow an unauthorised con-
tract to be enforced if satisfied
that the unauthorised insurer
reasonably believed he was
authorised, and that it is just
and equitable that the contract
should be enforced.
This covers contracts marie

after November 1986 when the
Act came into force, but does
not help previous contracts,
which are still subject to the
Phoenix position as stated in
the Court of AppeaL In other
words, insurance contracts
entered into by unauthorised
insurers before November 1986
are still illegal and void, so
that the insurer need not pay
the claims of the innocent
insured, and reinsurers need
not indemnify insurers

The recent case of Re Cava-
lier exemphfied the situation at -

first instance. Paying the
“highest respect” to obiter dicta
in Phoenix, the Chancery court
held that statutory “prohibi-
tion” on unauthorised perfor-

mance of a particular class of
insurance, renders the contract
void and illegaL

Vesta v Butcher - FT Febru-
ary 3 1989: Meadows Indemnity
- FT June 14 1989; Phoenix - -

[1986] 2 FTLR 665; re Cavalier -

FT June 21 1989
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INSIDE

Depressing news for
the financial world
Few people mthelnternatfonal ffnanro hunt- ’

ness can have been .cheered by last Week's
news of the proposed merger between Mitsui

'

Bank and Taiyo Kobe Bank of Japan. The alli-
ance will prdduce the second largest bark fa
the world - which Is bad enough Jn a busi-
ness already dominated by Japanese institu-

-

tions. Even more depressing, wrttes David
Lascelles In the Business Column, -is the fact
that the plan gives the He to the:ides — gain-
ing ground in western bankers', minds recently~ that Japanese bankers had ceased to be'
preoccupied with sheer size. Page 38

Mow angry words:
'

Thewar ofwords
accompanying the
£13.5bn bkl for BAT
Industries continued,

'

over fheweekehd as the
HoyTaRe

_
ct5n§ortfurh rr ‘

Headed by SirJames
Goldsmith (left) attacked
Its target's performance
Wnd accused the board ,

of attempting to frustrate
the bid. BAT responded
to the lengthy, letter sent

to shareholders In response to fts' defence doc-
ument by describing Hoytake’s remarks as
“highly selective and misleading".-Page 25

Murky waters expected
Bankers are predicting. marketconfuston.When
pricing of the standby credits for the British
water authorities that became public limited

.

companies last week becomes known. ITie rea-
son? Thoseauthorities perceived by banks .to

-

'

be the best credits are. not necessarily those
receiving the finest terms. Stephen Rdler and
Andrew Freeman report Page 22 . .

Conundnmv In liow York
A flash In the pan or a.market-Tally? Last Fri- .. ...

day's queer performance'by the UScredit mar-
kets has posed a oomihdrum. TKa New York
markets -aredlosed today.tor fhb Labor Day
holiday so the worfd will have to wait at feast; ;

.

until tomorrow, and possiblylonger, for an
answer. But. writes Jareea Buchan, it will be

'

worfh waltiiig for. Page 28 - .-.-V

"7"

Bu$ IdkS&wrata
.

St-' Money maritets
'*

EuromataBt tumowr. . -.22 r Nor tat bond tones •22
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.
2549
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on, have some nice foot-

hills here,” said a Swiss
central banker the kind-

est thingis to put it down to the
.altitude.

- The Grand Tetons are every-

one’s idea 'of a mountain range,
but because they rise .6,000 ft
front a- marshy plain that is
already 7,000 ft up, they look a

grand then they really

are. They breed a alight hght-hsa-
dedness, and some pretty had
Jokes. If yon-haven’t heard the
one about the squaw on the hip-
popotamus, don't let It worry
you. <It has something to do with
Pythagoras, and wild hisons will

not make me divulge anymore.)
-Every year the Federal Reserve

Bank erf Kansas City, which cov-
ers a vast area from the Mteris-
-slppi to the Rockies, invites bank-
era and academics to a
symposium In this wonderful
iesort, and every year a still

more prestigious crowd accepts
the invitation. The Swiss was
.perhaps, jealously aware that
Jackson Hole is now a serious
rival to Davos among the finan-
cial elite, ft is a place where you
can go up a trail looking tor
bearvimd find Mr Alan Green-
span..

This does riot inspire quite the
‘ same awe. When you take a cen-
tral banker - even a chairman
- to these altitudes, and dress
him in jeans- sneakers, he
becomes relaxed and unusually

. candid..The discussion this year.
On the fthaTlangpg for mnmiltiiy
policy in the 1990s, was a great
deal- less dry than you might

The politics

By Anthony Harris
in Jackson Hole, Wyoming
expect
The central problems, as the

nractitioners described them, are
now seen as political rather than
technical. This is because there is

no longer any accepted rule an
which policy can be based; yet
markets like to believe that
actions are guided by deep princi-

ples, and politicians have to be
serenaded that Hpwatinn is tech-

nically necessary, even If it is

unpopular.
There appear to be no believing

monetarists left, if there ever
were any. There are very few
practicing nnpfl^ either — though
Mr Leonhard Gleske, a veteran
director of the Bundesbank, said
that German experience showed
that the-markets are much com-
forted by monetary targets. The
trick is to give dear and honest
Mrpianfltinns of why you cannot

actually stick to them at any
given moment
Mr GleBke argued that it Is

international money flows which
maica the money numbers mis-
leading.
He went on to suggest that in

large, and therefore relatively
closed, economic units the quan-
tity theory might prove to work
after all, so that If 1992 leads in
the end to a European monetary
union, it may be a monetarist
one.
This is a long way off, though.

As our own governor Mpiairuni, a
monetary union is the coping
stone rather than the foundation
of an economic union. (There is
unfortunately no space here to
re-report his equally thoughtful
analysis, which appeared last Fri-
day.) Mr Greenspan might have
wished to put another reserva-

tion: the US is a large and rela-

tively closed economy, with less

than 10 per cent ofGNP exported,

but the quantity rules have bro-

ken down here, too.

Meanwhile, what does a central
hank tell its two constituencies
— thp finAnpjifil markets and the
politicians? One politician has no
doubt: Congressman Stephen
Neal, chairman of the House
committee on monetary affaire,

came to the mountains to lobby
for a bill he has drafted which
would enact a duty to give prior-

ity to securing stable prices.

He will hove encountered no
opposition here: one central
banker after another adopted thia

slogan - and the conference
host, Mr Roger Guffey, required a
toast to price stability if you
joined him for a drink.

This ideological purity was

contained in a more technical slo-

gan adopted by several speakers:

policy targets should be nominal,
never real quantities. It sounds
clear, but it is not what they
actually do: and one market ana-
lyst at the meeting, Mr Leonard
Santow, is preparing a study
which shows that the Fed makes
fewer mistakes when it is “fine

tuning” than when it is following

a technically pure rule.

Mr Gulfoy, who Is uneasy with
fine tuning, is one of the regional

Fed presidents who are playing
such a large role in US monetary
policy at the moment They were
flexing their policy muscles in lit-

tle groups all over the confer-
ence. These were the men Mr
Richard Darman, the Budget
Director, had in mind In his
recent criticism of Fed over-cau-
tion; but they do not have to
appear before Congress.

It does not seem likely that Mr
Neal's colleagues would be
entirely happy if Mr Greenspan
went to the Hill and explained
that since his duty was to stabi-

lise prices, he could take no
responsibility for any recession
which might result Indeed, a
rival bill would guard against
this by making the Fed more
political. It would add the Trea-
sury Secretary to the policy-mak-
ing open market committee and
insist that policy decisions
should be published at once,
instead of six weeks late, as at
present
Central bankers nearly all

believe that they need to pre-
serve some mystery to help them

in dealing with their market con-
stituency; the strategy sh ould be
clear, but not the tactics. There
may also be a clash between
domestic targets and a second
objective much discussed here:
stabilising exchange rates. The
objectives have been stated
repeatedly since the Plaza meet-
ing; but tile most effective tactics

are surprise raids which cause
dealers to lose money. Then they
support the strategy.

Again, though, things are not

as clear as they seem. ‘‘Appropri-

ate'’ exchange rates, like price
stability "in the long run", can
mean different things to different

central bankers. And the objec-

tives are not set just by economic
analysis, but by political needs.

For the US, as some speakers
conceded, it means a dollar rate

low enough to keep protection-

ism at bay - but certainly not
low enough to satisfy academics
like Dr Rudiger Dombusch. For
Panada and Australia, as their

officials explained, it means a
rate which offsets swings in com-
modity prices, and spares them
the fete of Texas. British argu-
ments about the petro-pound are
similar. It is all a matter of bal-

ance.
It was an enlightening parade

of dilemmas. Can all these objec-

tives be reconciled? Can central
bankers always say what they
really mean? Do they always
know what they mean? And, as
long as most of them produce
results as good as most have
recently, does it matter? My ques-
tions, your answers.

A hard lesson in the art of the deal
James Buchan on what looks like another success for Donald Trump

F or nearly two years, Don-
ald Trump has been all

over New York, not rally

in person but rai the cover of a
best-selling book.

His. tyro glare and crimson tie

leap-out at you from the satchels
of trainee real-estate brokers or
from under cash registers at Kor-
ean: wine merchants. The hook is

.called: The Art of the DeaL
.
Mr Trump, who is 43, mayjust

have delivered bis most advanced
lesson In the deal-making art.
Ufa unfortunate pupils are Mr

Merv Griffin, a some-time singer,

talk-show host and television pro-
ducer who boughl a couple of
casinos off Mr Tramp last
November, and the junk bond
investors who put up $325m to
^finance the deal
On August 28, Mr Griffin, who

Is 64, announced to nobody’s sur-
prise that he would stop paying
interest on the bonds. He did not
actually default, because coupon,
payments are not finally due
until October. But the credits
have collapsed.

Last November’s bond issues,

though they are mortgages on Mr
Griffin’s profitable casinos in
Atlantic City, New Jersey and
the Bahamas, were quoted by one
Wall Street firm at the end of last
week at 62 cents on the dollar.

The casinos’ J590m-odd in unse-

cured debt was bid at prices of
between 28 and 35, according to
Mr James Bennett of R. D. Smith,
a firm specialising in distressed
securities.

This devastation in value sug-
gests a number of things. It

shows that Mr Trump drives a
bard bargain. It shows that busi-

ness in Atlantic City is tough
now that 11 casino hotels are
competing for custom along the
famous Boardwalk. And it shows
that the big financial institutions

buying junk bonds can be as
innocent as an elderly slot-player

bussed in from Brooklyn. As a
credit specialistput it on Thurs^'
day: "Looking back, with retro-

spect, in hindsight, they were
insane.”
The key to the story is the

Resorts casino, an old Atlantic

(Sty hotel which was the first

house to introduce casino gambl-
ing in New Jersey in 1978.

In the middle 1980s, the com-
pany overextended itself trying
to build a vast new casino next
door, called the Taj Mahal After
many twists and turns, and a
parade of figures ranging from
millionaire car-dealers to dubious
baronesses, control passed to Mr
Trump in 1987. Mr Griffin tried to
buy the company from him in
March 1988. and. after some to-

isg and firo-ing, the two agreed to

hreak it up last November.
Mr Griffin put in $60m of his

own money and issued $325m in
junk bonds to buy the Resorts
and Paradise Island casinos, the
lease underneath the nearby
Showboat casino, various parcels
of undeveloped land in Atlantic
City and other bits and bobs.

Mr Trump, who is best known
as a real estate developer, formed
a new company, put 375m of his
own money into it and borrowed
3875m in junk mortgage bonds to
finish the building of the Taj
Mahal. Much of his equity, or
some $63.7m, he got back from
Mr Griffin as the price for buying
out his management contract.

The Griffin bonds were under-
written by Drexel Burnham Lam-
bert, the Wall Street firm which
brought casino financing out of
the twilight of Mob money and
union pension funds by selling

nearly S3bn in junk bonds to
equip the Atlantic City industry.

But last November, its bond
investors were scared by the
$60Qm-odd in unsecured debt that
tile Resorts casinos were already
carrying and demanded interest

rates as high as 13% per cent on
tile mortgages.
Even this was excessively opti-

mistic. The bond prospectus
matte clear that the rasinps nmilri

not cover the H33m in annual

debt service from what people
left behind on the tables and in

the slots. Real estate would have
to be sold to cover the difference.

As it turns out. the Atlantic

City casino market is now satu-

rated, competition between the II

casinos is ferocious, revenues are
rising at about 4 per cent a year,

which is much less than labour
and other costs, and Resorts’s

market share is falling. Accord-

ing to the Griffin camp, cash flow
Is actually an exiguous S60m a
year and there are buyers so far

fra* only about $4m in Atlantic

City real estate. The Showboat
lease, which is thought to be
worth $5Ora$l00m, is still being
marketed.
The junk bond investors can-

not put the company into Chap-
ter 11 of the bankruptcy code,

because no payment has yet been
mi«wri On September 19, they
will be Invited to Atlantic City to

vote on an exchange offer, which
will inevitably involve the
rescheduling or forgiveness of
principal and interest

Ironically, it could be Mr Grif-

fin who puts the company into

bankruptcy to convince the New
Jersey casino regulators that it is

financially sound and can retain

its licence. After all, a bankrupt
company is protected from its

creditors.

In contrast, Mr Trump, who
already owns two Atlantic City

casinos, is set to control the
world’s largest gaming house for

essentially no cash investment of

his own. Some $470m has already
been sunk into the building.

If Mr Trump can finish the
thing for the same amount or less

in the next year or so, analysts

say, he will make a lot of money.
The Taj Mahal mortgage bonds

are priced at 99 to the dollar,

which suggests a measure of con-
fidence in his building skills.

“It does seem," 9aid a credit
analyst, “that at this moment,
Donald has done better than
Merv. Maybe. Merv doesn’t know
all that much about financing
and he’s more a creative type,
with Vanna and all that. Donald
understands financing."

Economics Notebook

Calm in the face of pressure
JAPANESE economic policy
makers have been hnalring in
international praise for so long
that they have almost forgot-

ten what it is like to be critic-

ised. But they are not particu-

larly dismayed by the recent
emergence of some cavilling
from the US and other foreign
governments.
The one thing they remem-

ber from past skirmishes is

that foreign pressure tends,
paradoxically, to help make
Japan an even more successful

economy, and they are confi-

dent that this will be as true in
the future as it has been inthe
past • - — 7
Since the spring <rf 1987, the

government has been vigor-

ously implementing its prom-
ise to do its bit for world eco-

nomic growth.by maintaining
domestic demand at a brisk
pace.
While gross national product

growth has risen from' only 2£ :

per cent in T98&87, to 55 per
cent in 1987-88 and 5.1 per cent

last year,'domestic demand has
been, the star performer and .

the external contribution has
been negative.

The. feet that imports have
not grown as quickly as most
economists would have expec-

ted. given the sharp revalua-

tion of the yen against the dol-

lar, is a source • of
embarrassment, as was the
resurgence of exports late last

year.
But for the past two years.

Japanese officials have walked
into most mtemgrtrmftl coun-
cils with their heads held high,
knowing that they will be
praised for the thrust of the
country’s economic policy.

,

However, they were startled
out of their complacency a few
weeks ago,, when the new'IS
ambassador to Tokyo, Mr
Michael Armacost, suggested

,

that the government should do .

more to stimulate domestic
fomand-
“The expansion of.domestic

demand this year won’t come
close to last year’s impressive
performance,” Mr Armacost
grumbled in a speech in .July.
He «d«teii. that the government
had lots of scope for spemfing
on the country’s still Third
Worid^tandard infrastructure,
especially as there wore now
surpluses in both, the govern-
ment and private sectors;
Japan’s “twin surpluses”, as he
called them in an eloquent

- echo of- the well-known US
problem.
The consensus view among

Japanese economists is that
domestic demand is likely to
grow at slightly above 5 per
-cent in the-current fiscal year,
compared with a lofty 08 per
cent bike fest year. Whether

; that qualifies as “not coining
close” is perhaps a matter, for
personal taste. But it is stiff

strong for a mature industrial
economy, and its effects are
provoking worry among both
padvate and public sector econ-
omists about a possible out-
break of-inflation.
By some measures, the econ-

omy is operating above Its

potential capacity, and the job
market statistics are giving the
Bank of Japan fits. Seasonally

adjusted unemployment in

July stood at only 2-2 per cent
The ratio of job offers to job

seekBrsrose to L35, the highest
since April 1974, And everyone

remembers what happened
then the Inflation rate
jumped in the subsequent
months to a peak of 35 per
cent • '

,

Largely because of the
strength of the domestic econ-

omy, Japanese officials are also

suspicious of Mr Armacost’s

beguiling argument about the
twin surpluses.
• It is certainly true that

Japan’s public sector now has

the means to finance virtually^

any amount of fiscal stimulus
it might want to apply- How-
ever, iltt did so at a time when
the economy was running at

full capacity, the injection
might be largely absorbed by
price increases rather than
become a contributor to a
reduction of ex ternal balances,
a finance ministry official said

last week.
It may be that Mr Armacost

was jnst putting down a
marker for the moment when
the Japanese economy’s
growth rate does start to flag,

and the MoF puts up its usual
resistance to a fiscal stimulus
on the specious grounds that
funds have to be salted away
for the anticipated surge in
pension requirements in the
future. -

Hie may also have been try-

ing to increase the pressure on
the Japanese to propose sub-
stantial refrains of their distri-

bution systems and other
structural trade barriers at the
bilateral talks that get under
way next week in Tokyo.
In either case, Japanese eco-

nomic policy makers are tak-
ing it all calmly. They have
come to appreciate foreign
pressure as a positive force for
improving the Japanese econ-
omy and economic institutions.

For example, five years ago
the US and Japan began what
came to be called the yen-dol-
lar talks with the aim of dere-
gulating Japan’s financial mar-
kets SO foreign financial
institutions could compete on a
more equal basis with the Jap-
anese banks and .' securities
houses. Today, with most of
the deregulation completed,
the foreigners have - with a
few rare exceptions - got
nowhere In the Japanese mar-
ket, while local institutions
have become much more com-
petitive and profitable.
Perhaps the US could

achieve its goals more easily In
negotiating with the Japanese
in the next few months by
threatening to withdraw its
pressure.

Ian Rodger

THIS WEEK

UK CONSUMERS come into
the spotlight this week with

RetaO sales
three sets of figures that will
provide clues about the
strength of their spending and
borrowing.

Volume 1985-100
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Final figures for retail sales

volumes in July today are
likely to show year-on-year
growth almost at a standstill

Provisional figures - which
could be substantially revised
- showed sales 0.6 per emit
lower than a month before and
only 02 per cent higher than a

r til
« , ,£& G§.

year earlier.

Also today are figures for
consumer credit in July. In
recent months signs of a slow-

‘
"
Jld 1988 1989 Jui

down caused by high interest

rates have been - at most -
tentative.
On Thursday the Confedera-

tion of British Industry/Finan-
cial Times distributive trades
survey will give the first indi-

cations of the strength of retail

sales in August and expecta-

tions for September. This
month the survey also includes

questions on imports, retailers'

capital expenditure, confidence

and selling prices.

Other UK statistics include
official reserves figures for

August released today. Inters

vention by the Bank of
England is thought to have
been Hmited. The consensus of

City analysts' forecasts, com-
piled by MMS International,

the financial research com-
pany, is an underling fell of

3250m..
Also likely to be closely

watched by markets

this week is the meeting of

central council of West Ger-
many’s Bundesbank on Thurs-

day. Speculation about a rise

in interest rates in the near
future is increasing as infla-

tionary pressures in the econ-

omy seem to be building.

Also in West Germany, sec-

ond-quarter gross national

product figures are expected
tomorrow. Earlier figures

suggested a year-on-year

growth rate of 4 per cent, high-

lighting the buoyancy of the

country's economy. Analysts

will be looking for any signs of

a slowdown..

West German trade figures
for July could be released
sometime this week. Another
large surplus is expected.
European Community eco-

nomics and finance ministers,
including Mr Nigel Lawson,
the UK chancellor, meet infor-

mally in Antibes for a long
weekend starting on Friday.
Discussions are likely to
include plans for European
economic and monetary union.

US markets are closed today
for Labor Day. Other events
and statistics this week (with

MMS International consensus
in brackets) include:
Today: Organisation of

Petroleum Exporting Countries
meeting. UK, housing starts

and completions in July. Capi-

tal issues and redemptions in

August Trades Union Con-
gress annual conference opens
in Blackpool
Tomorrow: UK, Mr Peter Lil-

ley, financial secretary to the

Treasury, speaks on privatisa-

tion at Glasgow Business

School Halifax Building Soci-

ety publishes monthly house
price index
Wednesday; UK, Department

of Employment publishes
Employment Gazette.
Thursday: Australia. August

labour market data. US, whole-

sale trade date for July.

Friday: UK, construction
output in second quarter. US,
consumer credit in July (rise of

$4bn). Bank of Japan releases

short-term business outlook.
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The right finance

for ambition

At Hill Samuel Development
Capital we invest in a wide range
of ambitious companies, both
large and small. Our deals tell the

story.

8 M E D L E Y M es A L P I N E

To help you take off.

Smedley McAlpine is a

successful and imaginative

advertising and market
research group. Hill Samuel
Development Capital has

invested for new equity to

finance the expansion of its

growing businesses.

If you are ambitious to develop

your business then telephone
Garry Watson on 01-62S SOU.

HILL SAMUEL DEVELOPMENT CAPITAL
iiifliiiiiiiiiiiiiiimiiiiiiimiiHigiitiiiiaiiifliiiimiiimaiBiBiBiiiiimiii

FINANCE FOR AMBITION

100 Wood Street. London. EC2P2AJ. Telephone01-62$SOIL
Hill SamuelDevelopment Capital is a division of Hill Samuel Bank Limited

which n a MemberofThe Securities Association.
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INTERNATIONAL CAPITAL MARKETS
INTERNATIONAL LOANS

Water boards
court bankers
INTERNATIONAL bankers are
likely to be inundated with
invitations today to join more
than £7ibn in standby credits

for nine of the 10 British water
authorities, which since Friday
have been public limited com-
panies operating under govern-
ment control- Bankers are pre-

dicting some market confusion
when the pricing of the credits
- needed before the November
privatisation of the authorities
- becomes known. The reason;

those authorities perceived by
hanks to be the best credits are
not necessarily those receiving

the finest terms.
Nevertheless, although some

apparent pricing anomalies
remain, the terms of some
transactions have been altered

in the two weeks since the
mandates were announced. For
example, what was a united
front among the UK clearing

banks - an unwillingness to
enter a deal with a commit-
ment fee of less than 12 basis

points, which drew criticism

from competitors and pressure
from the borrowers - is now
less than united.

Leading banks are. for some
reason, under an embargo not
to disclose the terms of the
deals until today. However,
according to bankers. National
Westminster Bank (raising a
£1.2bn credit for North-West
and £450m for Welsh authority)
and Lloyds, jointly with Manu-
facturers Hanover raising
£1.5bn for Severn-Trent, now
appear to be pricing their deals

with a lO'/a basis point commit-
ment fee. At the same time, the

£1.5bn credit for Thames -
perceived by some hankers to

be the best credit - is said to

carry a 12 basis point commis-

EUROMARKET
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sion. This deal is arranged by
Barclays, which is also arrang-
ing a £800m deal for Anglian
The margin if the Severn-

Trent financing is drawn is

expected to be 25 basis points
above Libor, and that on the
Thames deal 22 basis points.
The £600m credit for the York-
shire authority being arranged

by Credit Suisse First Boston is

said to have a 10 basis points
commission and a margin of

25, while Wessex’s £350m -
one of three financings in
which Manufacturers Hanover
is involved in arranging - is

said to carry a 7% basis point
commission, rising to 12'A,
with a margin of 22V&.
Bankers point out that credit

judgments about the authori-
ties are complicated. Not only
are they of a different size and
perceived quality but also the
regulatory environment under
which they will operate will
affect each authority differ-

ently. Some face larger capital

costs than others for the man-

dated improvement of water
quality and sewerage systems.

Elsewhere, the Slbn maiden
international credit line being
arranged by Volkswagen has
been increased to Sl.Sbn by
J.P. Morgan, the arranger. The
seven-year credit, which car-

ried a margin of i point over
Libor rising to V* point if more
than half drawn, was syndi-
cated exclusively among non-
German banks, the company
having large arrangements
already with domestic institu-

tions. There is a commitment
fee of 8 basis points on
undrawn amounts.
Three commercial pro-

grammes were announced.
Daiwa (Europe) was the
arranger of a $500m pro-
gramme for Prudential
Finance UK, a guaranteed sub-
sidiary of the UK insurance
company. This marked the first

time Prudential used the Euro-
commercial paper market for
short-term borrowings.
A $l50m multi-currency pro-

gramme for Atlas Copco was
arranged by SEB London to
increase and update an older
programme. BZW arranged a
£100m programme for Control
Securities, the UK leisure and
property company.

Stephen Fidler and
Andrew Freeman

EUROCREDITS

Regulators stand to gain from electronic monitoriiig
THE Securities Association’s
plan to monitor electronically
Eurobond market transactions
is the most far-reaching regula-

tory proposal ever to hit the
market.
While the system, to be

known as Cobra (Capture of
Bond Reports and Analysis),
will simply collect existing
information from other
sources, the data will be left in
the hands of regulators with
the authority to discipline par-
ticipants for violation of mar-
ket practices.
“We think the main effect is

that it offers some form of
deterrence." said Mr Lindsey
Thomas, director of computer
systems at TSA, who is over-
seeing the Cobra project
Whereas the primary Euro-

bond markets have offered
some degree of transparency
while securities are still being
placed with investors, second-
ary markets offer little, partic-
ularly for seasoned, secondary
issues where few bonds change

hands.
And It is in these securities,

regulators say, that the great-
est need to monitor market
practices occurs. With profit-
ability defining sharply in the
Eurobond markets, dealers and
regulators have commented on
an increasing willingness to
bend rules about good market
practice in order to bolster
returns. Regulators hope that
even if the system pinpoints
few actual violations of rales,
it will at least have forced less
scrupulous operators to curb
some of their market practices.
Among the practices that

regulators say the system will
allow them to spot are front-

running (firms dealing on
information in advance of their
clients), and the so-called prac-
tices of ramping and dumping
which are organised efforts to

create an artificial picture of
demand or supply In a particu-
lar security.

Also, the system will allow
regulators to see which firms

are “overtrading" — taking on
more business than, their capi-
tal allows.
The system goes much fur-

ther than tracking the most
notorious market manipula-
tions in the Eurobond market.
Among other things. Informa-
tion reported to Cobra will
require participants to disclose
whether they are acting as
agent or principal on each
transaction, thus allowing reg-
ulators to see whether prices
charged to clients are in tine

with those of the market.
Reports to Cobra will also
include client identification
numbers so that regulators can
see whether a client’s account
is being churned, whether it

habitually makes heavy profits
or losses or whether it fre-

quently buys or sells at off-

market prices.

Among the practices TSA is

most concerned with involves
off-market trading where a
counterparty is induced to pur-
chase securities at, say, 10

points below the market
because the seller needs to dis-

pose of a particular heading. In-

return, the counterparty is

promised the opportunity to
buy securities at an equivalent
discount at a later date. TSA
officials said the practice'
allows firms to build up expo-
sures to each other that may
exceed prudential roles.

TSA will also be able -to
pgamfrie transactions between
dealers and interdealer bro-
kers, and be able to assess
whether prices quoted on bro -

leers’ screens are in line with
where the seenrities have actu-
ally traded.

'

Also, according to Mr
Thomas, Cobra will enable reg-
ulators to See mfim-rrmtinn fn a
more useful format. .For
instance, data from the ADHD's
(Association of International
Bond Dealers) Trax system
allows viewers with access to it

to match all trades among
members, but it does not, for

instance, provide easy retrieval

ofall transactions ofbonds ofa
given borrower. The ' new
Cobra system will gather infor-

mation from Trax as well as

from Euroclear anfr GedeL the.

two T" ai
'n clearing agencies,'

and from the Stock Exchange
itself.

Meanwhile, the board of the
~

AIBD meets today to consider
the imposition of fines -and
penalties for members Trim fail

to use the Trax system prop-.,

eriy.

• The debt securities of UAL
Corp’s United Airlines unit. —
rated BBB and BBB-mtnus —
have been placed under review
for a possible downgrading by
both Moody’s Investors Service

and Standard & Poor’s^ -The
action was prompted by -the
possibility, later confirmed,. o£-

a bid for the company by .its

pilots, management' and Brit-

ish Airways

However, investors ! in at

least two sales of the com-
pany's bonds believed they had

been offered; some protection
1

against -Just such a move by
so^aBed poison put covenants
contained in DAL’S - S150m
festse of '12Vk per cent bonds
dat-l99S and Its $350m issue of
13 per cent bonds due 1998-

. The catch is that white UAL
is required by the covenants to

repurchase:the bonds ata price
of 101 in the event of a. change
of ownership, it is only
required to do so if bothjrating
agencies cut the bond ratings
to B-ininus. Such a dramatic
downgrading Is highly unusual
and considered unlikely. Thus,
the poison put has failed to be
effective "against the .type of
scenario Investors fear most.

in the meantime, takeover
speculation about UAL has
ranged both series of bonds to

foil sharply in the past three

months to about 97 and 98
respectively from a price of

about 1M. - "V ,:

Norma Cohen
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RENAULT ACCEPTANCE B.V.

Guaranteed by

Renault Credit International S.A.

Lit. 100,000,000,000
123A per cent. Notes due 1992

Issue Price 101.20 per cent.

Istituto Bancario San Paolo di Torino

Banco di Napoli

Italian International Bank pic
(Monte dei I’ascfal di Siena Banking Group)

Sodete Generale

Akros S.p.A.

Banca Commerriale Italiana

Banque Generale du Luxembourg S.A.

Bayerische Vereinsbank
Aktimgescllschjft

Banca Nazionale del Lavoro

Caisse des Depots et Consignations

Credito Italiano

Generale Banque

Sanpaolo-Lariano Bank S.A.

Credit Lyonnais

Banco di Roma

Kredietbank International Group

UBS Phillips & Drew Securities l imited

Amsterdam-Rotterdam Bank N.V.

Banco di SiriHa

Banque Vemes et Commendale de Paris
-GmnpcSunRuda

Banque BmxeQes Lambert S.A.

BNP Capital Markets Limited

Compagnie Monegasque de Banque

Euromobiliare

Sanpaolo Bank (Austria)

Sumitomo Finance International

Redland Overseas Funding PLC

A$100,000,000
- ,

f. >•. y

16% GuaranteedNotes due 1993

unconditionallyand irrevocablyguaranteed by

Redland PLC

J. E Morgan Securities Ltd.

Baring Brothers & Co., Limited

Hamburgische Landesbank
- GntOZENTRALE

—

Sanwa International Looted

Westdeutsche Landesbank Girozentrale

Dresdner Bank Aktienc^eixschaft-.
’

’ - . -r

.
.. Hessische .Landesbank!

-—Girozentrale— ir

S.G. Warburg Securities

Westpac Banking Corporation

3rdAugust, 1939 AUofthete S'curi,*.Wb"„ ,ot<L ThU amaancn,e^ app,m ; |
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sells out of Channel Ten I Milan bank

••
:

MR FfeSNK LOWTSWestfield

fizist-casnalty
competitive commercial fefovl-;
sie&- jjidustry since; tor -owuef:

r„

regulation <±angesin 1986.

Westfield Capital Conjura-
tion, the group's uivestmc&t
ana, disposed of its S3 percent
ownership oTNortheirn Star,
for a fraction of what ft arigi-

.

nafly paid, after taking write-
downs running to hondredsof
mfifionR of dollars. -

1

.
-

The complex, deal hands con-'

trol of Northern Star said the
network's Sydney and Mel-
bourne television stations to
Broadcom, an indsp^odetd pro-,

ductloh house controlled by
the- AFP investment group-
The other,three stations hi the'
network---Canberra,’ Adelaide
aiidPerth will go^'a-group-
beaded by Mr Change Curran,
a’stddklbroker. -

’
4

;- 1

The deal marks ’another
aggressive move by AFP,

jfi.y,
<' i • z. v r

wlrich Is run by a group of
entrepreneurs ..Muatog Mr
Jphn Gerahty, MrBasfi Sellars
and 'Mr Peter Scanlon. AFP
ah^dycontrt^Gestetaerta
the TIK, recently acquired con-
trol' of Hahfrhex aod Wormald
in Australia and is art investor
in Bartin, which' ‘controls the
Elders IXL group. -•••-

v The deal also baa frnplica-.

tions for existing Northern
Star: shareholders; sutb

:
as

Associated Newspapers of fl»
UK, which has 14L5 per oent,
and for its creditors, who
irHdnxfe Mr 'Kupert Murdoch's
News Corporation, which is
owed some'A$2S0hl
-fis most- serious impact wffl

.

be onmarket valuatfoiis ofthe
troubled Bond Media; which
controte the tinted Channel
Mas networky Hnd Mr Christo-
pher ’ Skase-’s debt-hardened
Qtntex group, owner of-Chan-
nd? Seven, which 'has consis-
tently ran at number two in
the ratings.
-Each of *^a«A enWamansuB

paid top dollar to buy their net-
works after tiie Government
relayed .its two-station. <wijng
on television ownership, only
to see the 1987 stock market
crash slash their value. North-
ern Star, at A$3A0 per share
when Mr Lowy bought in,
slithered to little more than
Ail, and conditions afww than
have grown worse.
In recent weeks, as Ten'srat-

ings have langnishcd despite a
management shake-up and
comprehfinah^ -gafirfhwhilT^ nf
programmes, the shares have
traded down to 46 cents. Mr
Lowy,- who made his fortune
building suburban shopping
centres, clearly felt the burden
was too expensive.
Tinder the weekend deal:

• Broadcom has bought 19.9

per cent of Northern Star for 60
cents:a share, using funds i«rit

by Westfield. Broadcom has
put four directors on Northern
Star's, board, including Mr
Steve Coaser as chief executive
and Mr Gerahty and Mr Scan-

lon. Broadcom has also agreed
to produce programmes for the
network at subsidised costs for
10 years.

• Westfield’s remaining 32 per
cent of Northern Star is being
placed with various institu-
tional investors. Ownership of
the prime Sydney and Mel-
bourne stations will remain
with the group, but the other
three in the network will be
sold for AS185m.
• Northern Star will raise
ASUB&n through a rights issue
of six-year subordinated notes.

Its properties will be sold, as
will other surplus assets such
as its bolding in Barris Invest-

ment of the US, to realise
another A$86m. Overall, North-
on Star's debt will come down
ITOm A$650m;to A$300m-
Asked- about Mi Lowy's

costly exit from television, Mr
Cosser said on Saturday: “I

think Frank came to the view
trig business many impon-
derables and he didn't care to
ponder them."

Atlanta to Polygram silent on A&M
sell shares By Laura ftmin In Amsterdam

crrf" ITcTfUlA -POIlYGEAM,. the; record Polygram is seeking to PhOtps. wbdl aj9J^vUu r company helongtngr to Philips, broaden its repertoire beyond cent of Poly]

By Diana Smith
inlisbon :

ALIANCA, the state-owned,
insurance company ranked
sixth bluest in Portugal,, wfll

|

sell 49 per cent of Its capital at

;

a basic Es3,000 ($18.50) per i

share this month in the third
privatisation this year of state-
run concerns.
The company will sell lm

new shares and '470,000 state-

held shares. At Es3,000, the
issue would rai9e Es4.41hn, but
thefigure couldbe higher.
Alianca has been vataed-by

consultants at Es6bn. It had
revenues - of Esl3bn and- gross-
investments of Es5.4bn in 1988
when its profits rose 27-5 par
cent to Es346m. Itforecasts an
Es600m_. profit in 1989. .Lucra-
tive . life insurance business
helps offset heavy losses from

insurance."
Alianca has jnst capitaBsed

Es500m from reserves to raise

capital to£s2bn. -
- -

.
Sale qf shares begins on Sep-

tember 15 with a pubhc OTb-
sdptiott (4^1,000 shares) ’at cut
prices of EsS^SOO/or employees,
and Es2$OQ:forein2granl& and.

email buyers^ .. : ; .vo*.r.<

By Laura Maun in Amsterdam

-POLYGRAM, the; record
company belongfay to Philips, 1

the Dutch . electronics group, <

has refused, to comment on J

reports that itls negotiating to ]

boyA&M Records of the US for ]

6500m.'
speculation has centred on I

A&M. one of the two large US 1

independents, amid rapid con- i

solidatlffn In the record Indus- i

try. Last month Polygram said
it pfwTtnfld ftnflHT- anqmwfHnno . ]

of popular labels after Its pur- 1

chase -of island Records, the f

UK independent. “
]

Polygram is seeking to
broaden its repertoire beyond
classical record labels such as
Deutsche Grammophon and
Philips and. by moving into
popular Tnnsfo,

With sales of F13.5bn
(6L6bn) in 1988 Polygram is the
third largest record company
in the world with 15 per cent of
the global market mid around
45 of per «»nt the ciaadfai mar-
ket. The purchase of Island
Records for around £200m
(6300m) added another 2 to 3
per cent of the world market

Philips, which owns 90 per
cent of Polygram, refused to
comment on the reports about
A&M. It wants sources of soft-

ware for its consumer elec-

tronic products such as com-
pact disc players.

After the Island Records
takeover Philips said it would
publicly float 20 to 30 per cent
of Polygram, which analysts
believe could raise between
FI 500m and FI Ibn. Institu-
tional investors who own 10
per cent of Polygram are expec-
ted to sell their share.

FT-SE put warrant launched
‘MYKatftorfno Campbell

BANKERS TRUST has
launched a form of put warrant
on the. FT-SE Index, which
aBbws investors to hedge bets
on the course of the index gra-
rij —^ for tiie next month, that

5. • 1V;
1
-

•

. The issue of 500,000 war-
rants,- worth -about £120m *Tiri

expiringan 31 March 1292, car-

ries two alternative strike
priced September 1 or Septem-
ier_39. At on Friday, the
.first of the twb strike dates, the
index stood at 2396.00.

Hie new structure plays on
nryv»rfaiintifts in the mayftp*,

where many investors are
bearish in the longer term but
wary of committing themselves
to a particular level
' A purchaser of this put
should seethe warrant appreci-
ate in value if the fridgy falls

between now and the end of
September. Conversely, if the
index eHmiWj the investor ran
take advantage of the higher
strike price at the end of the
.month, effectively attaining a

free option for the four-week
period.

Investors pay £19.75 for each
warrant, which represents a
fenth of the sterling value of
the index. This equates to a
premium of 8.3 per cent and
yields an implied volatility of
around 18 per cent, according
to Bankers Trust
Previous index warrants

have been criticised as costly,

but the sweetener on last
week's issue met with approval
in some earners of the market

•+. i .. .

Placingon behalfof

. Espirito Santo International Holding S.A.

of912,000 shares ofU.S. $10 nominal value each of

Espirito Santo financial Holding S.A.

Offer Price.U.S. $30.40per share

UBS Phillips& Drew Securities Limited

Bank Espirfto Santo International Limited

Credit Lyonnais Securities

Euromobfliare

KEamrort Benson limited..

Merrill Lynch International Limited

Nomura International

Palm & Bodmer Bankers Zurich

Salomon BrothersInieraational Limited

Svenska TfowlplRhanken Group

Banqne Indosuez

Credit Suisse first Boston Limited

Goldman Sachs International Limited

Kredietbank international Group

Morgan Stanley International

Paribas Capital Markets Group

RBC Dominion Securities International

ShearsonLehman Hutton International

Swiss Bank Corporation
Investment Ranking

35% ahead
and plans

rights issue
By Our Financial Staff

MEDIOBANCA, Italy's largest

merchant bank, posted a 85
per cent increase in net profit

to Ll62.4bn (6117m) in the
year ended June 30, up from
L120-51U a year earlier, and
plans a L680bn rights issue.

The rights issue and a scrip

issue wQl raise share

capital to L840bn from
L204bm
Mediobanca said the reason

for tiie capital increase would
be disclosed at the time of the

shareholders meeting on Octo-
ber 28.

Mediobanca also said it

would distribute a dividend of
20 per cent or L200 a share,

both to shares in circulation

and those that will be freely
distributed.

Total dividend payout will

amount to L54.4bn, up 33 per
cent from the dividend paid a
year earlier.

Net profit in fiscal 1989
came after L87.2bn in addi-
tional reserves for bad loans
and devaluation of securities
holdings. This compared with
gteiiiar charges of L101-3bn In
tiie previous year.
The Adlan-based financial

institution also reported that
funds available totalled
L12£59bn as of Jane 30, UP
12J> per cent from a year ear-

lier, while loans outstanding
amounted to Ll0^34bn, up 19
per cent from a year earlier.

Investments in securities of
companies that it controls
were valued at L1^264bn, up
14_6 per cent from a year ear-

lier, while financial liquidity

fell 10.9 per cent to L2,611bn
as of the end of June.
The proposed capital opera-

tion follows a L520bn second-

ary public share offering last

year when state holding hold-

ing Istitnto per la Ricostru-
zione Isdostriale (IRI) decided

to privatise Mediobanca.
Taming to the toms of the

capital increase, Mediobanca
said it proposes a one-for-three

scrip issue consisting of 68m
new ordinary shares.
This is the first time since

1983 that Mediobanca is arr-

anging a scrip issue.

It also proposes a one-for-

three rights issue of 68m new
ordinary shares with a nomi-
nal value of LI,000 a share and
a premium of L9.000 a share.

Way cleared for

Noranda control

of Falconbridge
By David Owen in Toronto

THE withdrawal on Friday by
US-based Amax from the bidr

dipg for Canada's Falconbridge
Leaves the way dear for the

diversified mining company to

be teVftw over by Noranda in

partnership with Trelleborg of
Sweden.
The C62.2bn (US61.8bn) or

C$37 a share Noranda-Trelle-
borg bid is the only offer left

on the table for the Toronto-

based nickel, zinc and copper
producer. Conditional on at
least 25m shares being ten-

dered, it is due to expire on
September 15.-

Amax’s prior C63G'A a share

offer had surprised many
observers, since the group -
whose principal areas of activ-

ity are now aluminium, coal,

gold and molybdenum - had
extricated itself from both
nickel g»nr earlier in the
decade.
From Falconbridge’s view-

point. the Amax bid forced
Noranda. Canada's largest nat-

ural resources group, to make
an offer for 100 per cent of the
company rather than gradually
accumulate a controlling stake,

as its intention had previously
been.
in the past year. Noranda,

which is short of feed for its

Home copper smelter in Que-
bec, had inexorably amassed
23.8 per cent of outstanding
Falconbridge stock. Its average

purchasing price for these
shares amounted to just C$24 a
unit.

The past month’s develop-
ments have considerably
enhanced the reputation of Mr
Bill James, the Falconbridge
chairman, who has secured a
better deal for his shareholders
than previously seemed possi-

ble. Mr James and Mr Allen
Bora, the Amax chairman,
were once colleagues at Can-
ada’s Placer Development
• The Alouette aluminium
smelter project is going ahead
at Sept lies, an iron ore and
grain shipping port on the St
Lawrence north shore. 700
miles north-east of Montreal,
writes Robert Gibbens in Mon-
treal.

The first stage, costing
C$1.Ibn and with annual
capacity of around 210,000
tonnes, will be in production
by April 1992. The second
phase, costing around C$lbn,
wfll follow by 1995.

The Alouette consortium has
signed an electric power agree-

ment with Hydro-Quebec, cov-
ering the supply of 360MW.

Expanding Billiton to buy
35% of Quebec mine
By Kenneth Gooding, Mining Correspondent

BILLITON International
Metals, the Royal Dutch/Shefl
division which has been
aggressively building its world-
wide mining operations, is buy-
ing a 35 per cent interest in Les
Mines Selbaie, a leading cop-

per, rinr. and precious metals
complex in north-western Que-
bec, Canaria

The stake was put up for
sale some time ago by Imperial
Oil. Exxon's principal operat-

ing affiliate.in Canada. So far

details of the terms have not
been disclosed but might be
given when the deal is finally

completed on September 20.

Selbaie is 180kms north of
Noranda and encompasses

both open-pit and underground
mines. Control is held by Brit-

ish Petroleum’s Canadian off-

shoot which owns 55 per cent
and manages the complex.
When BP recently sold most

Of its worldwide mining and
minerals assets to the RTZ Cor-
poration for US$4.3bn, its
fianariian mining operations

were excluded.
The third partner in Selbaie

is a subsidiary of TransCanada
Pipelines with 10 per cent
Exxon’s share of Selbaie's

output last year was 900.000

tonnes of ore yielding 8,800
tonnes of copper and 16,200
tonnes of rinr

Management, Page IS

Lomas hints

at seeking

bankruptcy
protection
By James Buchan
in New York

LOMAS FINANCIAL, the
Texas financial services com-
pany which is struggling with
large losses and a heavy bur-

den of debt, has hinted to its

bankers that it would consider

bankruptcy if they do not
make concessions on their

loans.

The thinly-veiled threat was
made as Lomas, which has
been hard hit in its mortgage
finance business by the real

estate recession in Texas, for-

mally defaulted on $145m in

debt
The company is still locked

in talks with its bank and
insurance company lenders,

led by Chase Manhattan, to
provide a new credit facility to

cover the S145m In notes and
other debt coming due.
Wall Street saw the bank-

ruptcy threat as largely a ploy
by Mr Jess Hay, chief execu-
tive of Lomas, to hurry on the

talks.

Mr Hay said Lomas would
prefer “not to seek the protec-

tion of the court.” But, be
added, “we are committed to

protecting and preserving the
assets of Lomas and, to that
end, we will take whatever
actions will be necessary.”
Lomas, which is battling to

return to profit after two years
of losses, said that by selling

businesses it had reduced its

debt from $5.7bn at the end of

June to $3.8bn at the end of

August The company is now
trying to sell its big commer-
cial leasing operation to reduce
debt by a further 5i.5bn.

Insider trading

claim denied
By Robert Thomson
in Tokyo

MR YASUO MATSUSHITA,
president of Taiyo Kobe bank,
has denied insider trading took
place before the proposed
merger with Mitsui Bank was
announced.
The formal denial comes as

the Tokyo Stock Exchange is

conducting a “routine” investi-

gation into a sudden surge of

Taiyo Kobe buying before the
announcement

New Issue The announcement appears as a matter of record only. August 1989

A
Dresdner International Finance PLC

Republic of Ireland

FF 500,000,000

9 % Bonds due 1994

Payment of principal and interest

unconditionally and irrevocably guaranteed by

Dresdner Bank Aktiengesellschaft

Frankfurt am Main

Issue price 101 !4 %

Banque Nationale de Paris

Caisse des D€p6ts et Consignations

Credit Agricole

Bank Brussel Lambert N.V.

Banque Indosuez

Banque Veuve Morin-Pons
Croupe Dresdner Bank

Commerzbank Aktiengesellschaft

Credit Lyonnais

Deutsche Bank Capital Markets Limited

Dresdner Bank Aktiengesellschaft

Paribas Capital Markets Group

Algemene Bank Nederland N.V.

Banque Franpaise du Commerce Exterieur

Banque Internationale a Luxembourg SA.

Bayerische Hypotheken- und Wechsel-Bank
Atitiengeselischah

Credit Commercial de France

Credit Suisse First Boston Limited

Society Generate

UBS Phillips & Drew Securities Limited

Banque Nationale de Paris
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Mixed signals from economic data Interest rate gloom knocks prices
A FLASH in the pan or a
market rally? Last Friday's
queer performance by the US
credit markets has posed a

conundrum. The New York
markets are closed today for
the Labor Day holiday so the
world will have to wait till

tomorrow, and possibly longer,
for an answer. It will be worth
waiting for.

What happened on Friday
was this. Early in the morning,
the US Labor Department
reported that employment in

the economy, as measured by
non-farm payrolls, rose by
110.000 in August. Since this

rigure excluded some 103.000
striking workers at regional
telephone companies, the job
growth was deemed strong and
thus bearish for the credit mar-
kets.

Coupon prices fell quite
sharply, by as much as ft of a
point for long-maturity bonds.
But soon afterwards, the mar-
kets got hold of the results of

the monthly questionnaire of

purchasing managers at 250
manufacturing businessesmanufacturing businesses
around the country.

The so-called Purchasing
Managers' Index, a statistical

encapsulation of their business
outlook, fell to 45” in August
down from 46.0 in July. Typi-

cally, a reading of under 50
suggests that the manufactur-
ing economy is in decline but
the August reading was partic-

ularly eye-catching. Last
month's index was the lowest

since December 1982, when
manufacturing was struggling
to get out of recession.

The credit markets com-
pletely reversed themselves.
By the early afternoon, most
traders had left for their long
weekend but by then long-term
Treasuries were up the best
part of a point to yield some
8.12 per cent. Some bullish
noises were being made. The
holiday air carried the hint of

lower interest rates, like the
first smell of the sea.

Admittedly, the fall in yields

came in thin trading. “When
the traders are in polo shirts

and shorts, you have to be cau-
tious," said Mr Robert Brusca,
an economist at Nikko Securi-

ties. The purchasing managers'
report also covers only manu-
facturing while ignoring the
government or service sectors
which make up such a big part
of the US economy.
None the less, there was a

lot in the survey that sounded
well for the Treasury bond
market Most of the business-
men in the survey said that
production, new orders, inven-
tories and employment at their

businesses were down. Most
striking for the inflationary
outlook was the easing in
capacity constraints and the
fall in commodity prices.

Vendor deliveries, which is

how the purchasing managers
measure capacity use, were
faster for the fourth month in a
row which suggests that
demand for a wide range of
materials has fallen. Mean-
while, the price index fell

sharply from 46.9 to 43.1 with
29 commodities - ranging
from polystyrene to steel scrap
and copper - dropping in price

and only nine rising.

For some economists, such
as Mr Albert Edwards of Elein-

wort Benson in London, these
figures are bullish in the
extreme. Mr Edwards argues
that the purchasing managers
index for commodity prices is a
fairly good forecast of con-
sumer price inflation, which is

the key inflation measure for

fixed-income investors. He
believes that consumer price
Inflation next year could dip
below 4 per cent from its cur-

rent levels of about 5 per cent
and open the way for a drop in

long-term yields.

But other economists were
more sceptical. Griggs & San-
tow, the money market com-
mentary service, warned its

subscribers not to jump to con-
clusions: “The focus is on the
manufacturing sector and on
only the large firms within
that sector. Thus, 75 per cent
or more of the economy is out-
side the view of this survey.

Further, the level of the index
is a pretty good indication of
whether manufacturing is

expanding or contracting, but
it tells you very little about
how much. In short, be very

cautious in trying to generalise
about the whole economy on
the basis of purchasing manag-
ers’ data."

Still, the survey is the latest

in a string of hints that the US
economy is not really going
anywhere. Factory orders
dropped 1.7 per cent in July,
durable goods orders were
down 2-2 per cent that month
while the leading economic
indicators were up only mod-
estly. by 0.2 per cent Despite
lower mortgage rates, con-
struction is still unexciting.
Several companies that sold
junk bonds at high yields in
the hope of booming markets
have defaulted or reported dif-

ficulties this summer.
Employment growth in

August would seem to be the
exception. Bnt the markets
have become distrustful of
these figures since the Labor
Department was forced drasti-
cally to revise the May, June
and July estimates. Meanwhile,
a good portion of the August
gain, or 57,000 jobs, came in
the government sector and this

is probably temporary. Above
all, there is stOl no real evi-

dence of the sort of tight
labour market which would
push up wages and feed
through into consumer price
inflation. The average work-
week declined in August, as

did overtime and average
weekly and hourly earnings,
“it all adds up to a pattern of
weakness," said Mr Brusca on
Friday.

The US credit markets have
been through two distinct
moods this summer. Starting
in early May, investors became
increasingly convinced that
the economy was heading for
recession. This prospect began
to recede sharply last month
and yields rose firmly for fear
that the economy was quite
strong after alL The purchas-
ing managers' report may set
the stage for a third change of
mood in which the market
decides that there will be no
recession and no boom in the
foreseeable future, but it can
still look wistfully for an eas-
ing in monetary policy by the
Federal Reserve.

At the moment, it is hard to
see the Fed acting to cut inter-

est rates.- A really pronounced
weakness in manufacturing or
in exports might do the trick.
A repetition of October 1987,
when stocks and junk bonds
crashed, would also, no doubt,
force the Fed to ease and work
wonders for Treasury bond
yields. But history is unlikely
to repeat itself, one hopes.

James Buchan

US MONEY MARKET RATES (%)

Fd Fund] (nwkfy average)
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GILTS prices took another
tumble last week as it began to
dawn on more more mar-
ket participants that the out-
look for Interest rates might
not be as rosy as first thought.
The Bank of England,

through its recent money mar-
ket operations, has done its bit
to impoverish those optimistic
souls, who a month ago
thought the short sterling con-
tract was telling the truth
about the future downward
comae of base rates.

In the past two weeks the
Bank has contrived to keep the
money market short of liquid-
ity mini late in the day — a
development which has led to
a significant, flattening in the
money market yield curve
from overnight money to
three-month money at not far
short of 14 per cent.

On Thursday the Bank was
even able to take bills at
cheaper prices than its official
deaHng rates .

This represents a significant
change In the Bank's
operations.

It demonstrates its apparent
determination to support ster-

ling at current levels - the
cost of short-selling the pound
is now more than 100 basis
points more expensive that it

was a couple of weeks ago -
and, given the latest news and
prognosis on the pay front, a
determination which may well
last for some time.

The ehangp in tqrtiea alflO

appears to be a victory for
those in the market who have
been concerned about the

UKtfHeyleMt
tiie winter as welL
The reasoning here relates

both to MD and pay deals. It

seems as if the starting pmnt
for pay- negotiators this

autnmn/wtotar is 9 percent, or
a little higher. _

If the authorities are to inQu-

ence companies'- pay decisions
- to keep future deals at that

level or lower — companies
have to be squeezed and a
strong currency and high inter-

est rates are heeded.
It is also looking increas-

ingly likely that the -July read-

ing for 110 growth, and poes^
bly retail sales,., was

slackness in short rates
brought about by the Bank's
purchases -of gilts.

The Bank, through its

increased sales of Treasury
j»as turned the market

from one which seemed perpet-

ually to be in surplus to one
which dally has a shortage
that needs to be relieved.

The balance erf power has
therefore shifted decisively in
toe Bank’s favonr.

The growing appreciation of
the Bank's change of tactics

was not the only thing last

week to make the market reas-

sess the short-term outlook.
Wednesday's British Tele-

com pay deal - 155,000 work-
ers got a 9 per cent pay rise -
and Thursday's flash forecasts

for August M0 growth under-
lined wind many think is the

need for monetary policy to

stay tight throughout the
gutmwn and possibly far all off

This could relate to faulty

seasonal adjustment, strike

and weather effects, or the
influence of second-quarter pay
deals on thw pay of the
nation.
Whatever the reason, MO

growth appears tohe accelerat-

ing. The chances of its annual
growth rate coining within the
Chancellor's 1 to 5 per emit tar-

get range by the end of the
year appear remote.
As for retail sales, there is a

growing belief that July's ftfi

per cent foil was distorted and
that August sales will show a
bounce back.
This Thursday's FT/CBI dis-

tributive trades survey win
therefore be greeted with more
than usual interest.

LAST WEEK'S full money
supply data confirmed, if con-
firmation were needed, reports
of foreign investor interest in
tiw gfltJ> markot ifariwg July.

The Bank scooped up £634m
of gilts from domestic sources
while fixtigseis bought £3l2ro_

At the same time, the Bank
has modified the funding- rule.
In its Bulletin it noted that

the carry-over funding require-
ment was seen in terms of the
past two financial years
(EgJibnX whereas In its. May
Bulletin the carry-over require-

ment was put solely -in terms
of the £2L5on held over from
the 2988-89 year.
The result Is £300m left in

the . market's bands which,
from the market’s point of
view, has to be better than cm
the Bank's balance sheet.

.

CM the Public SectorBlow-
ing Requirement itself, the
market has changed Its view, ft

was sceptical of the decline,
path for the surplus forecast by
the Treasury at Budget time
and projected little change in

the surplus.
In April, the FT average of

City economists for economic
growth. Was for output to rise

by 20 per cent after a rite of
22 per cent this year.

. 1mdebt repayment was put
at £I5^bn after rising by
£L5£bn tins year. Growth has
now been downgraded- by.-0.2

percentage points to 2.1_per
cent, rise in 1990

.
but next

year's debt repayment' has
been cut by £3bn to £12J9hn.

The' market has dearly
taken on board the Bank's
comment that it expects a
lower debt repayment than in
the Budget forecast.

Simon Holberton

US BOND PRICES AND YIELDS (%)

t i ( mu
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UK COMPANY NEWS
EC Commission removes last regulatory hurdle in way of the bid

Pless&y to raise dividend by 20%
SrVanttMa W.gqdorvand Urn Dlctoon Iri Brussels

PLESSEY
, the \«ledatndcs ' to the ' ahsen<»-of iuifores8ai 1

gfo^fecmgafZJHtli^Ze-hiai cir-cqzn&Eaiices, the. board 1

from GEC-oiemensv ftris fore-v Intended, to recommend a total .. I

cast-a 20 per cegfIr&erin Jts net-tiivJdend for the year of 1

dividend in a ^oc^nneht sent to ?*19p. Since 1985, an increase at
shareholders this weekend- '

,
a rate of 15 per cent per year i

Plessey- said: it was too early had been achieved-
.. , ]

in the
. year to make a profits' ^Plessey will this, week com- J

forecast, which furthermore, it piste a aeries o£ presentations ]

east-a.20 per cent'Irisesihdls
dividend in a -docmnent sent to
shareholders this weekend.

Plessey- said it was too early,
in the. year to make a profits
forecast, which furthermore, ft

felt was inappropriate /because.

from Plessey that the takeover,

by GEC/Sfethens infringe toe
Community’s competition
rules.

The. decision, which-was
widely expected following, the
provisional blessing given T>y
Sir Leon Britten the EC’s.Com-
petition policy Commissioner,

of its link with GEC through - holders, which together repre-

to its' 55 institutional share- removes the last regnlatory

the GPT teleconunnnicatlons
joint venture. " . z'

.

The document* which . was
posted on Saturday, said that.

sent 60 per cent of the capital.
- Meanwhile in Brasses, toe
European Commission hs* for-

mally rejected a- complaint

hurdle in the way of the bid.
Complaint concerned the

agreement between GEC and
Semens to purchase Plessey.
combined with plans for the

future joint and/or separate
management of pertain assets.

The Commission said "cer-

tain elements of the agreement
may constitute appreciable
restrictions of competition
within the meaning of Article

85(1) particularly concerning
telecommunications and Inte-

grated circuits."

However, “in the light of the
particular circumstances of
this case”, an exemption could
be envisaged under Article

85(8).

Article

Net assets- rise- •

t Crown increases Chiltern offer
By Vannsa Houldw

GROWN Communications, -toe
commercial radio and broad-
castfog grog?, has. raised its

partial offer for Chiltern; Radio,
a private radio company, from
£10 to. £13 per share.

;

Grown isattempting to raise
its staketo_293& percent, toe
maxftnam tevel permitted by
the Independent Broadcasting

Authority, as part of its strat-

egy of bunding stakes in radio
companies in the south and
east of England.
In its offer document it

that although it was not hos-
tile towards Chiltern, it

believed there was consider-
able room for improvement.

Chiltern Radio said that the

Investment costs take toll

<m AJ& Selection profits

Magnet £2Qm
property deal
Magnet .Group, 'the* building
products ' concern, hasf
exchanged contracts for the.

sale andleasehack of59 proper-
*

ties for around £20ul •

The buildings, whichInclude
some Magnet retail outlets,

.

have been bcmght.by Lyntoifc’-

the property investment and'
developipent .company. ;

In two transactions this.;

brings to 78toe number of frefr •

hold properties bought from
Magnet by Lynton for a total in <

excess of £30m. The buildings,

having /aftptal flpor area of
:

about lm sq ft, have all- been -

leased back, to Magnet for 25.,

years. . .

COSTS OF. the . investment
programme' have’ restrained
profits at USM-qooted ATA
Selection, but the new
branches .should contribute to
the secohd balf. . .

Fra: the six months to end-
Ame, turnover rose toEUSm.
(£2-57m) but pre-tax profits fell

to £404*00 (£437,000).

In; the recruitment division
three hew branches were
opened and the refurbishment
programme continued. Exist-

ing outlets saw a growth in
activity with turnover rising
by 17 per cent
- Financial services lifted
turnover , by 45 per cent but
money costs were materially
higher because of increased
interest rates. That reduced
margins on the existing portfo-

lio although profit was nfwtd
of the 1988 comparison.
Earnings for the period were

217p (SL34p). The Interim divi-

dend is raised to lp (0.84p).

Itrrm Hldgs back in black
-Ferrari Ridings, the provider
tfcampaler 'systems and ser-

vices: formerly known as CJfer,

returned to the w«* tn the
Ssfc.tb4ime.3Q. ...... . .

. cThjs’ HSM-guoted company
made pre-tax^rofiteof £688,000

OBT, contmushg businesses,
agninst' losses of

,
£205,000.

Turnover [leaped to £14.5m
ffluBitf Payable interest fan
to £l6i.00e f£280,000) mid,' after

tax df '<£2l2)0Qa (nil), earnings
worked throng at 029p.-

In March Ferrari Computer
Services reversed into the com-
pany and in July the newly
formed Ferrari Holdings
bought Message Data Switch-
ing Business and certain assets
of Commercial Cable Company
for £L35m cash. Earlier this
week the company made a £4m
recommended offer for UCL,
the troubled computer systems
supplier. Details of a £3m
rights issue are to be
flimrnmrpd soon

offer grossly undervalued its

shares, ft intended to bring out
a profits forecast within the
ngyt three days, it said. On Fri-

day, valid acceptances of the
offer had been received in
respect of about 1 per cent of
Chfltem shares, which brought
its holding up to about 10.7 per
cent of the share capital

Pennant loss

expands to

£687,000
Pennant Group, a Third
Market company with interests

in the fields of leisure and holi-

days in Norfolk and the Isle of
Wight, suffered a rise in its

losses from £481,000 to £687.000

for the first six months of 1989.

Interest charges rose £70,000

to £233,000. Profit on the sale of
fixed assets increased by
£25,000 to £39,000. Turnover
totalled pi asm (£Ll8m).

. Looking ahead, the directors

said it appeared that the holi-

day industry was going to
move away from the pure vol-

ume market and look for an
improvement in profits and
return on capital. They were
hopeful that for 1990 Pennant
would benefit from this trend

Stainless Metalcraft

Stainless Metalcraft, the
stillage support structure sub-
contract with Strachan & Hen-
shaw has been settled with a
final value of £iQ asm, which
has been paid in full. The
directors feel the sum yields a
satisfactory profit.

Back in 1968 whenwe set up the Bestever.UK And our£3 billion offunds under management gives

managed fond;wearingquice afoUowtag. us the added attraction of being the largestUK managed

In toe 2i yearssince then,therincerestform offlatterv^fand around.No wonder they’re all after the Widow.

®j© SCOTTISHWIDOWS
for service and the resohswehave achieved for them. Looking good for your money

#ifn,Wwt«in^HMWid>JSri»e.PattpeifenaaiiabnotiicccanijIracBide»iI»efiinifC.

^iMt^^TfcBi^hhiMgxneotCSWQl^MdScoaiAWidowa'Fiad&LifeAMtMflCfcSode^incmbeHofLaiitna.

TR Australia

gets approval

for change
in policy
By John Thornhill

TR AUSTRALIA Investment
Trust, a £45m fund managed
by Touche Remnant, has won
shareholder approval for a
change in investment policy

despite previous opposition
from River Plate ana General
Trust, which holds a 29.9 per
cent stake.

In a 10-minute extraordi-
nary meeting held at Touche
Remnant’s offices at Paddle
Dock in London, TR Austra-
lia's board carried two resolu-

tions enabling it to concen-
trate its investments in
higher-yielding Far Eastern
stocks.

TR Australia also won
approval to increase its

authorised capital, to carry
out a one-for-two scrip issue,
and to make a bonus issue of
warrants at a price of 105p.
Of the votes cast, 57.8 per

cent supported the resolutions

and 42^ per cent were against.

In view of the majority of the
proxies in favour of the resolu-

tions, River Plate said it would
not seek a poll or try to
adjourn the meeting.

British Steel
reminder of
final instalment
Call notices have started to go
out from British Steel remind-
ing shareholders that the final

Instalment of 65p per share is

doe by September 26.

Members who foil to meet
this payment win forfeit their
shares. They will receive back
toe first instalment «*<«««

expenses.
The instalment will raise

£1.3bn from nearly
400,000 registered share
holders.

Hoylake accuses BAT board
of attempting to frustrate bid
By Vanessa Houlder

THE WAR Of words
accompanying the £135bn bid

for BAT Industries continued
this weekend as Sir James
Goldsmith's Hoylake consor-

tium issued a response to the

BAT defence document
In a lengthly docmnent sent

to shareholders, Hoylake
attacked BAT’S performance
and accused the board of
attempting to frustrate the

hid.

In response, BAT described

the Hoylake document as
“highly selective and mislead-

ing”. It said the letter did
not contain a single new
argument.
Hoylake has criticised the

BAT management for using
toe US legal, political and regu-

latory processes to thwart the
Hoylake offer, in its response,

BAT countered by citing state-

ments in its favour from US
officials.

BAT also claimed that Sir
James Goldsmith had failed In
his attempts to uncover evi-
dence that BAT had not per-
formed for shareholders. "No
feats of statistical manipula-
tion can disguise the consist-

ent strength of BAT Industries*

outstanding record," it said.

CCS acquisition and rights
By Clare Pearson

CCS GROUP, the supplier of
contract labour to the building

trade, plans to acquire G
Blagg, a West Midlands build-

ers’ merchant, from fellow
USM-quoted company SEP
Industrial Holdings.

To finance toe £1.4m pur-
chase of Blagg, CCS is launch-
ing a rights issue on a one-for-

24J89 basis. SEP is also selling

Its half-share in Rankins Glass,
which constitutes toe rump of
its building products division,

for £400,000.

CCS joined the CSM in April

following the reverse takeover
of Bhiemel Brothers, the cycle
accessories group.

The consideration for Blagg
is being satisfied in cash by
means of a vendor placing
where all the shares
will be offered to CCS
shareholders.
SEP announced in March it

was putting up for sale its

building trade investments
division in a move to focus
attention on its now dominant
industrial fastener distribution

division.

It has warranted that net
tangible assets of Blagg will

not be less than £153,000 on
completion, and that during
the period from October 1988 to
August 5 it made pre-tax prof-

its of not less than £293,000.

The 50 per cent holding in Ran-
kins, bought for £428,000 in
1987. is being sold to Rankin
family interests.

CCS announced taxable prof-

its of £81,000 for the six months
to end-May on turnover 27 per
cent ahead at £1.72m, against

£L36m.

COMPANY NEWS IN BRIEF

DSC HOLDINGS requested
temporary suspension of list-

ing pending approval of reor-

ganisation. Suspension price
was82p.
FORWARD GROUP has paid
£2-2m for the freehold premises
at Bracknell occupied by its

Technolograph Microcircuits
subsidiary.

GREYCOAT has paid £18m for
the head lease of Roman
House, Wood Street, EC.
Finance will come from a deep
discounted facility to compen-
sate for the initial low yield.

Greycoat has been granted a
150-year ground lease by the

freeholder, which allows rede-

velopment
NEW GUERNSEY Securities
made £14,592 pretax profit for

first half of 1989 (£13,045) after

amortisation of preliminary
expenses £4,327 (£6,334).

OCEONICS GROUP has condi-
tionally acquired 81 per cent of

Rimpac, Australian electronics

company, for A$3m. In 1988
Rimpac incurred a net taxed
loss of A£1.17m, and net asset

value was A$339,000 excluding
mhHigihlM.

OPTIM GROUP, computer
systems house, showed turn-
over of £6jn hi half-year ended

April 30 1989 (£3.79m) and
losses at pre-tax level of
£471,000 (£484.000). Extraordi-
nary charge £351,000 for clo-

sure of Butel Technology.
Turnover of £14m (£10m)
expected for year and company
again should be in profit
(£506.000). Acquisitions
included in figures: Optim
Computers France; LPR Office

Supplies (Herts); JPR (Office
Equipment); Datawork Com-
puter Services.
ROCKWARE has acquired Sen-
tec, Lancashire-based metal
products maker, for £750,000.

Vendor is C Walker.

Interim progress leaves

Record 19.5% up at £1.8m
GOOD PROGRESS was made
by Record Holdings in the first

half of 1989, with sales up 17

per cent and pre-tax
profit ahead 1915 per cent.

The group is based in Shef-

field and makes over L000 dif-

ferent hand and power tools

for the engineering, woodwork-
ing and electronic industries,

and DIY market
Mr Michael Mallett, chair-

man, said markets were not
becoming any easier but
sales rose to £19.1m
(£1634m) and profit to £l-8m
(£L5m).
Some 13 per cent of the sales

growth was organic. Good
progress was made in the UK
industrial and retail sectors of

the hand and power tool mar-
ket

Overseas sales moved up
only to £5.53m (£5.35m)
as they continued to be inhib-
ited by unfavourable exchange
rates, the nhairman said.

Earnings for the period
worked through at 4

;
38p (S.75p)

and the interim dividend is

raised to lp (0.66p) to
achieve a better balance
with the final - 2.34p last
time.

Record has acquired
Burgess Power Tools and Pow-
erline. thereby adding wood-
cutting handsaw machine and
soldering and engraving equip-
ment to the portfolio.

BOARD MEETINGS
71m toUowfng companies have notified dares
of board meetings to me Stock Exchange.
Such meeting* arc usually hold tor lha Pur-
pose at eonxldeflng dividends. Official Indica-

tions are not available ae to whether me
dividends ara Inter ln«a or thiols and Bm sub-
divisions shown below im based mainly an
last year's timetables.

TODAY
Interims- A3W. Booker. Bowaler. Cone. Ven-
ture Trust. Cooper (Alan). Durham IDG),
Entesa. Hans Homes a Gardens, UtlattmB,
Unread. Pacific Assets Trust. Porvslr. Psion.

Ramoo OH. Technology Project Services. Uni-

dare. WUces (dames),
finals- Cantors. Johannesburg Cons.

NTUraiMTM

FT Share
Service
The following securities were
added to the Share Information
Service in Saturday’s edition:

Pacific Property Investment
Trust (Section: Investment
Trusts).

SmtthKHne Beecham Float-

ing Rate Uns. Lm stk 1990/92
(Industrials).

Abbeycreat Sop- a

Corton Bendi — Sep. 6
Dwta — —
Durham (DO) —

.

EriBi

Sep. 4
Sep. 13

Portal*
KTZ

Sep. 7
Sep 14

Serco Sap. 14
TT Qroup

Petare (Michael)
Yoriohira TV

Sep. 5
Dec. IS

l.G INDEX LTD, 9-11 GROSVENOR GARDENS, LONDON SW1W OBD
Tel: 01-828 7233/5699 An AFBD member Reuters Code: IGIN, IG10

FT 30 .
FTSE 100 .

WALL STREET
Sep. 2402/2412 45 Sep. 2752/2764 +20

Sep. 1987/1996 +2 Oct. 2413/2423 +5 OcL 2766/2778 +18

Prices taken at 5pm and change is from previous close at 9pm
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ALUANCE-s- LEICESTER
Alliance & Leicester

Building Society

£200,000,000 Floating Rate Notes 1993

In accordance with the provisions of die Notes, notice is hereby given
i

that, for the three month period, 3 1st August, 19S9 to 30rh November,
j

1989, die Noies will bear interest at die rate of I4‘% per cent, per annum.
!

Coupon No. IS will therefore be payable on 30th November. j989 at

£3,52 1-5S per coupon from Notes of £100,000 nominal and £176.08 per

coupon from Notes of £5,000 nominal.

S.G.Warburg Sc Co. Ltd.
Agent Bank

mmmmmmmiimnimmimuummmm

PKBANKEN
(incorporated in the Kingdom

ofSweden)

¥5,000,000,000

Floating Rate Notes
due 1993

Notice is hereby given that the
Rate of Interest for the Interest

Period from 2nd September,
1989 to 2nd March, 1990 is

5.03% per annum.

Interest payable on
2nd March, 1990 will

amount to ¥2.494.329 per

¥100,000.000 principal amount
of the Notes.

The Lon
Agent Bank
H-Tcrm Credit Bank-ong-Tcrm Credit

ofJapan. Limited

BRADFORD& BINGLEY
BUILDING SOCIETY

£100,000,000

Floating Rate Notes Due 1994

In accordance with ihc icrms and con-

ditions of the Sates. nonce is hereby
given that for ihe hirer months IhIlt-

cst Period from (and including) 31st

August. 1989 to (hul excluding! 5Uth

November. 1*9, the Notes will cany a
rate of irunes of 14!rift per cent, per

annum.
The relevant Interest Payment Date

will be 30th November. 1989. The
Coupon Amount per £10.000 will be

£350.60 payable against surrender of
Coupon No: 2

Bambros Bank Limited

Agent Bank

Thts ohu luuiuii r is hsiad m amphanu nil At rqpLtlum if The Sox* Exchange, h a ejected that tieobves n the Ltaioml Sccnan uJI

omxract uday. ut paid, mlhe tdeu- OnLnan Shura and. ftSj pad. m dir exaang asm! Oirinwy Stem md Preference 9ma anl a the Tlu
afomnraiomloei omumgrawnwiiMmn tpnmpcrsua SisafaiTibeJiir wJi iccmaies.

THEBECKENHAMGROUP pic
(mempmeudrn Entfsmi under die Cvmpama Acts 194S-I98I. number J809J99)

Introduction to the Unlisted Securities Market

arranged by Barclays de Zoete Wedd Limited

and

Rights Issue

of 6,5 13,556 New Ordinary Shares at 85p per share

Authorised

£1,936.127
£2.563.873

£4.500,000

Share Capital

following the Rights Issue

Ordinary Shares of 5p each
9% Redeemable Cumulative Preference Shares of£1 each

Issued and tn be
issued, fully paid

£1.302.711

£2.563,873

£3.866,584

In addition, there are outstanding 2.559.237 Warrants each to subscribe for one Ordinary Share of 5p.

The Beckenham Group's principal activities are the design, manufacture and installation ofductwork far the air-

conditioning, heating and ventilating industry and the provision of mechanical and electrical services for the
construction industry. This business arises mainly Iron? major contracts for rhe development or refurbishment of
commercial, industrial and public property in London and the South East. The Beckenham Group is also

engaged in the distribution to industrial customers ofductwork components and ofengineer?' tools.

The Council of The Sleek Exchange has conditionally granted permission to deal in die Unlisted Securities

Market in the whole of the Company's Ordinary Share capital in issue and to be issued pursuant to the Rights
Issue, in its issued Preference Share capital and in the outstanding Warrants, and ir is expected that such
permission will become effective today. It is emphasised that no application has been made for such securities to

be admitted to listing.

Full particulars rebring to the Company are available in the statistical services maintained by Exrel Financial
Limited and details of the Rights Issue are set out in a circular sent to shareholders cm 9 August 1989. Copies of

those particulars and of the circular can also be obtained during normal business hours up ra and including

6 Seprembei 1989, by collection only, from Cimpany Announcements Office of The Stock Exchange,
46 Finsbury Square, London EC2, and on weekdays lexcluding Saturdays) up to and including 22 September
I9$9, the latest date for acceptance and payment in foil under the Rights Issue, from:

dc Zoete& Bevan Limited, Fiske &. Co Ltd,

Ebbgate House, and Salisbury House,
2 Swan Lane, London Wall.

London EC4R 3TS London EC2M 5QS
A September I9S9

87.01
1 87.14 89.29 83 751 127.4

1
49.18

98 2D
| 98.28 1 98.40 1 99.59 1 95.21 1 105 4

1977.91 1992.71 1447.81 1992.7

;

I

r

|,| MM 1 I Ml I B! HM if' IM I !! MM \ I

2407-51 2387.91 2381.3 1 2380-81 2397.4 1 2395.1 f 2407.5 1 1782.8
{

2443.4
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FT UNIT TRUST INFORMATION SERVICE For Current Unit Trust Prices on any telephone rj*0&FBcX-06364 + five digit oode

(listed below). Calls Chareed a: 38p per minute peox and 25p off peak. Inc VAT

UNIT TRUSTS

K3. C&2 SS PJB SSL

Buckmaster MangrotCot-td-Ccirtfl,
humr *1170.4 176 2 107 01

oSS *JB StrSSTfc 82. oiS ¥BS pJB KErSK‘35 ^ C« ^8S pffi SS.

SS.

lAceura Untul ....
Intewoliocial 5Ucam Ufiiu) 5i

Smaller Co'i S'

(Aaron UnlU). . 5|
Inv Pont olio . . 2>j

Ml* Hlh 3*0 6'

120 B 1206 10T34
1783 1TOX IBBB

Abbey Untt Tst Mngn CIOIHUH
SO Hotcemrani Rd. Bourwmontn 0345 717373
Hlqlr lecernf
American Ireane... b|57 01 57.54* 61 Z7b 47 WOO
Ella & Firm lot .. . bp) 00 110 W Life 60BX8MHU
High Inc EwKy ..feULOO 143 8a 153 0& ISWCffi
World-tor Bowl 6IM2.8 ZOLB* 214 8W 93M0003
Casital Growth

118 6 121b 124 011.77
130.4 U3 6 141BU .77
3814 60 17 62.03UJ3 -
bOJS 62.47 64.405J3 -
30 74 SL 1* 32 *016 01 -

Barrage Unit Tst Mangmt Ltd <0905IF

>... 61

. _ 01-407 5966 CttAral D. Kooll RHe
F&BSdUHioU 5I;|49 77 49 77 53.671(073 - EJCoiTrust S

American Growth ...

Oslui Puttie b
ton A toridngr

.
. bi

Canttal bzif flee _ . 0|

Camdtr ft Energy _
1942 tourerhe
European Ca»lal....fe
Cmul
hunuumjl b
Japan . b
Uunnini.. —

b

UK Gromit Acc 6
UK Growth Dirt 6
US Enipnglng Cm .... b

Ethical
. .b

2040 306 4 214 6
1041 1112 110.40
1662 164 S 160 7
47 01 87 01 87.11
U13.70 117 0 124 5
bO 73 61 91*365 87

...93 IB 43 45 94 450
-6|l87.d0 187 aca 200 9

34. 7B 5828
1143 11b 0 123 5® 00
41 74 41.74 48 12
207 B 217 0 230 4
138b 144 7 154 0[ . ._
33 41 53 41 34 27to D0le«J15

Income ft Gromit _ btHl 40 328.10 144 It.44MS 16
31.04 32.32 55 671x801*0017

|«0M

UK balanced Inc
UK Balanced Ace . . .

UKGrowUlAoc 6
UK High Inc Inc 6,
Mb America dec _. .b|

Far tavern Act
tonananAcc b
UK. Cm a F I loc 3,
UK GiltftFIAcc...Xl

117 Fcrxhrocn SL LondonEOM 5Ai_ 01-480,7213 SSi?°~r *“
ShcOldGILtftFl .11.134 10 3410 34 86(2 881*0216

“*lr

CCF Foster BralLTwaite UT Mrrct U1001F Eicon Ltd Q600IF
1 White Han Y»d. London SE1 UK _ ".

51-14477 49 77 SJ.67llJ7a

CCL Unit Trusts Ltd (34O01F
74 Sumner* Bash Green. W128SD 01-7407070
UK General Tfl._..5 lef34 41 6037 64 S7I2.23T
Global T* 31, 47 12 47 63 50.94b ol
Recsecre Ta 51, 152 04 52.84 58.80ll.92

OBC Unit Tst Managers Die Q200JH
Cotton Ctr Cottons Lone Ldn SE1 20L 01 Z346000
Growth Fd Acc . .31117.9 UU 125 .9W.07 14020
CS Fund Managers Limited (JOOO)H
125 High Hoigorn, London WCLV bPV 01-2421148
CS America 51 be- 24 6b 24 70.4bU.63|«C21
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46078 HRIcEhtcKebIRLIJII? 2 123J I -146385 CapttJJ Growth lAeS. . 107 6 1131

, r . ... OeBOshltau) in 6 1B0Z
46483 Ideal Insurance Co Ltd Deooui iacc) 2*3* 27b 9

Mow firm Lan. Birmingham B13 BUG 0214494101 EunwantCapi. led D 1734

I

jmu, Managed Fd 113.0 118.7 - 46705 Eumpea (Azz)._ .2536 26*4
feBtaK Managed J 102.9 108.1 1 -i - EquliytGap) — TO.2 517 4

E4urt»iA«J 7370 795 B

Ioteriife Assurance Co Lid giu iCapi 1580 Z7i 2

Mercury Ufe Assurance Co Ltd
I *OTtl 33 Kin*William 5l. London EC4ft9A5 01
_ TSKS PorUolio 51 8 54 5
- lawrnatlanql 51.9 54b‘L3L» UK Equity. . 510 53*
- d-sn/. British BbcCtilD 525 550
- ^7 494 5L9—
- a^a UK Smaller Cos. *9*
- UK Income 49 2
- a?fun Amer it* it 54b
- AMdf Janenoe *8 7

_ Jg41 Pacific Bxsxn 5*9
_ 2Sj|S European . S16
. inu Fixed Interest 49 0

a ISS? Property 48 4
- *2845 Stag Society 4 Deo .Jl4B 4
- 42847

-(42854 MdgtaFd....;.™;.;.. » |
_ 428S5 UFEsxHfFf 6*0
— 4285* iroeramionaiFd ... 60 7

. <3057 Money Mariei Fd 53.0

- 42858 Flwfl lBltpeM Fd- 5L3

-1 4Z9B4 Pearl Assurance (Unit Funds) Ltd
—1 42905 252 Musi HOlSarn. London WC1V7EB 01-4058*41
-I 42986 Prop Drf. iGrwsu

. ... 187 1 197 0 - 43235
Prop Act (Grets)

.

3115 317 9 - 4323b
. Eauii) iGraisJ 814 1 878 0 - 43137

Muraged 'GrotU.. .. 584 1 614.9 - *3138
Proa. See. iNetJ 140 b 1401 - 43139
Eaudy . 9(1).. 187 5 197 3 - 432*0
Manages 1 Neil 17J.o 1*3.8 - 4J241

-2802800 imerraitwl met) .. 1«J4 if’ b - 43241
Gill * Fid httcrasL

. . 10t».9 111* - 43243
- - Manes Fund ... 1084 114.1 - 43144
- - Prari Assurance (Unit Lie ken Pens! Ltd
_ _ RrtM*n(5ene»lJ 57*1 606 5 - 43245
- - 8w Marts* If* 2)... I«5 4 205 7 -4324*
- - ReiManiSerNes.31.— 129 5 109 5 - 4*4*1

- RciCasn 134 4 14*7 - 43147
- - R« Cash (Series 31 115.0 1100 - 4*4*3

Phoenix Assurance Co Lid
Pbaeniy huh. flcuclitf kill. Bnaal
Ute Assurance Funds

,WHItpAlM . 4*9.7 494.pl
Eb"i Ph Eq U14 2 451 51
PtmJcn has fund
Pnacnlz
UKEmmvAK 220 9 2325; Midland Ufe Umlted

£
- 4M? Noraiidi Hse. Cnmimclal Rd. SaathampignOTO) 729929 - -- 2200 =32^

_ ^52 AdveoturtutFd [589 62 0| -fd*097 - j« 4 >» 4

-^53 H? 606 ilffiS iJn tto!4*OK Flirt Irifrrt i

3S33 ••

— -it101 5cC. Lmh £cc. J 3.37 o lc^fi
- 4b*Q2 Spcnal Wlnqefl A«.a. I HI l> ZOlt

Er6S5W!.iu-» 123*1
An SWlr C!f AM.. J;i2 0 119*

- Interiife Assurance Co Lid simcapi - . 2582 Z7i 2

I S*B 149-L51 High Rd OtxdMlI Ulh PM6 6fjJ 01-5977566 ffltf
4
iSJ

SSSlfirir-B? ilSu gSSS :.;.::...:-: w*
0
i ill?-41370 rrousmi Mngd Fd I10BJ iin.ki

totei-Uiaed iCasd 105 8 111 1

41408 42043

1

-146700 Pro Stewart. Ivory. llSl.2 X27-J]
e| 42157 toCS BnaRfriMia-.llB 2 10351

' Formterpnero plow rtepkace 0279 626261

- 4^370 Pon«)P Ungd Fd 1108-3 114.11

- 42971 Krista Life Assurance Co Pic
- 42373 Leojbdw Hom, 20 Dkswtfl SL EC1-4074 Glottal Mnga Ser J _. 387 1 4076
- 9??7S Global Eawlx Ser 9.... 4419 4*50
- 41376 Gkuul Fealnt£er3.... 335 4 3531
- 4M77 Global Prep 5fr 3 .

. Z14.0 2905
- 4gn» Global Cash Ser 3 1500 158 1
- 42379 GHBalMnodSet 4 -... 103.2 108.6
- 41380 Giosal Equfiy Ser 4. .. 104J 109 8
~ 42381 Global Fid bit Ser4— 987 1039
- 422gZ Gtebal PrgpScr4 1M4 1088
- 4Z383 Global CashS«4 970 102.6
~ 038* Universal Security ..... 1250 1319
~ 4085 Unhwrui Balancad 1271 133 4
“ 42386 Untrorsal Oppnny.

.

131

A

1451
- 46W ummsal UN Equity .. 990 104.4
“ 44470 UBwenal Eurofqmly-. 13S* 142.7
- 46482 Unteertaiy. Aroer 131-9 138.8
,? -- Umxvtal Japxpnw—ZJ 1570 1*^8

kdex-Lskd Gilt lAo)... 1*10 170.6
lauroatloeaHCaB) 130 9 137 5

20L1 m3
“ J

2®” teua InrfCiUl _. UB1 114 1-42*45 iBUInsUrtl.. 1015 190 7
- f2?

46 Jtaaa'Cap* . 19*5 ax,

5

“ JJB»" fA«J' 3010 317 2> 42648 Managed ICapi 35* 0 373 9- “ Morttart lAcci 547 0 574 5- - PPP Fund (Cap).—. 3598 3779- " PPP Furt (An) 552 B 680 6- - Pacific iCapi MI.4 307 1- PaaheUo).- 449 2 <710
“ ii£K ProjwrtylCapl I5*.l 1*1.9

: §SJ 2^.1

- j^
62 UKmSb*ICxui.ZZ... 1«* 147.7

-
Municipal Ufe Assurance Ltd

I uSEi 1 SesUd® Hse Sq. Ma.dnone ME14 LXX 0622
- qaSj lml!i*l Easily la* 0 173 0
- 423*3 Aeeum Easily - • 219.5 231.5

> 418*4 Accum r.ljiuged 209.0 220 5 —
_ qvgB* Aeeum Fire Star. 173.0 183.0
- 410t>* Accum World 115 0 132.0
- *20*7 Accum Lifetime.. 113.4 113.4 -

- 42868 few Are Equity . - 246 0 2590
- *28*9 Pens Ace Managed.... 233 5 2*6.5
- 4*870 fen Act ln>.l ... 192.0 203 0
- 42871 PmArcDrpo-.il. 158 0 167 0
- 41872 Pens An Fm Sear ... . 19*0 2070
- 41873
- 41674

Z ami NEL Britannia Assce Co Ltd
- 42877 Mlltort Caun Porting Surrev 0306
- 428*8 Capital Growth . . . L3* b 1*3.8
- 41879 Managrt income 113 2 129 7
- 42880 CaoGwtnSrrE 116.2 132.8

-42681 Mnrt IncororSer B .... 1133 U4J
- 41882 NBA UTPaniollP 1163 U*3
- 42883 MUhitUK
- 42884 Managrd UiogSoc NX) 0 105 3
- 42385 KIM Ent Mgn Casure 108.7 1144
- 42686 Sonar. w«gAnro.ua 105 5 111.1
- *2887 rlar iltv Mgg Ema ... 1190 usj
- 42088 GartmoreMfldU.K 103 7 109 2 -
-4*1889 llatnasoos Mgo Ctesal 1D2_* 1080 -

JewnACenAa 1255 2 ZM.6
AmencanTum Ace. . 13*0 1*10

*hotvx PregxrrvTsL Aee . .1125* Z37 2
1 Sorcial r.’.pgd to 1 1«*J 104 5

..Ml PtHtfllA'GT
' atwMt.waiAce „ !750 IS* 7

_ avxtl US&Grri-illec
.

11*4 130 9
_ IS} 1 Are-SMeS.-iAK 9j <o 103.5
- _

14 Jaean 4. Gmerxi to 15* 1 2*7 5
Far East * Gen. —cc 207 5 213*

Z 0".Ca;iuito 11*0 13**
T?Si2 Eurepeari- :. .21*0 17* *

- 43M9 SOKUI K.ffl3 43t.... 17*0 163.1

Pioneer Mutual Insurance Co Ltd
:* Crete* Be ,1 v.Ateflro Lito-nwi ,051-9286*55

0306887766 L'xnOeiv.iK* Caifei 3 **0 *
- 43035 nlonrvfuM 1116 120 3
- 4305b Pens l.’.rce F4 Tr.U 119 3 12*2
—f **330 Pm> Mr a 3 f a -.Acc :*r; 15*4
- 4*331 Pen FT32 Fa iln.y. ... ieO 3 1*9 3
-143047 Per* FTjO Fd Jto' .. 197j 107 T

Pnt OVas tfgF* i.nl . '» * 83 8
- - gmsCuasUtfaiieti v- 7 102 *
— — Pens F xd Id*, rc ilmU.. 10** 1170
- - FemFiali rcito: 1303 137 7
— — Pern CLroj>itFd ;te.i‘ 10*4 LUO
— — Pens Dew.ll Fd Cto... 130* 13'

5

31* 1 3*1 2 - 43273
437 3 **0* -*3273
1216 119 3 - 4327*
”9 3 12*2 - 43175
1*7 1 15*9 -43276
ieO 3 1*9 3 - *3277
(97j 107 7 _ 43278
'J 6 - *3279
97 7 102 9 - *3380
l**s L.23 - *3281
130 3 U7 7 - 4JDJ2
lOuS LUO - 431H3
-30 * 137 5 > 4328A
Continued on next page
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FT UNIT TRUST INFORMATION
OfSrr View City-
Price Gnu lure

Premium; Life Asssrasice Co Ltd
37-39. Pcrrymo-jat Fees P-iiixanK Kv.r

13*0 i*:o
o :« c-

74£.0 J-a j
1 s».o i«® ?

o
:rbO

BeiitfitveScc Fi . .

Uqurcetr
Ewcpui< . .

G7 “Aid igra
Cjrrnujre EAnqg
Cranon
GHL
Cliul
Hr-jfi Ire .

Intara'.isiul Eauiiy.

Juin
Mj-uexd.
Frooeni
P. W Imperial Gold
U> Edu-“.
Pfm*on ^icci
Am-niuD
Building Sot Fd . .

.

balanced
Curoncjrr
German
Gill. . . .

intcnwicaal Ecu>ti
Jasjr .

Mjiuqrd.
Pnew . .

.

UK couilr ...

i;-»o
if; 3
50 3

:2: a
2C4 J

*->0
0

!?" 0
7oJ O

:«c ci

::«o
isao
:*i.owoM 0
=230
Jit 0

US 0
ij

c
53 3

:£j c
::sa

C
<.?u
»:d
I'iO
343 0

Ktf 0
lie 0
147 0
l»o 3
isro

*128o
J32B9
*3i«4
*3240
*3291
4«OJ
IWJ
43CW
472*5

*3)57
*3198
Ujeq
~x>oo

*3301
43302
43.303
*J3CS
43308
43J04
«J3iO
4.33U
433U
4333J

Prudential Hoitjorn Pension Ltd
30 Old Burling!*" SU L ndraiWlXILB
Unwed eOO 5 *J2 2
Equllr .. ---..877.0 423 2
GitalEiu'ir •• .-25*4 273 &
rindlmmd. 445 5 437 u
Piwirtj 403 4 424 7
C*n IMJ 168 3
lidouWCIIL . 204.7 215 5
Guaranteed I2W
imera-tiooii Weni.. 206.1 217 0
NcTtt American . _ 85 5 "0 1

Jjiw . . ISO 3 1583
EimMD 1U4 7 110 3
Soma I Situation . ... 124.1 130 7
Canmnuihm !123 118 3
Smiikr Comwto .Uni) 1223
Inpiuunl Small Col . 146 h 154.4

Prudential Pensions Limited
Hoibcra Ban Damn EC1H2NH
Diie/eiiiiun kugM. .

EduKf «UG Jll .

lntceiailor.il Asg 30
loii "cm An? 30 . .

Flint lnt Ail? 10
indri L4IIMA1I? 30 .
Proy r Co? 30 .

CMC due 30 .-
-1 43314 Pra44fllRl ReUneniedl Pi*

Professional Life Assurance Co Lid
Frobrtfrer Ms*. NWcn Gite SnUirTUi, 0703 232323
Pernem MkVicen Fund |4J 31 12i"' - “3'»i
ftraloxn Coin Fund 179 42 £3.601 -1 42264

Prolific Life & Pension Ltd
Stra-nongJie hcnfljll Cumcrr* LAh *B£ 0538 733733

Man -den Fund we BjLirudGrexnn Uxoogrd Fund

liltfads
balanced Gwth Urge
AdvenuiiOD? Alnqd .

Sxra* Until . . .

Cash Fd . .

Proem i Fund . .

631 6 665 6 -
—

i:j6 :23; —
237 2 250 0 —
292 9 311' —

-

335 4 321 * —
326 * 34') —

—
J*M 4 430 3 —
307 1 323 7 —

—
—

2^ 2 3112
140 1 170 3

—
—

•43) 141 5 —
»5 5 325 0
1110 117 0

—
—

103 5 110 5

60e) 639 3 -|

—
1-Jf. 2 261

)

-
—

42*6 4481 —
—
—
—

172 4 1815 —
n rra 1 —

4J0 7 453 J
—

357 7 37b 6 —
ITS 4 188 4 —
I5ol 164 4 —

—
—
—

1T6 7 186 1 _
147 0 175 a —

—

114 8 120.9 —
its) 1)4 5 —

—
IQS 2 110 6 “

926GH 0702
133 : 140.2 —

134 5 —
1238 —
173 6 —
313 7 —
1257 ”

lot MxnPrm-on fd
InvUia bin Bd Fd
Ire At-rx Ctdct Bd Fdicl

FVsitnr rrep 9d Fd _

Flute tftreqrb* Fd
ScetCil Man Inc. Fd

Property Growth Assur Co Ltd
Sun Alliance Hate. Hantum
ProaerV Fans .

Prefer.

7

Fund (Ac .

.

Agrrculiural Fund.. .,

Auric. Fin'd (A) . .

Alter Mil. Fund
Aocey Mil F-J iAJ .

.

fnmem-m: Fond . .

.

Inurnment turd (A*.
Eauity Fond
Eaull, Fund <Ai
Money Fjird.

Money Fund >A>
AciiLirUI Fund .. .

Gili-Edcnf Fund . ..

S
lt-Esgrf Fd. IAl—
tlieAnnunr

Immed Ann'tt
Intf&niaulFd

Preoertj Growth I

All w-llur Ac. UIS ..
Inv Fd Uu
PaniCirFd Uts.
Con* Pc"% Fd. .

.

Car.Pia.Caa Ut... .

Min. Pen!. Fd - . ..

Min Pen! C4P. Ut.

.

Poo Ben-. Fd. . .

.

Prop Pern Cap UlS. ...

Bid) Sot Pen UL.
BO? Soc Cap UL ...

GiKsPem Fd. . .

GiHsPem Fd Cad .

Equity Pert! F?
Emmy Pen-. Fd Cap
Inel Pens Fd.
Inti Fm Fd Cap .

.

467.4
444 a
620.8
60SZ
3336

SSI
2465
«7.4
«7.9

es
2715

s&s
502.2
io: b

AAmartieiUd
5375 M>S6

«7J
!s2i
7b3.7
482.8
5670
3685

2*3 D
208.5
6683
478 4
240 0
W>2

Prorldence Capital Life Assc. Co
30 U ibridij" Rd. Lnadd^ W12 8P&
UKEdiniyAcc . .

UP Fliefl Ini AtC. ....

Inti CauiVes *«. - ••

UK ManaordAct
Property Act . . _._
Money Ate. —
Special MarVtr Act—
JapjnCauiEyAcc.—....
Kdnii American Acc.. ..

Pacific Ace.
Technology *X-
Nat Resources Act...—

.

Euraccan Ace. - . -
Residential Prep Act-..
Swiss Emilies Act.. ..

Hooq Kong Act. . .— ..

UK H'gn Inc Ed Act-. .

Int Fixed Interest Act...

Int Managed Act - . -
HIP (jlanaoefl Ace. 1116.4 122 71
Total I

-

UK Flied Int Initial...

.

Iml EaalUes Initial

UK Managed Initial

Prsceny Inmal
Moner lailiJl

Sate ill Marin Initial...

.

Japan Edully initial

.

Nom American l.nual.

Pat lit Imual
Tecnnoloor Iniual . ...

Nat Resoarces Initial..

.

Eunopean uitUI
Residential Protitnlt...

Swfct Equitla Initial...

Hpnq Kong Initial -.

UK HI9h Inc £q loll. ..

Im Fi.ed loiercst IWL.
lot Managed Inlt.

HIP Managed Inlt

Broker Finds
Higfl Pertomuiree
Towemill FdArr-
YRAEaecutlreFo . .

f Global Growth
IHi
IM
uincomUoneiAx

—

I Balanced.

175 0
«6 3
008
1310
Ul.B

55.2
146 5
12? 1

101.4
122-4

800
4*J
95 a
138 1
117.9

H F Speculator Fd- ..

PEP Atom 1
1 . .,

PEP Cautionary

AAFS Int M.v> Find ...

IMitllMl PobIoa fun
UKEduitrAec. . 230.0 252 1

UK Flied Interest A«. 1755 1B5.2
Inti EquitiesAct - 246 B 260 5
UK Managed Acc 133 7 M3 7
Prewar ate. .. „ 212.2 223.9
Money Aa 1Z7.0 134 0
Special Martel Act.... 270 2 285.1
Japan Eda.tr Acc *51.9 2655
Njrth American Acc. . 149J 1575
Pacific Act . 199 5 2105
TecmwwAcc... ITS a 188 7
Natural Rescunes ACC. - 1U2 1M.5
Enreocan Acc. .. .— 126 1 133.Z
PWdenUal Proa Ace.. . 1172 123.7
Swiu Eaoltles ia . ...39 2 414
HongKoogAn. 47 8 50 5
Un High Inc Eqo Act.. 78 B 832
Int Fleet! InterestAcc... 52.7 556
lot Managed Ate 59.7 62 9
Grwo Poston Ponds . .

Equity Acc . . 838 4 864 4
r lied intrrett Acc... .. 15025 51&1
Managed Act 11342 13651

Provident Life Assoc Ltd

Unit Fund iM (redI

Equity Fund
IntcnulJnnal Fd . .

Flirt Interest Fd
Property Find.
bum • Linked Fuad. . ..

Oeooth Fund . . .. . .

Pern MliediOrtDFd...

oxeRGZl 2S 0256
1077 0 1130 9 *
2510 2b3*
164 2 172.4 —
157) 165.4 —
219 4 230.4
1*6 0 153 3 —
138.9 145.8 —
256.6 269.4 flte

1247 _
1277
112-1 —
1251 “
133 4 —
120) —
113) —
108 9 “
125 6 —
114)

Discretionary Fuad
Eoullr Fund
Filed Inlcnst Fund-...
late sat Icmal Fund —
Progeny Fuad
Inder-Unkud Fund
Deposit Fund -
SAFCantllldallM.-.
S&F Balanced.

,

SB F Maoism GrranhJ

Prerideirt Mutual Life Assc. Assn-
Wlllldd fid. KlldWn. Haps EG40LP, . 0433734000

' * ' 3382 356 0
2702 284 4
*B1.0 506 3

Equity MIL.- 394.2 404 4
Imler Lmkrd Gilt Drd. . laaJ 1514

120 a 126 7
3112 327 6
248 6 261.7
2105 221.6
163.1 176.9
13L1 l«.b
144 7 1523
146 2 153.9
1168 122.9

Managed Old
Managed InI'-

Equity Ord
-UllfhIL.-
..JB* Linked Gilt Did.
Inte Linked Gill Inh.
Overseas Egnil/ Oni

.

Overseas Equity ln(L

.

Property Ord.

Property IniV -
Find Interast Ord . ._
Flied Irtenrst Ml
DnrealtOrd.
Deposit inlt.

Pmrtlon Funds
Managed On! —..

Managed Inlt.

Equity Ord
Equity inn.
Pen Ind Ltd Gill Ord. ..

Penlnd Lad Gill lalb. ..

Orencas Equi:r Ord....

OrertMi Equity Irtt.-

FVcperr. Ort.
Pnerrtf IrrIL - .....
Fiurdlnixeess Ord
Fired Interest Inlt. — .

Deposit Ord —
Deposition.

4148
335 2
62LB
496 7
157.8
131.7
3612
2»> 1
2562
2D9 7
1121
169 5
140 0
152.4

44 1.7
!528
654.5
5228
166.1
1386
3913
3045
269 7
2155;
2233
17B4
200 8
160.4

Prudential Assurance Co
Holborn Ban Lontoa EC1H2NH

Managed Aug 30 J254 B 2&»l

PrudBitial Hoibom Life Ltd
30 Old Burllcgl'btSt. London W1X 1LB
Hdbia Senes I Life Fords
Managed StU 6 5W 6
Equity . 11601 1229 6
Fried Inlerea.. .. - 308 9 4G9 a
Property -. 398 9 4J9 4
Cash . . - :»4g 278 6
Imunta'.ienal . . 403 2 4245
HdibornSerin il Life Ftmai
Mam geo . . ... - 557 5 586 9
EiUlrr - 1141 9 1202 1

Munu;iorial ...... W4 416J
Fried Iptl J78 8 348 B
Preewtr 388 7 4g? 2
Cash- 2583 3718
Profit Basin . . - 215.7 227 1

North American 176.7 I86 0
European. 168 8 177.7

HgApq Balanced Euttli 120 0 126.4
mutant fCraWtmn- 11B.8 125 1

43484
43485
43436
43487
43488
43489
43490
43491
434“2
43493
43494
43495
45J16
43497

43498
43499
43500
43501
43502
43503
43504
43505
43506
43507
43508
43500
U91D
43511

01-4039222

-1*3512

—* 46553
46554

-146555
- 465*6
-146557
-I 46558

43513
43514
43515
43516
43517
43513
45519
43520
43521
43522
43523

Managed Aug 29 .

Cain iso 29
PnrCentICI Pu

'

PmMng4 5em 1

Pro UK Eg Bent 1 .

Pern Ini Sem 1
Pert Fixed 5ept t

Pe-t Inuei U Sept 1 1

Peps C*h Sect 1-. ..

.

ill* 40 172.40
tied 13 mi*
C2B 19 2" 10
LI- 60 1278
C74 40 75 30
(63.92 64 71
£11395 120 63
(21 ate? 214653

209 <

162 2 174.4
3(4 6 339 5
1*26 £37H
i;i o ie-i 6
163 6 1?2 a
Uli 136 6

43525
43526
43527
43528
43529
43530
435J1
43532
43533
43534
43535
43536
43537
4353a
46559

43540
43541
43542
43543
43544
43545
43546

43549
43550
43552
43552
43553
43554

Sccttlsta Amicable,
Exempt Intel. Inlt
Dp. Aram. .

Exempt. Prop, ul
Exempt Casa iViil". "...

Do Accunt
Exempt Ural. Inh
Da Accurt
Bunding Scaler/ Fd _.

-CaafaL
2203 231 9
3X7 o
1593
2512
129.0
203i
*34J
370.1
115.9

3t5 9

2645
1356
2t4 3
246.9
389.6
122X1

43866
41867
43468
43869
43870
43671
43872
43873
43874

ScottKb Equitable Ufc Assce- Soc.
031-S56 9101tf*28 51 A0d»m SO. EdMO

Mr ied
U< Coolly
Intxnuuenjl.. 11955
AroertCJA
Eureceap
Japan ....... . .

.

Pacific .. .. ..

trurelco.
F'trtlntrnec... . .
fnqetedUiPod . .

F jrefgp aaodlCmOKr
Gash
Pens Miug ... ...
Pro UK Eailty
Pnlnroraioul .

Pens Ameacjo ...

Pea European . . .J
PeaJapuD. .

Pern PasH Is

Pure Hug letrret

.

Pcm l—Iff* Linked. . .Pm Cash
Pern Pr-reerey .
PmsEteicjl.
riwudilm
Bxiliui Gifford Japan.

135 4
195 9
243 7
232 1
183 4
1245
at./
148 4
IW U«
4874
5212
571

4

1568
2018
2804
C7b B
2C9 6
1342
U2156
37*0
118 7
240.9
216.9

1893
175.6
2£? 8
163 6
2062
256 6
2444
1931
131.1
1176
1563UOM
513 1
5487
601.5
165.1
212.5
2952
5»?

1*L74?
23D0
1250
253 6
228 4

3^2
4331?
4 3718
4JJ1?
43320
43321
43322
43323
4)3-4
43325
4)?:o
4332?
4J32B
43329
4JJ30
46332

Fid Inf Fund
Imrrnjliorul

High IntamL .

Far East
fisah Ayncnun
SpKialS'M.
fsOntil'Wy
Esua me Fd
Corrro-.iMe A Oil; Fd
Aynce'can Income . .. .

Gilt Fund 20.. ._ ...

Eure; can Fund . —
Prro Jl Fish! int... ..

Sri! in Funds
«r,L

i| “ji* pros A=_ .

CCwcareuj lie; Pr= Set _
Jecare Mneu Pros Ac L.
aoiiDl-g S«. 4<c.

PrKertr Pros Acc
Fli Int Pew Aqc..

. .

Ediinr Pens Acc.
imcrerj.-uui Pros Ac- .

Hign Ine Pros Acc.
Teen Pens Act
N American Pea Acc

Far Eastern Pen Ace
SceeialSiuPmAcc.
Extri Irccire Pent Fd
Caneoigk A Gut Pro

American Im Pen . .

Euroce-m Pens
Managed Crsfi Pens ..
Pmf A Furt Pens . .

Cfliv Funds
Acorn Manned Fund.. 1T6 7 186 1 [

- 43348
Portfolio 2CC0 ...1670 175 8 - 43349
BatdP mud Mantwd . till 117 01 - 43353
PflM Uax&n-Jidmc. J1J4 8 120.9) - 43io6
0 Vi'C Growth 6 Irene
NCH Inc&Grguith -
NCH Managed -

Far Capital Unit and Otherpnm ring 0539-733733

Property Equity & Life Ass. Co

Regent? Life Assurance Co Ltd
Regency Hie. Lanark Sq. London E14 9XS.
AggyetifC PtTHo Fq. _.

r

Balanced Ptfllg Fd .

Crusl Jir. Ptflia Fd ...

Elite Fund. .......

Eurooun Final

Far East Fir'd
Fixed Intern! Fund ...

Inteirmtimal Fund. _.

Me» e> Fund ... _ .

rj Aroeiican Fd
Pre-snap Fond..

U> Equity Fd
A.! M im Dlpan Fd.
Sislm Select lire

CnjaSgirvj Firs* 8a. .

ExTcMxslrtFJ .

HaroNici Growtn Fd.
6crttie? haiq LR PgrL
UlltagumrSortPBrL
Snire G'ohji Fd
Harawitk T j Fu_.

-y405
43332
-*3333
43334
«7335
43336
43337
43338
43339
43340
43341
4;.J42
43343
43344
43345
46753
46333

125 0
327.6
1243
119.2
94 1
104.0
2442
2fl«4
179 4
1278
422.4
4G4 7
99.4
116 2
110.2
1022
111.2
103J
121 8
118.9
.726 -- -

All funds turn rquraiienl pension fart. Scries 2 prKres

above others MltaMefromRrgau» Lift.

1315
3448
131 0
1254
990
114 7
25 7 0
304 6
1688
1345
4446
425.9
104 6

lluO
107 6
117 1
1140
128.2
125.2
76 4

43556
43557
43558
43559
43560
43561
*3562
43563
4J564

—| 43565
43566
43567
43568

-| 43569
43671
43572

-) 43573
43674
46120

Reliance Mutual
Reliance Kouse. ToohrMoe Welb. Kent
Pew.it Acc Fd . ..[126.1 132.7
EquityAcc Fd 334 7 3‘-2-4Eauity Acc
UjiihM 4cc Fa
Pros Fd ' 1st issue' . .. .

Prop Acc Fd (2nd Is)...

Uoa Trvst Mn Fd.. .

.

EL Pension Fundi
Delimit Acc.
Eiiuilt Acc .....

Flied im Acc
Cillnd* Ldk Acc
Managed Acc

Royal Heritage Life Assurance Ltd

43364
4337a
43371
43372
43373
43374

ilAU
43375
45376
43JT7
4337B
43379
4J3C0
43381
4)382
43383
43384

2SS
43387
43368
43389

38
43392
43393

43394
43395
43396
43397
43398
43399
43400
4jJ01
43402
43403
43404
<3405
43406
43407
41408
43409
43410

01-«0 020flD7»?62S2«
507 21

507J 534 0

7C6

20 Clifton Si. EC2A4H]l
MuiilGwtb. .

Mum Gwth 'A* .....
Oo Prop 437.0 ’60-0
Op Eon ity 832.2 876 0
Op High YM 356.3 377 2
Op Man 629 6 662A

,

On Dm 279 2 2«3 4^3341
00 Bnd 257.8 265 1

OclncDl* 209 0 220.0
Op Im Kao. . 351 0 3«A5
OpUSi . 91 5 96.4
Oo Emerging Co's . 315J 331
Patras Forty-Series 8£ C Au.
Pronay
Equity
Fixed InurtkL
Manned
DeoaslL . . ......

Garmore Global . _
GJitmcraNA.
GartmorrpAlhc ..

Henderson Acc. . ...

RertMaal MPCrretnal Mon
Framlitglon Bng
Gxnmore Pen M“gd ...

Gartmove Pen Euro
Eectnux Prnswo Fund.

Sufre'k Cm Fen Fd .

IMC FTnSB Set B . . .

Prolan e raid* Stales D
Progeny

%3mm£ ::....-

Managed

&w...:
Gaiunoi* NA.
Garunocr Pacific .. .

Henderson Acc .

PeroetaaiMiH
Framllngton Mng... .

Gartmore Pen Mnqd...
GartnorrPm Eure
kdHMMfeimS Pea-
Ark Euro Pen

750.9 7«0 5
2064-2 2172.9
6543 6888
1075 2 1131-8
532 0 561

J

197.5
1131
233.8
202.1
206 0
1923
199J
1415
121.2
123.1
950

UBO

Scattisb Life Imestmeftis
19 SiAadrew Squrar. EfUntaB^k

UK Equtty .
"7

Araerkcaiv. ....... _. _ .

Pacific. 12453
European J 2832
Mcruuoul ..

Ftucdlninrea.
lode' Linked
Deposit.

Managed
MferidMdr
With Profits Pens.
Pern Progeny . ...

PmvUKE4B'Cr
Pro America*
Pm. Pacific.

Pern European. .. ._
Pent IntmaUpSAl
Pen. Fi*«d fra.

Pm. Mdu Linked.
Pens DesoiK. ... .Pm . Mtural-
Pens WortowM*.

Scottish Mutual Assorancc Society
109Stvloeem Si. Glasgow ,041-2486321
Flea End Aug 15. .-...11240 2 1278 6 - 43920
Pen Mngd July 3L I83L9 857 61 -143921

Scottbh Mutual Investments
109St Vincent SLSlaufo*
Safety Fund.
Growth fund
CnportxnttT Fond - .
WdfMwMe veBtm Fnd.
UK Eqaity Fioki
DK Sculler Cos. FanO
European Fund
Far Eastwn Fisd
Japanoe Fad
North Amorlcan Fuad..
Intcmniqnal Fuad
Gilts <£ Fad (nt Food. -J

indea-Ualed Fund....

.

sawr
Pera Salitr Fnd .... .

.

Pens Gro>etb Fnd. ...

Ksa Opportunity Fnd.
ftm rKudcVkscalFra—
Pens UK Eosltr Fnd....
Pm UK SmNCc'k Fnd—
Pens Earooean Fnd
Pent Far Eon Fnd
Pm Japanese Fad

,

Peas Nth American F«d_l
Kb fnterMtlonal Fb
PmGdtNFaUmFnd. '

Pens Ipdea-Unked Fad..
Pens Property Fnd
PtitS Cash Fond
Peas Halifax Fnd. -

Scottish Provident Instituted)

031-22SCia

4J902
4)403
43904
43905
43906
43907
<3908
43909

46124
4.1910
43911
43912

_ 43913
- 43914
- 43415
- 43926

43917
43918
43919

041-2486321
43922
43923
43924
4J9Z5
43926
43927

Skasnfta Ufe Assura«* CoLM
Nonn American — 1263 132.

Pacific —
Smaller Ccmoaolre ...

Smjilcr Css Duncend
UK Equity Gareth ...

9alte3aldil Oitiniute
Create GIIL
Irai Keeomr i

....

—

Soul'tarGxaOTlci
”

Sqec-al Fcatixes . 77
UK Incame
Extra tome —
hm-e-reGrowUL;.;;

1

PrefShae**. . —
ConunBdtti Shxrs.
Financial Seeuntles. .

Gold
Inti Leflore Mar*
dotal lorame
Piupon Shares...—
Unnenal Energy
World Tenwmoqy. .

American Growth
U.S. locome -
U S Small Ca
Australian Growth
Earner Perf ......

k"K“7."
FiwdiGrowin
HonghengPer!

' national Gra
iPafaman
1 Small Go

SMusporrASEAN
SEAua Growth
UK Growth. .. -. .

SSELmrJibiH
American laenne . -.
Equity Incanw
Earooean .. ....

Far Eastern
oiyTTituad—
Smaller CamsaalBL

SSbiF.,
American Growth . .....

Met
Target Ufe Adsmce Cm Ltd-CaqU.
AustralLax
Japaq&Cmnd
Coromodhy

Prtta

FINANCIALHMESMONPAYster^^^ER^gS^

' For Current Unit Trust Pricroon
(listed below). Calls charged at 38p per minute

ffis S£ saSt

FHandaL ..._7

UK Coital

44112
44US
**U4
441 IK
«4Ub
44)|7
44118
44U9
44120
44121

5JS
44126
44127
44128
44129
44130
44131
44132
44133
44134
44135
40176
440?
44138
44139

32 0

SU
83.1
232.9

112.2
206.4
889
188.5

9L2

bnvmtlB.
ErarecranSog-Sto—

Pan J 1006.4 1059 4
6188 6U.4
1633 1723
3424 3603
2150 2264
1110 116.9

- 44342
- 44343
- 44344
- 44345

ziSS
3283

NeWeLowmta&ParinwLM
PO Box 1A4. Croydon
Lanades I tCle.IMXi)-. | lfiJ
Liiault Cli niiiriT 1

1~* T

SSs&sSSrJiaM Mai
e~K>Horon & Co/CoontrywMe

PBR Fund Manasanaot Ltd
16 Ncrtfctanbroiaad AMfuroWC2M SAP . D.-8396876

I -144551
Ruborimgi RnaRdoI Wimumuwt Ltd
123-125 Curtain RoadJJMdopECZA 3BX 01-7397117

YM
let. raw tm
lOmaWLM

i«LS7as
rSWOECB JZZW

jidmgrtts— si .adB

Gil t Alnfia7117'77. .....
GoWJUglta.

ufSoUroAWroTTTZ
Yen Aloha.
D-Urafe Alpha.
European 4Ska_.

US Alpha -
GfftATBM
Gaid Alpha...
JapanAtoba.

DollarAifdB^-.

166.0
787
542
61.0
57(7
623
52.2

ra
54.4
613
39J

ui
S3

Maramrt Fd CMU
1

Prretoi ALiaaoed Odii—

i

DbcreUonarr Fd IBOO-I
CisaetreearyPereFomn)-
Mud>-TnmF0£SiO(i)_
Fortress Peas Fd
Oiairoro^MiwiKML-
Mutnal Mr-ier Cik*-!-.. I

— . Rsttwid Ira Bkg
-j - 2 The UDmonDe nr*
-I ~ AtliQfi LAS Man

OoKELBntaQfixMo

DoNM ManUfe.
DaKMManPW».-. _
Do Sait Ed MxO Purs. _
teaxtaaerSratMutMirelTl^
D0Sa»BBtPtret*»_l
Do NM Man Ufc.
DoNM MraiPgi^^J
Do Target Ufd

McesanoM pro farAccomniaUaa anKs

Teodten' faum Ctavm Ltd
UCMleiaroh Rd. B'ipMaBK13LW_ . 0202}
Aland Fiaid.—_..

~ * '

Glh.&FI*cd U4Fd.
Cash Flam.

Do Target Peso
DoScotEartiMaiiu-.
SfccuntriSaMy-
Do Balanced

Far Eaa G
Hlghlmome —
lireunye

Inti £raenrtn9 Cos.—
Inti Growth
UK Growth..
Worldwide I

Ml
Ska
UKSprddl Sits
Pacllii Basin
FIa & PropS
•mcmnionxi

]

Fixed 4CcuverUDle...l
Equity Irrcotne.

S^W.V..7
SrqaJlerCompanies
WraldwUa Alpha.

13.0
137.6
1623
1246
133 0
109.9

126.4
1343
*
169.4
168.7
1893

Z«1.4
|33.7
2286
1503
1203

Cash.

B
ut Canda Fpa
road Mangers Ltd

§r
_
MW

____ jSretpiS)_l
yfBMffl MMFEjbBfinrttM..-

.ill

1
44567

»f3®-
SterfflBaftpPiMCfi— l

43929
4393D
43931
43932
43933
43934
43933
4393b
43937
43938
43939
43940
43941
43942
43943
43944
43945
43946
43947
43940
43949
43950
43951

190.4
137.8
1603

ins
1238
116 5
1122.4
[149 0
.

506
153 2
632
07 9

,
09.6

.... J 147.1 .

For Pontons Capital Units plcisz ring ext350)352
Baring Fi

Ltd
01-7490111

4o75l

43429
4)430
43431
434)2
43433
43434
43435
467h2
43437
434)3
43439
43440
43442
43443
43444
43445
43446
46408
46409
46752

43448
43447
43449

43454
4)455
4)456
4)457
43458
43S59
43460
46761
43462
C3463
434*4
43465
43467
43463
43469
4)470
4)471
4*410
46411

143473
43474

14)475

43480
43401
4)432
43483

Australia. .
astern.. . .. ......
Equllr Income . .. .....

EuiooeanSmltrCeo
Portfolio .
Japan Growth
Japan Srawtsr .

American Growth
UK Smaller COS.
ManrgeO
Mill Britannia
American Growth.
Etmeain Smaller... ..
Internattapai Leflore .

US Income. . .........

gKE^.v.
Extra Inc.

SSfcf^r. ™jj

ini Growth -...
HU INcouery ......
Japan Pof...
Japan Smir Cos.
Nat High . .—
Prop Shares ... .

5roa»rr Cos -
Unix Energy
World Trch
Man Growth
GIIL

SSTte
Gartmore Foods
America! [

Australian. . . ...

0-ltnn
Earoopin
Extreme ..... .[

Far East.
Frontier Markets

|

inti Fired interest.

—

GiobalStrtqy
Gold Share. -
Hedged Amertcm .. ..

.

Hleh l«.
H0pqKan9 . ..... ._.

let! Peaurees.— j
Japan
Uh Sriea Dpos.

1

UFSnHrOa
Mae GUr
Garinrsrt Feeds (fw
Global Inc & Gwth
Worldwide »ecouerr....[

US Select Ogpt ...

Japan Select fln.

European Setrct (

Pacific Growth .

lull Managed.

Worldwide Reoowry....
American Growth
1ml Emerging Cos
Far Etet Growth.
European . ...........

Managed
T3B Fends
ArrerlCld...
Earooean .. ........

,

Extra income. ._ .. .

General... . - ........

cm A Fired mured.. 95J
Income ...
Pacific

International
Neural Xewarcex.
Se'rcird Cmrertaxties.....

Managed .

Broke

125.6
122.4
1334
107.8
1U3
1649
143 0
1223

103.4
1402
1365
124.0

USl9

m
207.9
ZEOJ
1433

#2
2923
1073
3913
169.2
351.6
265J
328.1
3S7 7

etmerl
1333
1489
101.0
1336
143.9
138.7
1063

1323
1289
1405
1133
1193
1733
150b
129.0

1089
147.6
143.7
130 6
100.4
1353
176.9
1373
200.9
1303
145*

1583
1653
107.9
93.4
523

117.0
1723
15)0
1673
1312
196.9
134*
1333
1049
135.4
1282
94.0

407.4
147 0
103*

Cny Cat-llcl Bond-
Blrcnwoed .....
Hlrdwfcs Ifir Mwit....
SurUnqCadGrwtii
CoiMaxgra Swift **"4
Axerewi Ores lerPut _
SlDdtKx^ferMaaBd .
Wejicru

C

ouhUb

M

ug. ..

Fnlrn InranaiionaJ...
Richards, Leimtaff ..

Hmuoc Hugd Bar-1 .

DDA CiCwr HedGaFd—
Guy Snicker fa
J J BarrlsgualiLFd. . '

G & T Smaller Cos Fd .

BKkKrtiaraUaMFd.
.

,

J J Bam-rgUMMngd...
Charles Suctey
Elhfcaf In
louestanlxcame Bd.

Royal Life Ipaarancc LU
Hew Hall Puce Uiwaml L69 3HS
PaAll Shield Fd. (680 0 71931
Bsrei UreitfuH LGWitdAmrsurol L3I
Manajed Find 279 2 2*3 9
Ecinty Fund 356 D 3Th2
Pnweny Fund. 217 3 228 6
Internal -anal Fend 341.2 359 1
Gilt Fimd - ... 215.7 22997
Me set Fund 153 8 161A
UnKed States Fund 155 4 1633
Pacific Basin 229.7 241.7
Ratal Lire limit LMd. fjCBteR FdsiLU
Eicmol Man Fd Aee._
Eirogrl EhwtvFdAcC....
Eiemet Prop Fd Act...
Exempt Inti Fd acc...
Exempt GIR Fd Act . -
Exempt Money Ffl Acc.....

Royal Lifer Assurance
Ratal Lho' Building. Lfeenpol. L3 1KT.
Uh Eeulle 566 6L7
GlohilEqxIty ...47 2 49 7
High Yield 54 9 57 3
lira! Edully - 553 SB 4
Flirt Interest. 512 53.9
Moner S4.B 57 7
Managed 563 59 3
Persists

43635
43636
43637
43638
43639
43640
43641
43*43

,43644
-(43645

- 43646
- 43647
- 4)648
- 43649
- 4)650
- 43651
- 43652
- 4)653
- 43654
- 43655
- 43656
- 43657
- 43658
- 43659
- 4)6*0
- 43661
- 43662
- 43663
- 43664
- 43665
- 43666
- 43667
- 43668
- 43670

- 43671
- 43672
- 43673
- 43675
- 43676
- 43677
- 43678
- 43679
- 4)680
- 43681
- 4)682
- 43*83
- 43684
- 43685
- 46707
- 43686
- 43688
- 43*89
-143690

H 43691
- 43692
- 43W3
- 43694
- 43695
- 43697
- 43698

43700
4)701
43702
4J7TD
43704
43705
43706
43707

43708
43709
43710
43711
43712
43713
43714
43715
43716
43717
43728

43739
4)740
437C6
4)730
43751
4)754
43755
437*0
43765
43771
4J784
43791
43792
43794
43796
43204
43808
46706

6 Si Andrews S4 Ed Intiinjhm*
EoifCy
Imrautkiui
Prapxny

214.9
233.6

Indo-Unied .

Gosh
2ZS8
135)

224 7
Pros Equity lnH
Do. Ord.. 237 4

M68
230)ftrtJ’rqwrtyfcril

Pots Fixed hit Sell

Do. ora.. .

Penchwex-LM im
Da. OnL

1*2.2
171.4
113.4
136.7

Da. Ord. ~
. 167.0

207.4
214.4
231.6
246.0
1501
1)56
142.4
1973
2367
207.6
250.0
2135
259.8
2427
290 9
149 7!

1805
U95
1440
145.1
173.9

Scottofi Widows' Grasp
PO Box 902. Edinburgh E H 16 5BU
bur Pol lSepl ' •

fmPtXZS® l
Iter Pol 3 Sep 1 -
lax Pol Cask Stpl
Mixed Fund.. . . ....
Equity Ftod ........
Property Fund
Internallocal Fuad
Fixed let. Fund—

Hflfc.'?
—

Peo.MtxrtFd.Oid.
ftps. Equity Fd Ord .
ftrts. Prop Fd Old....
Pern. tat. Fd. Ord
Pem.F1tLlDLFd.O1d....
ftps loA5tk Fd Ord-
Pea. Cadi Fd. OnL
PM Man.
PMSIEc
PM Prop . —
PM Pees Protection.....

PM Cash ....
Ex Unit Act

PL 1-IJ ftfyr,, #Lxi301CW Assurance Lea
40 Uxbridge Rd. W5 2BS.
5MCW Life Mngd 121.8 128 4
Shield Pension Mngd.. 130.7 137 8
SMeUSenre- 102.a ia72
Shield Seen* Fens 1065 111.4
3*dd Brunei .... 119 0 1255
Shield Brunei Pern— 1245 1)0.9

SbutdU Ufe Assurance Co LU
Frabhter me. Netson Gw. Sadhargpun
Shandli Lift Fends' 2955

353 6
285.0
101.3
2181
2208
198 4
151-7

W:::::::
Inurnatlcoal Fd .....
Index Lkd Gilt Fd
GUI Plus Fd.
Proomy Fd .....
DeswsHFd.
North Arnencan Fd

—

North Emenan Fd.....

tm. RrcoitryFo

2808

965

m
248.6 261.6

ParillcFd
Amerlnder MaaiUr....
Euro Index Maxllor ...

Uni Indot Monitor .....

Japan Index Moottor...
UK Index Morator.
Skaodfa Brains Foadt
Eastern

kisss-cki.
GMu) Growth .

Growth « I dcrant
Japan Growth —

—

JapanSqnnsc
European Growth.
American Growth.
UK Snullw CPBpames—

.

a^SxFtdxiHy Fauth
American
American Equity lac....

American Special SlU..
Australia.

Eastern Oups.
Eraooran
Eure neon Income.
Famocs Names
Far Eaa income
Glita Fid InuresL ...
Global Convertible
Growth & Income.
Income Plra.
International Bond.

—

Japan
Japan Special Sits
Manage! lutanatkenl—

ShE«ASL-.:~:
Special Sits.

194 2 204.4
1208 9 219 8
115.1 1211
109.7 115.4
105 4 U0 9
i960 101.8
10*0 1124

031-3569181
4)95)
43954
43955
4)956
4)°57
43958
43959
43460
439U
43962
-0963
43964
43965
43956
43967
4)968
43939
4)970
43971
43972
43973

031-6556000
43974
<3975
4)976

ks
439B3

4)990
43991
43992
43993
43994
4*422
43995
43996

01-5670700
43997
4J99B
43999
44000
46755
46756

b)
0703334411

-144001
—( 40002
-H 44003

nesUgeEiRBcR’tailo..Jl03*
pnalgeJaDaeP'lello—|

*

PiesUge UK P-falte ._7[
PrerateeUS F fotie. .&«
TSB Aura kail
TSB British Growth
TSBEtmreuU liw
T5B Exropeor
TSB Extra L-icoau.
TS8 General
TSB Premier Income...
TSBHtccme
TSB Not Resources.....

TS8 Pacific- .

TSB hnenaunai
T38Sd«clM Opp — -
TS8 SmallerCm....
T58 Managed.
Shondia WartfeyFob
Brtusb Wlikten...
European Growth..
Hong hang
Income
irallnccoe

1

JapasGrowth—
Japan Smllr Cos
PAcitk Performance.

.

awroiMatariA-

SkaraMPrastea Mora
Managed.. .... 1

Baring Managed
Fidelity Managed
Fraxsiiagten MaiDgad—
Cartmore Managed

—

Herdenor Managed...
lOefemanrirarllnqd...
UlUSntmaiawaCjC.—

aaifaSfe

WaaScy Mj^agrt-....

SSlmSdFdlhS.'"
Alter Index Manftor...
Euro (ran Monitor

—

let! Index Monitor.

—

Japan Index MaelUr

.

44152
44153
44154
44155

- 44156
44157
44158
44159
44160
46204

44163
«1M
44165
44166
44167
44168
44169
44170
44171
44172
44173

Tunbridge Wdb Eanttable
Abbey Cowl. TwhrMge Welle

Swfirncomi__|337.00 356.001
CilRegiiar 62. bO 65.90|
C&l Exraraa. .TJbgJO 72
Pitre Plan EFBrspt_..l 166 60
Do. Taxable 138.40‘

“ S3
71.20

Ufrteiwiwx 163350 653.10

1

Savings Narrow 2*1-20 289 90
SavingsWide 162880 648201

Nttfagol teltlxl J

Do. Ordhun .1

sfi&=l
UK Life Assurance Ob LU
WwtMpy Rd.. HonhaiR, RH12 1SL__

0892515353

BrailnprarScEcGWaL.
Da ScEn Global Pm-H
Sharp (Albert EJ ACS
12 Newhali Stmt.AfcmMgBQ

Mxo^yertcalMrtTl
Pem. Man-5chrodra^B^.
Sittala Fund Manxes Uniiteri
Simla hour. The Cahsemt^H^H
Bisoap'* Stortfqrd. Herts .

satxu Itraugrt Fxnds^H

1
Won,,,--“ mao »7l

CapKn !Gn«

“-= II
,021-2002244

Gold

SStiftn 1teiss » lr
jrZHVA 740JSI -144572 ^grageYen.. 0

SwteFrraoJIin.g
Frftapt*...—.

0

71 119

3363
53*5
46.91
204).
24.40

BoyaJ UerttranSOF
Royal Heritage CCF
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150.973 1.047
£1_OT2 1.069
£0.957 1.000
£0.996 1JJ71
50.933 1.004
50.975 1JC4
C.953 1.023
£0.991 1JJJ6
,73.4 79.0
69.1 74.4
IflSLOM L-142
AS0.9b9 L020
0.050 1106
0-047 1.103
£1-112 1245
£1097 1 199
£1211 3-170

u. Banlaafdwb— VI0M79.77 8216
Drawl Bantam Landxrt

45725 FbMwYCraapUrailad NAVflngatf 18X16242
45724 WtachattrQuitalLMtud PtAVAugmi 18S107.91
4572 WtodBUrCamPtaLU BAVflugiaUSSlOJJ
45726 Wlsctestar Ftsars Ud-OVrdSarHAV4og 17 513J4

WfachaUarFoUmUd-OrtanSerM NAV flag 17 52219
WtacSaaar FiwatarUmharf NAV Jal? 31 5197.80

—71. Wtadunar HWgKom Plus Strtas OAV Aug 18
4^571 US0003
45732 VFtachatta HMM*CBr 84 Stria flag 18Ea 1186.91
45717 WtackaOar Rtcotarv Limited NAVJaly31 S93 07
45716 Wlac&ciUr Pacnts Unrited flag ISCcnpR Ytatd 636

WWBUrtarmsMaUJGVtM NAV Aogast 10512-10
45738 WarMtafeUSoKlal Fand NV NAVAa*M118SBlS.43
45729 WarMnUaSnotties Umttol NAVAagas IB£35-14

Elders (SwI
, . .. EktarsAasttaMLTsL- ADflB2S lOaMf -(44402

0624^33343 EJdnlaur. la*. Tk_. SFrBASO lUfiol -144903

LONDON SHARE SERVICE

•d
BRITISH FUNDS

Steel
|
Price I tad. Last I latacri fCtty-

I S IYM. id I Dm IBm

l.t

"Shorts” (Lives up ta Five Years)
_JlUpcl989.„

‘

’nos5pcxgeM9.....
jrcti 10l*pcCv ‘89.....

reasl3pc 199012
;2pclL^9(K84^).ll32 IsS9^ 19 6

W\tll6Ul2.7

IWHa - 23.aHUB 9-3
99BUS 10.4

ji5ci99oa
b. lJi*2P6 1990

—

Treat 3pe 1990
" s5l.pel«7-9Qri.

5. 8pc Or 1990 J2 -

Trras. lOpcCa 1990-..
Exch 21jpc 1990
Trias uCpc!991

400 F#ndlng5V(K^MUt.
ASX Tress. 3pc 1991
646 Treas LOpcOr *91 »_.

14>5£ Exdi. llpc 1991
L3M Trees, ft* l99l.-._...

900 Treas i2hpc 1992*2..
L60C Treas 10pcl992_—„
1,400 Treas. 8pc 1992 tt

L288 rreal04pc C»1992g..
W. Treis. 3pe 1992

1,350 E«fi.i2l4PC-22..
1,757 Em* 13

*

2pc 1992_....

9S0 TreasB4mel9W.
1.B5C Treas 10pcl993».

—

UOO Treas UVpc 1993tt...

L05« Treas. B^OC 1994....

_

hoc Trees 14^pe 1994&...
1JOC Exch 13Ijpe 1994
ESa Tiw. lOpeLa. 1994ft
U50Exeta.I2iipel.994

—

loo^jiLtjj ao

29Mar29Se? 1256

1

I5*jrl5M 1329

ISltaUSei L255I

15Jwl3Jaa 1300

25jglgja. 1311

1

PIM1 UJbjl2Fd 1257

P9j(«3.« 16^ 2Sa28ar 13W
I

954 9.66 3.4 8** 9 Kay 1325
9751L5I 9.5 153k15JbI3M

9.6 16JBS1WJBWM
97A 1135 201 25 to 250a 1235

1

934 8 50 17.4 22>& 22to 1270
199*8 1204 27.6 10Jd 10J» 12921

£3>«W« L9 50tt&4pr 1275
Wit 9.29 6.4 UtoUiUi 13261

97,5, 1L63 27.6 12Jwl2lul 12861

99,* 1UE 20J 25to 250d 1258
I93A1L« 43 10J«alfftte 13»,
103,? 1L0C 15.6 22Jnl 22Jao 1297
I Wfi lUf 17.7 2Hn321f!t 1283

92j| 1L18 73 130al3teLJ37l
9S^g 1153 313 7 Not 7 Kn 1289
OS 9.20 S3 UDkIUio 132B|

10212 nos 19 7 SFd)25Aa 1265
10.95 31.8 22Uff22Seg 1266

192*8 las 12.7 I&tanUFeli -j
97a lo U 93 150a ISto 1279
1053 la 68 27.6 14Jm l«Jol 1246
B7**n 9.87 93 UlbrlStp 1276
lion I0.M 17.4 2£br 23*01 L304

920 U.U 27.6 3Avg3Feb -
114 i 1044 26.7 15relUariai7
110i 10M 213 Z70a27Apr 1267
9821047 33 9D*e9JBB 1284

186(111062! 17.7 2ZF&22«mI1263

UOC Treat 9pe 199*ri.
2350 Trees 12pc 1995
229 Exch 3pc Gas 40-9S....

2.100 Each. 10 ^4pc 1995.-..
1.000 Treas 12*pel995tt-.
900 Treas. 14pe ‘96 —
750 Treas.9pc 1992-960..

135C Treas 15>«pc 1996#...
800 Ext* 13 >4.pc 1996t*-..

1.109 Cocverslon lOpc 1996.
130C Treas 13 s*pc 1997#-.
S!lW Exdi 10>apc 1997.._..
3,750 Treas 84) pc 1997#
1.00C Exdi 15oc 1997
2350 Exch. 9VpC 1998
1.000 Treas 6 It pc 1995-98#..
1.100 Treas. £5*2pc '98#....
2300 Exch. 12pc 1998_
L250 Treas 9ijpc 1999#..„.
2,900 Exch. litpc 1999—.
L252Treai.l0«»PCi999.„|
1348 Cpnenlan loT.pc 1999.
1300 Treas. 8»2PcLn 2000#..
1354 Conretskxi 9pc 2000tt_

.

1317 Treas. 13pc 2000
1.050 Treas ltoc 2001
1350 Treas. 14pc '98-01. ._.

802 ^MiKnKm9Vpc2001_.
L«K Each. 12pc' 99-02
716 Conversion lOpc 2002.

1,450 Treas 91, pc 2002..
1300 Excb.9pc 2002
1.B0C Treas. pc 2000-03..

Five to Fifteen Years

986^

r
10!

1.CUV IIQD. U11AUWYW.. AMUIAVtaK
1,000 Treas lOpc 2003 m\#9 72 2.8
1.900 Treas. U»,pc 2001-04- UW^dlOi: 14.8
900 Treas. lOpc 2004.. 1023*19.68 11.4
443Jfimtllng3^pc ‘99-04. 575,0.6® 29.6

11041 10.4
1059 19.8
3.41 28.3
!

10.49 14.6
1039 10.4
1033 15.6

10.C 283
10.41 10.4
1032 10.4
1037 15.6
1031 17.7
1033 24.8
1052 213
102t 12.6

QHS

m
114
^00
#92
&2497VM W§
B2,tf9.30 2831K1J7 24.8

1 1030 13.41
WKJ9.94 8.6
Uuvtioa 21.8
UOIVlOJl 12.4
1100 A 10-11 17.41

1 90,1(9 89 21.6
9<tM 9.92 28.7

117,1 1027 278
*9|j 9.99 20.7

11956 10.« 17.41
98A 9.94 4.71
109a 103i 15.6
10836 9.87 631
991*9.84 21.7
949.78 12.41

122i 1QJ3 19.6

9.8

17U»17Bo*Q345
SJa25Janfl294
IMov lUarB/M
GUan2XJul
ISNjylSSffll

22id22Jag
15S*pl5#ar
3Nov3Mayl
15*fg.l5Mjip
15Mq15Ho*|4
22iul 22Jisl302
2Uag21F^|B
IMarlSep
?7AprrataH
19Adl9jS
INovIMay
30M3r30Seol

^323
a&pStel
IStoMMart
22Mm22Ho>E
2Slan 28Jtd|
3Sep3Mirl
14Jaal4Jdt
26Aa?2>Fij
22ttaTHM|
lOFrtilQAaq

!2Jpionnri
UOaUAfrl
27 fei 27M
lWayll
25JanlM
8Mar8S#l
l<7S#19M»r
lSnoalBUarl
ll4Jin 14JulL

I LOT
11254!
11298
U05
1344

1

1309
’268
1240

1 1302
5 12531 13411

r 7700 1269

1

RHnl273
y 13311
g 13081

1259
I 8847

1

(1264
*1288
* 1242
i L338
r 1244

*11299
U80

1230,1306

(15J34134;

122J4M1261

J Aa? L349

pl9ks> 1272
a 253# 1303

1281
1290

j 1282
iu54

1248
112611

S241

BRITISH FUNDS-Conid

Stock
Price Ret Last latcrtft tttr

I £ lYId. xd On lline

1362 Comers IMl 9 } pc 2004-
LE81 emersion 9fepc 2005_.
1.051 Exch.10‘epe 2005
2300 Treas 12 >2 ac 2003-05..
1.800 Treas. Bpc 2002-06#..
702 Conversion 91tpc 2006..:

3,150 Treas. 1U PC 5)03-07..
1,446 Treas S‘s DC 2007#....
1.250 Treas. l35pc'04-08..
1.800 Treas. 9pc 2008#
LOOC Treas6x2009
369 Conv 9pc (ji 2011 tt....

1.00C Tress. 5^pc 2008-12#.
700 Tress. 7<pe 2012-15#.

1,000&U*. 12pc '13-f17—

.

359 Corse Is 4pc.„
1,909 War Loan 3i?pot....-

140iw».3»aDC'61Alt....

Owr Fifteen Yean
98g|9.6l( 20.3

.
99S 9.59 133

107.1b 9.57 14.8
120A 9.75 14.4
87^a9.4G 1.9
101R 9.49 10.4
114*i 9.75 15.6
924n 34) 9.6

129J1S 9 68 21.8
97>, 9.29 73

88[5c 9.24 21.8
971i 9.1fl 29.6

65’««9.06 4.8
851. 9.17 19.6

126fil9-2ll 83

aflprZ50fl

180a IS Anri

2D to 20So
aB3a»«
5Aw50et
lilfeilSNw
22JpJ22J»i
loJii lAJsi

265ep2fiMjrBJ
13flor 130ctll34

25Mar25S#NI
12Janl2JuU
lOMflrlOSrp

26J.126JW
UZJmlZDs

i24b
1247
12511

1295
1334
1249

1293
1339
1301

1

13

Ip245|

1260

56lTrias. 30C66Ah_
276jCottsbls2i?pc...-
475ITreas?2 lapc l

-t26.6 tlFeD lAirgjl239

llJunlDecISi
lAprlOn 1245
5Apr50ct 1324

4 1.9 bJaApJulOtt??
25.8 lAprlOct11315

Index-Linked

Tr.2pc'92#f97.8)-.
[Do. 2 *94 (102.9)

Do. 2pc '96(67.9)
Do 2>*pc '01(783)...
Do. 2^i pc *03(78.8)..

Do.2pc‘06(69.5).-..
Do. 2*2pc '09(78.8)..

Do. 2^2pc '11(74.6)..
Do. 2J2 pc '13(89.2)..
Do.2>*pe'16(BlA)..
Do. 2>2pc *20(83.0)..“

*24#(97.7)

ft)

S43.gr
126(1
130 i*

Z2l3

sst

945*0371

'.95 17.8
2.97 10.4
3.12 10.B
r
.47 183

332 13.4
12.6

,3.53 13.4
6.53 17.7
(3.50 10.7
3.47 19.6
.42 10J

12.6

toMJrZTuel
IfcSnUlin
ldUarlhSeg

2*M«24SepJ

^»19JdT

16Febl6A#
BbJanaSJttll
U60ctl6Aprl

(1312

ll7Jaol7Juu323

1313
1316
1317
11314
1318
019
1320

IJ321
•0322

•PraspecUveieal redemption rate on projected Inflation of 5%.
ft) Figures ft parentheses show DPI base month for Indexing. (Ic 8
months prior to issue) and have been adjusted 10 reflect reoasing
of RPI to 100 In January 1987. Conversion factor 3.945. RPJ for
December 19880103 and fer July 19890153

INT. BANK AND O’SEAS
50IUriaiD*BkU>(Lo20U>-.

'

D*»«10i.pciji2OW_.
-alia 13*; x20l0_.

Do. il*pcLn2015....
re lB» llpc Ln 2002-

_ Do. 10),pc2004
5fc*-An ton 12^pe2003_,

Do. 94»pcLn 2015
Ilysla 10\pcLn2009.-

5010# HnfcaSues 16b#aa8.l

k
Sfeurol

CORPORATION LOANS

T
WmtojlBm 13hpe 1989-
Do. 11^pc 2012
GLC6\pc 1990-92....
Leedsl3)ax2006.._

Spjverppol 3^cjrred . -

Do.3pcT20Aft.
Mascheto 111; pc 2007—r

”.5

%
1L30
110.70

11.70

10.72

10.901

20.4
14.4
17.7
103
1.9
14.7
1.8

ISN4,2Qtol
JlSMajlSBovl
|l5Feta 15Aagl

llApr lOct
lUdtoJnOc
llOJaB laiui

flMarJnS D
106>2^10.701 313 l25AprS0al3275

1838
1837
2647
3146
3169
3198
3197

COMMONWEALTH &
AFRICAN LOANS

89|ll.70| 1.12 jUan Uni I

14.7 l7Frt 7aSI

14frrZ7**DC 1988-92--..
-B Rhod 2 1] pc Non-Asstd.

4T On. 4>2X87-92 Asstd. I

LOANS

Stack
Price Red. Last Interest ptj-
£ YU. xd I Dm Mine

Building Societies

13.74] 21.8

20(Da 12,\pc 4.12.89...
2fi&). 12Bpc 2.190
MDo. 12 <{pc 29.1.90, ..

HDo. 12 (i pc 26.2.90...
HDo. 12^|pc 193.90...

20|Do. 134*pc 23 4.90...

2dDo.l3pc 14.5.90
Do. 13 11pc 4/6/90
Da. 14 Ape 2.7.90
Do. 13*bpc 23.7.90...

12ttarlBSep

2hMar20a
.KMuruNot,
U&Msy 4D*d
2jan28lui.
|2SJao 23Jlyf
*f«2Wr*9
19Mrl3S*p
eitol70aj
|wdar8S(nJ
tJifli30Nn
2j Iy2bDec

60(00. 3^5 pelL Lx 202L..1106^04.40i 22.6 l30l»31JDib465

Public Board and Ind.

25(M«- Wlr.3pc 'B' .1 46*110 id 1.8 IlMarlSeptShl

FOREIGN BONDS & RAILS

£m
.

Stock

7faeck7Ktes
Do. 6k 28 SID. ta...
Do4peMHed Ass..

24ASS.
HjdroQwtec 15#2011

.-Mnll4iipcU201tL.
3QHRtan] 9 ^x '91-%..

Price

£
40

4Sd
40E
BO

134A
(12413d

n?3

Dll %
Gross

,

3.50

2.7H
15 Offl

145W
9.751

VU
HTSjl
aif
(5W

ID

1151

(Last
I

xd
U

1.2
3.4

S7I27

5

Intanst

Paid
1Mar l Wav
IFedlAug
lAprlOa

5J IMar
IH31M«3DN»

Jn.lfl3Uai31Jul
1U02L1 1 War lSep 13002

FVh
luw

ZK3
VbZ
2761
2935

AMERICANS

4hl
5 Ami
2 Ante

^5ol
241,
22»
412
L0<0
3.403

11877.

1 2401(4

van.
16413

33373
26788
msn

Soil

693.
hai.otenj'
3.44SJKI

120y-
4.151

I 1

•bp
r

TtAbbcttLataratoriesl

MAHe^eny&Wlc.

nnbase dorp &il—
dahl 5c.
er. Craramld S5.

iJArntr. Express 60c..
ilArar. MrdtoH in. SI

.

SAmtrtan T. A T. SL.
idAmeriteoi SI

itSEBft
|BanFers N.Y. SI
Bell Atlantic SI

dBeilSouth Corp
TvBrtMBinn Start S8..

reSio-Rad Labs. A...
liBowater ine.

TruiHwItk 75c.

. .PC mini. 25c
OfCallfornla Engy
Campbell Soup 15c.

6^seMadatunS12ii.
8anid*g DxpB—

. lersJu
lllcorp SI

CltyFed Fin. Carp-.

,. ,1 Loiqitr-Paln>Dll*e Jl_
LJHSJ Com'l Bank Core S4...

- KorameOaukace..
CuliinetSftwrlc....
Jana Corp Si
Oata General
pun&BtadUrrrtSU

6 Eaion Corpn. 50c....
“

llnlne

It -

jpeml
7422Wns:

170.1
U76.1
2733
V*M
1.827'

645*Ecbl
UnUFPL Group

Price Dir Y'ld La#
£ Gras Gr's ad

407.S SI.40 2-2 11.7
4Mp 30c 4.1 -
UP.nI 30c 2.8 7 B
10A a 20c 13 24.2
991pe hlOc 0 6 31 1

37 S1J5 2.3Z7.2
23%nl 84c 2.2 3.7

15^ t 72*
2.9 9.1

25H SI 20 30 273
39v.hS2.92 4.7 2B3
559p - - -

212,n 60C I F 175
3358 S2.08 39 31

J

62H S4.08 4.127 6
32 * S2.52 4.9 6.7

“u\- : :
6J

187. Si. 12 3 8 6.6
lln 44c 2.5 20.7,

42^ 51.60 2.4 25.9'

31K« 9i IB 3

_
7

241-a S2.36 6 C 27 7

24>, S2.72 7.1 12 6

16|Jn S1.2C 45 14 6
20 .Id 51.62 5 D 25.4
168a 4c 15 2910
37Hd sSl.48 2.5 20.7

1^ 86c 3.0 31.5
364| - - -

527p - - -
26*»a SL6D 3.9 29.8
991p - - -
37% S2.00 3.4 13 2
42% hS2.00 3.0 2 6
20 7. 70c 4.130.6

20%rf S2l23 7 2G3JI

jFbUyAgiav 1503

UrJaSrDr 1581
(jutbrJiDc 2915

Mr Jr A? -
Hr Jr St Ot
FbUf *5 N»

Fb Mr flu Hi
FbUrijH. 1597
FbMyflgNv

Dividends fcrtj-

Paid

1594

Ft My Au Ho

AlJhOsJM
Ft Mr Au No
Ft Ur 4* He
War Jon SO

OcJaflp Jr
F Mj Aii N
JaiAoJIjO

DcJaApJr
FbUrJ^Jb.

Jar Jot Sb
MyAuN

F

Ft Mr A3 Hr

F MyAuN
BcHr.JiSp.

MrJtTsrDr

Mr JsSoDc
F MyAuN
iaotoJidOa
MrJxScpDec

line

0744
E>45

1821

1884
1989
2263

(2109

£135
12141

12184

K306

12410

Continued an next page

SIS SS 16
wltztriind) Invest. MngL SA

^_.^_hn*LT*.„RnAB2s lotaor -f*
833343 EJdvrs Isttr. lav. Ta IsFrUfiX 07SOI -I*grirte^^^Mon^ CSpAV)

______ $JL
FdKAVSat

Europe 1992
NAVOgSl 1

-(46349

S9A4
S.G. Eorope ttritortiom SA
Enrepe-OhHuahta*.-” 179.

Inti LU
tin «
£102-25
I99J0

: SSS&Mp
AnVaiiiPTfJ*«e3i_

45494 AMVatalV
45495 American Aatts (J3„

AretreltaU)._-.

I -I -

I -144936

-(4493b

-1 44945

JaamiSaMrCasPflia— ...
Pidfle Portfolio. 1510.82
Nth American P'toiloZJsS.lS
Exrxnu Pat/olto._3s7J8
UKPorttono.

‘ "

Global Portfolio
FbMd tat Portfolio....

MkrLtoMtyP-feiie.

.

Sug Lleuidhjr P’fotlo-.

£13.49 IASS
S1&57 19A2

11.44,
545

t 780
£632 6.90
5935 986
£9.74 10 23

£11324 11354

E31
45232
45233

- 45235
45236
45Z37

Merrill Lynch Asset M<
worwiM torwiwU ill.
WbW tan 9a Pfelio 8.. I £10 98

sgsa^iasrtgry-
- literSipeM Jna.72

.
-I -i -

4332

_j _ Son A
.t *n PO Bax

Sun Alliance Intention} Life
PO tax77,N*wSL5tf*ttr Port, Guernsey 048123539

• - «£_Jsa2D aa3
159^8 9.98
*400 431

S3
SL76 1.91
0.13 1-22

PtadHcEmiill'S——J.

MICwnmcrS J;

US DQUarMa^MX-

GJutaaJ Strategy llnomt SAMmBUMSMternm
NorthAm Portfolio TTEu 99
Enrmiaia Portfolio—

J" ‘

UKCromh Portfolio...]

Jwan Portfolio—
Nteflc Portfolio.

45239 j,

|W Offir JMd
Pfw* Price taa Hat

-Coct^d.

MerriH Lynch lot .Capital Mngt(G5Y) Ltd
Iberia Portfolio I $a» “ -146590

Moran Stonier Slav
UmRMbPhaFdStpl-—

|
£1053.42

Patrimony FdSm 1 1 *1068 69 I

llirtay. Johnstoneitov. Adviser)
JtemewMo8o»re30.-_Ts27 62 _29.44|

BU Offer YWd Dtf.
Price Bras lire

22431

i :

- 45478
- *5474
- 45480

DollarCab Portfolio.-.
Sari»9 Cab PortfoDoTl

LM - 45243
L47 - 45244
LID -| 45245
1.4)1

„ 133
JH12 138
(SO.9926 0.9*26
In iva 1 iw

Hin SnweJ lovesbneat Services Inti (z)

iimnwii r*t *9
SFrlBJl 19.92
SFr39 93 *249

IS3
Investor* FA
£1426 14.44

vlFirEMU-
cccrHB Mta
ITF Fd (Tedraotagyl-
0*iaB Pd IN Amm—

SSJS£* :

Asia Invest Smicei Ltd

NAV«raz<i.aifM«lte(fSEI26J63

™
-wsat' £5836 I —1 45025

nr*
50.73

iHFffsfta
i^il g35

Th 2809 Tkl451735

tediN Ffamtep firodp

45476 ffinSfaSu

IFdtaXtt—.(873 "903> tt25l
-CmylWUUfl AtaXteJ191.9 2043ml. 4.971 45549
•Sob. dry rmw tubs. •Sob. dnriwtatfirStS *od20t)r“ IU

Serttap ciaacl—i

—

D-Mark Clxu

—

;

Dvtch Col ktar Class.—

i

JamatV#'

22361
Ftemlaj lajaiFted-J73^541 3U47I

ssatwuas* 2535

1

BEa-&«554.- CoadEtecpete

Peraatnid IIT
OffshoreMl 0«tb._.
OHihoreAm Cwtb Fp .

,
S3409B 316296

OfMareCnatfosCte.-. *23854 23476
OffteareCunwaaonL. *174*8 L854J
OfflhMC Far tore Ftf-iSZJUB 22517

.

OR*OreUK»0*lbFd_JSL4179 L3K31 -I

PnnlanMal loti FtaianriaT Serrieex -mil '

;

Intomt tAA B)—*-.‘^3 hj9[«b*4
Crotathrc&tn— .. IZOLI 21L4I OJ»t«^e
Royal Trent Fd ltedlCD LU ;:~
DoHartacFdf. l;.7|?I0W LOS4l 7

,U I

DM10133
(011.97

Y1DJJ78 I

Soortty PaeWc Fond* SJL La

Start tea Fbad hd
OS Dollar Man Fi

. AS DollarFtredMW-
-145757 Eco Bond Fd
—’ 44995 OmanttCfatedrEFd-l

. n»aaartChf» *sf<)_
“*44995 Darcoport Chad £ F.L-I

HWCUhualStaMte-l.
LXfl Utenial SHogi—(l
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- HI Perl |S9X5_ 9.75 1 -I -

45998
45399
45400
5401
45402
45403
45404

protected Performance Fund .

Performance Fund*.. ..I SO.72 I

'Weekly deal lag ao Tuesday

Prudential bit! Financial Services Ltd
l lolbw Cmrenry fte
Managed Steriwg.
Managed Dollar
Sterling Depcali
Dollar Deposit.
DM Drralt _...

SWFrDmoilt
J. Yen OeposiL

KapgaropFau
Essen ftinadre.
EampeaaOtgs Fund

—

Clocul Acres Fd
Balden Opps Fund . . ..

HK A Cwm Gateway Fd .

bit) OrmFaiW
KJt*ao-Oia Fred
Little Dragons Food.-.
PWflc Trcmolagy Fd

—

PBilleom Rolreel Fd.....

Tiger Fund
Japan Fond

.

Oriental Inc Find _ ...

Pacific Inv Fd SM £.
Pacific te PdSADM..
PacItePo FdWruL...
Pacific to. FatVrti DM..

, . r,„ Jakuta Fa'Cajreaalltd
—

'

-145609 GiflbB] Index Fate

S1039 -I -

S12U 12.7155
S9 93 10 4265
56 54 6.8670
Sli-SO 120750
57 06 7.4130
51035 10*675
5205 2-15
510.58 I1JD90
£20.84 2LB820
SU 97 123685
55229 549045
53009 313945
526.(3 773315
£21 94 23 0370
Ell 39 11.96
DM35 10
C6J9
DU 1969
S9.89

Putnam International Advisers Ltd
EargHltbScl- ~~ ~~

MAS (Cayman) Ltd

Ss&ifis^di^r ji*

McOanoeH A Ca BermuMUd
Bd)MerpjArtlt!*ge~, ^06 24x1
McD Flo AlhHrage— £27.77 29.13
McOFomim £11.07 11,63
McD DterUfled 51707 17.93
UcDBridorwaMrFd- S880 840
McONAmerGwth SU.09 1164

Shassdw ^
Magnum Fund Mugmt (Oumnrfal LU
Mygrewn Poteet Pate
Starting CUSS 1 M79

0.00 45419
080 45420
165 454^1
1.65 45422

Klgb IncomeGNMA

—

brtmatlenal Fiatd

Global HI GUI Fad.
Global Cert lac. Ta

—

136.6 1378
*13 01 1385
1008 100.0
S1Q.00 10.00
p in50 84 5L06w w

*16-33
51383
S9JU
>11-57
*1186
*15 06

6.125M
10-37

43637
43638
45639

45643

43646
43647
43648
45649
45650
45651

ASE 50 UW laden.
FTSE 100 Index

S&^uSl'vdB
Niwal Sroca flerragr

Three-Way Asset
TWAA FuM
TWAA Fioal II*. .

• Price otStol
Traasworid Bund Trust
NAV Aug 31 I *11-84

*15 45
£10 00
*11.27
S14X4
SU.11
Allocation Fund*
510831 10336
*95.65 9389

45842
45843
45844
46163
45845
45846
45847
46280
45849
45854
43853
43856
45848
43850
43851

45853

-46281
— 1 46282
-I 46283
-146284
-146285

-(46806
-146807

gaH^LW'ndiea* jM^Baslngsttee

£X500-£9W.'"".".
E10.000-E49.999
£50,000*

Tyndall International (Bermuda) Ltd
lnrtui!a»lj!9li 1*47*1 49 90) -

-145870

4542b
45427
45428
43429
45430
43451

Global Getemment Pto Fand

liS» c/b Prteemiif-Bacte S“ ^ ---146772 **
IMV Augusts ISS6-B5MCSSJMai

45129
aai-m
•5131
45132
43133
43134
45133
45136
4M37

Far
HgnMwuMI .

ASm OK3tAFMWZI|

MeursTra«

A

m 17 -JKI4S' SSi
Kffnwy Far Karate TttilUd v - .

jjp«ftjBAreBlJl3£5T.» HUftrf OXbj
ftSje Fata Aooim 31 J £5724 Mtfii J-471

ifMa

a®
Malaysia GrawthH
NAV re.....*. -I

Man Intowetlorai
umruufTED-oti-T]
MINT UMITEIMnc.-.
MINTGTDLTDSb'A.,
WfrGTtLTtWvec.B_
UWTCTOLTDriWi 19C~I
UDnCTDLnKtelWj
UnrCT6LT6-0«l«4_L
M*TCmUIW«19«I|

Khctcifxiu itim-J

TnSn Aiobaf Gtu Ud-.l
FBAt£ UIHTGTD FLC__[]
awnSotelliK8Npr^|
WGA-Poclfte Ud .— -J

1X2

1

*£?} bSH
^2j iw»im

S3?-

JapuFuad— ..

L077B -tamn HewSana F4--
144991 fared
(44932 Malay StoQ.

I449S KUAmncu

a-&ssstia-i
BBSBrT Bti
Finexa MeraatlouallUd

j

45945 Utmurd-Juu. . . ...
-l 44988 BoteFd Hsl4Xl7 14927

••• SSremneb PnwUraoi Copter! UuL .

Pacific Fd.

—1 44716 * NociSilrednSepiiBiberU
-144717 grsup Om Lfmlted

UarCfLyacaMI GCve/oflU^
44799 USS*P^tefc«S*rI-plilO 329J6
- US 6H Ed A Clan5v LI--.]*— “I

44760 USBua*aa«SerK..-IV
44761

'•

1.04

McditetraiteM Fund (SXCAV)

I il :

Baantum Fd NV Curacao
QnamamPM 1*14,166 14.4521

Qgantus Find
Ouamos Fred NAV.— I $16.44 I -145653

Scllter lotematlonil MangsReni Lid
Ouatbit. Irocl. Bend— SO.46 LoiT -MS65S
teodn.lMd.Eon>.— . C.86 3J»| -(«S6Sb
Stest Inte. F. EoL. £3X3 371 -143657
teadOL Md. N. AW... 51.97 207 ! -143668

Rosenbi ,
Alpha ClanX IS.

Alpha Clan 8 1*10.18

HflthtehJU Asset Mamenment (CD!Sf«- ISSrnmxriifl 45*61

NK Rothschild Aset Management Limited
Tokyo PotOmani)—.I £187 64 I -145597

AoicrtcavSptaWSIU..
Commodity Aug 31_...
EloQttaOf
Meoev
MortgageAre 3!
Narui Anwricao

*47 51 49 90
S36 05 37.86
5Z7.81 29.21
*32.93 34 34
013X9 13.95
*37.29 39.17
*29.36 3084,
55 88 6.18
£36.96 40.92

43878
45874
43873
<3872
45875

-145831
43S76
45879
43877

Royal Trust Asset

sioxs
Future*

540.09
swjaw
£21.24
04.75
59.08
515.24
*13 46
S1L02
itaw.«
51020660
5101.71
511553

-I -

I -I -

45432
45433
45434
45435
43436
45437

ASUM50KSI1*.

—

Canadian Growth.— ...

Indonesian Growia.—
HaaagtdCioRiugr
Nippon State
Pacific Grrnnn
WortdwMeGrewtli
Asla-PadilcGmaUL...
SwgnmcGrowth.

Mnomt (Asia) Ltd
5U_7b 1X36
cs'nm il aa
*14 0
510.45
SID 83
*10.31
51057

46770

CS10 88 11.44
SIS 08 14 80

1052
U-39
10.84
11-11
1X85
0.905

Bayal Trust North American Bond Fd
NAV 11551056

wSSwS»,l 518.BO I -I *5741

Sabre Fund MngtLhJ

Ed13.91 i -1 45445

qas

IbU Wrosy**)

44762 Dtmty Valta TflK^^TsiJtaJA -|

44763 UlilliyVabieTrga 3—151056^43 -I 7X9146767

44764 Mdbriial-igriufatnrtMBnHOIre

HambroPMif(eFuBdMM»rtUJ
4«»« Aactaklian FdSvM L... S6 64 7J6

44767 jSScSswI.::~;I|«.Q3 46X4

1

: HansanannHHlBS.NVQmcaa
44769 NAVA4B1S 1 *»« *

Uanlet Thrugmo^tim MnsmtUd
32-30

1

1

NAV Aag 29 1

Meridian Funds
Money Martel—
us G4rt latent
Glottal Govt totear^..
MiriU-CurrenEy

.

Global EtaUty 1

Merrill Lynch Asset Management
Ooliar Atatta Ffplle_4

”

First Conrertrble Sec*

.

517.83
SID57

SFri9.03

—] 45742
- 45743
-145744

Ud

M
WSk
510.09

A28 -

FularsFdSAaga-.
Rimial 'A' y
Financial "B“ SFr-

[ml Dollar. '

Inti ErgiHy—
*Ssi'nT

t

^T«“Nnca and Th Aug 29 -1 54289 I -145762
Schrodera Asia Limited
Altai Fond....

Pacific GoH
TUb-
ys Pacific Stock,Fund .

.

NAV Sep 1 -I 517.81 I -145902

Units Invest Fd Mgt Co SA Lux
London & ComJnoRJJ Basle* US
Uetelmest. Food. . - |0M77% BO30
Volte EguHy Fuad. - I DM67JO 04 41

Ufllon-lnvestment-Gesellschaft PmbH
Unifoptt»..._ D rase. 92 34 00
umiak. DM78.94 82.90
Urureolo IDU40JQ CL80

Viking Fnnd-SICAV
fNAV Aag 29 EBV90 49

Wartwrg imr Mngmt (Isle of Man) Ltd

GrtSfFdBDPUPi
4

^J?U).43 1044 - 46164
Dollar Fd OPUPi . ... 512.17 1229 - <6165
Starling Fd BOPUPl— £10.44 10.« - 46 66
Starting FdOHM. £14.15 14.28 - 46167
pMFdBOPUP* DM10J6 1017 - 46168
DM Fd DROP* DM1383 Si 46 - 46169
Yen Fd BOPUP*. 58-40 8 41 - 46170
Yen Fd GPU Pi 151202 12J« -446171

NMuAUa Pic Trust.- 51340 13.73 3.64145494

=368 .

S55SJR?f
,lSt^

Dynamic GrrthFd, 51903

-(43998

ITT
Global Eouliy PMIe...l S10^90 1 -1 -

UarriU Lywb Ghbal Ccvreroy pgrtteUK
fluu Dollar P-foilB—J ASJ089

HU te-SlIfl Hjgnlk. _l 6-
Imi tor-httiHig" loe-.lv-

-I -

1 Z

P-
folio.-.

8SS3S““~=!
IUIU-CbffBBPWIe_
uSAMteBrrfBiio.....
USFadmfSecwttisJ

DM10 28
aos7

t
il
15
49

39.41
59.92

45477
45900

—J 45901

CvrTWcy & Bmd Fd I*—
ConreniBand FdAcc-
EivsgvFdPd
EmKan Fd—
Cola Fond
Hong Hong Fd
International Tree.
Japan Fmo. -
Norw Amerlao Fund.

ScbRriets Austral
ScarcerAaS.5t

Elsi Money Market

Trust Funds

7W0 Contain £C3
,

£50O-£994 9 00
£1 000-£2 499 10-30
£2.SOO-£9 999.. .. 11.50
UO.OOOr 11280

Coutts Reserve Account
440 Strand. London WCR 005
£50.000*. ._. 12625
£20 000-T49.499 11250
£5.000-£19.999- ._ 12 00
£1-14.999 16 00

Partington & Co Ltd
10 The Crescent. Plymouth PL1 3AS

,
0752673873

Money M kt Acc 11275 9431 13811 -
Edlngton Pic
1 King Street. Manchester M2 6AW , ,0618342535
HfCA<U.0HM — 113 5 10B6 1 -l -

Financial & General Bank pic
13 Lowtatts Street Lctem. SW1X 9£X 01-2350036
RLDACSOOD-Ci JOB 11270 4.93 U 751 -
H.I.DA £15.000 113 00 10-171 14 091 -
Gartmore Money Management Ltd
2-3 White hart Yard. Lgnd« 5Q 1NX

.
01-2361425

Money Mpgt- AccL. . 113 125 10271 14X31 -

Girobank pic High Interest Cheque Acc
10 Mill St London ECTVSJH

,
016006020

£1.000-0.994 .7T9.SO 8.25 U.OO] -
fa OOO- £9.994 10 0 6 75 U e7 -
OO.OOO-r 110 75 9.25 1 IXJJ I

-

Grofund In? Mngn/Allied Irish Bank
High Interest Cheque Account
51. Brtmoot Road, Urbtlltae. UB81BZ

,
089339783

£1500* -.llJJO 1041) 24 441 -
Humberclyde Finance Group

I

0236B41863
12 47 -
1353 -
14 04 -
13.21 -

Lloyds Bank High Interest Cheque Account
71 LomltartSL London EC3P3BS

.
01-3253447

£500*. 8 0D 6.301 6 70) -
£5 000* 10.40 8.00 10 70) -
£10000* .-|10.no a JO 11.201 -
£30.000*- 1 11.40 8 00 1 11.70 1

-
M &. G/Klelnwert Bensori
M AGHie^VIcwrUlU OMirefonl

. ,
0245 266266

H.I.CJL i£2 SOOrt.....J 12.00 9X9 1 1309"
Midland Bank pic
PO Pot 2. Sbetfleld.

.

Hire Int04Acc. 110 86
£10 000* 11 50
£30000* .. . 11.82
PnraarStoi'ttaOOOr. 112 14

NatWest Special Reserve Account
41 LathaHy. London. EC2P 2BP
£25 DOT ana runt .

.
[1250

£10 OOO to £24.944- 12.00
£2 000-t4 9.« 111 73
E500-U.999 In 00
Provincial Bank PLC
30 Ajniey Rd. AJytodum. Ciierelrr ,061-9289011
H I CA. ’£1.030*1—..113 125 10 27) 14.361 -

Royal Bank of Scotland pic Premium Acc
42SlAitdrew5q. EdrnbsrgnCh22YE 031-2285650
£50 000*. Tlioo 10 17 14 09 -
£25 OOO- £49 449 ... 112.70 94? 13 75 -
£10 000 - £24 444. .. 1X30 4 62 13 JD -
£2J00-£4.949 11175 9J4 12.64 -
Save & Prosper/ Robert Fleming
28 Western Ra. hntftira RM1 3LB ,0708 766966
HI.BJL 112 00 9JMIU.12I -

TSB Bank pic England & Wales Division
100 L»nrT>iine}5f. London EC3R6A0, 01-6236000
HIUU-£449 .. . |o50 3!<l 7J3| -
£500-tl 999 4 00 7 50 10 00 -
£2.000* 1 11.00 9.001 12-00 1

-

Tyndall & Ca Ltd
24-33 Prlnass Victoria S«. Bridal
Demaed Act.
AtaKvAcL -

OtanPiuiflcc

.

J. Henry Schrader Wagg & Co Ltd
Billon Cm. NorJurowrPs. Psnun tn

,

0705372222
Sore.aiflee.

.
|1300 10.17 UXif -

£10.000 ru-datere.. 1L3X5 10.37114.511 -

Western Trust High Interest Chesue Acc
T6el.1™yteKtre. PlrmyuthPLllSL 0752224141
£25 WO* . 11350
£5.000-£24 499 . .. 113 23
£1.000-£4.994 . . iUOO
Wimbledon & South West Finance Co Ltd
114 Negate St. EC1 7AE 01-6069485
Hire int DwareAK.....! 1330 10 56 1 J4 Ml -

830
900
22*
930

m ua
aVinonsSi. Bridal 0272732241

rillTi 9 97 13 60 1
-

- J23J 931/133.- -
x 112 25 939 1 13 24 1

-

it a<52J24 14
10 56 14 64

1

-
10Jb 14J6 -
1017 !A 081 -

$7,65 8.27
51.63 L72
MX6 430
Sb 14 6JJ
55.93 6X7
S3 67 38S
HKS^Ob U.65

saw
7ib

S632
a Ltd
ASS 70

45768

Sl^
45771
4bl6£
45773
45774
45775
45770
45772

6.141 -(45777

Grott Net
C
cS* Hw

Charities Aid Fndtn Money Mngmt Co Ltd
SUrit Hail Sionr Cl, Kouwfcdltdi. EC3 01-283 Wbl
CAFCASH Clll Fund (13 66 10 64 14 MT -
CAFCASH J-lMi Fund .1 13 61 lO.bSl 14 7BI -
The Charities Deposit Fund
ZForeSlrVH. LodCon EgfMfl

(
0(^J8IBIS

Gartmore Mouqr Management Ltd
2-3 White Halt Yarn. Lonom&lRiMX 01-2361425
Call Fnd.— -.113.82 lOBil 14 60| -
7-day Fiotd 11383 10£2 1 14611 -

NOTES-Grou rate to iwm(iwa from rempatita rata cf
Um Stt atUiil rjatollrt triur.iw ii' C8T Gr Eguir CAR,
Grow equKJirr" tb blue rslp tinumv-campnindH
annul rjle !-i Cr irroutnc* mtersii credhed

UNIT TRUST NffTCS
Prices are (n ue*ce «rl«» ^-hmxiie indlcatHf and tltot«

deuputte i «nr no pretn rrier toll S dollar, yields •»
aliaar ici ail taoira e»«ne>. Pnen at certain alder
Insurarje Iiihtm purs Mi9wa to casiUl gam u» w
Mies b Dir.ripo.ion ireeat Ur. urea, p Periodic craniion
imurantr oiam- < ffl»CI' oremlum utwrance < Dtlrred
trier itc/uan an ntmn eueiiL Mcni's cwwntuion z
Pte.Ste Bay > arm ’n Garme* gr«c a SuiDHMrt 4
Yield brton-Jenn LU. i Ea-4Lbd>vn>u. tt OnltaiailiUc
to craMJfie dm>fl a f'SJs cciamr snom annuamed
rates el NAV mcreait. ad e* dltWend. I**)Fmh not 518
recegciMd.
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LONDON SHARE SERVICE • For Latest Share Prl^ ^ ary jjjgFlSflS fi*S^£vAX
(listed below). Calls charged at jqp t"

INDUSTRIALS (Miscel.)-Contd INDUS! KiALMMtad.r-^DnM.
' —

‘KOIAMERICANS -Contd
Rirtd
£u.Em stpek
laiKJ Fond Motor SI ....

SUE: Gen Elect bJc
- eGererei Haute* SI

3J25SGiN«[ic51
2b9.9 y.toritvi Sort 31 SL

90S 1 Sr»»noundSlt
75« 2 Hasbro Inc Me ....

I't'Si HnimvellSl 1!
25*5 fi Houston tods 3

ISM CeranSlir .

1 iTfiwflS-cnw*^ li-

UT3J Insenoll-Rand S2
2,140 J Lock treed Cron 51..

353 7 Lure Star I nds Si
aiB dLouiiljna Lard l£c

792 ojujae s Wc... . .

ISUWaruf Hanover SI

2 EllqMeTnll Lynch SL .

b08 ZMote* Inc.

A mJjMorgan t J pi S2
aCQLaMomslPIlllip* . ..

BffilWYNE^S!
3 24iN wide Legal Sen }...

412 7IPHH Com g
-WPaclflc#sp I

] BlbJlPaciliwro S3 1 *. ..

IlJDijPjt 11 ic Tries!* 10c.

786 3jPail Coro 25c ....

3.3l3|Penr)i0ilfi3 l/3c .

3.190 9 Quaker Oats S5 ...

.

7t>5 t> Pen NY Ccron 55 ...

CAfll JRixkwHUnll SI .

SIS.1 Sean. Roebuck 75c

Hljlh ‘ SouUiwstim Bell SL
LwllSSun Co. Ire. SI

1.821 1 TRW Inc. b2‘!C
l,Mi rw Services S5
5.7I4J TennecoSS..
TJJfcTJ Teiaco Sb.25
23o2i TetaJlnstr SJ ...

8JJLC Time Inc SI
639.6 TftlNOVA Coro

bS4.1b.Ll5X SI
23b 9 fUmlab
4.6TZ.7 U'd Tectroieqles..

- VLIllltUCHliic

QllblUSWesU
8471! WjaeMwnnBhSL
Ui6b Whirlpool SL.. -..

2 «{72 Wh. (man Coro . .

.

238LWWoolwonh S3»i .

.

BUILDING, TIMBER, ROADS -I

Contd

DRAPERY AND STORES -Contd ENGINEERING -Contd
a J. .. 1 —- - - - tnk. >1 I Mh I Ma Iv*u1 1JMl [DM

U43Q

!K£*KKi3

-{9ABU Gold Corp 9 . 1
153!

-WAHMS Energy Cere. .1 2*.
892BWan*r BirnckRei._.j 15*^

,
For^ilinierica'v* Asl^merlca, Ed. (Americana)

-bAucmiiio Espin..

LBDjlBli Montreal 0

L751qBk NovaScoL|. ...

-pBCGosSl
6.650 6 BCE g

300 2*BowValley|
LUO 2 BBrascinJ
30.9 (Breakwater Res....

2ibl8 Ian ImoBankg
- Central Capital "A" |

- vCororu Coro

60.5 IICoib TVS Min
- VDerianlnds 1

958.9 ?Edio Bay Mines...

.

- PECO Coro I

51.6 Mia lactic Resource...

345.2 Gandall Techs. Inc.

34.2 Granges Inc. t

- pGt Pacific Re.
- VGult Caudal -

122.3 PHawkerShsCanl..
- yHenlysGrouo ....

545. 1 uHudwm' s Bay |...

46% 7*9 Imperial Oil]

1505 : incnl

10 0?Mad(leine Mints .

-Wuscocha Erpln ..

- PNevJda Goldfields.

U»7: Nova Coro 0» Alberti

6*32.3 VR10 Algom
3.88.5 Roval Bb. Can. B-
5:23.7 Seagraml

- trSonora Gold Corol ..

- (TjmPureTMi Cerel-

3 463.7 Toromo-Dom. Bk|.

l.lfib 5 PTranS Can Pipe

286.aVarltyCorpl

>088

BANKS, HP & LEASING
Market

Can. £m Stock

1391 »NZ SA1-
L936B Abbey National lOo.

923.0 Allied Irish Ord

L2S4.r Algemene FI. 10....

29 8 Anglo Irish. Vl

135.7 Anstochtr HU lp 6]

Lffil 7 Bancarre Cle Fr 100.

2997 2 Banco Bilbao Viz....

3.637.6 Banco de Santander.

564.8 Bank Ireland IrEl. N
134.4 Bank Leumi
23J Bank Leumi tu.K.)

829 6 Bank Scotland.. -

108.0 Do. 9UpclndPf..
17.b Bank of Wales.... ..

6,859 1 Barclays 11
10 4 Benchmark 20p....

54.5 Broan Shi pin£L
73 1 Cater Allen £1
45.0 Chancery

369.7 Corrmerrt* DM 10.

321 5 CHqn Hbk KrlOO..

OT27U Dal Idil KBk Y50...

IMS! Deutsche Bk DM50
147.6 Espirito Sarto
354.8 First Nat. Fin. 10p__
54 7FNFC635CWMW1H

42.«U Fuji Bank Y50
104 8 Gerard & National..

61.6 Goode 0 arrant 5p.

94.0 Guliness Mahon iOp

369.4 Hambros 20p ......

145.5 Do 7.5peCvPf....y

26667 IK AShiiig HKS2.W
25.2 Joseph iLeoJ £L...y
20.2 King iShuson 20p v
454 6 r.Wnvmt Braoe Grp- f

33<W 7 Lloyds £1 a
26.8 lw. Scot Bank lOpy

Met Dt* YTd Last

Net GrS xd

249 SlC4Ht 6 6 12.6

14fi L7.7 6.9 -
167 hQ68*.L 43 22 5

£12.', t027% 6 3 2-5

ft 53 8.5

73 2 C 3.7133
£616 1.6 93
£45, 0357% 2J912.
£32 021‘N. 2.4JL101
226 fcOlilM 4.6 223

Q9b - -

345 tl33 53 31.7
110 3 B 4.6 85
108 9^»%i 11.4 85
55 i8 6.8 83

1

,

542k! rZ3 0 5.714 8
29 1.63 7 5 3.4

345 105 4319.6.
385 235 8.1 19.61

22l| 851 4.813.7

2914 ^Midland £1 op77tiid

37.6791 MiunbWii Bark V50.

16553 Nit9iDWdTsi4MY50- .

514 0 Morgan Grant ell £1. M
3139 7 Nat Aust.Bk.A51..

5.«i7 Nat West lOOp-.d
90 0 Ottoman Bank
26 7 Rea Bros Group...

635.1 Rothschild 1 J>Hltfgs.B

LJ71X Rural Bk. SctnJanL. tf

3J.699J Sanwa Bank Y50...;,

133.7 5andiraiuii Bk Dolts. N
3135 Schroders £1...

63 7 Do. £1 N/V ...._ yj
3.189 7 Sec. Pacific 510 ...[

L3ZL7 Standard Cnartd. £1 d
C.Wt Tcmliomo Bank Y50.

IwSnatciiioTnS BaYSO..,

1.718 b TSB
2b.8 TSB Ch'nel h'l ...

203.1 Union 0Honan £L-
813.2 Warburg (S.G '

62.5 DoOpeCnvPrf..
2.85L0 Westpac SA1 .

39 llWinuna 20p.— yi

£16*,
£241,

33E

113

Q189L 3.6127.5

5
015% 5.S213
15% 0^ 4.7

024% 1.1115
075c _ a
tlL5 6.B 17.7

b 3% 7.419.6

^ ,u
.a si&3

121 43 5.0 3L7
145 41.2 1.1 B.5

230 10.0 5.8 37
97c 74% 10314.8,
46 H036c 6 4 17 4

480sd 15.85 4 4 14.8

12B 9.25 9.6 22.5

343 14.0 5.4 3.4

415 116 8 5.4 31.7
46 t2.05 5.9 19 6

thl6 4
£14% 015% 0.

£12.I Qlb% 0..
3^4 10 85 43 3.4

303 sQ32i 5.1 19.6

359a fU4 L2 5.2 14 8

£180 Q90% 5 0 115
68 03 1017.4

221 95 5.7 19.6
457 tl5.0 4.4 8.5

£12% Qlb% 03 27 9
168 t8 5 6.9 17.4

1300 195 10 3.4

1000 195 2.6 3.4

£31 tf 05L96 3 9 27.7

5d& 33.9 8 2 3.4

06,; Q15% 0.2 4.7

..,£11% 016% 0.3 -
ahl4'2 * <5 24 b l 14.

B

182 1061 3.4 56
550 30.0 7.3 17 7,

433 125 3.8 19 6
147 6% 5.4 133
251 s033c 6.3 3014

463a 7.3 21414.8

IB*

b bO Caketwod Robey A.y
Z71 8 Caradon 5b
8.32 rCarron PnoeoJa IDpy
13.4Coiroyl0o v
B4 7 Conler Croup v
16.4 Coimmi (F.)5b y

551.3 Costair Group.

80 6 Countryside Praps.

1555 Crest NKhrtljta
355 DoS‘iPC Cr.Cra RLPf.yl

6 67 Creston 10a n
12.8 Crcsby Uamesl IOp- Si

29.7 Doneton TysoalOa..jj

78.6 DCMiiSifbbtM!-H
6 62 iOurnaa Group 5p.yt

24.5EBC50O. J
19. 4 Edmund Hldgs IOp... B
225 itpwln Group IOp ..y]

24 b Erllb -
27Jj4E« Sroafl

2W 7 Evered..... ....

—

39.7 Fan-briar IOp
11.7 Fed Housing 5a__
22.1 Flnlan Grows 10p.pl
17.0 tFiwnian Group10p' J

65 6 Ga HMord 5n . _...U
4 58 SlbbsO. Dandy 10p..y|

4.1b Do. "A" 10p....
1....y|

77 8 GMson iMJ) 10p..v|

835 Graham Wood v|

21 0 Harrison lndslOp..y|

13.9 r Hatfield Ests ....«}

221.1 Hnden-Suart IOp. B
37.9 Do. lOpc-IHfOS.-.S
9.59 frHemuon IOp •..*

4 12 Do. 7pc Cm C* Pf .,
857 6Key& Craft H5p..v

1462 Reywood Williams—

P

23.4 Do. Ciw. Prt v
114.5 Higgs A Hill i

41.4 How Group IOp. ...V

11.6 Reward Hldgs. IOp . v
306.1 Ibsvodi Johnsen„.0

- flnuii Amro Coo
253 Jackson Group 10p...y

21 G JarvisiJ J5o y
150.4 gjenmngs AS 50....

24.2 Htingjpan Gp IrZOp. y
iI405 Lafarge Cop F100..

129.2 Liing (John) (

119 0 Do “A ' N/VUl 8
163 Latham U. I £1 y
60.1 Lawrence IW3....P
5 2b DolSKCuthSH Cl

99.4 Lllley 12bp
8.09 Ron & Clydeside, y
156.2 LOMlI Of. J.l.

127 3 HlcAi pine (Alfred) 8
63.6McCartby&5laM2I)p.G

lb.4 McLaughlin & H.. v

75 2 MandtrsIHldgl.... 8
412.7 Harley i

109 2 Marshalls -t

70.1 DobbaCiCmRfdPf.y
21.4 Maunders (J_)20p.

372.0 Meyer InL...

12.4 Hiller (Stan) 10p..d

4.61 rUKklnGro20p-
357.9 Mnwlem (J>.—
235.1 N5M 10b -«
18.1 JNeedler Group y.

215.9 Newarthlil £1

136.2 Newman-Tpnlo....
119.7 Persimmon IOp....

12.2 Phoenix Timber ...

17.2 Pochlns

83.9 Polyplne IOp

775 Prowling 2ft)- m
255 tQuillgotiJ So—

n

UGL3 UMC
J

124 4 Ralne Inds. IOP—
7 97 1Ramus. yl

LH15 Redland d
b3.0MMCa7i.bC.blL-]
17.0 5i?oskel IOp yj
525 6 Rugby Group t

48 0 Rush & Tompkins..

y

7.94 5-5WP Group 5p....y

3 30 tSandell Group lOp-H

10.4 6SenrfWd-Rwel0p.y
24.0 Sharpe & Fisher....

y

273 Sheffield Imtk.l0p..y

8.61 bSheriff Hldgs. 5ay
7.72 pShorroGrp y
223 ilndall (Wm)5p...y
lb.b Smart U.) IOp. „..y

617.4 SteeUey 8
2B6L1 Tarmac 50p a
24.7 Tay Homes. y
9433 Taylor Woodro*»...o

130.8 Tilbury Gropp^. e

217JTS«P^slty
25.9 Try Gro*p V
3.25 !Tudor20p
29.6 Turriff Coip_. ......

8

15.7 SWwurePlaaiGip. Spy
99.8 Vibraplant5p y
81.6 Ward Group 5p.r .

42.1 Ward Hldgs. IOp..

7B.6 Watts Blake.

107.0 WestburylOp
30.0 wiggiiuwoun.....

141.4 WIISM Bowden IDa

110
44.
73l

J

1L.
231
31.
221

201
85

1

3‘

117i
5

509*
3
1_.
38ia
143:

7

10.65 1C 225
2.25 2 4 14 8

121 0201-. 4.0 33
93 L1.71 25 -

067% 025% L4 13.Z
292 12.0 5.5 3.4

281 12.0 5.7 3.4

324 10.75 4.4 3.7
130'2 7.5 7.7 22.5

135 3i2%lB.4ll3 2
tal.

121

Bi> YTd Last
Net Grt xd
.7% 2.6133
4.1 5.0 5 b

ll.C 33 3 7
4.0 7 3 17.7

L4.0 35 3.4
11. D Id 85
4 0 2.

3

14.8

U.75 5.0 17.4
0.15 1.917.7
t7.15 4.6 14 8
5%% 8.614.8
gi.6 b 3 27.2
3 5 4 014 8

uQ.75 L9
63 1.714.8

. 1.0 3514 8
rb6.75 4 9 34

1.7 5 9 17 4
03 4 9 14 8
3 9 7317.4
S7 0 33 31.7
455 3 8 8 5
5.0 oJ 19.6
75 7.9 34
4 9 9.1 14.8

tb.75 3.0 14 8|
t3.2 4 7 13.3
275 1.4 17 4
2.76 5.617.4
18.14 1.4 85
L7.7 4.3 17.7
685 S3 196
0.0 Z2 85

,

,
h22 2517.4

010% 20 3.7
3.85 3.7 14 B
7.0 7.G 19 6

1338 63 14
tll5 53 14 _

6.75 7.6 13.3
12C 4.717.4
3 3S 45 85
1.5 4 4 13.2
55 4.7117.4

1*215
]

MvMnds City-

Paid line

Apr July L698
Apr Oct

Dee July 1354
Aug May 1567
Fee Aug 1355
April lb24

MayMar E202
Dec June
Apr Oct ,

July Dee 1360
- 1740

AprSep Il740

Hot June 11742

5.Q14.8'
4.7

NuvjDA 1743
OctApr 1754

May No* 1802
Jan Aug 1983
Jan. July 2081

Jan July 2102
May 1046

March 2237
June 3221
May 2345
June 5187

Feb Aug 2571

July 2570

Dec June 1084

,June Dec. 2686
March Sep Z72Z

June 5074
Jan Sen 2812

Apr Oct (4388

MaySep
Jan Sept 3060
June Dec. 3088
JunDec 3102

Oct May 3171

Mar July 4651

May Oct 3380

June Dec. 5290
4775

Oct May 3417
JalyJan 3456

Oct May J3463
May

274
363
124
SBC
214
141

264k
111

227!
II

£16L
12i

I!

£1G

375i

111

37
10:

21

,6§ 3 d 3.4
5.7 7 B 19.6

16.65 3.2 3.7
161 60135
15.14 55 19.

_

g9C 4.019.9
6.35 3.9 5.4
655 5.G 3.4
8.75 4.4 14.8
6 5 7.8 14.8

t3-15 4 8 3.4

15 0 5.2 3.7
4.0 2-b B5

WdUG 3.2
19 5 bJ 17 4
3.0 2.9 3.7

09.8 5 4 17.4.

,15.0 0.9 22.5

tS5 6.1 17.7

5.0 4 4 135
2.75 45 19.6
19.0 1.5 3.4

f25 22 135
5.0 5.419.6

L2.0 3.0 3.7
14 5 2.717 4
t3.0 4.0 3 4

T7.0 5 2 3.4

19 G 4 8 85
07i»% b.9

3.0 31 B5
5.2 3 E 3 4

15.2 5.4 14 8
M5 2.1

L4 4 4.4 56
2J5 3.417.4
u40 4.7

L4.25 45
15.25 4 2 3.7

h3.75 2.2 3.4

5 0 2.1225
ltfi.fi 4.7 5.6

115 3.917.4
10.0 4.7 85

Hi2.67 3.1 3.4

,

H75 3 517.4
4H32C 6 617.4
tu2.25 3517 7
Ls7.5 4.7 85
L50 5.3

bZ.67 6.1 5.6
11.5 4.1 3.4

15.25 43 225
g3.0 LG 145
5.4 22 85
26 4.4 13.2
7.4 26 225
8.5 5.2 5.6
4.0 6.3 3L7

6.72 4.2 3.4
3.0 2.7 85
923 4.&I3.4

Dlrldents
Raid

Oct. Mar
Jan Jul

Jan Aug
Feb Jul
DecJun
No* Jun
Apr Oct
July Oct.

Sept Apr.

Apr. Oct
Apr Da
KnMtnber
Apr Oct

1
[September

|

October

May Oct
No* May
Jun Oct
NnMay
Mar Sept
Nov July
Feb dug

aiy-
1

line
1392
2033,
Mb*
4679
5090
2212
ZZ38
2246
2248
2276

,

ZZ75
3111

i

Tiro

4644
,

2366

2411

.

2427
2486
2493
25C8
2509
2532

On May ES
iFebAsrOa1

on Apr
Apr. Nov
Oct May
Oct May
Jan June.

Feb Aug
Mar Aug
June
DecJly
Jan July

Mar On
Jan Jly

Apr. Oct
April Oa
Apr On
Nov June
Nov. June
On Mar.
No* Jim

No* Jly

Apr Oa
MarlarOa

2564
4932
2653
2692
2691
7700
3234
3838
4628

2876
1875
2877
5124
2880
2831
2883
2886
4621
2930
2954

5107
U30
3033
1767|
1127
3122
3121
3136
3138

MarMl Mw
Cm. £10 Slack
b45 Lowndes O’ way bp. E

553.7 Magnet. * 30
65.7Do.S»ipePlZ012._y
21 BMallett5p _Y . l»l

5437 cSMarte & Spencer., c 2Z0>gl

20 1 Martin UL)20p....g U9
Z2S.0 Memte U. 0
125 Miller& Snthse. 5p_y
32.2 Uoss Bros Grp 5p--Y

514.7 Next IOp. —
25 7 Oliver Grp. ’A*..... v
8.9G Owen & Robinson Ip.v

1L0 FPMLSp...... t
20.9Panflda Group

117.7 Pentos IOp n
91.2»PeD* Group 10p> v
5 63 rPropeller lp..—

9

4.08 tanur Texts. 5a- v
536.0 RainHslOp..--...B
50.1 DaCroCofflMEl.y
IOC fRefeaShopSp— .»

8.11 Rltr DBlgnGrpSa-l
6.55 S4U Stores 12 >jp.,

140 Do 31>ipcpf.l2v-
1,047 TtSeais-

J.O rSbanlGroap IOp. v

62 8 iStewood Grp iflp..y

583. 9 Smith (W. H3A50p r

23.2 Book Shop ta0.5p..y

8.60 iSpedalnts 2p....y --
Bb 7 Stead. & Sim A - a 15M
24.2 Sorting Gram 20p_v *41

594.5 Storehouse 10p.....fl

7.97 Summer Inti. 20p..y

7.42 Do.75ee€»CnMPf.y
79.7 T &.S Stares 5a~. y
25.7 Tie Rack 5p t

93.8 Time Prods. 10p_. B
4.98 Uoton 4 Southwn. 7
6.29 HJsherfFranUSa,
32.6 Vhrat Hldgs

‘

527.1 Ward Whit*-...-. „
248 6 DoCnvRtdPrf lOp-v]

6Jb SWensum 5p
‘

27BJWK*
2l3wildlng Off. IOp..

10 ^yvvondof^tol^yj

Oh [YTdlLast

4.4 3.7 17.4
5.b 3.4 225,

4.75 5.4 22JI
489 ab 4 2.1 225
XfcC W4.C IW
255 4.0 2.1 85,
131 7.4 7.12251
IBS 65 C 35 17.4

64 05 0.6 17.7

2S 1.0 55 85
41 g2JES 7.4 195
119 li 2.0 225

349* fb.C 25 14.8
4J

”5 15 3.4,
32 1.75 75 350|
257 75 3.4 225
153 5.35% S.1 225
1« 355 42 3.7
9( 2.S 3 0 5.6
7< 4J5 7.7 225.
31 3.94 135 28-12}

U! 5.1 5J 22?
86 H3.4 55 225

39? SJ L9 3.4

36! 10.4 3.913.2,
86 *2.12 35 3L7I
59 1.88 4.3 301

*5.6 5.8 1.9

. .. L36 2.9 12-12]

14! 8.G 85 3.7
B7 FLC 15 31.7.

1M 75 9.< 31.7J
125 K45 2.4 6.6

7! L53 2.4 19.6
18! 65 4.G 19.

72 25 4.6 85
,

9B 6.0 95 27J
79 - -235

44! 610.5 35 5 b
152 6 C 53 3.7

85 LZ94 4.6.

221a t35l 2.1114.8

14 q 4 .ffl 17.7
4M 4.M 3.4
45< 2.S 3.4

Dhfciemb aty-,.__

W A
Feb Aug. 3265 1 27.
Mar Sep 3263
May Oct 3274, —
Jan. Am. 13292 1 34.

6
13!

Jaii Juft B6i I 1295TM6roup' IOp— 5M
JanOtt OT9l 72G Ballet (LHJ..— V 13J.
Oct May §386 Mi Beroford IOp -....3 2B
JunDec B4Z«

|
23.1 Slrmlngham Mint. 4 361K=“ l

85.9 Blackwood Hodge 8 S2h
4.4fi Booth hMhstries... y U2J
275 BraswaylQp. 9
75* irSpToisaplOa.y
345 Bromsgrove tab 5p_v
10.7 Brooke Tool 3p—

H

lb4i Sutloogti20o...

42.4 LI. lflp

54.7 Camford Eng...

575 ^rdoEng. Sp

—

225 Castings Up -V
45C LuiMrn Groui 5p. I
5.60 Chunbothi & Hlll.y

24.4 Janr1ogGrow5p_y
115 no.Cnv.RiPf 5p_.
5.07 SayunSonSOp-y
215 Cohen (A] 28p .

r

70.7 Doctentrlc I&.

—

38.2 DxritCWm.tap-
36.6 Cooper (Frl 10p-
14.1 urontte Group—

.

P
. lD.f Barte & HeL IOP—
25LG Davy Corp —
512.G Detii.

„

B4.1 Desoutter Bros—.0
7.70 Downltbrae 10a- Y
22.0 (Eadie. -Y
345 Edbra «
56.C BlhnilBJ Y
70.7 Falrey Group 5a—

Y

7.73FWelndmar.— ...9

37.

iTUlUst BWdrods
. Net fir's xd Paid

19lIlhS.BE 4.117.4 Mrt'Hm'
9q 352 4.7 135 AprOct

M>i 5.9 17.4 Nov May
IOC 3.1 85 DecJMW
tit 05 14 Mejw

- 3'80 -pm
4 6 21 3.4 MayHo*
B-( 6.6 £7.7 JM Qtt

tU IS 3.4 Jim NOV
25 25 31.7 JanSmt
U53 25 3L7 FebOtt

ttoKm 1163

Jul Dec 9229
Jan Jul 4235
June 4363

gg
July Dec >430

Feb Aug 4429
- 1913

oa Jul 1498
Feb Aug 4503 639.1

May No* 1512
Oct Apr 14546

eEnalOp-
SlynwedlnL

July

Oct June
On June
Feb. Am.
Jan. July

Apr On 1993

No* May 3166
July Feb 31%
Apr. Sept 3224

AprOct 331b
July Feb. 3318
May Nov 3322
Noa. May 3278

Qu May 3291

On Apr. 3300
5C99

May Nov 3307

Feb. Sept 3364
Nov June 3387

ELECTRICALS

Dec. July 3431
Oct Jan 4934,
On May 5105
July 3487

]

Mar Aug 3493

April On 3641
Jan Aug. 3655

,

May Dec. 3683]
Apr Nov 5b90

Jul D« p067
Jan Sep
May Dec 3838]
Jan May. 3760

May Dec 3765
Jul. Dec. [3793

January
June 5982

,

Nov May 3832]
Oct Apr 3386

5320

,

Jrty 1697]

May Oa 5126
3999
4640

ftinutf —
oa May >612

July Dec 1027

Dec. July 4042

Nov Jun 4108

July Nov. 4170
May Dec 4176.
July Oa 4177

1

June Oct 4230
[

FebJim 1<297

May Oct
June Dec
Jan Jun

July

Martha.
Jun Nov
Apr. Ocl
J uly Nov.

Jan July

FebSept
May No*
0a. July

OahUy

101.1 AB Electron Ic ri

98.0 abb Kern n
7 63 AMS IndsSp in

25.5 WlcalSp - Yj
17.9 wcorn Cmptr Ito-Y]

20.9 Mnltal Compell pgap-yj

325 BlbalOp ~vf
18J Alphameric 5p—

«

420.3 Aimtrad 5p 4
45.6 kAppl'd H’npblcsSp-

«

52.6 Apricot Comp IOp. H
3.26 SrcolecLric 'A' NV5PV1

78.6 1SEA AB. 'A‘ 3l50_
1

... u*c50a- v|
If Eog. 50p. .Yj

kerS1dddR...q
^i(SairaelJUpT|

55.0{HIII & Smith yj

103ftHob«ni5p

UM 4.0^
2.9J3.7J

Feb_5ep gK9 M®o«s& Shipman..

193d T255I mcwixir^ ssssyfifici
JUI Dec 11399

1 ^ Unnai _w
350 .ockermSp Yj

„ *2C 35 3L7 Sept Feb 1573

74 1.4 25 275 April No*. 1604

315 - - - - 1630

7D 2-0 35 5.6 JaiAog lb32

U 0.96 2017.4 May No* 1640

92* 35 4.1 14.8 OttMar 1647

£62^Q1B% 1.31151 May 0661

205 195! 6.2 14 Nov.May
SSt 0.85 2519.6 Jan Aug

35 15 4219.6 Jan Aug .

4 1Q3c 6.C 26.8 JM. Sept

117 24 2.71212 February

163 is4.C 3.3 3.4 M*yOa
IS 3-15 27135 May No*

1325
4329
1467
4397
4427
4428
4447
4466
4502
1516
4518
14519

11.0 Brtler Co* 5p y
375 WML Mlcranttns Spy

8 62 iCPU QjmpHtwi 5p- y va - -a - jcvti .. . ...

328 iSIKpSK nS SSl JlSi
1
""*1

87.4 Cambridge Bee.... f

56 6 Un»rt#je«asim5a«
82.4 Chloride Grp f
2L4 yOmangsCoowun-.
6.17 kCIrcapriRi 10a—

Y

15.9 Clark* (TJ IOp.— Y

KlSSaEiigirass
68 3 CrayETtrantc IOp. v
26.fi Crysuiate 5p_ 8
175 Dale Elea. IOp—

v

10.2 Densltnnlntl.Sp..Y

10 G (Denmans Elect.. .y

216 Dewhurst'A' 10a-

Y

43.2 Daaino PrintScl.Sf

73.1 Dmdtng&U. IOp-
351 Wrack Hldgsr

4385glea'romps H
27.3B««ii House

'

CHEMICALS, PLASTICS

54i tg4.fi l.Oj 3.4

17 - H14.11
283 6.5 3.U17.101

2B4 8.8 4.3 3.7

477Wl4.fi 19131.7
264 8.2 4.l]225
227 ia.0 5.48.5
96 3.5 4.4 14

LH7iAk» FI.20. -J £412] QJTMij 5.1 28.4

443.4 AlHedCollOUslOp-d 1^! 2^ 2C 17.7

115 MinerPlasUeTBblc-v] 58 02.5c 27 17,4)

233.7 Amershatn Inti.— p 462 120 3.219.6
120.1 Astra Hldffi C 133 g45S 4.414.8

S558.- BASF AGDM50._. £97i <&% 3.9 4.7

9L* BTP 10a f 153 7.0 5.9 3.7

6.270 1 Bayer AG DM 30-7 Qfti *020% « |
82E Blagden luds-.-.—f MJ t8.4 55 13 3

80.C IrertChemslOa.f M?| 6.0j5.43.4
95.7 laird Gram IOp— 8
219 rCnbrttauotflpelc-v

519.6 Canning lW.>. |

8.51 Chemox* Inti. IOp. y
4772 Coalite Group 1

169.2 Coates Bros- -I
290.0 Crada InL lffp—-p

1321 Ell^?EiSarirS 23Wj S3 3.^M^
628.3 Engelhard U.S5L«f a4>« Q52c 23 95
4.97 Eivopon Colour 5a-Y 27 40-92 45 3.7

82 1 ivodeEraup P 1J7
1525 4.D317

3072 Fosero 365 122 45 85
6 14 SGaynor GroupUp- y 117 *3 0 3.4 19 6|

351 Halstead (JJlOp-Y 2K -«§ 4J a.4

_ U14i Heresies loc| J 03 Q52W 5-1 ?2-5

u'nTiet C7JW 271* Hickson Inti P 2579 16.75 3.5 14.8

JrtD« 3864 SAW' HoeeimAGDM50.. £97,. 024% AO 3.6
Jul Dec 0- nn.10Bdln.Ln_. £310 010% 321212]

??nn 9107 1 Imp". Chem.£1— o 1318* 150.0 5 1 14.B
J
0?m£' m HKSwW-V 2N W2 2.1 3.4
ua May

702£ Laoorte 50p « SK 13 7 3.6 j.4

SffJng 114.1 LriSflrtBests 5p. t 4Ma b22 2.1M.B

lnTuIta*.WR4 18 7Do 6peCe.Bed.Pr1.- 381 6% 2.7 27 2

"18®?#
3S !S£iiSii*l “

S:5 ttl
nbltaffi'B'Kr.JO.. £»«.riOT% 1.2 24 4

44.2 ’emomAB-a-SltU IVh 032% 1.1 1.2

68 9 Plysu. —| 159| 285] 24] 5 6
112 JPorralr 2a--..Y

June
1918

On. Apr 4320
Jan Aug 4319

Mar Sept (4353

Mar Sept .

—

Jan July M473
On Mar W524

^ Isai
153.l|Anglo Grp. IOp—.a
78 5 Do 9 Ispc1W>....y
210 0 OF Yeoman 50p. v
25 8 iCanilil Leeuq IrlOpv

44 4 CaiUe's'Hdgsi IOp. p
7.60 Equity& Gen 5p... v
16b. S Pro* Financial .. f
25.0 yAefiu lovs. Ir5p y
31.2 Secure 1 rust Gro. Ip V

239.9IWoaMiesterlKSJp.Yl

Hire Purchase. Leasing, etc

460 5fi 1.4| S.b
£157 091*% 6.

275 qUW!A 3.

91 101129, L
67 1325 6._.

28 15 7.l] 3.7
331 18 0 7ijZ7.2
zisoifc-i"* 0.
22DW7 09 4
17SHIU>j'« 1.

Dec Aug h613
[September
Oct July

July 1641

MayOa 2062
JonOa 2487
No* Apr 3731

July Oec >940

May 1472
Oct Mar 11487

SSKicW attHkoM%|oak
34.4 Sutdltfc Spellman.,y 388| 20| 15|l9.9.

10 4 Ihurgar Barden 10a y

8.73 (Transrap 10p.—..«
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7.28 Audio Fidel hjlOp.-Y

rnS SSStrilS^OpM jS&Jaai^
^SSSte-a: 1 2ut
39.4 BeniTl&FLain 20p.| 93 1g4.( 5.719.6

12.5 Betacom IOp y 41* u2.6 8.5 14.8 MayOa
9103 Black 4 IHdwaUO-. 054 Q«f Lb 6.6 Ma^SeDe

59.2 Slide 5 d Y ?74 15A 2-7^7 AprSep
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B.»7 4 Anheuser-Busch SI.

3.777 1 Bass a
181 0 Boadingicn 3
985 BulmeMH P.150 .
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5.464 1 Grand Metro 50p...c
445.6 ireenail WhiUej..0
57 .8 Do. 5 95pcCvPftL.y
2195 Greene King f
52211 Gulruitss a
504 0 Do Sloe CmPif-.Y
147 3 DaSIrPCCtLn . v
308 4 Higniand Dhu. 20 p. f

302.8 Macailan-GlenilM-y

52 7 Uaataiald Martin A' ,

79. C Mansfield Brewery . y
208 8 Marstm Tbomosm . I

14 9 jMenydown Wioe.
. 0

65.3 Morland - f

L«3BSc«t&New20p..o
394 9 Vaui Group IOp . -0
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64 3 Abbey -y
22 8 i Allen 50.... 1
25 6 Anglia Sec IOp 0
1426 Anglo Utd V
9.5(1 ArnellHelOp v
44.2 ^tshtead Group lOp.y
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rBNH \Lt£J 1 4W»VV
Jan. May U72b

]
U.afHmctaHmOTUpil

Apr Ngv |l735
|

18.7lHelefle IOp.- H

L2J 2.C
105 3 4 3.7
703 1.0 03
3.0 1J 17.4
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11.1 Austin Reed. 1

64.8 Do.Am P
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|L7 1.1 85
75i 6.61 3.4
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1
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,
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,

23861
2491
24611
24991
25041
2515

,
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240.2 Uultedi IOp
78'6Wtd. Seiemifle—

.

233 aVG Instrumests Ida
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iSi 4.^ 0.7 3L7 FebSept.

rJyOcJat
lujyJan

2439.0 ASDA Group .« MW
703 kotos AHotcCu 50a y 220
7.09 Alpine Group 10p-Y
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Stock* previously listed under Shipping are now Indued In the
Transport sector, as are others horetntore dispersed under several
other headings.

REGIONAL & IRISH STOCKS
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Exchanger throughout the United Kingdom Idr a fee of £985 per
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CURRENCIES AND MONEY REVIEW

Sterling underpinned by rate squeeze
THE BANK of England has
changed its intervention tac-
tics on the London money mar-
ket recently, with implications
for sterling and foreign
exchange policy.
The central bank has been

much more determined to keep
the short end of the money
market tight, to underpin the
14 per cent level of bank base
rates and to help shore up the
pound, without the need for
too much direct intervention
on the currency market.
The authorities appear will-

ing to make their presence
known on the foreign
exchanges, if this gives the
desired signal to speculators
against the pound, but obvi-
ously would prefer not to use
up large amounts of reserves
in this way.
Today's figures on official

reserves are expected to show
that the Bank of England spent
money supporting sterling last

month, but forecasts of the
drop in reserves range from
$50m to $500m. A survey by

C IN NEW YORK

MMS International puts the
median estimate at $250m,
against a rise of S67m in July.

Tne pound nas been reason-
ably steady against the dollar

and D-Mark for the last month
or so. but has required some
support High short term rates
make speculation against the
currency more expensive,
while sterling is also likely to

remain reasonably attractive
on the assumption that base
rates will not be cut until some
time next year. This gives the
pound a strong interest rate
cushion, even though some of
the padding may be removed
later this year by a rise in Ger-
man interest rates.

The Bank of England’s last

quarterly bulletin indicated
that UK interest rates are
likely to stay high for longer
than might have been hoped at
one time, and the central bank
has backed up this message
through its operations in the
money market.
Overnight money had drifted

CURRENCY RATES

Sen C!o»
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Dew

LSpot 1.5570-L5590 L5b&0-1 5W0
I mooih 0.65-0 bjom 0 bb-ObTsm
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12 ntontin .... 6.48-bJjrm b-tZ-biim

Foneafll premium* at*1 discount: apply u? the US dollar
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9.00 •zni 415 91 4
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2.00 9L5 41.5
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400 pm — 914 415
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Bank
rate
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European t
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.
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.
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* All SDR rates are lor AugJl
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MONEY MARKETS

Doubts surround
German rates
RUMOURS CIRCULATED
around the middle of last week
that the West German Bundes-
bank was to hold an emer-
gency council meeting on
Thursday, and that this would
produce a rise in the 7 per cent
Lombard rate.

This was a reaction to Tues-

UK clearing tank bass leading rale

14 per cent

Iron May 24

day’s news that the central
bank had raised the rate at
which it sells three-day Trea-
sury bills to the money market
to 6 per cent from 5.5 per cent.

The three-day bill rate provides
an effective base for call
money, because banks can
always offload surplus liquid-

ity by buying short dated bills

at that leveL
There was no meeting on

Thursday and on Friday Mr
Karl Otto Pohl, Bundesbank
president, told journalists in

Frankfurt that the bill rate has
practically no significance as a
signal on rates and market
reaction had been exaggerated.
The next regular council meet-
ing is on Thursday and after

Mr Pohi's comments dealers do
not now expect this to result in

a change in rates.

Nevertheless higher German
rates are not out of the ques-
tion before the end of the year.
Economic growth is likely to

be around 4 per cent this year,
and although Mr Pohl hinted
that this strong export led per-
formance does not necessarily
mean higher rates, there are
other reasons why the central
bank may wish to tighten mon-
etary policy.

These include the forthcom-
ing round of pay negotiations,
at a time when West German
industry has enjoyed a particu-
larly profitable period and may
be tempted to avoid the possi-
ble threat of disruption by giv-

ing in to high pay claims.

SPONSORED SECURITIES
Capitalisation Change Gros Yield

5000'S Corn party Price on week dlv tp] % P/E

8076 Ass.Brtt Infl OnJ 340 0 103 30 92
750 Arm Hope am) Rhodes 30 +1

3312 080 Design Croup tUSM) 40 •4 21 5.1 9.8
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1

+1 14.7 86 -
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4518 Trevian Holdings IU SMI 105SUS +1 27 26 113
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d

0 93 69 -

6353 Veterinary Drug Co Ltd 385 0 220 5.7 9.4

7504 W.S. Votes 33S -1 16.2 4.8 27.9

Securities designated 15D and (USM) are dealt In subject to the rule and regulations of

The Stock Eichange Other securities listed above are dealt In subject to ihe rules of T5A

These Securities are dealt in strictly on a matched bargain basis. Neither Granville & Co nor

Granville Davies United are market makers In thee securities.

4 These securities are dealt on a restricted basis funner details available

Granville& Co. Limited

77 Mansell Street, London E I SAF
Telephone 0HS3 1-12

j

Member ot’TSA I

Granville Danes Limited

1

1

Mansell Street. London El SAF
Telephone 01-48S 1212

Member of the Srotk Exchange& TSA

down to around 13% per cent,

pulling the short end of the
rate structure down. Over the
last few weeks the authorities
have tightened the day to day
credit position, lifting the over-
night rate back to around 14
per cent to underpin base rates
of the same level.

This has been achieved by
keeping the market short of
day-to-day funds for most of
the day and at times forcing
borrowers to pay above 14 per
cent For late assistance. This in
turn has encouraged banks
and discount houses to bid for
overnight money in the mar-
ket. thus supporting the rate.

The tighter conditions were
also reflected last week when a
discount house sold bills to the
Rank of England at above the
established official dealing
rate. This was purely a techni-
cal operation, favoured by the
house involved, and did not
indicate pressure from the
Bank of England to force inter-

est rates higher. But at the
same time it helped underline

the authorities message.
The approach of the Conser-

vative Party conference next
monthhas led to suggestions of
a cut in base rates, particularly
since building societies mar-
gins are being squeezed, mean-
ing a likely rise in mortgage
rates if base rates are not cut
It would be a major surprise to
the City however if the Gov-
ernment were to give in to this
pressure.
The wider picture of world

interest rates does not encour-
age thoughts of lower rates.
Friday’s US employment fig-

ures were much stronger than
expected and do not point to an
easing of the Federal Reserve’s
monetary stance. The fear of
recession has faded and the
Fed appears likely to keep
interest rates steady, while the
strong German economy may
prompt a general rise in Euro-
pean rates, that would not help
sterling if UK rates are moving
In the opposite direction.

Colin Mfllham

CURRENCY MOVEMENTS OTHER CURRENCIES
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month 9*j per cent one-three months 11 per twit; three-six months 11 per cent; six-nine months
11 per cent; nine-twelve months 11 per cent; Under £100.000 9*z per cent from December
1.1988 . Deposits withdrawn for cash 5 per cent.

BANK OF ENGLAND TREASURY BILL TENDER
Sepl Aug 25 SeoJ Art- 25

Tap rerapUd rate of discount.

—

hnraaenWeidtaawt
34368% 133566%
L3.«198% 33492%
133843% 33088%

Mlnluum acceptm bid £%.b» £96670 Amounton offer« oen tender ... £500ro £500w
Allotment at. mininun (reel .... 21’- 82% Mlnlmsnaccwted bid 182 days .. £93 605 £93.640

WEEKLY CHANGE IN WORLD INTEREST RATES
Sepl duqe

SEW YORK
Sep-l

Undrd

Undid
Undid
Undid

10b
8V7 flay Interbank 14 Federal Foods......

3-mooui interbank

Treasure Bill Tender ]>%
an
13V

3 Mth. Tnasrey Bllh—
b Mth. Trrasure Bills— 832

821
&80

FRANKFURTBad 3 Bills 700
Band 4 Bills

3 Mth. Trraoey Bill

1 Mth. Bank Bills

3 Mth. Bank Blits

TOKYO
Onemnh Bills

Until'd

fil
13H

*4

3

PARS
Keerwntloiifcrt*-

Oneimh.lnUrhak
8.75

9
9b

12V
12V

93

BRUSSELS
One iTUAb ..

S5

1“

7J5
738

MILAN
Qaemonth

AMSTESfiAM DUBUN

+031

li
-O.lOd
[inch'd

(Inch'd

-0.060

-KL12S

Deed'd

(ladl'd

Usctfd

(inch'd

FT-ACTUARIES WORLD IWPICB •
.

I 'U. -
"

Jointly compiled by The Financial Times Limited, Goldman, Sachs & Co:, flind

Mackenzie in conjunction with the Institute of Actuaries and the Facolty:of Actawes ^
NATIONAL AND
REGTONAL MARKETS

Hflum In paiwntheses
how number of stocks
per grouping

FTWAY SEPTEMBER 1 1988

US
Dollar
Index

Day's
Change
%

Pound Local Oa/a change Gran
Sterling Currency % local Dhr.

Index index currency Yield

mtntaPAY august ai *M9 v

' us Pound' - .Vccat.
Dollar Stalling Currency
Index Index.- ,Jodax.-;

: dollar woex'^

.1088.
High

1M

Australia (85)
Austria (19)
Belgium (63)
Canada (123)
Denmark (38).
Finland (26)
France (126) -
West Germany (100)

—

Hong Kong (48)
Ireland (17) ...

Italy (97)
Japan (455)
Malaysia (38)_ —
Mexico (13)....

Motherland (43)
New Zealand (20)
Norway (24)
Singapore (26)
South Africa (60)
Spain (43)
Sweden (35)
Switzerland (64)
United Kingdom (307)..

USA (549)

Europe (1000)
Nordic (121)
Pacific Basin (670)
Euro— Pacific (1670)
North America (672
Europe Ex. UK (693)
Pacific Ex. Japan (215)...

World Ex. US (1866)

World Ex. UK (2108)
World Ex. So. At. (2355)_
World Ex. Japan (I960)-.

The World Index (2415).-

152.97 -1.1 145.70 133.53
146.31 -1.5 139.36 14937
132-32 -0.5 125.04 134.77
152.04 -0.3 144.82 130.19
194.61 -0.5 18537 202.55
133.39 -0.9 127-06 12430
T2S.54 -0.6 122.72 134.75
96.10 + 0.0 91.54 98.82

104.96 + 0.0 99.98 105.24
152.68 -0.9 145.43 158.94
94.90 -1.0 90.40 10037
178.60 — 0.9 170.12 164.60
187.76 -0.1 178.85 194.85
287.91 +0.0 27434 806.18
124.27 -12 118.37 128-43
87J25 -02 83.10 77.74
183.73 -12 175.01 178.62
16538 -0.1 157.53 150.07
150.75 -1.0 143& 13730
156.37 -0.3 150.85 14739
182.76 -1.3 174.08 179.85
89.50 -1-3 85.25 94.79
153.69 -0.3 146.40 146.40
143.84 + 0.7 137.01 143.84

128.46 — 0J5 12237 12731
167.39 -1.0 159.44 18138
174.99 -0.9 16a68 16137
156.51 -0.7 148.08 147.60
144.23 +0.6 13738 142.96
112.51 -0.8 107.17 115.70
131.55 -0.6 125.30 11935
156.39 -0.7 148.96 147.16
150.57 -03 143.42 14537
150.84 -03 143.67 146.04
138.01 +03 131.45 136.73

150^3 -0.3 143.67 14598

- 0.8
-0.9
+0.3
+ 0.2
•+'0.0

-0-3
+0.4
+ 1.0
+0.0— 0.2
+ 0.0
+ 0.0
+ 0.0
+02
-02
-0.4
-08
+ 0.0
-0.S
+0.5- 0-8- 0.1
+08
+07

4.68
1.62
4,10
3.09
1.55
9M
2-80
2SSI
5.26
2.79
2J24
048
2^0
062
4.13
4.44
1.45
1.86
4.08
3.47
1.91
1.99
4.00
3J24

154,70
148-60
133.00
152L57
195.64-
134.61
129.65
96.14
104^4
154.13
96.83
18018
187.87
287.87
125.81
87.43
186.00
165^2
152^4
158.80
185.08
90.67
154.09
142.89

145.77
140.02
125J32
143.75
184.33
126.83
122.76
9059
9088
145-23
9030
169.77
177.02
271.24
11055
09fM
17025
15096
143.45
14063
174.38
8043

.145.19
134.63

134J»
151.18
134-32
129.92
202.55
12455
134.17
97.84
10023
15922
10006
164.63
194.85
804^6
126.70
7009 :

180OT
15O07T
138.08

1

14725 :

181.3Hr

94,89
145.19 :

142.89

157.14
.15067
13727
153.59
219.89
158.16
133.44
100.53

.

140.33
166.69

- 96.73
-200.11
19328
20019
130.67
87.43

12828
9224
12058 -

124.67
16525-
12081
112^7
79.56
86.41

125.00
7497
16422
14325 ...

110.63
62.6* -

13922: :
f

124^7 ;

11528
143.>4
138.45
67.81 ;

133=2*
112.13-

/
/

faass
8801

111.46
117.93
-120.41
117J05
9028

- 74.07
.10014
127.07
SO84
153.13
.13094
'152.09
10053
70.75

r31QM:
12021
19073

: >3062
"non
.. 74,80

i-.12256
toaos

+05
-05
+ 0.0
+ 01
+ 0.6
+02
-0.5
+ 0.1
+02
+02
+0^

323
1.78.

0.72
1.56
323
2.65
4.53
1.64
1.99
2.16
329

129.09
169.03
17052
157.68
14336
11324
132.41
15733
15036
15122
13730

421.64
.15927
16632
.14837 .

135.06
106.70
124.76
T48.43
14224
142.48
12934

126.72-
16237-
-16135

'

14738
142.08'.-
11532'
120.11
146.94
145-58
145.57
135.90'

132.62
17838
794.72
16098
14423
11628
137,65
*66:35
.165-88
155-92
13823

11233.
137.95 ;.

15044
141.50 '

•

112.79
96.30

'

11133 --

141.4ft •

136.9ft
*

13067 :

11*3* :

*.10730
M5046
,13028
*10839
6536

*11827
•129.66

421.11
32130
105.90

+0.3 2.18 15123 142.49 . 14531 -
' ‘ 755-89 13068- .1^122

Copyright. The Financial Times UmKed. Goldman, Sachs & Co., and County NatWest
Malaysian market closed September 1.

Conatftuent change;l/9/89:Name change:Cape Wine to Stollanbosch.(South Africa).

Securities Limited.' 1967

EUROPEAN OPTIONS EXCHANGE

Sole
GoWC
GoWC
CaldP
GofdP

S360
5340
5360
5380

Nov. 89

Vd
51
56
203

Ust

12
2.20
7.30

57 [21-50

Feb. 90

Vo! US

22

May 90

Vo! Last Stock

5 359.40
S 359.40
5 359.40
S 359.40

Sep. 89 00.89 Jan. 90

EOF Index C FI. 300
i

-• 62 17 _ _ FI. 31231
EOE index C FI. 310 680 6 128 10 10 1730 FI. 312.11
EOE Index C FI. 315 328 330 19 730 - FT. 31211
EOE Index C FI. 320 192 190 658 5 10 n sn Fi. 31211
EOE Index C FI. 325 651 0.90 75 3 — — FI. 312.11
EOE laden C FI. 330 12 0.40 200 2-20 12 7 FI. TIP 11

EOE Index P FI. 280 — 2 0.70 100 230 FI. 312.11
EOE Index P FI. 290 — — 208 2 102 420 FI. 31211
EOE Index P FI. 300 468 130 155 3.40 6 6.70 FI. 31211
EOE index P FI. 305 175 230 a 371 4.80 — FI. 31211
EOE Index P FI. 310 574 3.90 a 464 650 — FI. 31231
EOE Index P FI. 315 469 630 126 8.80 — — Fi. 312U
EOE Index P FI. 320 147 930 104 LlJOa 49 14 FT. 31211
EOE Index P 0.325 78 13 1 1450 — FI. 31212

5ep. 89 Oct 89 Nov 89

S/FI C FI. 210 66 12 _ - _ _ R. 22225
S/FIC FI. 215 62 7.20 a 11 820 — — FI 992 59
5/FI C FI. 220 194 3.40 21 520 a — —

>

FI. 272 75
5/FT C FI. 225 133 1.15 68 290 a — —

FI. 222.35
S/FIC FI. 230 Sfa 0.40 35 130 a 3 2 FT. 222.25
S/FIP FI. 215 50 0.70 18 1.70 b n 290 FI. 22225
S/FIP FI. 220 61 1.70 124 380 FI mx
S/FIP FI. 225 66 3.80 4 6.20 — — FI. 22225

Oo. 89 Jan. 90 Apr 90

Owml^lt One Two Three Sb Untard
Mooh Mortis Months Months tolBvendnn

6.B0400 635-7.00 6.95-7J0 6 0S-7.15 7.05-725 7.00
8V-8V
6V-6V
725-737 Mi

9-9V m
733-7.43

9i-94 B.75

5V-5i • m * -

7.40

9b-9V »» 10V-10V Aft UV10V
*

ABNC n.45 196 0.70 29 1.90 46 330 FI. 43,40
ABN P n.45 167 220 25 240 32 3 FI. 43.40

n.no 63 280 17 530 FI. 108.70
AegonP FI- 95 52 030 — — — FI. 108.70
AkeoC FI. 150

FI. 150
122 210 119 5

8
— — FI. 144.60

6 ••

AroevC - FL 60 127 0.90 29 230 • — .• — - FI. 55.40 - — ' -f. . ‘ ;~i
Amro C FI. 90 109 1.40 191 330 — — FI. 8530
BUHRMANM-TC
DAFN.V.C '

-. EL70
FI. 60

-ST
298

280 b
220

FL 70.90.

—

FL 5624 270 3 430a
N.V.DSMC FI. 130 354 330 . 13 8-20 — -FI. 12720- . ..

N.V. OSM P FI. 125 213 280 39 430 •• — ‘FL 12720 r .
•*

HelnekenC FI. 130 83 730 a 23 1030 20 1250 FI. 135 • i

HoogtreensC FI. 100 890 530 111 L0.20 6 14 FI. 99.40
HoogovensP
KLM C

n.95
FI, 50

593
398

3.70 76
42

6
6.60

13 9 FI. 99.40
FI. 5400

. • .

KLMP FI. 55 428 240 128 3.50 1 4b FI. 5420
KNPC FI. 55 72 2.40 53 4.40 a — FI. 54.40 -

KNPP FI. 55 19 230 155 3.20 — -re FI. 54+0 •

NEDLLOYDC FI. 94 559 1.70 55 5-20 12 6.60 FL 8830
NEDLLOYO P FI. 88 110 430 —

FT. 8830
NMBP FI 270 55 6b 79 8.70 a — . — FI. 271.50
NaLNeLC R.65 219 530 2 730 — — FI. 69JO
PhHIpsC FI. 40 888 3.80 125 5 256 6 FI. 43
PhlltolP FT. 50 20 7a 10 720 317 a FI. 43
Royal Dutch C FI. 150 395 230 647 5 45 730 FI. 147.40
Royal Dutch P FI. 140 1293 2 852 380 7 530 FL 147.40
UnllerwC FL 160 400 5.80 129 7.60 a 17 3.70 FI. 16130 .

*

UnllewP FI. 170 116 9-10 — - 60 12 FI. 16130
Van OnunerenC FI. 50 77 020 b 9 030 FI. 35.40
Van OrranereB P FI. 35 40 1.60 9 250 160 280 FI. 33.40
WessanenC FI. 90 50 1.80 12 4 FI- 85.20

TOTAL VOLUME IN CONTRACTS : 41,677

A-Adt 8 -Bid C” Call P-Pot

LONDON REC0IT ISSUES
EQUITIES

hat

975
133
57
5100
S135
85

&
50

t
105
105

1109
eoo

pm

F.P.

F.P.

F.P.

F.P.

F.P.

FJ».

F.P.

F.P.
rjp.

FJ>.

F.P.

FJ*.

FJ>
F.P.

F.P.

F.P.

F.P.

F.P.

F.P.

utra

11/8

10/7

1WJ

92
42

66b
126
156
96
60m
58
76

513
51
21
440
85

122

US
265

Sled

1* ----A
61
108 tenure tnu. ig --
145 »0a*wyGr<xjgl4j_>^..
84 (KUsxad Grow)RMp 5dJ
53 rionsn Warrants _}
94 UveragedOppratunKrTsL..
53 Do. Warrants
71 MurrayBaasme-

500 fVLft Ajnfrtcaa6*,tavTst_
45 PatfHc Preg.lm.Tjl 10p_.
17 DaWarrawa

340 PresUloOII-A-IOe
55 IScftoond Dl&CaslOp
HI iSmtlhCJameJ Estate
63 1WPP Warrants
U5 bWtstnh8treSeaffbld.l0p
238 IfYorttsk Ire Radio NtxklSp

w
78
39

146
91
55

103
58
73
503
46
19

440
83
122
154
116
238

W

1041

10.0
*52
L5.06
LL13

10.75

Q25c

03.6

R5.0
MXI

The
Cert

0.9

Pi.
We

14.7

s
V
17

J

36J

5,703.2
22 hZA

FIXED INTEREST STOCKS

Prke

C

irwp

IS
lt&p

loop

•99.1

ASp
«100p

pad
V
FJ.
FJ.
FJ.
FJ.
FJ.
FJ.
FJ.
FJ.
FJ.
FJ.
FJ.
FJ.
FJ.
FJ.
FJ.
FJ.

Latest
1989 doling

+ crStock Price

EDate HKR Lore

“ft
UQp

106o

*
SrilMtAercraaee 7.75a (Net)Cv.Pf_;
Carttoo Conus. 6.5oOWl CvJ*Ltt*i_ +1

28/7
SWHJ 50Vo

10^

iartmoreAnL Sees. ZeroDtrPf5c._
“ft
118pll8p totting Gteoo 8Voc C*. Pf.._ +1

107p

100

100 imaged 0pptrtMftyT« Ur UasIn lOib

*array Eat. Zero C* . Uss. La.1W . 67b
-1

4

2

NathmHdeAngliaUiccBdi 13/8/90-

9£ >0. 4.25pc ladex-lhrited2024

Zl/8
loop
105b

Own& RdXrsaa8bPc0fet} Or. Pf. 10lp

1W7
25P

12*
i?ip

107p
invp

TebookUntaT
+1 * -

RIGHTS OFFERS
bare

Prfre

P

120
230
9
265
12
195
225
400
108
93
65
405
73

Paid

Hfl

NB
6
IID

FJ.
NU
Nn
Nil

NH
Nil

Nil
(Ut

NU

latest 1989

Date HW -a
a/9 12

35
21p«
33pm
*P-

IE

3S ktraHkte

Sack

TatfaiiguH
Zbpre Grtoroep

_

10pn tfLeWI fSJFJ
'-€KA

lOp.

15bpra hwBSMutHBa»5p.
Vpn Renumlistff 5p
37pwi toUwmfTtuwa^
1pm rrtanglfTntaZDp

Ckxtag

Pike

. P

8pn

3
SS
20pmBa
1pm

:hei tBvWawLS
terer baud on fthteid on full

Fareast.re ealinaWamMlflBWIW8JBtt
IWrBiMaoBpre«iBia^i-jeeiwlngi.HDwMaidaadyMdiai^ni 1

PJWB«B aroueomcalexbmw grl989.1c DMdMand yleu basesm reptctu or otter offkalesUmaujbr

cwnaret tor d GroA.it f-ncaa mvmuoa UMoeMjwer and prt ratio lased ca pn&peaB or otber
csttaitB. W Pro Fotsm IBM ty OKcrcdto ho2k of unftfRn sbstiM 4 “rloWS" t

btnxtaOlon.lPladnQ reke.Tr NdnurebahM.g baud In ameoioe with rmran^^g mower or tateorerltMogR prte4 twiatd seereitte ewtaL* Official Lnodan usuagU lacWty wwrattt eSlemesL*TM

BASE LENDING RATES

ABU Bank.

Hamit
AIM Trust I

AIM biA Barit.

• HaiyArtxkr.
Asodats Cap Carp

tattwrltj&s*

t B&CUsdBRtBst_
Bask of Banda I
Banco BlBaoVbGva-:

BaritHapoaEm

BaritCndK&Conm-
BaskofCyprus

BaRkortretaxf

Badtoftafta 1
Barit of Scotland:

BaaqKBdg'Lti.—

-

BarclaysBari. -

BtacbntBaritFIX.
Berfber BaritAS

Brit Bttf Hid East__
• BrafDSdpiqf^

Bastes HtgeTst__
n RMtNwfcfaQf

—

-

ftQartatosfBari

GOast.IL -

OdHsctetsBank.
Clydesdale Bari

Conm.BkJf.EEt_
Co-opeiat«Bari__

CoattsSCo.

%
HtntBariaag 14

NatBJurf KtflHft 14

HatWestarisbr 14

NdthniBariUd_ 14

Horwtri Gen. TrusC^_ - .14

PHVATlariaiLIfflftrie . 14

Provincial 8ariPlX.^_ 15

R.8ajter&5teL-.yi4

Wt

5*.-

EqiHtfflTarBarijfc __11 ^14 -

EnterTrdstUtf-i.-E*? 14^ '
. tayatfimfScotfad^.-M

F*aca&GecBari?.4S jr M
first national Bari Pic“15 ftSdiitiiSWifasiMS.^14

14 ftRttetFteniiHBSCa^: 14*v. StarianfChatnd^ ;U
14 . BohrtEwrlSww -m - TS8

* •••*.— q-r , . M
i4 .ftar- Driwaoncwr-

m

14 •e8BaesfctoOZ2,.lA
14 HFCBaripto*"..* 14

«=

a r~-

14

United Murahc8ari_ 14 J

Unit! Trust Bait Pfc
—

';. I4
.f

WestemTnri
.
.14

WestpacBariCR^^. 14 k

n14 - :
*

X.HiBnr&C0:»l-4
t-f»

'j Yortofel

14h W • Keobes of Britisb JtmieA
14 • £39 Banking & S&wKte: Hoe»
14

'
* Md)oiBe]fi)oarisBri~l4 r Associathm. <*- Deposit Utmi S9%

14 f ll*f«aaril3L^'.-I« Snevhc 85%!' Top T
~ Mritari Mast access 128% 4

-r' *-ivt- fid&iDennd4qirit 9%.A H25%.-.15%-.srs_ •

'.s': rf

,

'.*> t^i

-~S ! r- ’ . . rvv • •

?;e*
-I.-- *: i- - * i H I

*
”“

V •

:
•j

l.

i-s .* ; su'.s
>.

,

»• . . • — . V. u.l >)

. • ..JJ V.f

A:; f-

.52'.

WSL 49 E*’ .

c.-A •?..

•>

Jf !>'.
’

’•i C:

JOTTER PAD

Ua
.
%•

'•..i
1 J.V

'•

•. - i’*W 1

No.7,028 Set*by^QUARK ‘ ^

•*

S

'

V

•• ' ACROSS-'.
1 and 5 A man of mystery,

bell mock horses strangely
(8,6)

'"
9 Hie extremities of gotagteft
'- in. haphazard wandertng (8) •

10 Several lines in a pattern (6) .

18 Important man —'with cor-
poration! (5)

13 Drink knodeed back by salt?
Give details (9)

14 Note rise resting place here
(6>

16 Tho bench takes In one In
the north-west (7)

19 Tree put in. order around
' court <7>.

‘

- _

21 Horrified! Silver ash devas-
tated by edge of forest (6)

23 Qroark makes up these jmrtt..

25 Greek character? fit
C

. with civvies (5)
28 'Take for granted ^e-fooZ'-

gets the bird -in cometeck
(6) v^r-'

27 Politician’s speech? Could
be meaningless (8)

*-~

28 caaih well above 8(6) ,

:
-

29 Defection shown when one’s
• off-fay? (8^

.

DOWN
1 SeedfoUowtog Open?(6)

:.

a2 Cofffributor* to tho-dawn
•.^choirps? (5,4) J,';; ”7

;3 Interval. Aboat to come up
:. Ibrardrlnk (5) ???,%-

’

4 GettaiK togeiher.for .|®ayer

-6 jfieaiex? . He’s'; apt too, -in.

: 'manipulation (9)
- "•

7 Method, we hear. to get
heavenly food (5)- . _ . .

8 The .main fiat "ba^e for mea-
suring purposes (3£X

11 Mad Cricketers (4)
15 Circus performer could b&a

roaring success (4,5)
'*

17 Only short time to request
- Church fipc group to do Job
(i5)

18 Very. French permit to
Intzude (8)

211 180*0$fell
: “hallo"-

di±ukf7) - - — ,.i.

.

- 22 In the event,- debatai cut

lli.fl'cianges. for £ng£sh &
; beat (5) .\i <- -

; 25 Composition encountered'
- adxjot -the book (Si; hz :

. ;

Th^soiufion-to fost Saturday's
Prize paste wlU he pi^Ush^ -.

with names -of wtoner^ -onSat-
urday Seytenbczm!‘" “ '

v -

, * _

.*» •,

A

'+

• V
• I. v

'



FINANCIALTIMESMQNDAY^Sm^MBER 4 1989
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Jri
'J, -7777

- TJP ’ PS—j—

|

-
,m

mu town—

p

CANADA

Trlrit-

.

1
i

1 ,il~i ^

;;«L

Salem teak Wgh Law CtmOng

TORONTO
Closing prices September ]

OnoaDons fci can*wdan martad $,

8197 AUCA Ml «A 4C 4SC+ H
W12 A^lBbl Rr 917% 17% 17%

22726 Anriaa E 99% «% 9%- %
Uses Afima Go 920 tB% »%
2034 AJbrtm N *18% 18% 18%

235477 Mean 929% 29% 3B% + <l

4212 Atoa Cant *17% 17% 17%- %
199060 A IW* *25% 27% 27%-1

700Am M *10 9% 10 - %
1B1851 BCE Inc *42% 41% 42

4S9B8CEO 208 20* 204
74700 8CE UaU 931% 38% 81%+1%
SSSBGSuprA *18% 19% ia% + %
7085BOA A 910 0% B\- %
B8W BP Canada 918 17% 17% + %

43381 6k Mend *33% 83% 33%
99396 Bk NSdOt *19% 18% 18%
23800 Manm 75 71 72- 8
SSOOBombdr A *18% 18% »%- %

85800 SoatoOr 6 M% 18% 18%- %
00103 Saw VUy *18% 13% 19% 4- %
S8G0 BranUMa *33% 92% 33%+ %

40480 Brawn A *30% 30% 30% %
14200 Brimtar 255 253 355
34422 BC Phowa *16% 16% 16%+ %
SSOBruncor *17% 17% 17%
noOBmaa* *t?% 12 e%- %

33907 CAE *14% 14% 14% + %
10200 C8 Me *19% 19 18 - %

719060CO. B I $12% 12% 12%+%
12100 C«*te *19% 13% 13%' %
27063 Cambeidg *37% 37 37 - %
2*380 Camp Raa 80 84 88

82 Camp soiai *22% 21% 22%
SHJ76 Campons f S»% 18% 19%+ %
5200C Nor West 435 425 425+ 6
366SC Pndcra *14% 14% 14%
roocs flam r 330 320 320- 18

06320 C Expm I 94 90 91- 2
tooco invest *48% 46% 48%+ %

154«60 Cl Bk Com S»% 30 30 - %
400 C Uareonl *u% 15% 15%

3S37B C Ocdardal *19 18% 19
7725 CP Formal $43% 43 43%

650683 CP LM *28% 27% 27%
83716 C ROXV *7 6% 6%
23334 CThV A f *24% 24 24
1100 CLUB A I $20% 20% 20% + %
4490 Cmnwncr o 24S 233 245 + 5
too CanamA I 88% 6% 8%- %

11110 Cantor *31% 30% 30% - %
leooCanranA *10% 10% 10%
1790 Cara SW% 9% ifi% + %
aeOCwaAf *19% 18% 19%+ %

Uw Mask High Law Oeca Ctmg

3000 coo tvx sr n 7 + %
1200 Craum Oaa *29% ®% ®%— %
BlfltaiwatB *0% 18% 13%+ %
1200 Corby A 529% 29% 3%

341954 Catena A f *8% 9% J%- %
2SE4Caaeaa Sli% 11% Il%- %
ItOO Crown* *14 14 14 - %

18234 Crown A I V 6% 6% - %
7200 Denison A 405 480 49S+ TO

12088 Denison 8 1 468 455 4»+ 5
srreoDviAB sii% 11% 11%-%
1539 Oletma A 7 83% 5% 5%+ %

225823 DotoKO *27% 26% 27%
masDTaima Si7% 17% 17%
38760 Donor *15% 14% 16

4200 Dnmagmi a *1*% «% J*%+ %
1900 Dv Ppol A *27% 27% 27%+ %

119800 Dytax A *12% 11% 12 + %
145247 EdW Bay *19 18% 19 + %

20 EmpkM 1 *15% 16% 1S%
320130 EntaW *8% 9% 9% + %
HSSOEnua&vA «3 480 490+ 5
1000 fCAind 110% 10% 10%
1*50 FP1 LM *7% 7% 7%

301482 Ftaibntg $30% S7% 38 - %
8019 Fed M A *13%. 15% «%- %
2800 Fad Pin 813% 0% 13%- %

64400 FtastogL *13% 18% 13% + %
2725 FCayfin *48% <7 48% + 1%
200 FUmrattiA I 810% 10% 10%
TO Ford Coda *108% 109% 109%

2120 Forth *22% 22% 22%+%
169M RhpSmm 1 635% 84 84 -1%
17200 Franeo o $12% 12 12%+%
465 GW Udl *2*% 34% 34%+ %465 GW Udl 834% 34% 34%+ %
sod Gaucdc aio 3» sio+ a

27137 Grata* $7% 7 7 - %
S3? Banda A *22 71% 23

2300 Giant Yk *9% B% •%
10000 Glrnoib 110 110 110+ 1

13800 doktanpf 435 490 430
20100 GW Knlgtd 88% 8% 3%
1000 Cram A I sa% 9 9 - %

83500 Grangaa 295 2BS 290
400 0. Group *20 20 20
1968 OH LAocs *15% 19% 15%
TWO GraytlM 830 30 30

23674 Oo* Raa *15% 15% 15%
1(75 Malay *0% 8% 6%

23674 0aa Raa *15% 15% 15%
1175 Malay »% 6% 6%

2S300 Harm A *5% 5% 9%
262 Howkar 527% 27% 27% - %

87006 Hayaa D *15% 15% 1B%+ %
18*40 Haas Ina *30% 30% 30%
187370 Hants *16 14% W% + %
30900 HoUngr $13% 13% 13%- %
253300 Hotatam f *9% B\ *%- %

280 H Baffin a *6% A, 8%- \
93807 H B»y Co *37% 39 38% +3
6I32I Imam L *39% 38% 39% + %
93470 Imp O* A *56% 65% »%+ %
57131 Inco *43% 43% 43%+ %
8400 Innopae H0% 10% 10%
6400 Ildar 09 *34% 24% 24%+ %
1325 Imarhoma $48% 48% 48%- %
2S00 In* Orp *20 20 20
1441 tpaco 818% 18% 18%+%
400 Ivaco A I ' *13% 13% 13%-%
V400 Ivsco B *13% 13% 13%

16505 Janoock *20% 20% 20%- %
630 Karr Add *20% 20% »%

300 Cam Af *10% 19% i9%+ %
liOOCarana *29% 29 29
306 Cascade! *6% 6% 6%- %
SOOCalaaeaa *30% 80% 30%+ %

4B51 Caa CapBal *12% 12% 12%+%
B200CanCap A *10% 10% 10%
WOO CpMFdA *3% 5% 51+ %
134 C Gear Tin *10% 10% 10%

13000 Ctaran 129 121 124
UOOCMaftaa 318% 18% 18% + %

2B740 DnatMx *14% 14% u%+ %
86835 Caarinco *31% 31% 31%- %
2400 Ceopudofl 410 410 410

38400 Connaught *25% 25% 25% - %

2500 In* Orp
1441 tpaCO
400 ivaco A I

1400 ivaco B
18505 Janoock

630 Karr Add
21673 LaOmB
40040 Lac Unrla
202B Lata/S* p *22%- 2% 22%+ %

5218SLH£*wA *19% 19% 19%+ %
2260*7 Laldlw B f *19% «% «% + %

1700 Lour Or B $8% 8% 8%- %
14100 Lawcnll A *12% 12 12%+ %
4830 LoUow Co *14% 1+% 14% " %
4380 Lomraat 123% 23% 23% - %
M0M0SB »V *% »%. ,

i3S2S0Uae Kanda *8% 8% B%+

%

45875 maan H X $13 12% 12%-%
10020 Mcln HY I *11% 11% 11%- %
264329 Httemlan 121% » l 21%+ %
4755 Magna A f ttt% «% »%- %
3900 MarCkna f *17% 17% 17%
2020 Mark Raa (9% 0% i%- %
«oso Uwnetac Sri »% 11 + %
8385 Menu U *14% 14 14% - %
1500MOM DQ> *5% ft S%+ %
1M lUnnova *19% «% 19%

S700 Mttal Carp 365 380 300

4179 Motion A 1 $37% 87% 37% * %
60105 Uoora (38% 37% X + %
S188 MuaeoahO 235 230 289+ 10

48302 Mat Bk Caa *19 W% M%
9100 N BuWwm 07 K 86- 1

202NttwTalEia *19% 19% 19% - %
1800 Noma A *14% 14% 14%

14150 Itoranda F $16% 16% 16%- %
135740 Noranoa *28% 25% 26 + %
W2N0ie«B $36% 26 28
1564 Moral A I *34% 24% 24%- %

39783 NCOna *21% 21% 21%+ %
498932 M07 Tat 526% 25% 25% - %
9510 Noraigat Sft 8% 6%+ %

468454 Mcwa I S8% 8% 9%
1210 Momca *12% 12% Q%

lazaOMumac 310% 10% ia%+ %
19500 Ocalot 8 I *10% 10% 10%+ %
43HOamttHtf 39J 265 273+ 15

98970 Oahawa A I 330 % 29% 90 - %
0485 PWA Gorp *18% 17% 18%+ %
33100 SQuftn A I 88% 8% 8%
14400 Pamour $8% 6 0 - %
7D00 PaaCao P £»% 29% M%- %
100 Pagaaua Cii% 11% 11%- %

21900 PJewl At *21% 21 21%
2B308 Ptooosr U 106 86 100- 7

520000 Ptear Dm $ig% 18% 19%+ %
97833 PoeaPw 19% 9 9
20859PM Curl *16% 15% 10%- %

B00 Pwr Fla *21% 21% 21%+ %
81500 Prorlgo *10% 10% 10%- %

*50 Quo Tal *15% 15% 16%
WOO CfeaPcor A *17% 17% H%+ %

232559 Rangar 87 8% 8% + %
100 Rayrodt ! *8 8 8 - %

99400 Raltman A I *20 20 20
6SB35 Rwibaaca 619% 19% 1B%- %
£0900 Ropap I $13% 13 13%- %
33189 «o Mgom 126% 26% 28%
12834 Ropen B t *T»% 717% 118
1068 Roam SiO% w% w%- %

26042 Royal Bnfc *40% 46% 46%
29987 sn.8yat $11 W% 10%-%
11700 SNC A 1 *10 10 10 + %

600 SO. CamA 1 *20% 20% 20%+ %
200 Samoa! MT *15% 15% 15%+ %

23160 SasfoH *13% 13% 13%
116804 Sceptra *5% 495 5 - %_

300 Scot Papar lift 18% 18%+ %
53940 Scons I *19% 19% 19%
ICSSraatC *37% 20% 37% - %

29478 Saatf-am 187% 95% 97% + 1%
30*83 Saara Can $14% 14% 14%+ %

Satan Stack tsgb Lew OmCting

12400 BhowC B I 613% 13% 13%+ %
10180 SMI CM $47% 42 42%+%
107850 Snorrttt 613% 13% 13%+ %

500 Seim 1G 1S2 163- 2
12881 Souttam «32% 32% 32%
3200 Boor Aero f *12% 12% 12%
HOTOSrofco A S23% 23% 23% + %
27550 TCC S*v $11% 11% 11% - %
196878 T+Ck B I $23% 22% 23 + %

000 Tombac A $10% 10% 10%
148073 Tor Dm Bk 521% 21% ?1%- %

1195 Tor Sun *25% 25% 25%+ %
2800 Terattr B f 138% 36% 36%- %

83550 Total PM 529% 25% 29% + %
46073 TmABaU 614% 13% 10%- %
1S2048 TrCan PL. 516% 10% «% + %
20913 TrUon A *22% 22% 22%- %
20662 Trimac 55% 480 5 - %
11211 Trtxac A > $28% 28% 26%

3800 Trtcac B *00% 80% 30%- %
500UAPA *18 17% 17% - %
1372 Unieorp A *7 7 7

2700 UniffKoB I 475 470 470- 5

5000 lln CaiMd $21% 21% 21%
1025 U EntpHao $11% 11% 11%

1700 Un Carp »% 36 36%+ %
14488 VwByC 320 315 315- S
27650 Vlcaroy R 400 395 995- ID

31000 vaoopn t *19% 19 19 - %
1400 vac B I $15% 15% 16%+ %
200 malax A *14% 14 14 - %
2000 Wacdwaod $17% 17% 17%+ %
435 Wit Fraw *18% 19% 1B%+ %

7867 Wooe* E *19% 19% 19% - %
7800WeMmln »% 9% 0%
4800 WiMn *41% 41% 41%+ %
4702 Woodwd A 320 316 315- 10

100 Xenix Can SIB 18 19

f-No vaUns tlfitaa or rasaicad voting

rtgtxx.

MONTREAL
Closing prices September t

5000 BombrdrA
33400 BombrdrB
5400CB Pak
95600 CamOior
9415 Cascades
72S3 DomTxtA
2280 Doratiua

94000 Maraotoc
49182 NalBk Caa
5954 Novoreo

37350 Power Cerp
8806 Prtrrigo

4075 QveOaeor
18948 VMoeea
ToW SaM 8,171.434

*16% W%
516% 16%
*19% 19

*13% 13%
S07 06%
*17% 17%
*13% 13%
*1 < 10%
*13 14%
*12% 12%
*16% 18%
610% 10%
$15% 15%
519% 19

stares.

CB%- %
17%+ %
13%
It + %
14% - %
12%
16% - %
10% - %
15%
IB - %

MMi i

'
i’( rpm

S3

1526321

-?*'T |

EM
p.*-JI

- r'-f - f

'

17483 1763Z 178L2 I7HL0
B4&B BS&2 87L0 875.1

42438 42932 <38.04

17BLB 129/81 1412.9 (7/41

875.1 (29/69 652.6 (7/4)

<38.04 00/3) 2195 (2/U

6513-07 (29/8) I 5SI9J0 14/11

33520 1 334.99
|

334-61 1 337.61 1 356.65 02/7) 275.49(27/2)

762A 77U 7723 7713 8153 UB/4) 7233 (4/1)

526.4
)

5230
123.4 125J

665.95 659.7
1995.7 19753
160833 159735

5208 | 520.8

1234

696.70 658 50
19662 1971.4

15ffi.se 159724

526.4 d/9) 417 9 (4/1)

125J (31/® 973 07/2)

665 95 Off) 535.78 (27/2)

1995.7 (1/9) 1595.7 (27/2)

1609.93 do/® 1271.70 (23/2)

JAPAN
MOM 06/5/49)
TokyoSECTopM (4/1/68

2508.91 1250837
j
250.40 1 2487.94

1
330934 05/5)

]
209161 0/6)

73412 73434 730.73 7310 73434 C31/S3 577.49(28/®

8213 is;

TnuHWAcnvmr

|J

Cl

0
m *5

IS
a C1

uso
927 ,
1310 »

1.750
IJ&0 J

1.808
1.060
8.600
1330
1.140
L880
4J70
1,480
1,030
1290
1340
1,740
1390
5230
2.270
4250
1,200
1,260
3.170
1.4*0
3.090
1.730
3.730
2.090
4.600

L640
994
2790
2.750
1.090
3.110
L550
1.020
2720
2700
4270
1250

25»
2260
uwo
7.400
1240.
3,720
1,300
4.730
2380
L090
1.460
1.990
917
4.600
1,690
2360
2450
1.710
2700
1250
U20
1.400
1,210
925
LMO
3.800
L840
2280
1,250
5200
1.150
1.730

U70
1,920
1.970
3,160
1.790
1.060
880
4250
1.170
4250
2210
U60
2.600
2700
U60
2100
2070
2,050
SAW
770 .

3.790
960'
L130
1.200
1,560
2450
4,700 3.
1,610 1.
2970 2
2*60 2
L%0. 1.

3^70 2
17^00.19
2300 7)

rir: r.-r’*-

hr t
"

agoM,
Seal *0931 *09 30

133300 143.420 174350
12587 13,069 14345
113.463 117756 121781

NETHERLANDS
j

CBS TtLRui.Gen.(EU 1983)J 2641 264.6 263* 26L7
CSS A) I Skr(Eta 1983)—-I 2047 20U 204.4 2029

35140.83 (21/a 30183.79 (5/1)

265908 Olia 2366.91 (6/U

2662 Q7/0 2063 O/U
207.0 aiia U6.7 a/3i

67331 67936
{
677 47 67216 67936 01/89 467.17 (2/1)

136X73 135601 135021 134254 1387.01 (21/0 1030*9(4/1)

CANADA
TORONTO

xSEg
;

S9
|

A89
|

*89
|

Me

29

SOOTH AFRO
]

JSE Gold(28/9/78) 15552* 15712 160621 15940
J^taitortaJ (22/9/7® 28192* 28282 28242

16850 (3/S 1291.0 05173
28380 (25/ffl 19612 (3/1)

32246 320.181 32073 32251] 32251(29/8) 26821 Q/3»

205320 0/9) | 1677.48 (3/D

NEW YORK ACTIVE STOCKS
JaeebSoaiP. 01/12/56)— 4569.9 45823 45621 45705 4660J 06/8) 3333.9 0/D

SWITZERLAND
Safes Bank tad- 01/12/58) ... 8172 816.4 8107 8ZL7 8252 08/8 6131 0/D

Friday

64»Motoa—
NUgMotata _
Bmio* Hym_

SUxb dosing Cbange
traded price on day

2010.600 <9% + %
1.945.700 12% + %
1^96000 50% + i
12M^O0 89% 1%
L524J00 <0% %

% Eaea —
% Teas IKilitia _.

% Upjota ...

1% U«axiC*rtst*_

% Reebokmt!

Stocks Dosing Ctaage
trsdrd price 0B «y— 1.493300 44 + %— 1,470300 32% + %

... 1.446.700 40 + %— 1367^00 30% - %— 2351200 16% + %

WORLD
us.ca0Mud.aafm... ao

* Subject to official rrateutaikon.

8107 82L7 8253 08/9 6131 (3/D

537.7 5372 HL2 OS 4872 03/6)

Ban «aftesof all IntfkHare 100 exnjit NYSE Ail Coranoo-50; Standard and Poor's- Hfcaad Toronto CnoMsite
and Metal* - 1000. Tomato Indices based 1975 2M Montreal Portfolio 4/1/83. t Ettlodlag bonds.

* MlBtftai. pits Utintks, Floandal and TrimportillQA. (cJ Closed, to) UnvalUMe.

Base values of alt Indices are 100 excent Mussel* SE and DAX - 1,000 JSE GoW -255.7 JSE
Industrials - 2MJ3 and Auualla. All Ordinary and Mining - 500: (cl Closed. (11) Unavailable.

TOKYO - Most Active Stocks
Friday September 1 1889

gpH

Hr

Stock* Ctoeing Change
Traded Prices on day

Keieel Railway* , 2S2m SJM0 +t£0 YenaKaW
Nippon Steel 1S2m 793 0 Sony
TosMbe &8m 12S0 -30 Kawasaki Steel

.

Stock* Closing Change
Traded Prices on day
72m 2020 +150
6.7m B2S0 *100
6.9m 831 -9

Yanvato Trapn 7-2m 2210 + 10 Ofcaraura 9.7m 1,600 +40
AsaM Optical 72m l.TBO +50 Morinege SJra 1210 +40

Travelling by air on business?
Enjoy readingyour complimentary copy of the Financial Tones wbca
you are travemog on schialulcd flights from . . .

. . . AMSTERDAM
with British Airways. British Midland, Ginadian Pacific Air. Frnnair.

KIM. Lufthansa, ran-Am, SAS, Singapore Airlines, Thai Airways
International. Transavia

. . . ROTTERDAM
withNLM

Ifinancialtimes j
1 1 I3»C**I I lUliNlM to|w3f*PI I ;

Your FT hand delivered in Germany

Hi*
23 ua
626 4.S
83 538
123 8.7
526
0-2i an
6.7 526
12 0.925
5.68 MB
222 0,75
178 U2
103 67
06 0.45
63 3.98
2 035
IAS 061
LB5- 042
47 3
322 L72
143 103UA 0.73
4 ZM
175 258
1175 774
53 3,96
US IB
TLBS 0.45an 0.02
033 CU»
8.98 348
9.44 73
43 333M 4
3JB US
3J 2
324 221
Z.73 24
aw 03
235 L83
282 222
7 S3
226 2.44
25 L78
U-4 726
29 226
13 B

Ifyou work in the business centres of
HAMBURG, BERLIN, DUSSELDORF,
NEUSS, KOLN, BONN, FRANKFURT,
OFFENBACH, HOCHST, ESCHBORN,
RUSSELSHEIM, MAINZ, WIESBADEN,
MANNHEIM, LUDWIGSHAFEN,
STUTTGART, MUNCHEN,
HEIDELBERG, NURNBERG or in the

TAUNUS AREA— gain the edge over your
competitors.

Have your Financial Times personally hand
delivered to your office at no extra charge and
you will be fully briefed and alert to all the

issues that influence or affect your market and
your business.

12 ISSUES FREE

When you take out your first subscription to

the FT, we'll send you 12 issues free. Then see
for yourself why Frederick Ungeheuer, Time
magazine’s senior financial correspondent,
describes us as “the paper with the best
coverage of international finance.”

(jfi
Frankfurt 0130-5351 (toll free)

and ask for Karl Capp for details.

FINANCIALTIMES
£LiBO?k S SUCiMEtt

wOTES-PriifflOD uibP*Be»**sowed
on tfit IndluWwl e*tam»s« ata mr» last

traded prlu* «u) unanllktoe. • Dealings

amended- *4 Ex dMdnd. a Ex scrip

tap xr Ex rigios. *x £x alL
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4pm prices September 1 NEW YORK STOCK EXCHANGE COMPOSITE PRICES

hsw

24V 241

40% 40
23*, 23

77\ 7B
28V 20
158 ISO

SB’s 36
23 25

«!*«•
12 Mon8> N da COM Pm.

flflh Lea »of* Dty, TM.E lOOoM^t Ho OmMCOm
15*3 ~h Benner 3 29 100 u16% >6*3 16% * It

33 28% Barela, 1.70a S-0 5 205 34** 34 34%- %
20 If 23 BaiBpr 99 23** 23*, 23*,— *«

28 2*% BVB 10
“ _09 23V 23*

34 23 24’
28 *2 18% Boro 40 UUH07 21% 21*2 21%* %
38% 31 *2 BamoU 129 10 10*1023 040 30% 38V* V
10 *> **i BuM n 20 2146 30 0% 9*1 9s,- %
12% 4% BaryWr 202 10 12% 12% 12%
V % v)BAS IX 7 11-33 11-32 11-32

16% 13 BalMt .10 .7201733 14% 13% *4%
63V 38% aauscn 1.-M 19 17 283 60% ES% 38V * %
24% 18% Baxter 96 24 17 3789 23% 23% 23%
43% 33 BaxpttXSS* AS 43 38%_ 33% 38%- %
74 56% Bax 003-50 43 1043 71% 71 % 71%
13% 8 Boyfln 1 8% 9% 9%
21% 14% SaySG ,130 83 10 34 21% 20% 20%-%
17% 11%8«WSt JOB 13 94200 M% 16% 18%* %
42 38 BavSpaiUr 9 8 40 39% 38% 39% - %
30% 20% Bearg .84 11 12 130 30 29% 30
16% 10% Beater .6*e SO 71120 10% 10% 10%
22% 17% Bcfcina n21e 1.1 13 3322 20 18% 18% * %
36% 4B% BectDfc 1 1L7 U *874 sa% 57% SB - %
99% 87% BefiAB 4.40 4J 14 1574 9G% 97% 88% + 1%
10% U%B*lliM J8 U20 14 15% 13% 15% * %
33% S%BfllOO 182 49 14 3932 52 51 51% + %
41 22% BoloAH 44 12 43 0 38% 38% 38%- %
35 20% Bern*, .80 1.7 21 177 38 34% 35 * %
38% 43% BentCp 120 39 13 1472*58% 34% 33% +1%
26% 23% Bene! PC2J0 99 x2C0 23% 25% 23% - %
5% 3% SengtS .19, 49 8 228 4% 4% 4% - %
14% 12% Benetn a 302 14% 14% 14%

8175 4200 BartHa 3151107830 7900 7323 -SO
30% 22% BcrryP 1 32 28 103 u»% 30% 30%+ %
13% 3% BcuSy 60 272 8 6 8 + %
28% 19% BemSB .10, .4 81901 22% 22 22% + %
36% 48% BIAS pi 3 07 S 31% 61% 81%+ %
27% 24 BUIS p(B2J0 99 73 25% 28% 23% + %
10 3% Bavrty 4820 8% 8% 0% - %
20% 7% Blocfl 23 MB 20% 20 20 - %

36% 48% BDiSt pi 5 BJ
27% 24 BUIS PIB2J0 89
10 3% Bmfy
20% 7% Bkxfl
29% 18 BB-S0 JO 21 8 302 24 23% 23%
25% 18%BlackD 40 19 18x232324% 24% 24%+ %
29% 24% BlkHCp 1.82 6 4 12 90 28% 27% 28%+ %
10% SV Bfluun 1.10 12 7Z7 9% 0% 0%
10% B% BDifltT o 1 12 1337 Ut 9% 10 + %
34 26% BldcHfl 1J8 39 17 986 32% 32% 32% + %
18% 7% BIcfeE s 37 28M 15% 15% 16%- %
18% 14% BlueAr n.34e 1.9 IB 2051 18 17% 17%- %
7% 5% BtuPGftp 938 84 196 7% 7% 7%
83% 38% Boeing ,1 20 211B7X39dM*j 64% 58% + 1%
48 89% Botoec 140 39 72730 48% 43% 46%+ %
16% 7 BoliBer 08 J 313 8% 0 8% + %
M% 8% Bend 570 8% 0% 8%
24 14 % BoidC pr3 609 22. 3 781 16% 18% 18%
24 14% BcrdC n360a 23. S 174 18% 18 16 - %
77% 31 % Borden 192 28 18 830 73% 72% 73%
38% 25% EorO nl 22 36% 30% 36%- %
15% 13% BOW 1 S0e II. 7 38 14% 14 14

IS 14% BonEd 192 11. 10 206 17% 17% 17%

38% 23% Born nl 22 36% 30% 36%- %
15% 13% BCelM 1 60e II. 7 38 14% 14 14

18 14% BonEd 192 11. 10 206 17% 17% 17%
82% 82% BcoE (6098 99 2306 91 91 91

15% 14 eo*Epr140 97 1 15 15 IS

34% 25% Bowatr 1.T2 39 7x490 29% 29% 29%+ %
12% 7% Braze J0e 74 304 10% 10% .10%- %
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Worries as
Japan’s
bankers bet
on size

The creation of a
new banking order

It is, of course, open to west
era banks to view these devel
opments with a cold, detached
eye and comfort themselves
with the thought that the his-

tory of basking mergers is Ut-

tered with failures. Mergers
seldom enhance earning power
in banks; indeed it is an axiom
that smaller banks are usually
more profitable because they
can concentrate on lucrative
niches. If western bankers
hold firm to their professed
belief that what matters at the
end of the day is sot the size

of the balance sheet bnt the
returns earned for sharehold-
ers they should have nothing
to fear.

But will they be able to keep
their nerve in the face of this

Oriental rash for size? What
the Japanese banks are threat-
ening to do is create a wholly
new order of magnitude for
the world banking industry
which western banks will be
forced to confront
How valid win their defence

of earnings quality prove to be
against competitors which are
massing into units many times
their size? What will be the
nature of competition in a
global market dominated by
half a dozen Japanese mon-
sters? What point is there,
indeed, in even trying to com-
pete on an international scale
against institutions whose
shareholders seem to be so
undemanding?

It is quite easy in this situa-

tion to see western banks
themselves resorting to sheer
size in self-defence. By coinci-
dence, the opportunities may
well present themselves in the
progress of geographical dere-
gulation in the US (the liberal-

isation of inter-state banking),
and the emergence of a single
market in Europe, both of
which open up fresh possibili-

ties for bank mergers.
One hopes, of coarse, that

banks find better motives for
merger than fear of the Japa-
nese. Aside from the dobious
benefits which have already
been mentioned, there are pub-
lic interest issues to do with
competition and the pruden-
tial risks inherent in over-con-
centration.
Nothing would please west-

ern bankers more than to see
Mitsui Taiyo Kobe become a
dinosaur rather than a dragon,
because this wonld support
their argument that quality
prevails over quantity in the
end. But the growing lopsided-
ness of the world banking
structure most be a worrying
trend; aad western banks may,
in the end, have little choice
but to take countervailing
action of their own.
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The quiet pursuit of a moralist’s goals
W hen former US

President Jimmy
Carter left the
White House in

January 1981. aged only 56, he
says he faced “an unwanted
and potentially empty life.”

But In the subsequent eight
and a half years he has
remained politically active.
Although he has not sought
office, be has been involved in
international public service.

Last week, in his office at
the Carter Presidential Centre,
Mr Carter was preparing for
talks which he is chairing this

Thursday between the Ethio-
pian Government and the Eri-
trean People's Liberation
Front. The aim Is to help to
end their 2S-year-old civil war.
Later this month Mr Carter
will travel to Nicaragua for dis-
cussions ahead of his role as
an independent observer of
that country's elections next
February.
Mr Carter admits there is no

precedent for his activities.

They contrast with those of the
other three living ex-presidents
- Richard Nixon, tarnished by
Watergate, dispensing "elder
statesman” advice; Gerald
Ford, an amicable presence on
the lucrative convention and
golf circuit; and Ronald Rear
gan, who has largely disap-
peared from view apart from a
few money-making ventures.
But Mr Carter has always

been different - more of a
moralist thaw a conventional
politician. Many familiar fea-

tures have not changed since
he left the White House: There
is the same precise intelli-

gence, the same commitment
.and, above alL the game grin.

Yet the boyish looks are gone.
Wig fane is lined anrt hig hair

grey-white. He is more relaxed,

more detached and wittier
than he often appeared when
in office.

Mr Carter has chosen not to
pursue commercial activities.
Instead, he has made the heart
of his life the Carter Centre at
Emory University at Atlanta.
This is more than thw nm»l
museum and library of other
ex-presidents. It is a base for
study, discussion and his
worldwide initiatives on civil

conflicts and hunger. His role,

he say9, is as "a professor,
writer and organiser of the
Carter Centre’s work."
Mr Carter sees the centre as

filling a previously empty
niche in the resolution of con-
flicts and civil wars within
countries. International bodies
like the United Nations are, he
points out, “specifically prohib-
ited from becoming involved

-q 'i ew people in the inter-

national finance busi-

J-L ness can have been
cheered by last week's news of
the proposed merger between
Mitsui Bank and Taiyo Kobe
Rflyk of Japan.
The alliance will produce

the second largest bank in the
world - which is bad enough
in a business already domi-
nated by Japanese institu-
tions. Tc pet it into a western
perspective, it is as if Citicorp,

the US's largest bank, and Bar-
clays, Britain's largest,
decided to merge. The new
bank will be ten times bigger
in assets than an average-sized
European bank such as the
TSB or Credit Commercial de
France, and its market capital-

isation will be five times that
of Germany’s largest, Deut-
sche Bank.
The most depressing point

about the merger, though, is

not its huge dimensions bnt
the lie it gives to tiie idea that
Japanese banks had ceased to
be preoccupied with sheer size.

This idea had been gaining
ground in western bankers’
minds over the last year or
two. The rationale was that
the new international capital

roles which were introduced
this year wonld force Japanese
banks to be much more profit-

conscious. and therefore less

concerned with piling on
assets. Tbe rationale was
based on only flimsy evidence,
bnt it was boosted by a sense
of wishfulness on the part of
western bankers who had been
battered by the Japanese
banks' ruthless price-cutting.
That rationale may still hold

true. But it has clearly not
prevented two major Japanese
banks from perceiving benefits

in sheer size. And if this
merger is the precursor to oth-

ers. as Japanese bankers are
themselves predicting, we may
merely be witnessing the first

of a new generation of behe-
moth hanks.

Jimmy Carter, former US
president, speaks
to Peter Riddell

with revolutionaries opposing
a government which is a mem-
ber of that organisation."
The Carter Centre becomes

involved in talking to both
sides in such domestic disputes
in a way that other organisa-
tions and national govern-
ments could not In Ethiopia,
for instance, this week's talks
have been preceded by several
visits by Mr Carter himself to
the country.
There are obvious parallels,

which Mr Carter accepts,
between these Ethiopian talks
and the moves leading to the
Camp David agreement
between Israel and Egypt of
1979. In each case, he says, the
discussions occurred because
parties were willing to negoti-
ate after long conflicts rather
than because of his interven-
tion. Similarly, the outcomes
were, and are, “totally unpre-
dictable."

Mr Carter will preside over

PERSONAL FILE
1924 Born, Plains, Georgia.

Educated In Georgia and
US Naval Academy,
Annapolis

1946-53 Served US Navy
1953-77 Peanut farmer and

warehouseman
1982-66 State senator,

Georgia
1971-74 Governor, Georgia
1977-81 US President
1986 Formal opening of

Carter Centre

the talks which are hold
with no preconditions. He
hopes they set the agenda for
subsequent negotiations and
lead to certain confidence-
building measures such as a
ceasefire, as well as the greater
involvement of international
relief organisations.

It is appropriate that the
meeting is being held in the
Carter Centre since it is sited
on the hill from which Union
General Sherman watched one
devastating result of America’s
own civil conflict - fee burn-
ing Of Atlanta

Mr Carter has similarly been
acting as a conciliator in Cen-
tral America. As an indepen-
dent observer of the Nicara-
guan elections, he will be
repeating the role he adopted
last April whan confronting
General Manuel Noriega’s

thugs during the Panamanian
elections.

He believes the basic defects
of the elections in Panama -
the absence of freedom to cam-
paign and inKwiitatinn of can-
didates and voters - have
been avoided in the Nicara-
guan procedures, which ware
agreed between the govern-
ment and the opposition
groups. But he is keeping a
close eye on any loopholes.
Mr Carter denies that he is

pursuing an independent for-

eign policy. “One of the prem-
isses of what we do at the
Carter Centre is to be totally
non-partisan, and non-politi-
cal” (he is careful to involve
prominent Republicans in his
delegations and conferences).
"I never profess to speak for
my government, but I have
always been careful, even
when Reagan was in office, to
keep the White House end the
State Department informed."
The “even” in relation to for-

mer President Reagan is signif-

icant since Mr Carter gets on
much better with President
Bush than his predecessor. He
says that there is now "total

co-operation and understand-
ing with officials in Washing-
ton — a harmonious relation-

ship. ” Communications with
the White House are now
"much easier.”

Mr Carter has in general
avoided domestic political con-
troversy since 1981 - apart
from producing a Level-headed
report last winter on how to
tangle the US budget dpfirll

This was written with Mr Ford,
his old opponent and now
friend. Mr Carter prefers to
pursue his fnter»arinnai inter-

ests In the third world, peace
and human rights, the allevia-

tion of hunger and health -
issues which have "long been
overlooked in many parts of
the industrialised world.”
Some of fee Carter Centre's

domestic operations in, for
example, preventive health
care have been extended over-

seas. Mr Carter and his family
also remain involved with
helping to rebuild inner city

houses. He is an experienced
carpenter.
Many of Mr Carter's activi- j

ties are in countries in which,
while president, he was at
times more popular than he
was in the US.

“hi the Scandinavian coiin-

Shedding the ass’s

skin in Poland
T hat great operatic para- ““ joined fee reg

hie of class struggle. The lBmHI swore fee lu
Marriage of Figaro, has I comfortine irr

David Lascelles

T hat great operatic para-
ble of class struggle. The
Marriage of Figaro, has

in its final act a song sung by
Don Basilio, a music master.
For much of the opera, Basilio
is seen as a lackey of the Count
Almaviva, against whose tyr-

anny the revolt, which is the
subject of the opera, is
directed. He is a henchman of
the Count in the latter's efforts
to assert a droit de seigneur
over Figaro's bride-to-be,
Susanna - even though he has
formally renounced this
supreme symbol of the lawless-
ness of aristocratic rule.

Then, in the miraculous
fourth act, where power is
humbled and a greater law
implicitly conjured forth. Basi-
lio is given an aria in which to
display his philosophy of life.

He tells the story of the ass’s

skin; an ugly, noisome cloak
given to him by Lady Discre-
tion, which allows him to
weather storms and to blunt
the appetite of wild beasts.
"So fete taught me that
Insults, dangers, shame and

death
Can be escaped under an

ass’s skin"
A small part of the aid now

being considered for Poland
could be worse spent than on
sponsoring a season of the
Marriage of Figaro in Warsaw’s
opera house - or for that mat-
ter in Prague (where it played
with great success two centu-
ries ago) or East Berlin, or
Budapest, or Moscow. Basilio’s
song would mean much more
to audiences there, now, than
it possibly can in Paris, Lon-
don, Milan or New York.

n the day Mr Tadeusz
69 JBMazowiecki was con-

firmed as Prime Minis-
ter of Poland. I spoke to Jerzy
Urban, chairman of the state
committee of radio and televi-
sion. For much of the 1980s, be
was famous as the Govern-
ment’s chief spokesman, and
his appearances before the Pol-
ish and foreign press corps
were set pieces of aggressive
verbal ping-pong, with Mr
Urban often getting the better
of the press because of his
brass neck and shameless wtt_
Just before the elections this

June be was given the media
job, a reward for nearly a
decade of unswerving loyalty
to the authorities.
But he is now a man on his

way out Whatever Mr Mazo-
wiecki’s government has

Eastern Europe
Notebook

decided most be left to the
Communists, the media will
not be part of it Though the
reporting on Polish television
and radio is now relatively
straight, and in some cases
quite critical of the Govern-
ment, and though Solidarity
has a whole 45 minutes a week
to produce its own programme,
there are recent and sharp
memories of tbe media’s role
during martial law which must
be assuaged. A Solidarity-led
government would be a non-
sense if it were not to tackle
that So Mr Urban's discourse
was a valedictory of his imme-
diate past But it was frill of
interest as is he.
He spent the early part of his

professional life in the 1950s
working for a journal whose
dissidence was only just per-
mitted. He then shifted to poly.
t£ka, the weekly started to pro-
vide a safety valve for critical
ideas and commentary —
though, he admits, this was a
criticism which could never
question tbe Socialist system
or the alliance with the Soviet
Union. Many thought of him as
the best writer on the paper -
original, caustic and funny.
To be a journalist of that

kind in post-war Poland was to
wear an ass’s skin but to be
able to claim it did good for
others, not merely for oneself.
Since these journals were sanc-
tioned and nothing was printed
without the censor's stamp
they were by definition safe.
Yet they also pushed at the
limits of the permissible, pres-
ented arguments which some-
times won by their own force,
and preserved ventilation

’

where otherwise there would
have been an airless vault.
Then, with his former editor

Mieczyslaw Rakowski, he

joined the regime. He thus for-

swore fee limited but surely
comforting irresponsibility and
freedom of a journalist for real
power, but one closely con-
strained and intensely destruc-
tive of ideals and of the truth.
Did he regret that period?

Not at all; though he had had
to accept the bridle of loyalty,

he had joined fee Jarnzelski
regime because he saw it as a
reforming one. What would he
do now? Return to the pen;
Poland would offer plenty of
opportunities for sharpening it
Newspapers would now, he

said, be commercial: they
would sink or swim by sales,

publishing "sex and tips for
housewives.” Old forces once
held down - nationalism, rac-

ism - wonld reassert them-
selves. A sense of purpose (the
Communist party's sense of
purpose) would be lost There
were, after all, no such things
as neutral media, as the Ameri-
cans claimed. Yes, there would
be much to offer a critic of fee
opposition (for such he would
be) in the new Poland - for
“things do not arrange them-
selves as in fairy stories, to end
happily ever after.”

For tbe very many, like Mr
Urban, who have lived beneath
the ass’s skin these are diffi-

cult, if not for the present dan-
gerous, times. Much too late to
slough it off and pretend it was
never worn: an that is left hi
honesty is to say, with Don
Basilio, yes, I wore it so did
very many of ns, perhaps at
some time and in some fashion
all of os who sought to be
active in public life. How many
Figaros were there, who chal-
lenged absolute power?
Wen, there was one: Lech

Walesa, who sensed the inner
emptiness of the absolute
power and who rallied against
it For the realists and practi-
cal reformers who had lived
under the skin, his ultimate
success (fragile though it st£Q
is) threatens to render lies
meaningless in retrospect
Only if they can show that

we all, or nearly all, crawl
under the skin when times get
rough. at least a certain
self respect (if not an ideology)
survive. And indeed, there will

be some mileage in such a proj-
ect in the new Boland, the new
Hungary, the new Soviet Union
or the old Anywhere for as far
ahead as anyone can see.

John Lloyd

‘What we do at die Carter Centre Is totally non-partisan’

tries, fee third world and Latin
America, my policies were
quite acceptable. Peace, tinman
rights, arms control and envi-
ronmental quality were very
attractive in other parts of the
world - in some cases more
than in this country.”

Mr Carter believes his repu-
tation is “getting better as
times passes. This has been
historically the case with
Eisenhower, Truman and
Nixon. That’s kind of an inevi-

table political science truism.”
He stresses “the stark contrast
between my policies and those
of President Reagan - some of
which are to my benefit” He
believes this contrast is “help-
fill in modifying public opinion
in the US. Recent newspaper
columns and several books
written by scholars have been
more favourable than news
reporters at the time.”

Any favourable reassess-
ment of Mr Carter's term still

has a long way to go given the
low standing be had on leaving
office. He was widely criticised

both in Washington and in
west European capitals for
inconsistency and ineffective-

ness; that view has not yet
rhmyd significantly.

Republican politicians even
now run against the Carter
record - using Urn as a sym-
bol of past failures - even,
though he was welcomed back
by his own party ait last year’s
Democratic convention in
Atlanta. To some extent, how-
ever. the more positive view of
Mr Carter now expressed .in

opinion polls and by commen-
tators reflects as much his con-
duct since leaving the White
House as his patchy record as
President.

Democrat to be elected presi-

dent since Lyndon Johnson in
1964, Mr Carter is not pessimis-

tic about ids party’s prospects.

He says the answer is “just get
the right candidate. If we have
someone like Senator Bill.

Bradley or Senator s*»m Nunn
[a follow Georgian] or others-

1

will not name now, that would
be a major step forward.

"There needs to he a combi-
nntinn rtf philncnphy — conser-
vative on the budget deficit, on.
finance,- on trade, strong- zga"

defence, strong , cin local goy- .

eminent, on the one hand, and
quite a progressive attitude on
human rights, civil rights,
environmental quality; peace
- that kind of relationship •

which! tried to espouse when I
was President would,be appeal- -

ing now ”
- w*-" .

Although he is the only
He adds that it "is almost

wiaHwimitiraiiy Impossible to
•'

he elected president without
carrying the South- given the
way the rest of the nation is

divided."

Talking to Mr Carter there is

. sot only the impression c£ a
fundamentally decant man,
whatever his firaHsr.in execut-

ing bit aims in offifier^mt also

of someone who is trying to
prove. something.-;HO inay no

- longer'he' trying io show that
American voters wfe£. wroqg

. in 1980, when : hie lost, but
lather that whatlie tried to do

- in fee preceding foaT yeare rtf

his. presidency was rigte -

-Initially, fir Carter agreed
when asked, whether he wfts
still fighting the battles of Iris

presidency. But then he addrid
fee qualification thatjm/wookl
'not necessarily refer© battles.

He preferred to say that he wfe
“still pursuing some of fee
same goals he pursued as' pres-

ident"-'
- ’ r
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